BID TABULATION - PAPER SUPPLIES

PAPER SUPPLIES
BID OPENING
11-10-09

ST LOUIS
ENVELOPE

NATIONAL
ENVELOPE

XPEDX

MAOS

SCHOOL
SPECIALTY

Item Number

Item Description

Suggested
Manufacturer

Vendor Item
Number

Unit Of
Measure

Quantity
Ordered

Item
Number

10300

Envelopes - coin,
#5-1/2, 3-1/8" x 5-1/2",
gummed flap, 500/bx.

National

94961

BOX

16

10300

NO BID

$18.38

$19.00

$11.60

$14.25

10306

Envelope - booklet,
6" x 9", white, #24, 500/bx
USED FOR METERED
MAILINGS

National

4238

BOX

24

10306

NO BID

$15.16

$10.50

$10.82

NO BID

10307

Envelopes - w/o clasp,
9" x 12", 28# Kraft,
500/ctn

National

04132

BOX

41

10307

NO BID

$41.38

$34.00

$24.98

NO BID

10308

Envelopes - 6"x10" self
sealing puncture resistant
padded mailer, 25/bx., Ea

Seal Air Corp

ANLE10185

EACH

91

10308

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

$12.75

NO BID

10309

Envelopes - 8-1/2" x 12"
self sealing puncture
resistant padded mailer.
25/box, Ea

Seal Air Corp

ANLE10187

EACH

156

10309

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

$19.25

NO BID

10310

Envelopes - 14-1/4" x 20"
self sealing puncture
resistant padded mailer,
25/bx., Ea

Seal Air Corp

ANLE10192

EACH

31

10310

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

$38.60

NO BID

10311

Envelopes-10 x 15 w/o
clasp, 28# catalogue, brown
kraft, 500/bx

NATIONAL

4161

BOX

10311

NO BID

$59.98

$90.00

$54.10

NO BID

10312

Envelopes- 12 x 15 1/2, w/o
clasp, 28# brown kraft,
500/bx

NATIONAL

4168

BOX

10312

NO BID

$67.29

$100.00

$56.48

NO BID

10313

Envelopes - #6-3/4,
3-5/8" x 6-1/2", white, 24#,
500/box, 1 box

National

33933

BOX

10313

NO BID

$7.11

$6.90

$8.22

$6.60

10314

Envelopes - #10 window,

COMMERCIAL STYLE

FLAP ONLY,24#, white,
500/box, 5 box/carton

National

28461

BOX

242

10314

NO BID

$8.75

$8.70

$7.73

NO BID

10315

Envelopes - #9, regular,
COMMERCIAL STYLE
FLAP ONLY 24#, white,

500/box, 5 box/carton

National

33794

BOX

47

10315

NO BID

$7.42

$7.30

$6.54

NO BID




BID TABULATION - PAPER SUPPLIES

PAPER SUPPLIES
BID OPENING
11-10-09

ST LOUIS
ENVELOPE

NATIONAL
ENVELOPE

XPEDX

MAOS

SCHOOL
SPECIALTY

10316

Envelopes - #10, regular,

COMMERCIAL STYLE

FLAP ONLY 24#, white,
500/box, 5 box/carton

National

28439

BOX

239

10316

NO BID

$7.42

$7.30

$6.54

NO BID

10317

Envelopes - #10
window,Right window
position panel,
COMMERCIAL STYLE
FLAP ONLY,244#, white,
500/box, 5 box/carton

National

99999

BOX

55

10317

NO BID

$8.75

$10.50

$8.03

NO BID

10319

Envelopes - #9, window,
COMMERCIAL STYLE
FLAP ONLY 24# THIS IS
REQUIRED STOCK FOR
THIS ITEM, white,
500/box, 5 box/carton

National

33825

BOX

14

10319

NO BID

$8.75

$8.75

$8.03

NO BID

10322

Envelopes - A8,
5-1/2" x 8-1/8" catalog,
brown kraft, 1000/bx

National

1208428

BOX

10322

NO BID

$63.40

$45.00

$41.63

NO BID

10700

Paper - 8-1/2" x 11", 84
white, multi-purpose for use
in copiers, laser printers,
plain paper fax machines,
inkjet printers, and offset
presses, 20#, grain long,
acid free, 500 sheets/ream,
10 reams/ctn

Georgia Pacific

221001-00

REAM

9372

10700

NO BID

NO BID

$2.75

$2.60

NO BID

10701

Copy paper - 8-1/2" x 11",
pink, 20#, 500 sheets/ream,
10 reams/ctn

Wausau

2001611

REAM

28

10701

NO BID

NO BID

$4.35

$3.95

$4.30

10702

Copy paper - 8-1/2" x 11",
canary, 20#, 500
sheets/ream, 10 reams/ctn

Wausau

2001603

REAM

72

10702

NO BID

NO BID

$4.35

$3.95

$4.30

10703

Copy paper - 8-1/2" x 11",
goldenrod, 20#, 500
sheets/ream, 10 reams/ctn

Wausau

2001606

REAM

10703

NO BID

NO BID

$4.35

$3.95

$4.30

10704

Copy paper - 8-1/2" x 11",
green, 20#, 500
sheets/ream, 10 reams/ctn

Wausau

2001607

REAM

97

10704

NO BID

NO BID

$4.35

$3.95

$4.30
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10705

Copy paper - 8-1/2" x 11",
blue, 20#, 500 sheets/ream,
10 reams/ctn

Wausau

2001600

REAM

113

10705

NO BID

NO BID

$4.35

$3.95

$4.30

10706

Copy paper - 8-1/2" x 11",
buff, 20#, 500 sheets/ream,
10 reams/ctn

Wausau

2001601

REAM

10

10706

NO BID

NO BID

$4.35

$4.24

$4.30

10707

Copy paper - 8-1/2" x 14",
white, 20#, 500
sheets/ream, 10 reams/ctn

2251794

REAM

43

10707

NO BID

NO BID

$3.50

$4.18

NO BID

10711

Copy paper - 11" x 17",
white, 20#, 500
sheets/ream, 5 reams/ctn

2251793

REAM

83

10711

NO BID

NO BID

$7.10

$6.58

NO BID

10713

Letterhead - 8-1/2" x 11",
20#, 25% cotton water
marked, PREMIUM
GRADE, suitable for laser
printing, 500 sheets/ream,
10 reams/ctn

Capitol

2085221

REAM

11

10713

NO BID

NO BID

$10.25

$10.78

NO BID

10714

Paper- 11" x 17" Finch
Opaque Cover 65# 96
bright 500 sheets/rm

Finch Opaque

REAM

10714

NO BID

NO BID

$10.60

$27.24

NO BID

10800

Card stock - 90#,
8-1/2" x 11", white,
250/ream, 8 rm/ctn

Springhill

2227280

REAM

11

10800

NO BID

NO BID

$5.50

$5.08

NO BID

10802

Cover - 80# cover,
8-1/2" x 11", white, 96
brightness, laser capatible,
250 sheets per ream, 8
reams per ctn.

Wausau

2140968

REAM

10802

NO BID

NO BID

$6.50

$7.02

NO BID

10803

Vellum - 57# Bristol,
8-1/2" x 11", white, 90
brightness, 7 pt. Reply card,
250 sheets per ream, 8
reams per ctn.

Wausau

2229770

REAM

10803

NO BID

NO BID

$6.00

$4.23

NO BID

10804

Card stock - 90#,
8-1/2" x 11", buff,
250/ream, 8 rm/ctn

Wausau

2045193

REAM

10804

NO BID

NO BID

$5.50

$6.61

NO BID

10805

Card stock - 65#,
8-1/2" x 11", white,
250/ream, 8 rm/ctn

Finch

2063740

REAM

38

10805

NO BID

NO BID

$5.50

$5.73

$9.35
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10806

Card stock - 65#,
8-1/2" x 11", green,
250/ream, 8 rm/ctn

Wausau

2045883

REAM

10806

NO BID

NO BID

$5.50

$5.84

$6.77

10807

Card stock - 1104,
8-1/2" x 11", cherry,
250/ream, 8 rm/ctn

Wausau

5210965

REAM

10807

NO BID

NO BID

$6.00

$6.97

NO BID

10900

NCR paper - superior
heavyweight, 8-1/2" x 11",
2 pt., reverse, 500/ream,
10 reams/ctn

Mead

2063251

REAM

95

10900

NO BID

NO BID

$6.70

$8.24

NO BID

10901

NCR paper - superior
heavyweight, 8-1/2" x 11",
3 pt., reverse, 500/ream,
10 reams/ctn

Mead

2241308

REAM

277

10901

NO BID

NO BID

$7.45

$9.05

NO BID

10902

NCR paper - superior
heavyweight, 8-1/2" x 11",
4 pt., reverse, 500/ream, 10

reams/ctn

Mead

2241305

REAM

325

10902

NO BID

NO BID

$7.85

$11.09

NO BID

10903

NCR paper - superior
heavyweight, 8-1/2" x 11",
4 pt., straight, 500/ream, 10

reams/ctn

Mead

2216205

REAM

64

10903

NO BID

NO BID

$7.85

$11.09

NO BID

10904

NCR paper - superior
heavyweight, 8-1/2" x 11",
5 pt., reverse, 500/ream,
10 reams/ctn

Mead

5060750

REAM

20

10904

NO BID

NO BID

$8.05

$10.02

NO BID

10905

NCR paper - superior
heavyweight, 8-1/2" x 11",
5 pt., straight, 500/ream,
10 reams/ctn

Mead

5062311

REAM

45

10905

NO BID

NO BID

$8.05

$10.02

NO BID

10917

NCR paper - superior
heavyweight, 8-1/2" x 11",
CF white tag, 500/ream,
10 reams/ctn

Mead

5068195

REAM

10917

NO BID

NO BID

$30.00

$10.69

NO BID

10918

NCR paper - superior
heavyweight, 8-1/2" x 14",
2 pt., reverse, 500/ream,
10 reams/ctn

Mead

5202999

REAM

17

10918

NO BID

NO BID

$8.40

$10.23

NO BID
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NCR paper - superior
10919 heavyweight, 8-1/2" x 14%, | -\ 2241309 REAM 0 10919 NO BID NO BID $9.85 $11.30 NO BID
3 pt., reverse, 500/ream,
10 reams/ctn
NCR paper - superior
10920 heavyweight, 8-1/2" x 14%, | -\ 2230434 REAM 58 10920 NO BID NO BID $10.95 $12.38 NO BID
4 pt., reverse, 500/ream,
10 reams/ctn
Computer paper -
10950 9-1/2"x 11", 1 part, IBM 5242689 | CARTON 12 10950 NO BID NO BID $25.60 $24.29 NO BID
continuous pinfeed, 2500
sheets/ctn
Computer paper -
10951 147/8"x 11", 1/2" green IBM 5231988 | CARTON 2 10951 NO BID NO BID $40.90 $39.06 NO BID
bar, one-part, continuous
feed, 2500 sheets per ctn
Crack - n - peel -
10960 8 1/2" x 11", white, 250 FASSON 5156903 HUNDRED 17 10960 NO BID NO BID $22.00 $20.42 NO BID
per ream, 8 reams per ctn
Krome-kote -
10961 8 1/2" x 11", 250 sheets per SMART 5204233 REAM 12 10961 NO BID NO BID $10.75 $11.61 NO BID
ream, 8 reams per ctn
10971 Padd'”gfggf;#"d’ red | coLor 5079815 | GALLON 0 10971 NO BID NO BID $21.15 $19.03 NO BID
3 hole punch - 8-1/2" x 11" International
10972 20#, 500 sheets per ream, Paper 2251795 REAM 230 10972 NO BID NO BID $3.50 $3.54 $3.60 RM
10 reams per carton P
Color copy paper - 8-1/2" x
11"; 28# photo white 96 NO
10980 brightness, 500 sheets per | SUBSTITUTE| 5198832 REAM 42 10980 NO BID NO BID $8.90 $10.46 NO BID
ream, 8 reams per carton | Hammermill
(NO SUBSTITUTE)
AFFIDAVIT
COMPLETED NO BID NO YES YES YES
E-VERIFY
DOCUMENTATION NO BID NO NO NO NO
COPY OF
INSURANCE NO BID NO NO YES YES
PROVIDED
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