Subdivision
Arnold:

Highland House
Creekside
Carlton Manor
Whitehall Estates

Barnhart:
Wiliamsburg
Fountains at Moss Hollow

Cedar Hill/House Springs:
Pine View Acres
Northwest Point

Brooks Farm

Twin Pines

High Ridge:
Camelot Gardens
Ivy Trails

Timber Ridge
Eagle Point

Fenton:

San Marino

Fenton Park Il

Joshua Crossing

Winter Bluff/West Grove
Corisande Crossing
Winter Lakes Estates
Harbor View Estates
Konert Lake Estates
Silver Maple View

Festus:
Lake Estates @ Crystal Highlands
Wimbledon

Imperial:

Castlegate

Countryside

Valley Oaks 1 & 2
Windmill Summit
Crossings @ Seckman
Parc @ Kimmswick
Mystic Valley

The Oaks

Kneff Farms

Remington Place Phase 1
Imperial Hills

Estates of Castlegate
Amberleigh Woods

Twin Oaks

Williams Brook Meadows
Meramec Estates

Length (Miles)

0.771
0.638
0.688
0.944

1.519
1.159

1.634
0.829
0.410
1.116

0.336
0.654
1.157
0.533

0.379
0.488
0.326
0.972
0.346
1.251
0.797
0.416
0.391

0.572
0.869

1.516
0.562
2.534
0.425
0.593
0.765
0.608
1.433
1.179
0.526
1.345
1.050
2.354
0.368
0.360
0.422

Cardinal

650
600
620
750

RV SRV SRV NV Y

W

750
$ 700

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

700
880
950
750

v v v

600
650
600
750
600
750
700
600
600

RV RV SRV RV SV SRV SV SV VS

R0

650
750

R0

800
600
1,400
650
700
700
700
850
700
600
750
700
1,500
600
600
600

R RV T ¥ Y IV SV SV SV SRV IV SV RV R Y

Snow Removal STL
Plow 1-4"

Salt

RV VR Vo VS

w

429
327

W

461
234
116
315

RV Vo Vo V2

95
185
327
150

v v v v

107
138

92
274

98
353
225
117
110

v VvV nn

W

161
245

W

428
159
715
120
167
216
172
405
333
148
380
296
665
104
102
119

R ¥ ¥ Y Y IR Vo Vo o Ve ¥ RV TR "R Vo S Vo Vo A Vo

$
$
$
$
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v n
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218
180
194
266

429
327

461
234
116
315

95
185
327
150

107
138

92
274

98
353
225
117
110

161
245

428
159
715
120
167
216
172
405
333
148
380
296
665
104
102
119
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Plow 5-8"
283
234
252
346

557
425

600
304
150
410

123
240
425
196

139
179
120
357
127
459
293
153
143

210
319

556
206
930
156
218

223
526
433
193
494

864
135
132
155

Plow 9-11"

$
$
$
$

RV SRV SRV NV Y

v v v n

RV RV SRV RV NV SRV SRV SRV VS

R IV RV RV N ¥ R RV SV SRV SRV, SV SV SV SRV RV S VS

368
304
328
450

725
553

780
396
196
532

160
312
552
254

181
233
156
464
165
597
380
198
187

273
415

723
268
1,209
203
283

290
684
563
251
642
501
1,123
176

201

Precision

Snow
250
235
235
300

RV SRV SRV NV Y

W

450
375

W

400
290
145
380

RV SRV SRV NV Y

150
400
400
190

v v v

125
160
115
340
125
450
280
150
140

R R RV AV SV SRV RV SV SV

W

200
315

W

350
185
800
150
200
268
225
500
415
185
475

750
130
130
150

R ¥ Y V¥ SV RV SV SRV SRV SV SV SRV IR V2%
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Salt
250
235
235
300

500
375

450
290
150
380

150
255
400
190

125
160
115
340
125
450
280
150
140

200
315

350
185
900
150
200
268
225
550

185
475

850
130
130
150

Johannes
Pretreat
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

$ 270

$ 410
250

v

No Bid

150
190
310
170

RV SRV SRV RV Y

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

No Bid
No Bid

No Bid

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

No Bid
No Bid
S 250
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

w

160
$ 225

Plow/Salt 1-3"
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

S 340

W

315
S 200
No Bid

180
240
390
215

RV SRV SRV NV Y

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

No Bid
No Bid

No Bid

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

No Bid
No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid
210
200
285

R IRV SET,Y

Plow/Salt 3-5"

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

W

No Bid

RV SRV SRV NV Y

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

No Bid
No Bid

No Bid

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

No Bid
No Bid

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

R IRV SET,Y

535
340

510
315
200

180
240
390
215

285

285

315

210
200
285

Plow/Salt 5-7"

S 180




