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JUMBO TOILET TISSUE
Manufacturer: 1559673 NO BID GEN 9JUMBOB WGG70308 401097
How packaged: 12 ROLLS/CASE
CS- CASE OF 12
Rolls per case: 12 ROLLS/CASE ROLLS 12/PKG 8
bid price per case: $29.79/ ROLL $25.97 18.50/CASE $23.79 $23.05 $19.75 $36.44
BRIGHTON NOVA JUMBO
1 ROLL =
Comments: PROFESSIONAL BATH TISSUE ’OPOISR (C)ASE 8
365379 (RISNOVA1002)
Liquid Detergent: Liquid: 5-Gallon Buckets
100693D D- LEAD
Manufacturer: ORIGINAL SCENT 5 UNX 130759 WGB508378 400864
GALLON ON DETERGENT
i PAIL CONTAINGING 5
How packaged: GALLONS
Bid price per bucket: $56.35 $81.12/ 5 GL BUCKET $56.96 $51.90/PAIL $37.89 $19.16 $55.20 $70.76
PUMPS & SERVICE
. ECOLAB #6116326 TRI- INTERCHEM SPARKLE
Comments: STAR FLEXLITE 5GL PUREX 06354 PFE:%\QTD;? CL)':' ° BRIGHT (INT8017)
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Small Toilet Tissue

Manufacturer: BWK6145 TOILET TISSUE NO BID BOARDWALK 6145 WG670310 401099

Rolls per case: CS - CASE OF 96 ROLLS 96 ROLLS/ CASE

Sheets per roll: 500 SHEETS/ROLL 500 SHEETS

Bid Price per case: $33.58 $42.70 $29.60/CASE $35.84 $36.54 $28.38 $40.68
c ts: BRIGHTON NOVA BATH TISSUE
omments: PROFESSIONAL 365377 (RISNOVA4535)
Kitchen Towels

Manufacturer: MRC06350 NO BID TRIPLE S 35001 WGB2310558 400935

Rolls per case: CS - CASE OF 30 ROLLS 30 ROLLS/ CASE

Sheets per roll: 85 80 SHEETS/ ROLL 85 SHEETS

Bid price per case: $23.40 $25.83 $18.25/CASE $24.60 $24.13 $18.49 NO BID

Comments:

*85 SHEETS PER ROLL
BRIGHTON
PROFESSIONAL 365384

GEN KITCHEN ROLL
TOWELS 85 SHEETS/
ROLL (ESDGEN1797)
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Trash Bags: Large
Manufacturer: BWKA4046EXH NO BID NO BID TRIPLE S 12388 WG261763 401309
How packaged: 100 COUNT BOX 40-50 GAL
Bags per case: 250 CS - CASE OF 200 BAGS 100/ CASE
Bag size: 10 MIL 1.0 MIL
Bid price per case: $15.80 $14.22 $16.72 $15.20 $27.80 25.25 $19.03 $43.06 $10.96 $30.95
BERRY PLASTICS 40" x
. el aa .73 MIL FLAT PACK IN 46" LINERS, 125 BAGS/
Comments: HI-D INT-4048-XH, SAMPLE 1 A CASE CASE (BERLSR 4046
HB)
Trash Bags: Small
Manufacturer: IBSS3340ZZK NO BID NO BID TRIPLE S L243204 TOFB477921 401271
How packaged: 250 COUNT BOX 12-16 GAL 6 MICRONS
Bags per case: CS - CASE OF 500 BAGS 500 1,000/ PKG
Bag size: 10 MIL
Bid Price per case: $17.90 $34.78 $17.24 $18.10 $14.80 27.17 $34.58 $27.34 $24.89 $20.94
BERRY PLASTICS 24"
. x32" LINERS 1,000
Comments: HI-D INT-2433-REG, SAMPLE #2 4AMIL 6 MICRONS BAGS/ CASE
(BERLBR2432LB)
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Bar Hand Soap (NOT Ivory)
Manufacturer: BWKNOISSOAP NO BID NO BID GOOD DAY 400050 WGB260029
How packaged: 500 COUNT PER CASE
Oz. per bar: 10Z BAR 2502
. CS - CASE OF 1,000

Bars per case: BAGS 200/CASE

Bid price per case: $52.66 $43.35/CASE $58.32 $48.00 $46.28 $85.63
TRANSMARCO GOOD
Comments: UNWRQSLEDD BAR 1,000 1/2 OZ PER CASE | DAY BAR SOAP, 1,000/
CASE (RISTD400075)
Single Fold Towels
Manufacturer: PNL8210 NO BID GEN SF5001K TOFB2273827 401101
Sheet size: 9.125" x 10.25"
. CS - CASE OF 4,008
How packaged: 4000 COUNT CASE TOWELS 250/PK
Sheets per package: 250 200 334 250

Package per case: 16 16/CASE 20 12 16
Bid price per case: $22.27 $35.31 $17.80 $33.32 $21.07 $16.47 $21.34

Comments:

GEORGIA PACIFIC
20904Q

GEN SINGLE FOLD
PAPER TOWELS, 9" x 9
1/4 (ESDGENSF5001K)
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Ice Melt (Potasium Chloride)
Manufacturer: NAS635292 NO BID SALT 'NDEEQR'ES S0B- WGB1753134 400969 NO BID
How packaged: 49 BAGS/PALLET 49 BAGS/ PALLET
Lbs. per bag: BAG OF 50 POUNDS 50 POUND BAG
Bid price per 501b: $12.59 $11.73 $5.79/BAG $11.65 $9.44 $18.76
SCOTWOOD ROAD *MUST BUY IN
Comments: RUNNER INDUSTRIES MULTIPLES OF 49
50 BRR BAGS AT ATIME
Individually Wrapped Sanitary Napkins (Maxi Pads)
Manufacturer: HOS4147 NO BID NATURELLE 25130973 TG7B260042 400397
Pads per box: 250 COUNT 1 PER BOX
Boxes per case: CS - CASE OF 250 PADS 250/CASE
Bid price per case: $44.13 $31.48 $25.20 CASE $46.73 $39.11 $32.70 $49.98
HOSPECO MAXI THINS
Comments: MAXITHINS 539139 SANITARY NAPKINS
(RISMT-4)
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Mop Heads
Manufacturer: BWK216CCT NO BID NO IBD TRIPLE S 37063 TOFB1574349 401148
How packaged: 12 PER CASE 2007
Mop Heads per case: CS - CASE OF 12 3 CASE
Bid price per case: $48.46 $33.60/CASE $5.51 $5.56 $45.64 $68.85
O'CEDAR 16 OZ MAXI
. CASE PRICE IS FOR 12 COTTON SCREW-ON
Comments: MOP HEADS 12PER CASE MOP (OCD97819) 12
MOPS/ CASE
Bleach
Manufacturer: 1912120 NO BID NOVEL WASH 37842 T97B1872708 NO BID
How packaged: 4 PER CASE 1 GALLON 1 GAL BOTTLE
Gallons per case: 3CT/CASE CS - CASE OF 4 6/ CASE
Bid price per case: $8.00 $8.58 $5.80/CASE $20.77 $11.70 $17.24
3CT PER CASE 6% NOVEL WASH BLEACH
C ts: SODIUM 5.25% 6- 1 GALLON
omments: HYPOCHLORITE PURE BOTTLES / CASE
BRIGHT KIKBLEACH 3 (RJ5502)
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Brooms
Manufacturer: 62.25 NO BID NO BID GOLDENSTAR BRP58B T9FB1574310 400572 NO BID
How packaged: 6 PER CASE CS-CASE OF 12 12/PKG 6 PER CASE 1
Bid price per dozen: $124.50 $91.68/ CASE $100.56 2 CASES $20 $4.13
. MUST BE ORDERED IN
Comments: MULTIPLES OF 12 $10 PER CASE
Non-Alcohol Foaming Hand Sanitizer:
Manufacturer: BWK440 NO BID TRIPLE S 44096 NO BID 90151120
. 4 GALLONS/CASE
How packaged: POURABLE CS-CASE OF 6
Bid price per box: $41.56 $49.00 $55.65/CASE $62.12 $37.52 $92.42
ECOLAB INC #6100730
FOAM HAND
. SANITIZER 4x1250ML PROVIDE FREE FREE CUSTOM
Comments: PER CASE. ECOLAB DISPENSER DISPENSER (DEBSS5857)

DISPENSER NO
CHARGE
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White Roll Towels
Manufacturer: KCC01000 NO BID VONDREHEL 813 B T97B241033 400015
How packaged: 12/CASE CS-CASE OF 6 12 ROLLS/ CASE
Bid price per case: $105.66 $96.77 $49.16/CASE $112.27 $49.12 $34.70 $85.39
SOLARIS LIVI VPG
HARDWOOD ROLL
TOWELS 8" x 1000", 6
. SCOTT KIMBERLY \ ROLLS/ CASE
Comments: CLARK 815614 BO0'WHITEBPER CASE|  21550146528)
DISPENSERS WILL BE
AVAIABLE AT NO
CHARGE
Anti-Bacterial Hand Soap
Manufacturer: NO BID NO BID TRIPLE S 44097 NO BID 90091120
How packaged: CS - CASE OF 6
Bid price per case: $47.49/CASE $44.77/CASE $51.58 $30.95 $16.75
ECOLAB INC #6101088
NEXA AB FOAM HAND
SOAP 4 x 1250 ML PER WE WOULD PROVIDE 6 x 1250 FREE
COMMENTS CASE ECOLAB FREE DISPENSERS DISPENSER (DEBANTLL)
DISPENSER -NO
CHARGE
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Laundry Bleach
Manufacturer: 1912120 NO BID UNX 130959 NO BID NO BID
i PAIL CONTAINING 5
How packaged: 4 GALLONS PER CASE GALLONS
Bid price per bucket: $2.00/GALLON $29.50/5 GL BUCKET $35.20/PAIL $34.48 $8.38
ECOLAB #6115982 PUMPS & SERVICE INTERCHEM KHLOR
Comments: LAUNDRI DESTAINER PROVIDED AT NO EXTRA LAUNDRY
5GL COST BY UNX BLEACH (INT630)
Laundry Softner
Manufacturer: NO BID NO BID UNX 130859 NO BID NO BID
. PL - PAIL CONTAINING
How packaged: 5 GALLONS
Bid price per bucket: $107.29/5 GL BUCKET $75.71/ PAIL $75.30 $56.77
ECOLAB #6100998 TRI PUMPS & SERVICE INTERCHEM SOFTY
Comments: STAR CLEARLY SOFT PROVIDED AT NO LAUNDRY SOFTNER
PLUS 5GL COST BY UNX (INT655)
Screw On Mop Handles
Manufacturer: BWK 834 NO BID TRIPLE S 37696 T97B55828 401149
) CS - CASE OF 12
How packaged: 12/CASE HANDLES 12/PKG
Bid price per unit: $5.25 $3.48 $43.20/ CASE $7.35 $5.86 $42.44 $6.30
BOARDWALK HEAVY
C ts: Pi%LLEI’NA:BEFfS:H FITS MOP HEADS DUTY THREADED
omments: BRUL QUOTED HANDLE 60"
(ESDBWK137)

Hi-Performance Neutral Floor Cleaner 2.5 gal
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Manufacturer: BWK4404N ECOLAB NO BID TRIPLE S 48133 NO BID 60331400 NO BID
CS- CASE OF 2
How Packaged: 4 C;AC)SL?R{A%?ELJ%Z OF 2-13ML BOTTLES EACH
BOTTLE 2.5 GALLONS
Bid Price per box: $30.96 $90.85/CASE $57.84/CASE $107.04 $207.08

Comments

ECOLAB #6100036 HI
PERF NEUT FLOOR
DISPENSER NO
CHARGE

DISPENSERS AT NO
CHARGE

OVER 650 END USE
GALLONS 4 BOXES PER
CASE
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Hi-Performance Neutral Floor Cleaner 2.2 Liter

Manufacturer: ARM 1033704 ECOLAB INC NO BID TRIPLE S 48216 NO BID 60331400 NO BID
CS-CASE OF 2
How packaged: ! GALLO’;‘UPGO URABLE 2-1.3L BOTTLES EACH

BOTTLE 2 LITERS
Bid price per box: $35.34 $35.35/ASE $50.08/CASE $107.04 $243.57
ECOLAB #6100082 HI
PERF ULTRA CONC OVER 650 AND USE 4
Comments: NEUT FLOOR. D o N0 BOXES PER GALLONS
DISPENSER NO E33
CHARGE
All Purpose Disinfectant Cleaner

Manufacturer: CLO31751 ECCOLAB NO BID TRIPLE S 48261 NO BID 60231400 NO BID
CA- CASE OF 2
How packaged: 2-101 C;Eé:gxgwms 2.1-3L BOTTLES EACH

BOTTLE 2 LITERS
Bid price per box: $71.21 $21.88/CASE $51.76/CASE $82.48 $53.20

Comments:

ECOLAB #6100792 MS
PEROXIDE
DISINFECTANT
DISPENSER NO-
CHARGE

DISPENSERS AT NO

CHARGE 4 BOXES PER CASE E23
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Bio-Enz Odor Control

Manufacturer: FRSIBWBMG ECOLAB NO BID TRIPLE S 48257 NO BID 60421400 NO BID
CS- CASE OF 2
How packaged: 455&2&2‘3'{%‘ 2-13L BOTTLES EACH

BOTTLE 2 LITERS
Bid Price per box: $57.80 $23.61/CASE $46.55/ CASE $116.52 $5.72
ECOLAB #6101023 QC77
BIO ODOR
Comments: ELIMINATOR D'SPE(;\‘:EE(S; EAT NO £42
DISPENSER NO
CHARGE
Acid Bathroom Cleaner

Manufacutrer: DV05019237 ECOLAB INC NO BID TRIPLE S 48260 NO BID 60111400 NO BID
CS- CASE OF 2
How packaged: 4702 CONTAINER 2 PER 2-13L BOTTLES EACH

CASE
BOTTLE 2 LITERS
Bid price per box: $62.94 $46.59/CASE $51.30/ CASE $72.60 $23.68
ECOLAB #6110422 QC91




BID TABULATION - JANITORIAL SUPPLIES 2020

ALL-TYPPE
FORDION PACKAING| COTTON'S ACE LNAEiTGOIEg ECOLAB ING CENTRAL POLY- QUILL LLC DUTCH HOLLOW | ALL AMERICAN EQUGIIP_I\O/IEQ# co gfg;ﬁpi VACUUM AND | MSC INDUSTRIAL
LLC HARDWARE BAG CORP SUPPLIES POLY JANITORIAL SUPPLY CO
CORPORATION INC CENTER
JANITORIAL SUPPLIES 2020 SUPPLY
11-19-2019
637 WYCKOFF AVE 114 BRACKEN RD 100 SCHELTER RD | 6218 OLD ST LOUIS | 40 TURNER PLACE | 11 HARBORPARK 1 545 70DIAC IND | 10678 TRENTON
STE 335 WYCKOFF NJ Dé;gTNoMl\?cl)Neggzo MONTGOMERY NY |* Egﬁ'f;;ﬁigz ST zi?ﬁ’,g.fﬁ ',‘\IEJ z';(’;%E LINCOLNSHIRE IL | ROAD BELLEVILLE | PISCATAWAY NJ | AsﬁTNZOTFf)TN Ny |COURT MARYLAND| AVE ST LOUIS MO Mgfv'\ﬁ)éEr\?\S( TB a7
07481 12549 60069 IL 62223 08854 11050 HEIGHTS MO 63043 63132
REQUIRED DOCUMENTS

NOTARIZED WORK AFFIDAVIT

COMPLETED Y Y Y Y Y Y Y N Y Y Y Y

E-VERIFICATION

DOCUMENTATION (Y/N): N M M M M M M N N N N N

COPY OF INSURANCE PROVIDED N Y Y Y N Y Y N Y N Y N
TAX RECEIPTS OR NOTARIZED
LETTER STATING NO REAL OR

PERSONAL PROPERTY OWNED IN N Y Y Y Y Y Y N Y N Y N

JEFFERSON COUNTY

COOPERATIVE BID FORM (Y/N) Y Y Y Y Y Y Y Y Y N Y Y

COOPERATIVE CONTACT INFO: Y Y Y % % Y Y Y Y Y Y
COMPANY INFORMATION AND

SIGNATURE Y N Y % % Y Y Y N N Y Y

BID DEPOSIT REQUIRED N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A

COMMENTS:

MISSING PAGE 9




