
BID TABULATION - TRAFFIC SAFETY DEVICES

TRAFFIC SAFETY DEVICES        
BID OPENING                     

2-10-09

3M TRAFFIC 
SAFETY         
SYSTEM

PLASTICADE 
PRODUCTS

SAFETY ZONE 
SPECIALISTS, 

INC

CPC             
CUSTOM 

PRODUCTS 
CORP

TAG 
INTERNATIONAL

COLT            
SAFETY INC

HIGHWAY 
TECHNOLOGIES, 

INC

PLASTIC DRUMS
1 - 99 NO BID $36.00 $41.20 $49.14 N/A $42.40 $41.50
100 + NO BID $35.00 $39.65 $49.14 N/A $37.40 $40.50

RUBBER TIRE RING BASES
1 - 99 NO BID $2.75 $10.30 $3.91 $46.00 $5.00 $4.65
100 + NO BID $2.75 $8.00 $3.91 $43.00 $4.15 $4.00

28" TRAFFIC CONES/WITH 
REFLECTIVE COLLARS

100 NO BID N/A $15.60 $15.38 $47.00 $14.25 $14.00
500 NO BID N/A $15.10 $15.38 $45.00 $12.60 $13.00

L.E.D. FLASHING LIGHTS          
(4 D-CELL BATTERY STYLE)

1 - 49 NO BID N/A $18.50 $20.71 N/A $11.90 $13.25
50 + NO BID N/A $17.50 $20.71 N/A $11.20 $13.00

360° DOME FLASHING LIGHTS     
(4 D-CELL BATTERY STYLE)

1 - 49 NO BID N/A $32.25 $35.31 N/A N/A $28.05
50 + NO BID N/A $31.00 $35.31 N/A N/A $27.48

BOLT PROTECTORS
1 - 49 NO BID N/A $0.40 $0.42 N/A N/A $0.90
50 + NO BID N/A $0.37 $0.42 N/A N/A $0.85

3-1/2” TO 3 3/4"                     
“HALF-MOON” BOLTS

1 - 49 NO BID N/A $0.80 $1.98 N/A N/A $0.60
50 + NO BID N/A $0.80 $1.98 N/A N/A $0.55

WRENCHES FOR                  
“HALF-MOON BOLTS”

20 + NO BID N/A $2.25 $2.12 N/A N/A $1.00

D-CELL BATTERIES
1 - 99 NO BID N/A $0.90 $1.93 N/A N/A $0.75
100 + NO BID N/A $0.84 $1.93 N/A N/A $0.65

MINIMUM DOLLAR                
AMOUNT OF ORDER NO BID N/A N/A $50.00 $100.00 $200.00 $250.00

NUMBER OF DAYS BETWEEN 
ORDER AND DELIVERY ON SITE NO BID 5 DAYS 10 DAYS 25 15                 

BUSINESS DAYS 7 - 10 1 - 10 DAYS

DATE BID                         
PRICES EXPIRES NO BID 4/30/09 1 YR FROM 

AWARD DATE 8/28/09 2/10/10 4/30/09 5/5/10

COMMENTS:


