
BID TABULATION - AUTOMOTIVE PARTS AND SUPPLIES

AUTOMOTIVE PARTS    
& SUPPLIES             

BID OPENING            
04-13-10

CHROMATE 
INDUSTRIAL 

CORP

AUTO            
TIRE & PARTS 

FACTORY 
MOTOR 
PARTS

PEVELY 
PLAZA AUTO 

PARTS

HILLSBORO 
AUTO PARTS

AIR CONDITIONER

BRAND
NO BID NAPA AC DELCO 

MOTORCRAFT AC DELCO FOUR SEASON

PER CENT DISCOUNT NO BID J - 10 UP TO J - 20 10% -20% -5%
ALTERNATORS

BRAND
NO BID NAPA AC DELCO 

MOTORCRAFT AC DELCO JNI

PER CENT DISCOUNT NO BID J - 5 UP TO J - 20 10% -20% 10%
BEARINGS

BRAND NO BID NAPA BCA BCA BCA 
BEARINGS

PER CENT DISCOUNT NO BID J - 19 10% -15% -10%
THROW OUT BEARINGS

BRAND NO BID NAPA BCA BCA BCA 
BEARINGS

PER CENT DISCOUNT NO BID J - 18 10% -15% -10%
BRAKES

BRAND

NO BID NAPA

BENDIX       
AC DELCO 

MOTORCRAFT 
CENTRIC

WAGNER RAYBESTOS

PER CENT DISCOUNT NO BID J - 5 10% -20% -20%
BRAND NO BID N/A N/A N/A WAGNER

PER CENT DISCOUNT NO BID N/A N/A N/A -20%
BRAKES HYDRAULIC

BRAND

NO BID NAPA

BENDIX       
AC DELCO 

MOTORCRAFT 
CENTRIC

AC DELCO RAYBESTOS

PER CENT DISCOUNT NO BID J - 15 10% -20% -20%
CARBURETORS

BRAND
NO BID NAPA AC DELCO 

MOTORCRAFT HYGRADE HYGRADE

PER CENT DISCOUNT NO BID J - 17 10% -15% -12%
CHASSIS PARTS

BRAND
NO BID NAPA AC DELCO 

MOTORCRAFT MOOG MOOG

PER CENT DISCOUNT NO BID J - 10 UP TO J - 19 10% -15% -15%

BRAND NO BID N/A N/A N/A MC QUAY 
NORRIS

PER CENT DISCOUNT NO BID N/A N/A N/A -15%
CLUTCH REBULT 
PRESSURE PLATE

BRAND NO BID NAPA SACHS AMS PRECISION
PER CENT DISCOUNT NO BID J - 10 10% -15% 5%

REBULT CLUTCH DISC
BRAND NO BID N/A SACHS AMS PRECISION

PER CENT DISCOUNT NO BID N/A 10% -15% 5%
REBULT CLUTCH DISC

BRAND NO BID N/A SACHS AMS PRECISION
PER CENT DISCOUNT NO BID N/A 10% -15% 5%

ENGINE PARTS



BID TABULATION - AUTOMOTIVE PARTS AND SUPPLIES

AUTOMOTIVE PARTS    
& SUPPLIES             

BID OPENING            
04-13-10

CHROMATE 
INDUSTRIAL 

CORP

AUTO            
TIRE & PARTS 

FACTORY 
MOTOR 
PARTS

PEVELY 
PLAZA AUTO 

PARTS

HILLSBORO 
AUTO PARTS

BRAND NO BID SEALED POWER NO BID SEAL POWER SEAL POWER
PER CENT DISCOUNT NO BID J - 25 NO BID -20% -5%
EXHAUST SYSTEMS

BRAND NO BID NAPA NO BID WALKER WALKER
PER CENT DISCOUNT NO BID J - 10 NO BID -20% -12%

BRAND NO BID N/A N/A N/A GOERLICH
PER CENT DISCOUNT NO BID N/A N/A N/A -10%

FILTERS
BRAND NO BID NAPA HASTINGS WIX WIX

PER CENT DISCOUNT NO BID J - 57 50% -37% -30%
GASKETS

BRAND NO BID FELPRO FELPRO FELPRO FEL PRO
PER CENT DISCOUNT NO BID J - 10 10% -10% -15%

GEARS
BRAND NO BID NAPA NO BID CLOYES CLOYES

PER CENT DISCOUNT NO BID J - 10 NO BID -15% -15%
 IGNITION ELECTRICAL

BRAND
NO BID NAPA ECHLIN AC DELCO 

MOTORCRAFT STANDARD STANDARD 

PER CENT DISCOUNT NO BID J - 17 10% -20% -12%

BRAND NO BID N/A N/A N/A STANDARD 
WIRE 

PER CENT DISCOUNT NO BID N/A N/A N/A -12%
IGNITION WIRE SETS

BRAND NO BID NAPA BELDIN AC DELCO AC DELCO STANDARD 
PER CENT DISCOUNT NO BID J - 10 10% -15% -12%

BRAND NO BID N/A N/A N/A STANDARD 
WIRE 

PER CENT DISCOUNT NO BID N/A N/A N/A -12%
BATTERIES

BRAND NO BID NAPA AC DELCO AC DELCO ELLIS 
BATTERY

PER CENT DISCOUNT NO BID J - 40 15% -25% -5%
GLOW PLUGS

BRAND
NO BID CHAMPION AC DELCO 

MOTORCRAFT AC DELCO MOTORCRAFT

PER CENT DISCOUNT NO BID J - 15 10% -10% -5%
BRAND NO BID N/A N/A N/A CHAMPION

PER CENT DISCOUNT NO BID N/A N/A N/A -5%
BRAND NO BID N/A N/A N/A AC

PER CENT DISCOUNT NO BID N/A N/A N/A -5%
LAMPS
BRAND NO BID NAPA SYLVAVIA WAGNER WAGNER

PER CENT DISCOUNT NO BID J - 10 UP TO J - 22 15% -15% -15%
PUMPS - FUEL - NEW

BRAND
NO BID NAPA AC DELCO 

MOTORCRAFT AC DELCO AIRTEX

PER CENT DISCOUNT NO BID J - 13 10% -20% -15%
PUMPS WATER NEW

BRAND
NO BID NAPA AC DELCO 

MOTORCRAFT AC DELCO A1 SELECT

PER CENT DISCOUNT NO BID J - 10 10% -20% -18%



BID TABULATION - AUTOMOTIVE PARTS AND SUPPLIES

AUTOMOTIVE PARTS    
& SUPPLIES             

BID OPENING            
04-13-10

CHROMATE 
INDUSTRIAL 

CORP

AUTO            
TIRE & PARTS 

FACTORY 
MOTOR 
PARTS

PEVELY 
PLAZA AUTO 

PARTS

HILLSBORO 
AUTO PARTS

PUMPS WATER REBULT

BRAND NO BID NAPA AL CARDONE 
AC DELCO CARDONE A-1

PER CENT DISCOUNT NO BID J - 10 10% -10% -10%
RUBBER PRODUCTS

BRAND NO BID NAPA GATES IDEAL         
AC DELCO AC DELCO GATES & 

DAYCO
PER CENT DISCOUNT NO BID J - 14 10% -20% -10%
SHOCK ABSORBERS

BRAND

NO BID NAPA
KYB           

AC DELCO 
MOTORCRAFT

KYB MONROE

PER CENT DISCOUNT NO BID J - 12 10% -15% -15%
SPARK PLUGS

BRAND
NO BID CHAMPION AC DELCO 

MOTORCRAFT AC DELCO AC

PER CENT DISCOUNT NO BID J - 15 10% -15% -10%
BRAND NO BID N/A N/A N/A CHAMPION

PER CENT DISCOUNT NO BID N/A N/A N/A -15%
TRANSMISSION

BRAND NO BID ATP NO BID ATP ATP
PER CENT DISCOUNT NO BID J - 18 NO BID -15% -10%

U-JOINTS
BRAND NO BID NAPA AC DELCO AC DELCO PRECISION

PER CENT DISCOUNT NO BID J - 2 UP TO J - 12 10% -20% -10%
BRAKES

1 SET SS-7574-X
BRAND NO BID NAPA BENDIX WAGNER RAYBESTOS

NUMBER NO BID SS-7574X MKD699 ZX699 PGD699M
LIST PRICE NO BID $80.99 $99.86 $38.49 $99.16

LESS DISCOUNT NO BID 61.3% 54% 20% 60%
NET AMOUNT NO BID $31.32 $45.93 $30.79 $39.66

1 SET SS-8269-X
BRAND NO BID NAPA WAGNER RAYBESTOS

NUMBER NO BID SS-8269X ZX1159 PGD1159C
LIST PRICE NO BID $92.99 $43.90 $113.16

LESS DISCOUNT NO BID 61.3% 20% 60%
NET AMOUNT NO BID $35.96 $34.79 $45.26

1 SET SS-7950-X
BRAND NO BID NAPA WAGNER RAYBESTOS

NUMBER NO BID SS-7950X ZP1047 PGD843M
LIST PRICE NO BID $77.99 $43.49 $63.70

LESS DISCOUNT NO BID 61.3% 20% 60%
NET AMOUNT NO BID $30.16 $34.79 $41.48

MUFFLER .

BRAND NO BID NAPA N/A WALKER WALKER 
DYNO MAX

NUMBER NO BID 733-5794 N/A 21406 17792
LIST PRICE NO BID $5.99 N/A $103.19 $221.00

LESS DISCOUNT NO BID 61.4% N/A 20% -60%
NET AMOUNT NO BID $2.31 N/A $82.55 $88.40

CLUTCH
ORGANIC LINING

BRAND NO BID MBI AMS PRECISION

NO DIRECT 
COST

NO DIRECT 
COST

NO DIRECT 



BID TABULATION - AUTOMOTIVE PARTS AND SUPPLIES

AUTOMOTIVE PARTS    
& SUPPLIES             

BID OPENING            
04-13-10

CHROMATE 
INDUSTRIAL 

CORP

AUTO            
TIRE & PARTS 

FACTORY 
MOTOR 
PARTS

PEVELY 
PLAZA AUTO 

PARTS

HILLSBORO 
AUTO PARTS

NUMBER NO BID RC1086604X 185139 CD5139
LIST PRICE NO BID $483.45 $185.00 $190.00

LESS DISCOUNT NO BID 46.7% 15% 50%
NET AMOUNT NO BID $257.69 $157.25 $95.00

CERAMIC BUTTONS
BRAND NO BID MBI AMS PRECISION

NUMBER NO BID RC1686607X 185139CB CD5139CB
LIST PRICE NO BID $459.05 $209.50 $230.00

LESS DISCOUNT NO BID 46.7% 15% 50%
NET AMOUNT NO BID $244.67 $178.08 $115.00
OIL FILTER

BRAND NO BID NAPA HASTINGS WIX WIX
NUMBER NO BID 7744XD LF597 57744 57744

LIST PRICE NO BID $107.09 $104.95 $44.27 $88.54
LESS DISCOUNT NO BID 84.5% 55% 37% 75%

NET AMOUNT NO BID $16.60 $47.21 $27.89 $22.13
BATTERIES

BRAND NO BID BAT AC DELCO AC DELCO ELLIS
NUMBER NO BID 7236 31-900 CT ACP31TS HD31

LIST PRICE NO BID $149.59 $146.21 $86.18 $125.95
LESS DISCOUNT NO BID 61% 39% 25% 30%

NET AMOUNT NO BID $58.34 $89.19 $64.62 $88.17
TRANSMISSION

BRAND NO BID ATP MOTORCRAFT ATP WIX

NUMBER NO BID 1-9751 FT105 B144 58955
LIST PRICE NO BID $26.54 $35.78 $19.94 $38.42

LESS DISCOUNT NO BID 65% 50% 15% 75%
NET AMOUNT NO BID $9.24 $17.89 $16.95 $9.60
OIL FILTER

BRAND NO BID NAPA AC DELCO WIX WIX
NUMBER NO BID 1522 PF61E 51522 51522

LIST PRICE NO BID $11.24 $13.13 $6.60 $13.20
LESS DISCOUNT NO BID 84% 58% 37% 70%

NET AMOUNT NO BID $1.81 $5.51 $4.16 $3.96
BRAND NO BID N/A N/A N/A 618

NUMBER NO BID N/A N/A N/A 51522
LIST PRICE NO BID N/A N/A N/A $4.44

LESS DISCOUNT NO BID N/A N/A N/A 60%
NET AMOUNT NO BID N/A N/A N/A $1.77
AIR FILTERS

BRAND NO BID NAPA HASTINGS WIX WIX
NUMBER NO BID 6870 AF2357 46870 46870

LIST PRICE NO BID $137.99 $139.64 $67.88 $135.76
LESS DISCOUNT NO BID 85% 55% 37% 65%

NET AMOUNT NO BID $20.36 $62.83 $42.76 $47.52

AFFIDAVIT COMPLETED N/A NO YES YES YES
COPY OF INSURANCE 

PROVIDED N/A NO NO NO NO

COMMENTS:

NO DIRECT 
COST

COST


