
BID TABULATION - POLICE CANINES

POLICE CANINES                              
BID OPENING                                  

1-19-10

VON DER HAUS GILL           
KENNEL 1 VOHNE LICHE KENNELS INC

TOTAL COST OF NATCOTICS AND 
DANGEROUS DRUGS CANINES PER 

SPECIFICATIONS AND HANDLER TRAINING
$9,100.00 NO BID

TOTAL COST OF PATROL CANINES PER 
SPECIFICATIONS AND HANDLER TRAINING

$9,400.00 NO BID

DISCOUNTS IF MORE THAN ONE IS 
PURCHASED

1% IF 2 OR MORE CANINES 
PURCHASED ON 1 PURCHASE 

ORDER
NO BID

DUAL PURPOSE (PATROL / NARCOTICS 
CANINE AND HANDLER TRAINING)

$11,200.00 NO BID

DORMITORY FEES FOR 6 WEEKS CLASS FOR 
HANDLER (ON SITE AND PRIVATE INCLUDES 2 

MEALS A DAY, 5 DAYS A WEEK)
$2,000.00 NO BID

GUARANTEE
2 YRS HIPS / HEALTH AND       

WORK ABILITY ON ALL         
TRAINED CANINES

NO BID

AIRPORT TRIP CHARGES

DETROIT $275.00 NO BID

COLUMBUS $275.00 NO BID

CINCINNATI $300.00 NO BID

DAYTON $250.00 NO BID

INDIANAPOLIS $400.00 NO BID

VET TRIP CHARGES

HEALTH CERTIFICATE LOCALLY $75.00 NO BID

VET TRIP LOCALLY $25.00 NO BID

HEALTH CERTIFICATE OUT OF TOWN VET $100.00 NO BID

VET TRIP OUT OF TOWN $50.00 NO BID

RABIES $45.00 NO BID

CRATE TRIP FEES

500 SERIES VARI KENNELS USED (1 TIME ONLY 
FROM GERMANY) $75.00 NO BID

500 SERIES VARI KENNELS FIBERGLASS, OR 
USED MORE THAN 1 TIME

$55.00                          
1 INCLUDED AT NO CHARGE 

WITH THE DOG IF YOU ATTEND 
OUR ACADEMY

NO BID

AFFIDAVIT COMPLETED YES N/A

COPY OF INSURANCE PROVIDED NO N/A


