
BID TABULATION - BITUMINOUS MATERIAL 2012

BITUMINOUS MATERIAL                                                                  
BID OPENING                                             

12-27-11

PACE 
CONSTRUCTION  

1620 WOODSON RD  
ST LOUIS MO        

63114               

MISSOURI 
PETROLEUM             

1620 WOODSON RD   
ST LOUIS MO                 

63114

COASTAL ENERGY               
PO BOX 218           

WILLOW SPRINGS 
MO                       

65793             

NB WEST 
CONTRACTING CO    

2780 MARY AVE         
BRENTWOOD MO           

63144

LEAD BELT 
MATERIALS CO           

PO BOX 607             
PARK HILLS MO  

63601

SIMPSON 
CONSTRUCTION 

MATERIALS                
PO BOX 250                  

VALLEY PARK MO         
63088     

MINERAL AREA 
ASPHALT LLC             

PO BOX 637       
FESTUS MO                

63028

FRED WEBER INC                       
2320 CREVE 

COEUR MILL RD              
MARYLAND 
HEIGHTS MO              

63043

Liquid Bituminous                                         
Material  Cost Per Gal. 

Delivered
MC-30 NO BID $3.48 $3.26 $3.19 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

MC-3000 NO BID $3.14 $3.05 $2.85 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
CRS-2 NO BID $2.08 $2.14 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

CRS-2P NO BID $2.55 $2.40 $2.35 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
SS-1H NO BID $2.08 $2.25 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

HFE-150 NO BID $2.28 $2.30 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
 Liquid Bituminous                                                

Material  Cost Per Gal. Bulk
MC-30 NO BID $3.35 $3.06 $3.10 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

MC-3000 NO BID $3.01 $2.85 $2.76 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
CRS-2 NO BID $1.95 $2.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

5 gallon Bucket of CRS-2 NO BID NO BID $40.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
CRS-2P NO BID $2.42 $2.30 $2.27 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
SS-1H NO BID $1.95 $2.05 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

5 gallon Bucket of SS-1H $32.00 $25.00 $40.00 $30.00 NO BID $44.00 NO BID $7.00
HFE-150 NO BID $2.15 $2.20 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

 Cold Mix                                                                               
Cost Per Ton - Plant Pick-up $75.00 NO BID NO BID $62.00 $48.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID

Modified Cold Mix                                                       
Cost Per Ton - Plant Pick-up NO BID NO BID NO BID $100.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID $99.50

Hot Mix                                                                         
Cost Per Ton - Plant Pick-up $51.25 NO BID NO BID $45.00 $47.50 $46.00 $46.25 $48.00 

(FESTUS)

Haul Chart                                                             
Cold Mix Stock Pile

0-5 $4.90 NO BID NO BID $3.50 $3.80 NO BID NO BID $4.00
5-10 $5.40 NO BID NO BID $4.25 $4.60 NO BID NO BID $4.50
10-15 $5.90 NO BID NO BID $4.90 $5.25 NO BID NO BID $5.00
15-20 $6.40 NO BID NO BID $5.75 $6.25 NO BID NO BID $5.50
20-25 $6.90 NO BID NO BID $6.35 $7.50 NO BID NO BID $6.00
25-30 $7.25 NO BID NO BID $6.85 $7.90 NO BID NO BID $6.50
30-35 $7.75 NO BID NO BID $7.30 $8.20 NO BID NO BID $7.00
35-40 $8.15 NO BID NO BID $7.90 $8.70 NO BID NO BID $7.50
40-45 $8.65 NO BID NO BID $8.50 $9.20 NO BID NO BID $8.00
45-50 $9.15 NO BID NO BID $9.00 $9.80 NO BID NO BID $8.50
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12-27-11

PACE 
CONSTRUCTION  

1620 WOODSON RD  
ST LOUIS MO        

63114               

MISSOURI 
PETROLEUM             

1620 WOODSON RD   
ST LOUIS MO                 

63114

COASTAL ENERGY               
PO BOX 218           

WILLOW SPRINGS 
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65793             

NB WEST 
CONTRACTING CO    

2780 MARY AVE         
BRENTWOOD MO           

63144

LEAD BELT 
MATERIALS CO           

PO BOX 607             
PARK HILLS MO  
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SIMPSON 
CONSTRUCTION 
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MINERAL AREA 
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2320 CREVE 
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MARYLAND 
HEIGHTS MO              

63043

50+ $0.50 NO BID NO BID $9.00 +$.10 $0.35 NO BID NO BID $9.00

 Haul Chart                                                                
Hot Mix Job Site

0-5 $4.90 NO BID NO BID $3.50 $3.80 NO BID $3.60 $4.00
5-10 $5.40 NO BID NO BID $4.25 $4.60 NO BID $4.45 $4.50
10-15 $5.90 NO BID NO BID $4.90 $5.25 NO BID $5.05 $5.00
15-20 $6.40 NO BID NO BID $5.75 $6.25 NO BID $6.10 $5.50
20-25 $6.90 NO BID NO BID $6.35 $7.50 NO BID $7.30 $6.00
25-30 $7.25 NO BID NO BID $6.85 $7.90 NO BID $7.55 $6.50
30-35 $7.75 NO BID NO BID $7.30 $8.20 NO BID $7.70 $7.00
35-40 $8.15 NO BID NO BID $7.90 $8.70 NO BID $8.55 $7.50
40-45 $8.65 NO BID NO BID $8.50 $9.20 NO BID $9.05 $8.00
45-50 $9.15 NO BID NO BID $9.00 $9.80 NO BID $9.65 $8.50

+50 $0.50 NO BID NO BID $9.00 +$.10 $0.35 NO BID $0.29 $9.00

Prices Firm Until 4/1/12 THEN MONTH 
TO MONTH

MONTH TO MONTH

2/16/13 UNLESS 
SUPPLIERS ARE 
ALLOWED TO                     

RESUBMIT PRICING

3/1/12  MONTH TO MONTH 4/1/11 4/30/11 4/30/12

AFFIDAVIT COMPLETED YES YES YES YES YES YES YES YES
COPY OF INSURANCE PROVIDED YES YES YES YES YES YES YES YES

COMMENTS: 15 TONS MIN 18 MIN HAUL
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