BID TABULATION - CHANNEL POST 2012

CHANNEL POST
BID OPENING
12-27-11

MIDWEST
CONSTRUCTION
SERVICES &
PRODUCTS
516 N MAIN
DESOTO MO
63020

VULCAN INC
PO BOX 1850
FOLEY AL
36536

J & ATRAFFIC
PRODUCTS
790 W 40 HWY
BLUE SPRINGS
MO
64015

CUSTOM
PRODUCTS CORP.
PO BOX 54091
JACKSON MS
39288

HALL SIGNS
4495 W VERNAL
BLOOMINGTON IN
47404

NATIONAL SIGN
Co.
PO BOX 25
OTTAWA KS
66067

FRANKLIN
INDUSTRIES CO.
PO BOX 671
FRANKLIN PA
16323

COMADE INC
1920 E WARNER
SANTA ANA CA

92705

PRICE TO REMAIN IN EFFECT
UNTIL

AFFIDAVIT COMPLETED

30 DAYS FIRM

YES

90 DAYS

YES

12/31/12

YES

6/30/12

YES

NO BID

2/18/13

YES

5'PRICE PER POST 500 $7.25 $5.84 $7.70 $6.85 NO BID $7.36 $5.32 $7.80
5'PRICE PER POST 1,000 $7.25 $5.46 $6.65 $6.70 NO BID $6.90 $5.32 $7.80
7 1/2' PRICE PER POST 1,000 $9.38 $8.76 $11.55 $10.13 NO BID $11.04 $7.98 $11.10
7 1/2' PRICE PER POST 2,000 $9.38 $8.19 $9.98 $10.00 NO BID $10.35 $7.98 $11.10
10' PRICE PER POST 100 $13.13 $11.68 $13.30 $13.50 NO BID $14.72 $10.64 $14.80
10' PRICE PER POST 500 $13.13 $10.93 $15.40 $13.45 NO BID $13.80 $10.64 $14.80

90 DAYS

YES

12/31/12

YES

COPY OF INSURANCE
PROVIDED

COMMENTS:

NO

NO

NO

PRICING BASED ON
40,000 LBS
SHIPMENT

YES
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