
BID TABULATION - CRUSHED STONE - TRAP ROCK 2012

JOERLING BROS. 
TRUCKING INC.

BOBBY HOELSCHER 
TRUCKING INC

BOBBY HOELSCHER 
TRUCKING INC        

2ND BID                           

IRON MOUNTAIN TRAP 
ROCK

PO BOX 215                                
NEW MELL MO                        

63365       

24477 WINDY LN                                                                                
WARRENTON MO                                                  

63383-3440

24477 WINDY LN                                                                                
WARRENTON MO                                                  

63383-3440

11366 STATE RD CC         
FESTUS MO                         

63028

2320 CREVE COEUR MILL RD           
MARYLAND HEIGHTS MO              

63043-8501                          

3/8" TRAP ROCK                                             
COST PER TON N/A NO BID NO BID N/A $10.75 - (IMTR #41)         

$9.75 - (IMTR #42)

HAUL CHART                                                       
ADD ON PRICE PER TON

0-5 $3.00 - - $3.00 $3.00
5-10 $3.45 - - $3.50 $3.50
10-15 $3.95 - - $4.00 $4.00
15-20 $4.70 - - $4.50 $4.50
20-25 $5.70 - - $5.00 $5.00
25-30 $6.45 - - $5.50 $5.50
30-35 $7.55 - - $6.00 $6.00
35-40 $8.75 - - $6.50 $6.50
40-45 $9.00 $7.55 EAST $8.75 EAST $7.00 $7.00
45-50 $9.90 - - $7.50 $7.50
50-55 $10.45 $9.55 WEST - $8.00 $8.00
55-60 $10.95 - - - NO BID
60-65 $11.35 - $10.75 WEST - NO BID
65-70 $11.95 $11.65 NORTH - - NO BID
70-75 $12.50 - - - NO BID

OVER 75 MILES $13.00 - $12.85 NORTH - NO BID
                                   PRICES EXPIRE ON - 3/31/13 3/31/13 N/A 4/1/2013

AFFIDAVIT COMPLETED YES YES YES YES YES

COPY OF INSURANCE PROVIDED YES YES YES YES YES

COMMENTS: HAUL RATES FROM IRON MTN. 
TRAP ROCK TO THE LOCATIONS

HAUL RATES FROM 
GRANITEVILLE QUARRY TO 

THE LOCATIONS

HAUL TO WEST SHED - $11.00                 
HAUL TO EAST SHED - $9.50              

HAUL TO NORTH SHED + $12.50

                                                                
TRAP ROCK 2012                                                     

BID OPENING                                                         
12-27-11

KA PAZDERA 
HAULING & EXCAV            
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