BID TABULATION - CRUSHED STONE AND GRAVEL 2012

WINTERS FRED WEBER INC
: PO BOX 215 MATERIAL CO. 322 N HWY 67 3224 N HWY 67 5000 BUSSEN RD 6800 ANTIRE QUARRY RD 12520 STATE RD 21 10200 HWY C PO BOX 69 11866 STATE RD CC PO BOX 250 MILL RD
BID OPENING NEW MELLE MO | P08 GRAVOISRD | opyssanTMO | FLORISSANT MO STLOUISMO EUREKA MO PEVELY MO DESOTO MO HiLLsBoroMo | MPERIALMO FESTUS MO VALLEY PARK MO | VARYLAND
192711 jiopn STLOUIS MO pre pre 63129 63025 fomf b P 63052 63028 A HEIGHTS MO
127 63043
CLEAN STONE
Cost per Ton
1/4" - N/A - - $10.80 $10.80 $8.80 - - - - N/A NO BID
3/8" - N/A $10.45 $8.75 $10.80 $10.80 $8.80 - $9.50 - - N/A $13.00
1/2" - N/A $10.45 - $10.80 $10.80 $8.80 - - - - N/A $14.00
3/4" - N/A $9.40 - $8.70 $8.70 $8.20 $7.95 $8.00 - - $8.25 $8.00
1" - N/A $9.40 $6.90 $8.70 $8.70 $8.20 $7.95 $8.00 - - $8.25 $8.00
11/4" - N/A - - $8.70 $8.70 $8.20 - - - - N/A NO BID
112" - N/A - - $7.50 $7.50 $6.90 - - - - N/A $7.50
13/4" - N/A - - $7.50 $7.50 $6.90 - - - - N/A NO BID
2" - N/A $8.70 $6.90 $7.50 $7.50 $6.90 $6.75 $7.50 - - $7.25 $6.75
3" - N/A - $6.90 $7.50 $7.50 $6.90 - - - - N/A $6.75
4" - N/A - - $7.50 $7.50 $6.90 $6.75 - - - N/A $6.75
5" - N/A - - $7.50 $7.50 $6.90 - - - - $8.50 NO BID
6" - N/A $8.70 $9.35 $7.50 $7.50 $6.90 - - - - N/A NO BID
MINUS
Cost per Ton
1/4" - N/A $3.25 $3.20 $1.00 $1.00 $1.00 $2.50 - - - $2.50 NO BID
3/8" - N/A $4.85 - $5.20 $5.20 $4.90 - $3.50 - - $2.50 NO BID
1/2" - N/A - - $5.20 $5.20 $4.90 - $3.50 - - N/A $4.50
3/4" - N/A $5.40 - $5.20 $5.20 $4.90 $4.95 $6.00 - - $4.65 $4.50
1" - N/A $5.40 - $5.20 $5.20 $4.90 $4.95 $6.00 - - $4.65 $4.50
11/4" - N/A - - $5.20 $5.20 $4.90 - - - - N/A NO BID
112" - N/A - - $5.20 $5.20 $4.90 - - - - N/A $4.50
2" - N/A $5.40 - $5.20 $5.20 $4.90 $4.95 $6.00 - - $4.65 $4.50
2 12" - N/A - - $5.20 $5.20 $4.90 - - - - N/A NO BID
3" - N/A $5.55 - $5.20 $5.20 $4.90 $4.95 $6.00 - - N/A $4.50
4" - N/A - - $5.20 $5.20 $4.90 $4.95 - - - N/A $4.50
1/2 - 4 Minus Backfill - N/A - - $5.20 $5.20 $4.90 $4.95 $6.00 - - $2.50 NO BID

COMMENTS:




BID TABULATION - CRUSHED STONE AND GRAVEL 2012

WINTERS FRED WEBER INC
: PO BOX 215 MATERIAL CO. 3224 N HWY 67 3224 N HWY 67 5000 BUSSEN RD 6800 ANTIRE QUARRY RD 12520 STATE RD 21 10200 HWY C PO BOX 69 11866 STATE RD CC PO BOX 250 MILL RD
BID OPENING NEW MELLE MO | P0BGRAVOISRD |0 opissanTMO | FLORISSANT MO STLOUISMO EUREKA MO PEVELY MO DESOTO MO HiLLsBoroMo | MPERIAL MO FESTUS MO VALLEY PARK MO |~ VARYLAND
192711 jiopn ST LOUIS MO pre pre 63129 63025 fomif b P 63052 63028 A HEIGHTS MO
63127 63043
MAC
Cost per Ton
1/4" - N/A - - $10.80 $10.80 $8.20 - - - - N/A NO BID
1/2" - N/A - - $10.80 $10.80 $8.20 - - - - N/A NO BID
3/4" - N/A - - $8.70 $8.70 $8.20 - - - - $8.25 NO BID
1" - N/A - - $8.70 $8.70 $8.20 - - - - $8.25 NO BID
2" - N/A - - $7.50 $7.50 $6.90 - - - - $7.25 NO BID
3" - N/A - - $7.50 $7.50 $6.90 - - - - N/A NO BID
3X 10 - N/A - - $10.25 $10.25 - - - - - N/A NO BID
OTHER
Cost Per Ton NIA )
3X 10 - N/A - - $10.25 $10.25 - - - - - N/A NO BID
SHOT ROCK N/A - - $3.75 $3.75 $3.75 $4.75 $5.00 - - $5.75 $5.00
GABION ROCK - N/A - - $10.25 $10.25 - $9.95 $11.00 - - $5.75 $12.00
QUARRY RUN - N/A $5.25 $4.40 $3.75 $3.75 $3.75 $4.75 $5.00 - - $5.75 $5.00
DIRTY STONE - N/A - - $2.75 $2.50 $2.75 - - - - N/A NO BID
DIRT - N/A - - - - - - $6.00 $6.00 - N/A NO BID
SAND - N/A - - $5.40 - - - $11.00 $13.00 - N/A $6.10
DIRTY STONE - N/A - - $2.50 $2.50 $2.75 - - - - N/A NO BID
FILTER ROCK - N/A - - $7.50 $7.50 $6.90 - - - - N/A NO BID
DIRTY SHOT ROCK - N/A $4.00 $4.00 $2.50 $2.50 $2.75 $3.50 - - - $5.75 $5.00
BLANKET ROCK N/A $13.35 $13.35 $11.50 $11.50 $11.50 $9.95 $11.00 - - N/A NO BID
4 X 6 CLEAN - N/A - - $10.25 $10.25 $11.50 - - - - N/A NO BID
GRAVEL PRODUCTS
P-GRAVEL - $8.60 - - NO BID NO BID NO BID - $9.50 $8.50 - $8.20 NO BID
SCREENED GRAVEL - N/A - - NO BID NO BID NO BID - - - - NIA NO BID
CREEK GRAVEL - N/A - - NO BID NO BID NO BID - - $4.00 - N/A NO BID
B-GRAVEL - $13.50 - - NO BID NO BID NO BID - $7.50 $7.50 - $12.50 NO BID
C-GRAVEL - 59.45 - - NO BID NO BID NO BID - $11.00 $13.00 - $8.90 NO BID
CONCRETE ROCK - N/A - - NO BID NO BID NO BID - - $13.00 - N/A NO BID
FILTER SAND } N/A - - NO BID NO BID NO BID - - - - $9.50 NO BID
SAND - $9.70 - - NO BID NO BID NO BID - $11.00 $13.00 - $9.50 NO BID
$11.00 Pulverized $6.00 Top soil
DIRT - $8.00 Bank Run - - NO BID NO BID NO BID - $6.00 $4.00 Fill dirt - $5.00 NO BID
BLANKET ROCK - N/A - - NO BID NO BID NO BID - $11.00 - - N/A NO BID
SHOT ROCK - N/A - - NO BID NO BID NO BID - $5.00 - - N/A NO BID
3 X 10 CLEAN - N/A - - NO BID NO BID NO BID - - - - N/A NO BID
4 X 6 CLEAN - N/A - - NO BID NO BID NO BID - - $8.00 - N/A NO BID




BID TABULATION - CRUSHED STONE AND GRAVEL 2012

WINTERS

FRED WEBER INC

e s | Tuckine | 2ROTERS | “coarona | comomsemi | SR | ATREQLRY Moo | come | wareaisi |MSSSESRVEL | arae | Sirials | 28T coen
. PO BOX 215 3224 N HWY 67 3224 N HWY 67 QUARRY RD 12520 STATE RD 21 10200 HWY C PO BOX 250
BID OPENING NEW MELLE MO 13098 GRAVOIS RD FLORISSANT MO FLORISSANT MO STLOUISMO EUREKA MO PEVELY MO DESOTO MO HILLSBORO MO IMPERIAL MO FESTUS MO VALLEY PARK MO MARYLAND
12-27-11 63365 ST LOUIS MO 63033 63033 63129 63025 63070 63020 63050 63052 63028 63088 HEIGHTS MO
63127 63043
HAUL CHART
STOCK PILE
DELIVERY
0-5 $3.40 $4.55 $3.35 $3.35 $3.60 $3.60 $3.20 $3.00 $3.00 $3.00 $3.00 N/A $3.00
5-10 $3.95 $4.55 $3.95 $3.95 $4.00 $4.00 $3.60 $3.50 $3.50 $3.50 $3.50 N/A $3.50
10-15 $4.45 $5.45 $4.75 $4.75 $4.50 $4.50 $4.10 $4.00 $4.00 $4.00 $4.00 N/A $4.00
15-20 $4.95 $5.70 - - $5.00 $5.00 $4.80 $4.75 $4.50 $4.50 $4.50 N/A $4.50
20-25 $5.50 $6.10 - - $5.50 $5.50 $5.30 $5.75 $5.00 $5.00 $5.00 N/A $5.00
25-30 $6.50 $8.15 - - $5.90 $5.90 $6.00 $6.50 - $5.50 $5.50 N/A $5.50
30-35 $8.00 $9.20 - - $6.50 $6.50 $6.70 $7.75 - $6.00 $6.00 N/A $6.00
35-40 $9.50 $10.05 - - $7.00 $7.00 $7.40 $8.75 - $6.50 $6.50 N/A $6.50
40-45 $10.50 $10.85 - - $8.00 $8.00 $8.00 $9.75 - $7.00 $7.00 N/A $7.00
45-50 $11.50 $11.95 - - $9.00 $9.00 $8.70 $10.75 - $7.50 $7.50 N/A $7.50
+50 $12.50 CALL - - - - - $12.00+ - $8.00 $8.00 N/A $8.00
ADD ON
PRICE ON SITE
DELIVERY
0-5 $3.90 $4.55 $3.35 $3.35 $3.60 $3.60 $3.20 $3.00 $3.50 $3.00 - N/A $3.00
5-10 $4.45 $4.55 $3.95 $3.95 $4.00 $4.00 $3.60 $3.50 $4.00 $3.50 - N/A $3.50
10-15 $4.95 $5.45 $4.75 $4.75 $4.50 $4.50 $4.10 $4.00 $4.50 $4.00 - N/A $4.00
15-20 $5.45 $5.70 - - $5.00 $5.00 $4.80 $4.75 $5.00 $4.50 - N/A $4.50
20-25 $6.00 $6.10 - - $5.50 $5.50 $5.30 $5.75 $5.50 $5.00 - N/A $5.00
25-30 $7.00 $8.15 - - $5.90 $5.90 $6.00 $6.50 - $5.50 - N/A $5.50
30-35 $8.50 $9.20 - - $6.50 $6.50 $6.70 $7.75 - $6.00 - N/A $6.00
35-40 $10.00 $10.05 - - $7.00 $7.00 $7.40 $8.75 - $6.50 - N/A $6.50
40-45 $10.75 $10.85 - - $8.00 $8.00 $8.00 $9.75 - $7.00 - N/A $7.00
45-50 $11.75 $11.95 - - $9.00 $9.00 $8.70 $10.75 - $7.50 - N/A $7.50
+50 $13.00 CALL - - - - - $12.00+ - $8.00 - N/A $8.00
PEORNF OE:\IOIA_II;SED West shed - $3.40
COMMENTS East shed - $3.00
FOR SHOT ROCK, North shed - $4.00
GABION, OR RIP
AFFIDAVIT
COMPLETED YES YES YES YES YES YES YES YES YES YES YES YES YES
COPY OF INSURANCE YES YES YES YES YES YES YES YES YES YES YES YES YES

PROVIDED
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