
BID TABULATION - HYDRAULIC AND ELECTRICAL PARTS AND SUPPLIES 2012

HYDRAULIC & ELECTRICAL                              
PARTS & SUPPLIES 2012                                                                   

BID OPENING                                             
12-27-11

NOWACK COMPANY     
301 E CLINTON                  

GRAFTON IL                  
62037

CERTIFIED POWER INC      
4035 FEE FEE RD               
BRIDGETON MO                

63044

JGB ENTERPRISES INC            
115 METROPOLITAN DR     

LIVERPOOL NY                      
13088

HYDRAULIC MOTORS
CHAR-LYNN 30% 10% NO BID

WHITE HYDRAULICS 30% 36% NO BID
 PTO DRIVE LINES NO BID

CHELSEA 50% 40% NO BID

SPICER 50% 45% NO BID
 PUMPS, VALVES & MOTORS

COMMERCIAL 30% 20% NO BID

EATON 30% 10% NO BID

GRESEN HYDRAULICS 40% 30% NO BID

PRINCE 25% 36% NO BID

REXROTH 25% 36% NO BID

SUNSTRAND 25% 5% NO BID

VICKERS 20% 5% NO BID
 HOSE & FITTINGS

GATES 60% N/A NO BID

WEATHERHEAD 50% 76% NO BID
 CABLE

MORSE CONTROLS 25% 10% NO BID
 COMPUTER CONTROLS

STORM GUARD 20% 10% NO BID

HYDRAULIC PUMP
# P30-A342 X LAB15 JCH MOD. 1 - 1/2" 

GEAR BRAND - COMMERCIAL 
SHEARING
LIST PRICE $575.00 $575.82 NO BID

LESS DISCOUNT 30% 10% NO BID

NET AMOUNT $402.50 $518.23 NO BID

CONTROL VALVE

# V20-0-4-4-4 BRAND GRESSEN 
HYDRAULICS

LIST $903.00 $903.00 NO BID

LESS DISCOUNT 40% 30% NO BID

NET AMOUNT $541.80 $632.10 NO BID

COPUTER CONTROLS
GL400-JCH BRAND - STORM GUARD NO BID

LIST PRICE $2,450.00 $2,450.00 NO BID

LESS DISCOUNT 20% 10% NO BID

NET AMOUNT $1,960.00 $2,205.00 NO BID

# DMC-IA-JC SET WIRE HARNESS 
BRAND - STORM GUARD NO BID

LIST PRICE $1,007.00 $1,007.00 NO BID

LESS DISCOUNT 25% 10% NO BID

NET AMOUNT $755.25 $906.30 NO BID



BID TABULATION - HYDRAULIC AND ELECTRICAL PARTS AND SUPPLIES 2012

HYDRAULIC & ELECTRICAL                              
PARTS & SUPPLIES 2012                                                                   

BID OPENING                                             
12-27-11

NOWACK COMPANY     
301 E CLINTON                  

GRAFTON IL                  
62037

CERTIFIED POWER INC      
4035 FEE FEE RD               
BRIDGETON MO                

63044

JGB ENTERPRISES INC            
115 METROPOLITAN DR     

LIVERPOOL NY                      
13088

HOSE & FITTINGS

# 8C2AT (SAE100R2AT) BRAND - 
GATES HOSE & RUBBER

LIST PRICE $8.53 $10.95 $8.15

LESS DISCOUNT 60% 76% 65%

NET AMOUNT $3.41 $2.62 $2.85

# 8-8MP FITTING BRAND - GATES 
HOSE & RUBBER

LIST PRICE $3.89 $7.63 N/A

LESS DISCOUNT 60% 76% N/A

NET AMOUNT $1.55 $1.83 $2.60

# 8PC1FA BRAND - GATES HOSE & 
RUBBER

LIST PRICE $5.32 N/A $1.81

LESS DISCOUNT 60% N/A 10%

NET AMOUNT $2.12 N/A $1.63

# 12MP-12FPX ADAPTOR BRAND - 
GATES HOSE & RUBBER

LIST PRICE $5.15 $9.26 $5.35

LESS DISCOUNT 60% 76% 46%

NET AMOUNT $2.06 $2.22 $2.88

# 8MP-8FPX 90 BRAND - GATES HOSE 
& RUBBER

LIST PRICE $5.44 $10.82 $6.01

LESS DISCOUNT 60% 76% 46%

NET AMOUNT $2.17 $2.60 $3.26

HYDRAULIC MOTOR

# RS 0301210 BRAND - WHITE 
HYDRAULICS

LIST PRICE $774.00 $774.60 NO BID

LESS DISCOUNT 30% 36% NO BID

NET AMOUNT $541.80 $495.74 NO BID

AFFIDAVIT COMPLETED YES YES YES

COPY OF INSURANCE PROVIDED NO NO YES

COMMENTS:

All gates hose equipment 
for shops and service trucks 

furnished at no cost to 
Jefferson County Hwy Dept
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