JANITORIAL SUPPLIES BID TABULATION

E&R BUCKEYE CALICO EARTH ALL
INDUSTRIAL INDUSTRIAL ;}:)PYE':LS XPEDX CLEANING TRONEX VAALCLUTUYJZ HP INDUSTRIES CFHRE';'\:CDlA‘ZS CENTRAL PYRAMID AMERICAN
JANITORIAL SUPPLIES | soap 722 SALES ING 1230 2099 CENTER INTERNATIONAL | AL PRODUCTS INC 585 POLY SCHOOL POLY
BID OPENING S VANDEVENTER 2635 METRO COMMERCIAL CORPORATE 44| 300 ZODIAC |INC 300 SUPPLY 4220 SAGUARO | 9045 JUNCTION HORSEPATURE CORP 2400 PRODUCTS 40 TURNER
10-18-11 AVE ph BLVD BLVD DR INDUSTRIAL CT| INTERNATIONAL |, /"0 o o TRAIL DR RD BEDLE PLACE | 6510 N 54TH ST PLACE
LOUIS MO 63110 MARYLAND HERKY MO FENTON MO MARYLAND [ MOUNT OLIVE NJ ST LOUIS MO INDIANAPOLIS IN| ANNAPOLIS VIRGINIA LINDEN NJ TAMPA FL PISCATAWAY
HIEGHTS MO 63048 63026 HEIGHTS MO 07828 53072 46268 JUNCTION MD BEAGH VA 07036 33610 NJ
63043 63043 20701 08854
23453
Item #1 - 80z Foam Cups
How Packaged 1000/ CS 1000 PER CS 1000/ CS 1000/ CS 1000/ CS - 1000/ CS 1000/ CS - - - - -
Quantity per case 1000 1000 1000 1000 1000 - 1000 1000 - - - - -
Bid Price $15.64 $16.91 $13.99 $20.25 $14.15 NO BID $14.70 $16.67 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Item #2 - Jumbo Toilet Tissue
How Packaged 12 ROLLS/CS 8RL/CS 12/CS 12/CTN 6 RL/CS - CS 12/CS - - 12 /RLS - -
Sheets per roll 2000 2000 2000 2000 2000 - 2000 1000 - - 2000 - -
Rolls per case 12 8 12 12 6 - 12 12 - - 12 - -
Bid Price $20.88 $21.08 $20.35 $23.35 $23.24 NO BID $27.06 $24.43 NO BID NO BID $28.90 NO BID NO BID
Item #3 - Small Toilet Tissue
How Packaged 96/CS 96 PER CS 96/CS 96/CS 96/CS - 96/CS 96/CS - - 96/CS - -
Sheets per roll 500 500 500 500 500 - 500 500 - - 500 - -
Rolls per case 96 96 96 96 96 - 96 96 - - 96 - -
Bid Price $31.35 $37.22 $28.05 $42.25 $32.01 NO BID $27.84 $29.34 NO BID NO BID $43.66 NO BID NO BID
Item #4 - Kitchen Towels
How Packaged 30/Cs 30 PER CS 30/Cs 30/Cs 30/Cs - 30/Cs 30/Cs - - 30/Cs - -
Sheets per roll 90 90 90 90 84 - 90 90 - - 90 - -
Quantity per case 30 30 30 30 30 - 30 30 - - 30 - -
Bid Price $19.04 $21.98 $18.10 $21.35 $22.54 NO BID $19.33 $18.54 NO BID NO BID $28.66 NO BID NO BID
Item #5 - Large Trash Bags
Bag Size 40 X 46 40 X 46 40 X 46 40 X 46 - 43 X 46 40 X 46 40 X 46 40 X 46 - 40 X 46
How packaged 250 200 BAGS/CS 250 250/ CTN - CS 10 RL 25/CS 200/CS 200 - CS
Bags per case 200 200 200 200 - 200 $200.00 200 200 - 200
Bid Price $19.26 $21.86 $17.80 $23.40 NO BID NO BID $14.98 $17.88 $15.28 NO BID $15.20 NO BID $20.51
Comments .55 MIL
Item #6 - Small Trash Bags
Bag Size 24 X 33 26 X 33 23X 33 24X 23 - 24 X 33 24 X 32 24 X 33 23X 33 - 23 X33
How packaged 1000 1000 BAGS / CS 1000 500/CTN - CS 10 RL 50/CS 1000/ CS 1000 - CS
Bags per case 1000 1000 1000 1000 - 1000 $1,000.00 1000 1000 - 1000
Bid Price $22.94 $24.78 $15.68 $8.80 NO BID NO BID $11.47 $15.45 $17.72 NO BID $15.10 NO BID $27.46
Item #7- Liquid Tide Laundry Soap
How packaged 2.5 GALLON 6 BTL/CS 2.5 GAL 150 0Z 2X - - 6-500Z/CS 6/500Z/CS - - - - -
Bid Price $175.84 $68.90 $107.56 $105.95 NO BID NO BID $59.25 $62.85 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Item #8 - Bar Hand Soap
Oz per bar 0.75 3/4 3/4 3/4 35 - 3.5 3/4 - - - - -
How packaged 1000 1000/ CS 1000 CS 1000 CTN 48 BRS/ CS - 4 BRS/PK 1000 - - - - -
Bars per case 1000 1000 1000 - 48 - - 1000 - - - - -
Bid Price $45.00 $83.00 $67.15 $43.55 $63.15 NO BID $39.50 $81.50 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Item #9 - Single Fold Towels
Sheet size 9X10 9 X 10 9 X 10 9 X 10 9X 10 - 9X 10 9 X10 - - 9 X 10 - -
How packaged 4000 15/CS CS 16 CTN 16 RL/CS - CS 16 /250/CS - - 12 - -
Sheets per package 16 PKG / 250 - 268 250 250 - 4000 250 - - 334 - -
Packages per case 15 15 15 15 16 - 15 16 - - 15 - -
Bid Price $16.24 $17.90 $15.10 $18.65 $16.20 NO BID $16.45 $14.90 NO BID NO BID $19.55 NO BID NO BID




JANITORIAL SUPPLIES BID TABULATION

E&R BUCKEYE CALICO EARTH ALL
INDUSTRIAL INDUSTRIAL ;AOPYE':LS XPEDX CLEANING TRONEX \'/L\"ALCLUTUYJZ HP INDUSTRIES CFHREIE\:CDlA‘ZS CENTRAL PYRAMID AMERICAN
JANITORIAL SUPPLIES | soap 722 SALES ING 1230 2099 CENTER INTERNATIONAL JANITORIAL PRODUCTS INC 2585 POLY SCHOOL POLY
BID OPENING S VANDEVENTER 2635 METRO COMMERGIAL CORPORATE 44| 300 ZODIAC |INC 300 SUPPLY 4220 SAGUARO | 9045 JUNCTION HORSEPATURE CORP 2400 PRODUCTS 40 TURNER
10-18-11 AVE ph BLVD BLVD DR INDUSTRIAL CT| INTERNATIONAL 10678 TRENTON TRAIL DR RD BEDLE PLACE | 6510 N 54TH ST PLACE
LOUIS MO 63110 MARYLAND HERKY MO FENTON MO MARYLAND [ MOUNT OLIVE NJ ST LOUIS MO INDIANAPOLIS IN| ANNAPOLIS VIRGINIA LINDEN NJ TAMPA FL PISCATAWAY
HIEGHTS MO 63048 63026 HEIGHTS MO 07828 53072 46268 JUNCTION MD BEAGH VA 07036 33610 NJ
63043 63043 20701 08854
23453
Item #10- Ice Melt
How packaged - BG/BX BG/BX BG/BX BG/BX - 50 BGS/PAL BG/BX - BAG / BX - -
Lbs per bag - 50 50 50 50 - 50 50 - 50 - -
Bid Price NO BID $7.28 $7.35 $13.60 $6.51 NO BID $380.00 $7.30/BG NO BID $16.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
Comments
Item #11- Facial Tissue
Tissues per box 100 100 100 100 100 - 100 110 - - 100 100 -
How packaged 30/Cs 30/Cs 30/Cs 30/Cs 30/Cs - 30/CS 30/Cs - - 30 30/Cs -
Boxes per case 30 30 30 30 30 - 30 30 - - 30 30 BX/CS -
Bid Price $15.12 $19.35 $14.10 $19.35 $17.28 NO BID $13.59 $17.14 NO BID NO BID $18.99 $17.08 NO BID
Item #12- Maxi Pads
Pads per box 1EA 1 EA 1EA 1EA 1EA - 1EA 1EA - - 1EA 1EA -
How packaged 250 CS CS 250 250 CTN 250 BX - CS 250/ CS - - 250 250/ CS -
Boxes per case 250 250 250 250 250 - 250 250 - - 250 250 -
Bid Price $24.51 $31.53 $36.75 $39.50 $28.18 NO BID $33.31 $26.88 NO BID NO BID $32.66 $29.89 NO BID
Item #13 - Non-Latex Exam Gloves
How packaged 10 /100 CS CS 1000/ CS 10 BX/CS 100/ BX CS 10 BX CS - - 10 BX/CS -
Gloves per box 100 100 100 100 100 100 100 100 100 - - 100 -
Boxes per case 10 10 10 10 10 10 10 10 10 - - 10 -
Bid Price $27.00 $29.76 $34.92 $62.20 $30.48 $24.30 $31.61 $28.00 $29.64 NO BID NO BID $37.10 NO BID
Comments N LATEX NO POWDER
Item #14- Plastic Forks
How packaged BULK BULK BULK BULK BULK - BULK BULK BULK - BULK - -
Forks per box 1000 1000 1000 1000 1000 - 1000 1000 1000 - 1000 - -
Boxes per case 1 1 1 1 1 - 1 1 1 - 1 - -
Bid Price $7.70 $20.79 $9.24 $7.40 $13.67 NO BID $6.84 $7.54 $7.14 NO BID $8.99 NO BID NO BID
Item #15 - Plastic Spoons
How packaged BULK BULK BULK BULK BULK - BULK BULK BULK - BULK - -
Spoons per box 1000 1000 1000 1000 1000 - 1000 1000 1000 - 1000 - -
Boxes per case 1 1 1 1 1 - 1 1 1 - 1 - -
Bid Price $7.70 $23.13 $9.24 $7.40 $13.67 NO BID $6.84 $7.54 $7.14 NO BID $8.99 NO BID NO BID
Item #16- 20" Polish Pads
How packaged 5 CS CS OF 5 PADS 5/CTN 5/CS - BX 5PADS/CS 5/CS - - 5/CS -
Pads per box 5 5 5 5 5 - 5 5 5 - - 5 -
Boxes per case 1 1 1 1 1 - 1 1 1 - - 1 -
Bid Price $7.70 $14.12 $10.98 $13.15 $9.95 NO BID $15.52 $14.45 $12.54 NO BID NO BID $11.98 NO BID
Item #17 - 20" Buff or Burnish Pads
How packaged 5 CS CS OF 5 PADS 5 /CTN 5 PADS / BX - BX 5 PADS/CS 5/CS - - 5/CS -
Pads per box 5 5 5 5 5 - 5 5 5 - - 5 -
Boxes per case 1 1 1 1 1 - 1 1 1 - - 1 -
Bid Price $11.48 $14.43 $10.98 $13.85 $9.95 NO BID $15.52 $15.42 $12.54 NO BID NO BID $11.98 NO BID

Item #18 - 20" Stripping Pads




JANITORIAL SUPPLIES BID TABULATION

E&R BUCKEYE CALICO EARTH ALL
INDUSTRIAL INDUSTRIAL ;AOPYE/;LS XPEDX CLEANING TRONEX \'/L\"ALCLUTUYJZ HP INDUSTRIES CFHREIE\:CDlA‘ZS CENTRAL PYRAMID AMERICAN
JANITORIAL SUPPLIES | soap 722 SALES ING 1230 2099 CENTER INTERNATIONAL | AL PRODUCTS INC 585 POLY SCHOOL POLY
BID OPENING S VANDEVENTER 2635 METRO COMMERCIAL CORPORATE 44| 300 ZODIAC |INC 300 SUPPLY 4220 SAGUARO | 9045 JUNCTION HORSEPATURE CORP 2400 PRODUCTS 40 TURNER
10-18-11 AVE ph BLVD BLVD DR INDUSTRIAL CT| INTERNATIONAL |, "0 o o TRAIL DR RD BEDLE PLACE | 6510 N 54TH ST PLACE
LOUIS MO 63110 MARYLAND HERKY MO FENTON MO MARYLAND [ MOUNT OLIVE NJ ST LOUIS MO INDIANAPOLIS IN| ANNAPOLIS VIRGINIA LINDEN NJ TAMPA FL PISCATAWAY
HIEGHTS MO 63048 63026 HEIGHTS MO 07828 53072 46268 JUNCTION MD BEAGH VA 07036 33610 NJ
63043 63043 20701 08854
23453
How packaged 5 CS CS OF 5 PADS 5/CTN 5/CS - BX 5 PADS/CS 5/CS - - 5/CS -
Pads per box 5 5 5 5 5 - 5 5 5 - - 5 -
Boxes per case 1 1 1 1 1 - 1 1 1 - - 1 -
Bid Price $11.48 $14.81 $10.98 $13.20 $9.95 NO BID $15.52 $14.86 $12.54 NO BID NO BID $11.98 NO BID
Item #19- 16" Stripping Pads
How packaged 5 CS CS OF 5 PADS 5/CTN 5/BX - BX 5 PADS/CS 5/CS - - 5/CS -
Pads per box 5 5 5 5 5 - 5 5 5 - - 5 -
Boxes per case 1 1 1 1 1 - 1 1 1 - - 1 -
Bid Price $7.28 $10.35 $10.50 $13.30 $7.20 NO BID $11.02 $10.44 $9.24 NO BID NO BID $8.99 NO BID
Item #20 - Vacuum Cleaner Bags Style Y
How packaged BULK BULK BULK - BULK - BULK BULK - - - - -
Bags per package 150 3 3 - 3 - 10 3 - - - - -
Packages per case 50 PKG OF 3 6 6 - 12 - 10 1 - - - - -
Bid Price $130.00 $26.37 $12.50 NO BID $99.40 NO BID $75.66 $3.76 / PKG NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Item #21 - Vacuum Cleaner Bags Style AA
How packaged BULK BULK BULK - BULK - BULK BULK - - - - -
Bags per package 150 3 3 - 3 - 3 3 - - - - -
Packages per case 50 PKG OF 3 6 6 - 12 - 6 1 - - - - -
Bid Price $77.00 $15.88 $12.50 NO BID $71.76 NO BID $10.29 $2.46 | PKG NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Item #22 - 160z Mop Heads
How packaged BULK BULK - BULK BULK - BULK BULK - - - 6/CS -
Mop Heads per case 6 12 - 6 12 - 6 12/CS - - - 6 -
Bid Price $15.75 $66.30 NO BID $45.35 $30.96 NO BID $25.92 $57.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID $17.34 NO BID
Item #23- Liquid Bleach
How packaged CS CS CS CS - - CS CS - - - - -
Gallons per case 4 6 4 4 - - 4 6 - - - - -
Bid Price $5.25 $10.10 $6.10 $6.25 NO BID NO BID $9.13 $7.30 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Item #24 - Wooden Handle Brooms
How packaged 12 12 12 12 /CTN 6/CS - 6/CS - 12/CS - - 12/Cs -
Bid Price $8.40 $110.70 $79.24 $123.70 $27.54 NO BID $36.32 1/2 DZ NO BID $82.84 NO BID NO BID $81.48 NO BID
Comments NO WIRE MAGNOLIA | RUBBERMAID
Item #25 - Food Service Gloves
How packaged CS CASE CS CS - - - CS CS CS 1000/ CS -
Gloves per case 1000 1000 1000 1000 - - - 1000 1000 1000 1000 -
Bid Price $52.00 $62.47 $6.45 $62.20 NO BID NO BID NO BID $55.00 $5.98 NO BID $56.80 $56.90 NO BID
Item #26- Food Service Caps
How packaged CASE CASE CS CS - - BAG CS CS - -
Caps per case 1000 1000 1000 1000 - - 1000 1000 1000 - -
Bid Price $18.52 $42.59 $28.90 $15.00 NO BID NO BID $3.32 / BAG $40.25 $19.98 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Item #27- Aerosol Air Neutralizer
How packaged 12 CS - 12/CTN - - 12 12/200Z/CS - - - - -




JANITORIAL SUPPLIES BID TABULATION

EARTH

E&R BUCKEYE CALICO ALL
INDUSTRIAL INDUSTRIAL ;AOPYE':LS XPEDX CLEANING TRONEX \'/L\"ALCLUTUY'\;’Z HP INDUSTRIES CFHREIE\:CDlA‘ZS CENTRAL PYRAMID AMERICAN
JANITORIAL SUPPLIES | soap 722 SALES ING 1230 2099 CENTER INTERNATIONAL | AL PRODUCTS INC 2585 POLY SCHOOL POLY
BID OPENING S VANDEVENTER 2635 METRO COMMERCIAL CORPORATE 44| 300 ZODIAC |INC 300 SUPPLY 4220 SAGUARO | 9045 JUNCTION HORSEPATURE CORP 2400 PRODUCTS 40 TURNER
10-18-11 AVE ph BLVD BLVD DR INDUSTRIAL CT| INTERNATIONAL |, "0 o o TRAIL DR RD BEDLE PLACE | 6510 N 54TH ST PLACE
LOUIS MO 63110 MARYLAND HERKY MO FENTON MO MARYLAND [ MOUNT OLIVE NJ ST LOUIS MO INDIANAPOLIS IN| ANNAPOLIS VIRGINIA LINDEN NJ TAMPA FL PISCATAWAY
HIEGHTS MO 63048 63026 HEIGHTS MO 07828 53072 46268 JUNCTION MD BEAGH VA 07036 33610 NJ
63043 63043 20701 08854
23453
Cans per case 12 12 - 12 - - 12 12 - - - - -
Bid Price 52.25 $48.00 NO BID $48.45 NO BID NO BID $34.42 $28.48 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Item #28 - Deodorizing Urinals Screens
How packaged 12 CS 12 12 /CTN - CS 12/CS - - - 12/Cs -
Quantity per case 12 12 12 12/ CTN - 12 12 - - - 12/CS -
Bid Price $5.75 $9.35 $7.25 $14.50 $7.31 NO BID $13.67 $8.57 NO BID NO BID NO BID $8.98 NO BID
Comments ROYAL RELIABLE
Item #29- No Rinse Floor Stripper
How packaged 5 GAL 5GAL 5 GAL 5 GAL 5 GAL - 5 GAL 5 GAL - 5 GAL - - -
Quantity Per Case - 5 GAL 5 GAL 1 CTN 5 GAL - 1 5 GAL - - - - -
Bid Price $51.30 $46.58 $47.40 $80.10 $56.51 NO BID $26.44 | GAL $38.44 NO BID $55.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
Item #30- One Coat Floor Wax
How packaged 5 GALLON PAIL | 5 GALLON PAIL 5 GAL 5 GAL 5 GAL - 5 GAL 5 GAL PAIL - 5 GAL - - -
Quantity per case - 5 GAL 5 GAL 1/5 GAL BOX 5 GAL - 1 1 PAIL - - - - -
Bid Price $54.05 $60.74 $79.10 $46.90 $74.17 NO BID $54.10 / GAL $54.77 NO BID $124.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
Item #31- Toilet Seat Covers
How packaged 20/ 250'S CS CS 5000/ CTN 5000 / BX - CS 5000/ CS - - CS -
Sheets per box 5000 5000 5000 5000 5000 - 5000 5000 - - 5000 -
Boxes per case 20 20 20 20 20 - 20 20 - - 20 -
Bid Price $25.53 $33.44 $26.00 $29.25 $30.99 NO BID $35.20 $27.97 NO BID NO BID NO BID $29.98 NO BID
Item #32 - Sanitizer Concentrate for pit toilets -
How packaged 5 GALLONS 5 GAL 5 GAL - - - BUCKET 5 GAL - - - - -
Bid Price $24.00 $99.25 $32.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID $44.46 $51.91 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Item #33 - Deodorizer Concentrate for pit toilets
How packaged 5 GALLONS 5 GAL - - - - BUCKET 5 GAL - 5 GAL - - -
Bid Price $19.50 $99.25 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $44.46 $51.91 NO BID $66.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
Comments
Item #34 - Plastic Spray Container
How packaged 12 PER CASE 12 PER CS 12/CS 12/CS 100/ CS - 12/Cs 12/CS 12/CS - - 12/CS -
Bid Price $6.60 $1.02 EA $9.48 $63.75 $30.00 NO BID $12.24/ DZ $0.73 $0.84 NO BID NO BID $9.48 NO BID
Comments PER SPRAY BTL 320ZBTL
Item #35- 10 inch Deck Brushes Wood Handle
How packaged 12/CS 12/Cs 12/CS 12/CS 12/CS - 12/CS 12/CS 12/CS - - 12/CS -
Bid Price $5.52 $74.61 $53.40 $40.00 $42.60 NO BID $104.16 $6.30 $49.76 NO BID NO BID $59.88 NO BID
Comments
Item #36 - Vacuum Cleaner Bags Style LS
How packaged BULK BULK BULK BULK BULK - BULK BULK - - - - -
Bags per Package 150 3 3 5 3 - 6 3 - - - - -
Packages per Case 50 PKG OF 3 6 6 - 12 - 3 1 - - - - -
Bid Price $89.60 $24.04 $12.50 $5.90 $65.99 NO BID $24.69 $3.57 PKG NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Item #37- Disposal Bags for Sanitary Napkins
How packaged 500 PER CASE 500 PER CS 500/CS 500/CS 500/CS - 500/CS 500/CS - - - 500/CS -




JANITORIAL SUPPLIES BID TABULATION

E&R BUCKEYE CALICO EARTH ALL
INDUSTRIAL INDUSTRIAL ;fp\(E':LS XPEDX CLEANING TRONEX \'/L\"ALCLUTUY'\;’Z HP INDUSTRIES CFHREIE'\:CDlA‘ZS CENTRAL PYRAMID AMERICAN
JANITORIAL SUPPLIES | soap 722 SALES ING 1230 2099 CENTER INTERNATIONAL | AL PRODUCTS INC 2585 POLY SCHOOL POLY
BID OPENING S VANDEVENTER 2635 METRO COMMERCIAL CORPORATE 44| 300 ZODIAC |INC 300 SUPPLY 4220 SAGUARO | 9045 JUNCTION HORSEPATURE CORP 2400 PRODUCTS 40 TURNER
10-18-11 AVE ph BLVD BLVD DR INDUSTRIAL CT| INTERNATIONAL |, "0 o o TRAIL DR RD BEDLE PLACE | 6510 N 54TH ST PLACE
LOUIS MO 63110 MARYLAND HERKY MO FENTON MO MARYLAND [ MOUNT OLIVE NJ ST LOUIS MO INDIANAPOLIS IN| ANNAPOLIS VIRGINIA LINDEN NJ TAMPA FL PISCATAWAY
HIEGHTS MO 63048 63026 HEIGHTS MO 07828 53072 46268 JUNCTION MD BEAGH VA 07036 33610 NJ
63043 63043 20701 08854
23453
Bid Price $12.65 $21.59 $18.90 $15.50 $12.80 NO BID $16.06 $14.43 NO BID NO BID NO BID $13.98 NO BID
Comments HOSPEKO
Item #38 - Non-Alcohol Foaming Hand Sanitizer
How packaged 6BX-ML/CS - 3/BX 6/BX - - 6/BX - - - - -
Bid Price NO BID $47.36 NO BID $41.80 $52.08 NO BID NO BID $60.09 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Item #39 - White Roll Towels
How packaged 12-1000RL/CS 12RLS/CS 12RL/CS 12/CTN 6 RLS/CS - CS 6/800'/CS - - - - -
Bid Price $65.18 $72.34 $68.21 $111.00 $33.40 NO BID $115.46 $21.40 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Comments KIMBERLY CLARK
Item #40 - Antibacterial Hand Soap
How packaged - CS 6/CS 8/CTN 6/CS - 6/CS 6/CS - - -
Bid Price NO BID $42.46 $35.40 $49.50 $61.80 NO BID $32.35 $35.15 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Comments KUTOL GOJO SOLD CS
Item #41 - HDQ C Deodorizer Cleaner
How packaged 4 -2 LITERS CS 4-2LITER 6/CTN 4GLS/CS - 4 4-2 LITER - - - - -
Bid Price $35.53 $62.09 $30.85 $61.80 $50.36 NO BID $26.19 / CS $35.51 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Item #42 - Concentrated Glass Cleaner
How packaged 4 -2 LITERS CS 4-2LITER 12/CTN 4 GLS/CS - 4 GAL 4-2LITER - 4-1GAL/CS - - -
Bid Price 74.50 PER CS $61.08 $68.25 $25.05 $68.24 NO BID $39.56 $78.85 NO BID $35.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
Comments BETCO SPARTAN
Item #43- Multi Surface Cleaner
How packaged 4-2LITERS CS 4-2LITER 4/CTN 4 GLS/CS - 4 GAL 4-2 LITER - 4-1GAL/CS - - -
Bid Price $41.63/CS $35.73 $36.48 $44.15 $42.96 NO BID $46.30 $44.07 NO BID $37.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
Comments BETCO SPARTAN GP
Item #44- Air Lift
How packaged 4 -2 LITERS CS 4-2 LITER 4/CTN 5 GAL / BX - 4-2LITER - - - - -
Bid Price $32.20/ CS $118.47 $113.59 $71.05 $61.21 NO BID NO BID $136.36 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Item #45 - Clorox Liquid Bleach .
How packaged 5 GALLON 5 GAL 5 GAL 1 PAIL - - 6-96 OZ 5 GAL - - - - -
Bid Price $70.15 $72.04 $44.20 $29.60 NO BID NO BID $12.97 $33.49 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Item #46- Downy Liquid Fabric Softener
How packaged - 5 GAL 5 GAL 8/CTN - - 8-640Z 5 GAL - - - - -
Bid Price NO BID $161.88 $96.55 $29.90 NO BID NO BID $28.02 $67.72 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Item #47- Spartan Damp Mop 2 Liter Bottles
How packaged 4 -2 LITERS CS 4-2LITER 4/CTN 4GLS/CS - 4 GAL 4-2LITER - - - - -
Bid Price $20.55 / CS $64.49 $19.25 $19.70 $37.80 NO BID $27.49 $21.75 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Item #48- Spartan Acid Bathroom and Shower Cleaner
How packaged 4 -2 LITERS CS 4-2 LITER 4/CTN 4 GLS/CS - 12-320z 4-2LITER - 4 -1GAL /CS - - -




JANITORIAL SUPPLIES BID TABULATION

EARTH
E&R BUCKEYE CALICO ALL
INDUSTRIAL ROYAL XPEDX CLEANING TRONEX ALL TYPE HP INDUSTRIES FRIENDLY CENTRAL PYRAMID AMERICAN
INDUSTRIAL PAPERS VACUUM & CHEMICALS
JANITORIAL SUPPLIES | soap 72 SALES INC 1230 2099 CENTER INTERNATIONAL | o AL PRODUCTS INC 2585 POLY SCHOOL POLY
BID OPENING S VANDEVENTER| 2635 METRO COMMERGCIAL |CORPORATE 44] 300 ZODIAC |INC 300 SUPPLY 4220 SAGUARO (9045 JUNCTION [, oo\ - o [CORP 2400 PRODUCTS 40 TURNER
10.18.11 AVE ST BLVD BLVD DR INDUSTRIAL CT| INTERNATIONAL , oo"o - oo TRAIL DR RD BEDLE PLACE | 6510 N 54TH ST PLACE
LOUIS MO 63110 MARYLAND HERKY MO FENTON MO MARYLAND [ MOUNT OLIVENJ [“ . o o) - INDIANAPOLIS IN| - ANNAPOLIS VIRGINIA LINDEN NJ TAMPA FL PISCATAWAY
HIEGHTS MO 63048 63026 HEIGHTS MO 07828 63072 46268 JUNCTION MD BEACH VA 07036 33610 NJ
63043 63043 20701 08854
23453
Bid Price $97.65 $63.96 $88.60 $62.25 $69.68 NO BID $37.03 $103.40 NO BID $47.50 NO BID NO BID NO BID
Item #49 - Urinals Screen Deodorizing Blocks
How packaged 12/CS 12/CS 12/CS 12/CS 12/CS - 12/CS 12/CS - - - 12/Cs -
Bid Price $9.22 $12.31 $5.38 $15.65 $12.51 NO BID $5.86 $15.36/ CS NO BID NO BID NO BID $9.69 NO BID
Item #50 - Dawn Dishwashing Detergent 24 oz Bottles
How packaged 8/380Z EA 380Z BTL/CS 8/CTN 4GLS/CS - 8-320Z 12/320Z/CS - - - - -
Bid Price $35.15 $4.89 $34.25 $37.50 $48.16 NO BID $35.20 $29.63/CS NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Comments 380Z BTL
Item # 51 - Large Aerosol Disinfectant Can Deodorizer Spray 15.5 oz
How packaged 12 - 20 OZ CANS CS 12 -20 0Z/ CS 12/CTN 12/CS - 12 -24 0Z 12/200Z/CS - - - 12 - 16.5 CANS -
Bid Price $22.43 $40.80 $33.75 $66.45 $56.52 NO BID $32.85 $28.48 / CS NO BID NO BID NO BID $27.95 NO BID
Comments BETCO
- - - |
Affidavit Completed YES YES YES NO YES YES YES YES YES YES YES YES YES
Copy of Insurance Provided YES YES NO NO YES NO NO YES YES NO NO NO YES
COMMENTS:




JANITORIAL SUPPLIES BID TABULATION
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10-19-10 NORHTBROOK IL |\~ ~very |CT WALL NJ LINE RD HOUSTONTX | _o\ \ L IN Wi
60062 07719 LENEXA KS 77047
NY 12549 53132
66215
Item #1 - 80z Foam Cups
How Packaged 1000/ CS - 1000/ CS
Quantity per case 1000 - 1000
Bid Price $18.19 NO BID NO BID $30.01 NO BID NO BID
Item #2 - Jumbo Toilet Tissue
How Packaged 8/CS - - -
Sheets per roll 2000 - - 2000
Rolls per case 8 - - 12
Bid Price $31.67 NO BID NO BID $41.11 NO BID NO BID
Item #3 - Small Toilet Tissue
How Packaged 80/CS - - 96/CS
Sheets per roll 500 - - 500
Rolls per case 80 - - 96
Bid Price $54.93 NO BID NO BID $57.31 NO BID NO BID
Item #4 - Kitchen Towels
How Packaged 30/CS - - 30/Cs
Sheets per roll 85 - - 90
Quantity per case 30 - - 30
Bid Price $35.15 NO BID NO BID $34.13 NO BID NO BID
Item #5 - Large Trash Bags
Bag Size 40 X 46 40 X 48 - -
How packaged 125/PK 200/ CS -
Bags per case 200 200 - 200
Bid Price $28.93 $13.84 NO BID $39.89
Comments NO BID NO BID
Item #6- Small Trash Bags
Bag Size 24 X 33 24 X 33 - -
How packaged 1000/ PK 1000 -
Bags per case 1000 1000 - 1000
Bid Price $21.40 $14.84 NO BID $26.84 NO BID NO BID
Item #7 - Liquid Tide Laundry Soap
How packaged 4/ PK - - 6/CS - -
Bid Price $97.32 NO BID NO BID $92.50 NO BID NO BID
Item #8 - Bar Hand Soap
Oz per bar 3/4 - 3/4 -
How packaged 1000 / PK - 10/BX
Bars per case 1000 - 1000 72CT
Bid Price $69.39 NO BID $79.47 $87.45 NO BID NO BID
Item #9 - Single Fold Towels
Sheet size 9 X 10 - - 9X 10
How packaged 16 PK/CS - -
Sheets per package 4000 - - -
Packages per case 15 - - 15
Bid Price $25.33 NO BID NO BID $61.20 NO BID NO BID
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60062 07719 LENEXA KS 77047
NY 12549 53132
66215
Item #10 - Ice Melt
How packaged 50 LB BAG - - BG/BX - -
Lbs per bag 50 - - 50 - -
Bid Price $14.47 NO BID NO BID $39.59 NO BID NO BID
Comments
Item #11 - Facial Tissue
Tissues per box 100 - - 100
How packaged 30/CS - - 30/CS
Boxes per case 30 - - -
Bid Price $37.92 NO BID NO BID $31.68 NO BID NO BID
Item #12 - Maxi Pads
Pads per box 1EA - 1 1
How packaged 250/ BX - 250
Boxes per case 250 - 250 250
Bid Price $47.98 NO BID NO BID $49.72 $15.00 NO BID
Item #13 - Non-Latex Exam Gloves
How packaged 100/ BX CS - 10/100 CS
Gloves per box 100 100 100 100
Boxes per case 10 10 10 10
Bid Price $62.20 $28.50 $50.09 NO BID $27.80
Comments NO BID
Item #14 - Plastic Forks
How packaged BULK - BULK
Forks per box 1000 - 1000
Boxes per case 1 - 1
Bid Price $19.51 NO BID NO BID $24.27 NO BID NO BID
Item #15 - Plastic Spoons
How packaged BULK - BULK
Spoons per box 1000 - 1000
Boxes per case 1 - 1
Bid Price $19.49 NO BID NO BID $24.27 NO BID NO BID
Item #16 - 20" Polish Pads
How packaged 5 PADS / BX - -
Pads per box 5 - 5
Boxes per case 1 - 1
Bid Price $16.69 NO BID NO BID $22.96 NO BID NO BID
Item #17 - 20" Buff or Burnish Pads
How packaged 5 PADS / BX - -
Pads per box 5 - 5
Boxes per case 1 - 1
Bid Price $33.42 NO BID NO BID $22.96 NO BID NO BID

Item #18 - 20" Stripping Pads
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60062 07719 LENEXA KS 77047
NY 12549 53132
66215
How packaged 5 PADS / BX - -
Pads per box 5 - 5
Boxes per case 1 - 1
Bid Price $23.44 NO BID NO BID $22.60 NO BID NO BID
Item #19 - 16" Stripping Pads
How packaged 5 PADS / BX - -
Pads per box 5 - 5
Boxes per case 1 - 1
Bid Price $19.17 NO BID NO BID $22.60 NO BID NO BID
Item #20 - Vacuum Cleaner Bags Style Y
How packaged BULK - -
Bags per package 10 - -
Packages per case 1 - - -
Bid Price $10.44 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Item #21 - Vacuum Cleaner Bags Style AA
How packaged - - BULK
Bags per package - - - 18 / PKG
Packages per case - - - -
Bid Price NO BID NO BID NO BID $23.62 NO BID NO BID
Item #22 - 160z Mop Heads
How packaged BULK - - BULK
Mop Heads per case 6 - - 6
Bid Price $13.74 NO BID NO BID $115.68 NO BID NO BID
Item #23 - Liquid Bleach
How packaged CS - - CS
Gallons per case 4 - - 4
Bid Price $11.49 NO BID NO BID $64.84 NO BID NO BID
Item #24 - Wooden Handle Brooms
How packaged EACH - - - -
Bid Price $7.89 EA NO BID NO BID $157.17 NO BID NO BID
Comments
Item #25 - Food Service Gloves
How packaged CS - CS CS
Gloves per case 1000 - 1000 1000
Bid Price $86.80 NO BID NO BID $44.69 NO BID $45.80
Item #26 - Food Service Caps
How packaged CS - CS
Caps per case 1000 - 1000
Bid Price $46.15 NO BID NO BID $37.22 NO BID NO BID

Item #27 - Aerosol Air Neutralizer

How packaged EACH
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Cans per case 12 - - 12
Bid Price $2.67 EA NO BID NO BID 69.86 NO BID NO BID
Item #28 - Deodorizing Urinals Screens
How packaged 10 /PK - - CS
Quantity per case 1 - - 12
Bid Price $18.45 NO BID NO BID $30.78 NO BID NO BID
Comments
Item #29 - No Rinse Floor Stripper
How packaged 5 GAL - - 5 GAL - -
Quantity Per Case 1 - - - - -
Bid Price $46.24 NO BID NO BID $96.74 NO BID NO BID
Item #30 - One Coat Floor Wax
How packaged 5 GAL - - 5 GAL - -
Quantity per case 1 - - - - -
Bid Price $82.28 NO BID NO BID $118.27 NO BID NO BID
Item #31 - Toilet Seat Covers
How packaged 5000 BX - - -
Sheets per box 5000 - - 5000
Boxes per case 20 - - 20
Bid Price $1,039.20 NO BID NO BID $47.59 NO BID NO BID
Item #32 - Sanitizer Concentrate for pit toilets
How packaged - - - 5 GAL
Bid Price NO BID NO BID NO BID $127.00 NO BID NO BID
Item #33 - Deodorizer Concentrate for pit toilets
How packaged - - - 5 GAL
Bid Price NO BID NO BID NO BID $137.00 NO BID NO BID
Comments
Item #34 - Plastic Spray Container
How packaged 12/CS - - 12/Cs
Bid Price $14.40 NO BID NO BID $36.00 NO BID NO BID
Comments
Item #35 - 10 inch Deck Brushes Wood Handle
How packaged 12/CS - - 12/CS
Bid Price $120.72 NO BID NO BID $762.00 NO BID NO BID
Comments
Item #36 - Vacuum Cleaner Bags Style LS
How packaged BULK - - BULK
Bags per Package 5BGS/CS - - 18/ PKG
Packages per Case 1 - - -
Bid Price $7.45 NO BID NO BID $23.62 NO BID NO BID
Item #37 - Disposal Bags for Sanitary Napkins
How packaged 1000/ CS - - 500/CS
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Bid Price $12.88 NO BID NO BID $23.58 NO BID NO BID
Comments
Item #38 - Non-Alcohol Foaming Hand Sanitizer
How packaged 6/BX - - 6/BX
Bid Price $27.84 NO BID NO BID $190.55 NO BID NO BID
Item #39 - White Roll Towels
How packaged 6/BX - - 30 BX
Bid Price $63.92 NO BID NO BID $34.30 NO BID NO BID
Comments
Item #40 - Antibacterial Hand Soap
How packaged 4/BX - -
Bid Price $30.28 NO BID NO BID $101.50 NO BID NO BID
Comments
Item #41 - HDQ C Deodorizer Cleaner
How packaged EACH - - - -
Bid Price $11.72 EA NO BID NO BID $54.42 NO BID NO BID
Item #42 - Concentrated Glass Cleaner
How packaged EACH - - - -
Bid Price $25.26 EA NO BID NO BID $39.72 NO BID NO BID
Comments
Item #43 - Multi Surface Cleaner
How packaged EACH - - - -
Bid Price $30.47 EA NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Comments
Item #44 - Air Lift
How packaged EACH - - 4/CS - -
Bid Price $26.65 EA NO BID NO BID $207.90 NO BID NO BID
Item #45 - Clorox Liquid Bleach
How packaged 96 OZ BTL - - - -
Bid Price $11.49 NO BID NO BID $24.47 NO BID NO BID
Item #46- Downy Liquid Fabric Softener
How packaged EACH - - 5 GAL - -
Bid Price $14.38 EA NO BID NO BID $51.06 NO BID NO BID
Item #47- Spartan Damp Mop 2 Liter Bottles
How packaged EACH - - 4 GAL/CS - -
Bid Price $25.65 EA NO BID NO BID $41.38 NO BID NO BID
Item #48- Spartan Acid Bathroom and Shower Cleaner
How packaged 4-1GAL - - 12 CS - -
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Bid Price $57.50 NO BID NO BID $43.70 NO BID NO BID
Item #49 - Urinals Screen Deodorizing Blocks
How packaged 12/CS - - 12/CS - -
Bid Price $8.06 NO BID NO BID $9.11 NO BID NO BID
Item #50 - Dawn Dishwashing Detergent 24 oz Bottles
How packaged 8/PKG - - 2/240Z - -
Bid Price $40.70 NO BID NO BID $25.61 NO BID NO BID
Comments 38 OZ BTL
Item # 51 - Large Aerosol Disinfectant Can Deodorizer Spray 15.5 oz
How packaged EACH - - 12/BX - -
Bid Price $2.57 NO BID NO BID $73.75 NO BID NO BID
Comments
- - - |
Affidavit Completed NO YES YES YES YES YES
Copy of Insurance Provided NO YES YES NO NO NO

COMMENTS:
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