
BID TABULATION - SPRINKLER AND FIRE ALARM TESTING

SIMPLEX GRINNELL ENGINEERED FIRE 
PROTECTION INC

TECH 
ELECTRONICS INC

INTERNATIONAL 
SYSTEMS OF 

AMERICA LLC

3787 RIDER TRAIL S         
EARTH CITY MO            

63045

1615 S KINGSHIGHWAY         
ST LOUIS MO                      

63110

6437 MANCHESTER           
ST LOUIS MO                     

63129

9647 DIELMAN ROCK 
ISLAND INDUSTRIAL DR 

OLIVETTE MO 63132

ANNUAL SPRINKLER SYSTEM INSPECTION AND TESTING $768.00 $1,360.00 $1,564.00 NO BID

ANNUAL FIRE ALARM SYSTEM INSPECTION AND TESTING 947% $15.38 $576.00 $543.45

ANNUAL SPRINKLER SYSTEM INSPECTION AND TESTING $898.00 $1,360.00 $1,564.00 NO BID

ANNUAL FIRE ALARM SYSTEM INSPECTION AND TESTING $6.05 $1,569.00 $800.00 $838.67

ANNUAL SPRINKLER SYSTEM INSPECTION AND TESTING $369.00 $540.00 $621.00 NO BID

ANNUAL FIRE ALARM SYSTEM INSPECTION AND TESTING $4.00 $575.00 $483.00 $345.37

ANNUAL FIRE ALARM SYSTEM INSPECTION AND TESTING $715.00 $1,042.00 $768.00 $544.73

ANNUAL SPRINKLER SYSTEM INSPECTION AND TESTING $1,748.00 $1,360.00 $1,564.00 NO BID

ANNUAL FIRE ALARM SYSTEM INSPECTION AND TESTING $1,458.00 $2,708.00 $1,472.00 $1,940.19

ANNUAL FIRE ALARM SYSTEM INSPECTION AND TESTING $1,899.00 $2,982.00 $1,056.00 $1,820.19

AFFIDAVIT COMPLETED YES NO NO YES

COPY OF INSURANCE PROVIDED YES NO NO NO

COMMENTS:

LOCATION 6.  COURTHOUSE BUILDING                                                             
300 MAIN STREET                                                    
HILLSBORO MO

ANNUAL SPRINKLER AND FIRE ALARM TESTING                                                      
BID OPENING                                                                               12-20-

11

LOCATION 1.  JUVENILE TREATMENT CENTER                                                                 
9501 GOLD FINCH LN                                                 

HILLSBORO MO

LOCATION 2.  JUSTICE CENTER                                                                 
400 FIRST STREET                                                       
HILLSBORO MO

LOCATION 3.  ADMINISTRATION CENTER                                                                
729 MAPLE STREET                                                      

HILLSBORO MO

LOCATION 4.  ANNEX BUILDING                                                               
725 MAPLE STREET                                                      

HILLSBORO MO

LOCATION 5.  JAIL FACILITY                                                             
510 FIRST STREET                                                     
HILLSBORO MO
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