
BID TABULATION - TRACTION SAND SUPPLY 2011

TRACTION SAND SUPPLY                                                                   
BID OPENING                                             

10-25-11

CENTRAL STONE 
COMPANY

DRY CREEK 
MATERIALS

BOBBY 
HOELSCHER 

TRUCKING INC

FRED WEBER INC,                               
IRON MOUNTAIN TRAP 

ROCK

BASE BID PER CU YD / TON                          N/A N/A NO BID NO BID $5.20 TON

ALTERNATE #1 $8.25 $9.50 NO BID $6.00 $5.20

ALTERNATE #2 N/A N/A $4.00 6.00 PLUS ATTACHED 
HAUL RATE

$5.20 PLUS VARIOUS 
HAUL RATES

HAUL RATE HAUL RATE 
CHART

HAUL RATE 
CHART

HAUL RATE 
CHART HAUL RATE CHART HAUL RATE CHART

DELIVER TO 5275 STATE 
HWY B HILLSBORO, MO $14.00 PER TON NO BID $9.80 PER TON $11.00 PER TON $6.00 PER TON

DELIVER TO 2960 LEE PYLE 
ROAD DESOTO, MO $15.50 PER TON NO BID $11.90 PER TON $9.50 PER TON $6.00 PER TON

 O 6460 STATE HWY MM HOUS  $12.50 PER TON NO BID $6.95 PER TON $12.50 PER TON $4.65 PER TON

LOCATION OF STOCKPILED 
MATERIAL

14200 LEWIS AND 
CLARK BLVD 

FLORISSANT MO 
63034

10200 STATE RD C 
HILLSBORO MO 

63050

CHARAH 3435 
LABADIE 

BOTTOM RD, 
LABADIE MO 

63055

325 HIGHWAY W                    
IRONTON, MO 63650

6800 BUSSEN RD 
EUREKA MO 63025

PRICES FIRM TILL OCTOBER 31, 2012 OCTOBER 25, 2012 OCTOBER 31, 2012 OCTOBER 31, 2012 DECEMBER 31, 2012

AFFIDAVIT COMPLETED YES YES YES YES YES

COPY OF INSURANCE 
PROVIDED NO YES NO NO NO

COMMENTS: MATERIAL IS                                             
ECO SAND

BUSSEN QUARRIES
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