BID TABULATION - AUTOMOTIVE PARTS AND SUPPLIES 2012

O'REILLY
AUTO TIRE & PARTS| WEIR WHOLESALE | WEIR CHEVROLET | FACTORY MOTOR CONTINENTAL HILLSBORO AUTO
AUTOMOTIVE PARTS | REUTHER FORD INC COMPANY PARTSLLC BUICK GMC INC PARTS ASUTTOOR"QST’L\(/:E BATTERY CO B &AAUTOPARTS PARTS
& SUPPLIES 2012
BID OPENING
03.27.12 1325 MCNUTT 120 FLETCHER ST PO BOX 69 1107 S MAIN 11109 LINDBERGHCTR |  233SPATTERSON | 1828 W SQUARE DR 146 7TH ST 10810 BUS. 21
HERCULANEUM MO DESOTO MO RED BUD IL RED BUD IL ST LOUIS MO SPRINGFIELD MO HIGH RIDGE MO HILLSBORO MO HILLSBORO MO
63048 63020 62278 62278 63123 65802 63049 63050 63050
AIR CONDITIONER
BRAND FOUR SEASON
PER CENT DISCOUNT 10%
BRAND Ford/Motorcrat NAPA MOTORCRAFT GM 4 SEASONS MURRAY NO BID COMPRESSOR WORKS ACKITS
PER CENT DISCOUNT 25% 310 up 10320 21% List minus 30% 20% Tist less 41% NO BID 1% 30%
ALTERNATORS
BRAND &l
PER CENT DISCOUNT 0%
UTIMA, WILSON,
Ford/Motorcraft NAPA MOTORCRAFT GM ACDELCO MASTER PRO, BEST NO BID WORLDWIDE REMY BBB
BRAND TEST
PER CENT DISCOUNT 5% 35 Up 10.3:20 2% List minus 30% 2% Tist less 41% NG BID 6% 20%
BEARINGS
BRAND Ford/Motorcraft NAPA FORD GM BCA BCA NO BID BCA AUTO EX & BCA
PER CENT DISCOUNT 25% 319 2% List minus 30% 8.50% Tist less 41% NO BID 21% 15%
THROW OUT BEARINGS
BRAND Ford/Motorcraft NAPA FORD GM BCA BCA NO BID BCA BCA
PER CENT DISCOUNT 25% 118 2% List minus 30% 8.50% Tist less 41% NO BID 21% 15%
BRAKES
ACDELCO CENTRIC WAGNER,
BRAND Ford/Motorcraft NAPA MOTORCRAFT oM ) N NO BID RAYBESTOS AUTO EX WAGNER
PER CENT DISCOUNT 25% 75 2% List minus 30% 15% Tist less 41% NG BID 23% 15%
BRAKES HYDRAULIC
BRAND Ford/Motorcraft NAPA FORD oM ACDE'E‘;EEDC&NTR'C AL CARDONE NO BID RAYBESTOS DORMAN
PER CENT DISCOUNT 5% 115 2% List minus 30% 15% Tist less 41% NG BID 23% 20%
CARBURETORS
BRAND Ford/Motorcraft NAPA MOTORCRAFT oM AC DELCO WA'\;V'ZE;LESRG NO BID smr:ggggggmrz HYGRADE
PER CENT DISCOUNT 25% 317 2% List minus 30% 10% Tist less 41% NG BID 21% 12%
CHASSIS PARTS
BRAND Ford/Motorcraft NAPA FORD GM MOOAGC"[’)'EI\_’SJECH MONROE, MOOG NO BID RAYBESTOS MCQU’:AYO’;C(;RR'S &
PER CENT DISCOUNT 5% 10 up 0 J-19 2% List minus 30% 15% Tist less 41% NG BID 2% 15%
CLUTCH REBUILT
PRESSURE PLATE
BRAND Ford/Motorcraft NAPA FORD GM SACHS SACHS NO BID NO BID UNIOUE CA
PER CENT DISCOUNT, 25% 110 C+10 List minus 30% 5% Tist less 41% NO BID NO BID 50%
REBULT CLUTCH DISC
BRAND Ford/Motorcraft NO BID FORD GM SACHS SACHS NO BID NO BID UNIQUE
PER CENT DISCOUNT, 25% C+10 List minus 30% 5% Tist less 41% NO BID NO BID 50%
REBULT CLUTCH DISC
BRAND Ford/Motorcraft NO BID FORD GM SACHS SACHS NO BID NO BID UNIQUE
PER CENT DISCOUNT 25% C+10 List minus 30% 5% Tist less 41% NO BID NO BID 50%
ENGINE PARTS
BRAND Ford/Motorcraft SEALED POWER FORD GM NO BID SEALED POWER NO BID MELLING SEALED POWER
PER CENT DISCOUNT 25% 125 2% List minus 30% NO BID Tist less 41% NO BID 18% 15%
EXHAUST SYSTEMS
BRAND Ford/Motorcraft NAPA FORD GM NO BID ROL. WALKER NO BID GOE AP GORLICH WAGNER
PER CENT DISCOUNT 25% 310 2% List minus 30% NO BID Tist less 41% NO BID 30% 20%
FILTERS
BRAND Ford/Motorcraft NAPA MOTORCRAFT NO BID NO BID WiX NO BID WiX WiX
PER CENT DISCOUNT 25% 357 21% NO BID NO BID Tist less 41% NO BID 82% 37%
GASKETS
BRAND Ford/Motorcraft FEL-PRO FORD GM FELPRO FELPRO NO BID VICTOR FEL-PRO
PER CENT DISCOUNT 25% 310 2% List minus 30% 10% Tist less 41% NO BID 22% 7%
GEARS
BRAND Ford/Motorcraft NAPA FORD GM NO BID NO BID NO BID CLOYES CLOYES
PER CENT DISCOUNT 25% 310 2% List minus 30% NO BID NO BID NO BID 18% 20%
IGNITION ELECTRICAL
BRAND Ford/Motorcraft NAPA - ECHLIN MOTORCRAFT oM ACDELCO STANDARD Baiesxai’;?' NO BID WELLS STDT STD
PER CENT DISCOUNT 5% 117 2% List minus 30% 5% list less 41% NG BID 1% 5%
IGNITION WIRE SETS
BRAND Ford/Motorcraft NAPA - BELDEN MOTORCRAFT oM ACDELCO STANDARD B%RMGN‘I’;?/F:Q‘ER' NO BID PRESTOLITE TTW STD
PER CENT DISCOUNT 25% 310 2% List minus 30% 5% Jist less 41% NG BID 20% 15%
BATTERIES
BRAND Ford/Motorcraft NAPA MOTORCRAFT GM FVP ACDELCO SUPERSTART CONTINENTAL EAST PENN EXCIDE
PER CENT DISCOUNT 25% J-40 C+10 List minus 30% 10% list less 41% 0% 30% 20%
GLOW PLUGS
BRAND Ford/Motorcraft CHAMPION MOTORCRAFT oM N gfg:éggﬁ C;'ég"EpL'gg / NO BID AUTO LITE AI\/CI:("_)$SQ(|\:A:,IA?=$’
PER CENT DISCOUNT 25% 115 2% List minus 30% 10% Jist less 41% NG BID 2% 10%
ist minus Jist less
LAMPS
BRAND Ford/Motorcraft NAPA FORD GM SYLVANIA SYLVANIA NO BID WAGONER WAGNER
PER CENT DISCOUNT 25% J-10 up 10 J-22 2% List minus 30% 20% Tist less 41% NO BID 30% 20%
PUMPS - FUEL - NEW
BRAND Ford/Motorcraft NAPA MOTORCRAFT GM ACDELCO AIRTEX NO BID AIRTEXT AIRTEX
PER CENT DISCOUNT 25% 113 21% List minus 30% 10% Tist less 41% NO BID 17% 20%
PUMPS WATER NEW
BRAND Ford/Motorcraft NAPA MOTORCRAFT GM CARDONE ACDELCO | MASTER PROSELECT NO BID ASC PRO SELECT
PER CENT DISCOUNT 25% 310 21% List minus 30% 10% Tist less 41% NO BID 17% 20%
PUMPS WATER REBULT,
BRAND Ford/Motorcraft NAPA NO BID GM CARDONE ACDELCO | AL CARDONE NO BID AUTO LITE AL
PER CENT DISCOUNT 25% 310 NO BID List minus 30% 10% Tist less 41% NO BID 17% 10%
RUBBER PRODUCTS
BRAND Ford/Motorcraft NAPA GATES MOTORCRAFT GM ACDELCO GATESIMASTER PRO NO BID GATES GATES DAYCO
PER CENT DISCOUNT 25% 314 21% List minus 30% 15% Tist less 41% NO BID 37% 20%
SHOCK ABSORBERS
BRAND Ford/Motorcraft NAPA MOTORCRAFT GM KYB MONROE NO BID GABRIEL MONROE
PER CENT DISCOUNT 25% 112 21% List minus 30% 20% Tist less 41% NO BID 22% 15%
SPARK PLUGS
Ford/Motorcraft CHAMPION MOTORCRAFT oM ACDELCO AUTOLITE/ICHAMPION NO BID AIC DELCO AC, CHAMPION,
BRAND MOTORCRAFT
PER CENT DISCOUNT 5% 115 2% List minus 30% 8% Tist less 41% NG BID 2% 15%
TRANSMISSION
BRAND Ford/Motorcraft ATP FORD oM NO BID P'ONT%E;*(’)PL?EWER NO BID PIONEER TRANSTAR
PER CENT DISCOUNT 25% 718 2% List minus 30% NG BID Tist less 41% NG BID 12% 5%
U-JOINTS
BRAND Ford/Motorcraft NAPA FORD GM ACDELCO PRECISION NO BID NEAPCO PRECISION
PER CENT DISCOUNT 25% 32 up 10 J12 2% List minus 30% 10% Tist less 41% NO BID 22% 10%
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BID TABULATION - AUTOMOTIVE PARTS AND SUPPLIES 2012

O'REILLY
AUTO TIRE & PARTS | WEIR WHOLESALE | WEIR CHEVROLET | FACTORY MOTOR CONTINENTAL HILLSBORO AUTO
AUTOMOTIVE PARTS | REUTHER FORD INC COMPANY PARTSLLC BUICK GMC INC PARTS A;L%"ggmf BATTERY CO B &AAUTOPARTS
& SUPPLIES 2012
1SET SS-7574-X
BRAND Motorcraft NAPA NO BID NO BID ACDELCO WAGNER NO BID RAYBESTOS WAGNER
NUMBER BR1269 S5-7574-X NO BID NO BID 140699M MX699 NO BID BMD699 MX818
LIST PRICE $74.97 $80.99 NO BID NO BID $45.00 $69.54 NO BID $56.99 $96.38
LESS DISCOUNT 25% 61.3% NO BID NO BID 48% 41% NO BID 23% 50 - 15%
NET AMOUNT $56.22 $31.32 NO BID NO BID $23.40 $41.03 NO BID $43.88 $40.96
1 SET S5-8269-X
BRAND Motorcraft NAPA NO BID NO BID BENDIX WAGNER NO BID RAYBESTOS WAGNER
NUMBER BRSD777 55-8269-X NO BID NO BID MKD1159 MX1159 NO BID GMD1159F MX1159
LIST PRICE $79.98 $92.99 NO BID NO BID $99.86 $82.69 NO BID $79.76 $127.78
LESS DISCOUNT 25% 61.3% NO BID NO BID 58% 41% NO BID 23% 50 - 15%
NET AMOUNT $59.98 $35.96 NO BID NO BID $41.94 $48.79 NO BID $61.41 $54.30
1 SET S5-7950-X
BRAND NO BID NAPA NO BID NO BID ACDELCO WAGNER NO BID RAYBESTOS WAGNER
NUMBER NO BID $5-7950-X NO BID NO BID 14D1047C QC1047A NO BID BCD1047 PD1047
LIST PRICE NO BID $77.99 NO BID NO BID $62.40 $79.98 NO BID $60.99 $117.98
LESS DISCOUNT NO BID 61.3% NO BID NO BID 48% 41% NO BID 23% 50 - 15%
NET AMOUNT NO BID $30.16 NO BID NO BID $32.45 $47.19 NO BID $46.96 $50.14
MUFFLER
BRAND Ford NAPA NO BID NO BID NO BID WALKER NO BID FORD OEM WALKER
NUMBER 6C325230G 733-5794 NO BID NO BID NO BID 21583 + 35794 NO BID OE. 21583
LIST PRICE $887.63 $5.99 NO BID NO BID NO BID $140.55 + $5.06 NO BID $572.39 $218.08
LESS DISCOUNT 25% 61.4% NO BID NO BID NO BID 41% NO BID 30% 50 - 15%
NET AMOUNT $665.72 $2.31 NO BID NO BID NO BID $82.93 + $2.99 NO BID $400.67 $92.68
CLUTCH
ORGANIC LINING
BRAND Ford NAPA NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID UNIQUE
NUMBER YC3Z7L596AA RC1686607X NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID CD5139
LIST PRICE $675.76 $474.62 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $112.56
LESS DISCOUNT 15% 43.8% NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 50%
NET AMOUNT $574.39 $255.61 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $56.28
CERAMIC BUTTONS
BRAND NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID UNIQUE
NUMBER NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID CD5139CB6
LIST PRICE NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $281.56
LESS DISCOUNT NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 50%
NET AMOUNT NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $140.78
OIL FILTER
BRAND Motorcraft NAPA NO BID NO BID NO BID WIX NO BID CARQUEST WIX
NUMBER FL1995 7744XD NO BID NO BID NO BID 57744XD NO BID 84744 57744
LIST PRICE $12.51 $95.99 NO BID NO BID NO BID $48.69 NO BID $100.31 $88.54
LESS DISCOUNT 25% 85.0% NO BID NO BID NO BID 41% NO BID 82% 50 - 37%
NET AMOUNT $9.54 $14.37 NO BID NO BID NO BID $28.73 NO BID $17.64 $27.89
BATTERIES
BRAND Motorcraft BATT NO BID NO BID ACDELCO SsB CONTINENTAL BAT EXCIDE
NUMBER BXT65850 7236 NO BID NO BID 31TS 315 XHD31C 31HDS30 HP31D
LIST PRICE $119.95 $169.49 NO BID NO BID $130.15 $172.89 $67.95 EXCHANGE $129.99 $141.09
LESS DISCOUNT 15% 60.40% NO BID NO BID 36% 41% 0% 30% 20%
NET AMOUNT $101.95 $67.17 NO BID NO BID $83.30 $101.99 $67.95 EXCHANGE $90.99 $112.87
ALTERNATOR
BRAND J&1
NUMBER 7773
LIST PRICE $255.52
LESS DISCOUNT 25%
NET AMOUNT $191.64
BRAND Motorcraft ATP NO BID NO BID MPA usL NO BID WORLD WIDE REMY J&1
NUMBER F8AZ10V346ABRM 1-9751 NO BID NO BID 7795610 3612161 NO BID 7795A 7795
LIST PRICE $244.98 $26.54 NO BID NO BID $239.76 $322.01 NO BID $174.99 $229.96
LESS DISCOUNT 25% 65.20% NO BID NO BID 51% 41% NO BID 16% 25%
NET AMOUNT $183.73 $9.24 NO BID NO BID $117.48 $189.99 NO BID $146.99 $172.47
OIL FILTER
BRAND Motorcraft NAPA NO BID NO BID NO BID WIX NO BID WIX AUTO EX & WIX
NUMBER FL321 1522 NO BID NO BID NO BID 51522 NO BID 85522 51522
LIST PRICE $8.42 $11.54 NO BID NO BID NO BID $6.71 NO BID $13.02 $13.20
LESS DISCOUNT 30% 84.30% NO BID NO BID NO BID 41% NO BID 80% 50 - 37%
NET AMOUNT $5.80 $1.82 NO BID NO BID NO BID $3.96 NO BID $2.59 $4.15
AIR FILTERS
BRAND Motorcraft NAPA NO BID NO BID NO BID WIX NO BID WIX WIX
NUMBER FAL778 6870 NO BID NO BID NO BID 46870 NO BID 88870 46870
LIST PRICE $65.89 $137.99 NO BID NO BID NO BID $71.05 NO BID $156.07 $137.76
LESS DISCOUNT 25% 84.30% NO BID NO BID NO BID 41% NO BID 82% 50 - 37%
NET AMOUNT $49.41 $20.67 NO BID NO BID $41.33 NO BID $28.00 $43.39
AFFIDAVIT COMPLETED YES NO YES YES YES YES YES YES YES
COPY OF INSURANCE
PROVIDED YES NO NO NO NO NO NO YES YES
Engines and Mn?ﬂ':?g:fﬂ':i:re‘: et R155-200 WIPER
COMMENTS: transmissions are sold at total cost plus $100.00 BLADE ASSEMBLY
cost plus $100.00 : $7.19 - $2.79
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