
BID TABULATION - CORRUGATED METALLIC STEEL CULVERT PIPE 2013

METAL                          
CULVERTS, INC

MIDWEST 
CONSTRUCTION 

SERVICES & 
PRODUCTS

CONTECH ENGINEERED 
SOLUTIONS

PO BOX 330
JEFFERSON CITY MO

65102

516 N MAIN
DESOTO MO

63020

110 FORD LANE
HAZELWOOD MO

63042
Zinc-Coated                                                                                                                                             

2 2/3 X 1/2 IN. CORRUGATION

16 GAUGE RIVETED
12" $6.45 $7.59 $6.31
15" $8.12 $9.55 $7.76
18" $9.64 $11.34 $9.35
21'' $11.17 $12.51 $10.20
24" $12.91 $15.19 $11.40
30" $15.81 $17.99 $14.40
36" $18.85 $22.17 $17.40
42" $22.05 $25.94 $20.40
48" $25.09 $29.51 $22.80

CONNECTING BANDS
12" $6.45 $7.59 $6.31
15" $8.12 $9.55 $7.76
18" $9.64 $11.34 $9.35
21'' $11.17 $12.51 $10.20
24" $12.91 $15.19 $11.40
30" $23.72 $27.90 $14.40
36" $28.28 $33.26 $17.40
42" $33.08 $38.91 $20.40
48" $37.64 $44.27 $22.80

FLARED END SECTIONS
12" $42.15 $49.57 $59.12
15" $53.55 $62.38 $75.00
18" $69.40 $80.07 $92.74
21'' $83.50 $98.20 $116.99
24" $103.55 $121.78 $145.16
30" $174.70 $201.53 $264.95
36" $281.55 $327.96 $427.10
42" $591.21 $688.65 $805.58
48" $675.30 $786.60 $937.50

CORRUGATED METALLIC STEEL 
CULVERT PIPE 2013                                                                                                 

BID OPENING                                                         
11-27-12

Contract term: 3-1-13 to 2-28-14 upon 
approval by the County Council and County 

Executive



BID TABULATION - CORRUGATED METALLIC STEEL CULVERT PIPE 2013

Zinc-Coated                                                                                                                                                                   
3 X 1 IN. CORRUGATION

16 GAUGE RIVETED
54" $33.52 $39.42 $31.50
60" $37.07 $42.77 $34.65
66" $40.54 $47.23 $37.80
72" $44.09 $51.85 $41.58
84" $52.85 $61.56 $48.51
96" $60.17 $69.42 $54.81

108" 14 GA $90.15 $106.02 $79.20
120" 12 GA $128.21 $149.35 $120.78

CONNECTING BANDS
54" $50.28 $55.99 $31.50
60" $74.14 $83.04 $34.65
66" $81.08 $93.54 $37.80
72" $88.18 $101.73 $41.58
84" $105.70 $121.94 $48.51
96" $120.34 $138.83 $109.62

108" 14 GA $180.30 $212.04 $158.40
120" 12 GA $256.42 $298.68 $241.56

FLARED END SECTIONS
54" $830.54 $958.12 $1,111.09
60" $1,245.83 $1,451.15 $1,667.00
66" $1,339.25 $1,544.95 $1,791.64
72" $1,484.62 $1,712.66 $1,986.11
84" $1,872.75 $2,160.41 $2,347.22
96" $2,433.48 $2,861.78 $3,113.88

108" 14 GA N/A NO BID N/A
120" 12 GA N/A NO BID N/A
Zinc-Coated                                                                                                                                             

2/3 X 1/2 IN. CORRUGATION

16 GAUGE RIVETED
17 X 13 $8.70 $10.23 $8.92
21 X 15 $10.22 $11.80 $10.75
24 X 18 $11.89 $13.99 $12.32
28 X 20 $13.78 $16.21 $13.11
35 X 24 $16.68 $19.62 $16.56

42 X 29 14 GA $24.62 $28.95 $24.89
49 X 33 12 GA $39.68 $46.67 $39.33
57 X 38 12 GA $45.12 $53.06 $44.85

CONNECTING BANDS
17 X 13 $8.70 $10.23 $8.92
21 X 15 $10.22 $11.80 $10.75
24 X 18 $11.89 $13.99 $12.32
28 X 20 $13.78 $16.21 $13.11
35 X 24 $25.02 $29.14 $16.56

42 X 29 14 GA $36.93 $43.02 $24.89
49 X 33 12 GA $59.52 $69.33 $39.33
57 X 38 12 GA $67.68 $78.84 $44.85

FLARED END SECTIONS
17 X 13 $49.25 $56.82 $74.45
21 X 15 $57.73 $67.90 $88.49
24 X 18 $70.24 $81.03 $107.65
28 X 20 $82.74 $95.45 $126.81
35 X 24 $154.40 $178.12 $212.50

42 X 29 14 GA $229.25 $264.47 $336.12
49 X 33 12 GA $412.16 $444.57 $579.16
57 X 38 12 GA $588.92 $679.38 $722.17



BID TABULATION - CORRUGATED METALLIC STEEL CULVERT PIPE 2013

Zinc-Coated                                                                                                                                              
3 X 1 IN. CORRUGATION

16 GAUGE RIVETED
60 X 46 $43.88 $51.61 $42.09
66 X 51 $48.68 $57.25 $46.23
 73 X 55 $53.25 $62.63 $51.06
81 X 59 $58.05 $65.02 $55.89
95 X 67 $68.40 $76.00 $64.86
112 X 75 $108.10 $127.00 $101.43
128 X 83 $121.73 $137.00 $113.85
142 X 91 $140.70 $158.00 $161.46

CONNECTING BANDS
60 X 46 $87.76 $102.23 $42.09
66 X 51 $97.36 $113.41 $46.23
 73 X 55 $106.50 $124.06 $51.06
81 X 59 $116.10 $130.00 $55.89
95 X 67 $136.80 $153.00 $64.86
112 X 75 $216.20 $249.00 $116.65
128 X 83 $243.46 $272.68 $227.70
142 X 91 $281.40 $320.00 $322.92

FLARED END SECTIONS
60 X 46 $770.32 $888.62 $1,030.53
66 X 51 $1,017.40 $1,173.69 $1,361.09
 73 X 55 $1,365.22 $1,529.05 $1,826.39
81 X 59 $1,437.90 $1,609.00 $1,923.64
95 X 67 $1,755.50 $1,966.00 $2,152.80
112 X 75 $2,274.19 $2,547.00 $2,788.88
128 X 83 N/A NO BID N/A
142 X 91 N/A NO BID N/A

Polymer Coated                                                                                                                     
2 2/3 X 1/2 IN. CORRUGATION

16 GAUGE RIVETED
12" $8.23 $9.22 $7.10
15" $10.36 $12.18 $9.23
18" $12.30 $14.47 $11.36
21'' $14.25 $16.00 $12.78
24" $16.47 $19.25 $14.20
30" $20.17 $24.00 $17.75
36" $24.05 $29.00 $21.30
42" $28.12 $33.00 $25.56
48" $32.01 $39.00 $28.40

CONNECTING BANDS
12" $8.23 $9.22 $7.10
15" $10.36 $12.18 $9.23
18" $12.30 $14.47 $11.36
21'' $14.25 $16.00 $12.78
24" $16.47 $19.25 $14.20
30" $30.26 $36.00 $17.75
36" $36.08 $43.00 $21.30
42" $42.18 $51.00 $25.56
48" $48.02 $57.00 $28.40

FLARED END SECTIONS
12" $42.15 $47.00 N/A
15" $53.55 $62.00 N/A
18" $69.40 $79.90 N/A
21'' $83.50 $98.00 N/A
24" $103.55 $122.00 N/A
30" $174.70 $202.00 N/A
36" $281.55 $318.00 N/A
42" $591.21 $672.00 N/A
48" $675.30 $765.00 N/A



BID TABULATION - CORRUGATED METALLIC STEEL CULVERT PIPE 2013

Polymer Coated                                                                                                                      
3 X 1 IN. CORRUGATION

16 GAUGE RIVETED
54" $42.40 $51.00 $38.34
60" $46.89 $56.00 $40.47
66" $51.28 $62.00 $44.73
72" $55.77 $68.00 $48.99
84" $66.85 $77.00 $56.80
96" $76.11 $91.00 $64.61

108" 14 GA $110.58 $129.00 $88.04
120" 12 GA $151.45 $181.00 $133.48

CONNECTING BANDS
54" $63.60 $77.00 $38.34
60" $93.78 $110.00 $40.47
66" $102.56 $120.00 $44.73
72" $111.54 $135.00 $48.99
84" $133.70 $160.00 $56.80
96" $152.22 $179.00 $129.22

108" 14 GA $221.16 $262.00 $176.08
120" 12 GA $302.90 $353.00 $266.96

FLARED END SECTIONS
54" $830.54 $930.00 N/A
60" $1,245.83 $1,400.00 N/A
66" $1,339.25 $1,520.00 N/A
72" $1,484.62 $1,700.00 N/A
84" $1,872.75 $2,200.00 N/A
96" $2,433.48 $2,725.00 N/A

108" 14 GA N/A NO BID N/A
120" 12 GA N/A NO BID N/A

Polymer Coated                                                                                                                                         
2 2/3 X 1/2 IN. CORRUGATION

16 GAUGE RIVETED
17 X 13 $11.10 $15.00 $10.62
21 X 15 $13.04 $16.00 $13.06
24 X 18 $15.17 $18.00 $14.70
28 X 20 $17.58 $23.00 $16.33
35 X 24 $21.28 $28.00 $20.41

42 X 29 14 GA $30.44 $34.00 $30.21
49 X 33 12 GA $47.18 $56.00 $48.17
57 X 38 12 GA $53.64 $60.00 $54.71

CONNECTING BANDS
17 X 13 $11.10 $15.00 $10.62
21 X 15 $13.04 $16.00 $13.06
24 X 18 $15.17 $18.00 $14.70
28 X 20 $17.58 $23.00 $16.33
35 X 24 $31.92 $39.00 $20.41

42 X 29 14 GA $45.66 $51.00 $30.21
49 X 33 12 GA $70.77 $85.00 $48.17
57 X 38 12 GA $80.46 $90.00 $54.71

FLARED END SECTIONS
17 X 13 $49.25 $60.00 N/A
21 X 15 $57.73 $69.00 N/A
24 X 18 $70.24 $85.00 N/A
28 X 20 $82.74 $99.00 N/A
35 X 24 $154.40 $181.00 N/A

42 X 29 14 GA $229.25 $256.00 N/A
49 X 33 12 GA $412.16 $461.00 N/A
57 X 38 12 GA $588.92 $659.00 N/A



BID TABULATION - CORRUGATED METALLIC STEEL CULVERT PIPE 2013

Polymer Coated                                                                                                                             
3 X 1 IN. CORRUGATION

16 GAUGE RIVETED
60 X 46 14 GA $53.82 $60.00 $45.72
66 X 51 14 GA $59.71 $69.00 $67.77
 73 X 55 14 GA $65.32 $79.00 $62.87
81 X 59 14 GA $71.21 $85.00 $68.59
95 X 67 14 GA $83.90 $93.00 $79.20
112 X 75 12 GA $127.69 $145.00 $123.29
128 X 83 14 GA $143.79 $181.00 $137.99
142 X 91 10 GA $175.88 $210.00 $195.14

CONNECTING BANDS
60 X 46 14 GA $107.64 $862.00 $45.72
66 X 51 14 GA $119.42 $1,155.00 $67.77
 73 X 55 14 GA $130.64 $150.00 $62.87
81 X 59 14 GA $142.42 $171.00 $68.59
95 X 67 14 GA $167.80 $189.00 $79.20
112 X 75 12 GA $255.38 $296.00 $246.58
128 X 83 14 GA $287.58 $342.00 $275.98
142 X 91 10 GA $351.76 $410.00 $390.28

FLARED END SECTIONS
60 X 46 14 GA $770.32 $864.00 N/A
66 X 51 14 GA $1,017.40 $1,159.00 N/A
 73 X 55 14 GA $1,365.22 $1,555.00 N/A
81 X 59 14 GA $1,437.90 $1,630.00 N/A
95 X 67 14 GA $1,755.50 $2,000.00 N/A
112 X 75 12 GA $2,274.19 $2,597.00 N/A
128 X 83 14 GA N/A NO BID N/A
142 X 91 10 GA N/A NO BID N/A

AFFIDAVIT COMPLETED YES YES NO

COPY OF INSURANCE PROVIDED NO NO NO

COMMENTS:


	1

