BID TABULATION - CRUSHED STONE AND GRAVEL 2013

CRUSHED STONE & GRAVEL
PROD. 2013
BID OPENING
11-27-12
Contract term: 3-1-13 to 2-28-14
upon approval by the County
Council and County Executive

CLEAN STONE

WINTER BROTHERS CENTRAL STONE CENTRAL STONE H SAND AND TRAUTMAN HOUSE SPRINGS
MATERIAL CO DRY CREEKLLC CO.-ANTONIA CO.-MORSE MILL GRAVEL QUARRY QUARRY ANTIRE QUARRY
13098 GRAVOIS RD 10200 STATERD C 3224 N HWY 67 3224 N HWY 67 PO BOX 69 87%%;12%1—2/';'\‘ PO BOX 159 6800 ANTIRE RD
ST LOUIS MO HILLSBORO MO FLORISSANT MO FLORISSANT MO IMPERIAL MO PEVELY MO HOUSE SPRINGS MO EUREKA MO
63127 63050 63033 63033 63052 63070 63051 63025

Cost per Ton
1/4" - - - - - $9.00 $9.00 $11.00
3/8" - - $10.75 - - $9.00 $9.00 $11.00
1/2" - - $10.45 - - $9.00 $9.00 $11.00
3/4" - - $9.40 - - $8.45 $8.45 $8.95
1" - - $9.40 $7.05 - $8.45 $8.45 $8.95
11/4" - - - - - $8.45 $8.45 $8.95
11/2" - - $8.20 - - $7.15 $7.15 $7.75
13/4" - - - - - $7.15 $7.15 $7.75
2" - - $8.70 $7.05 - $7.15 $7.15 $7.75
3" - - - $7.05 - $7.15 $7.15 $7.75
4" - - - - - $7.15 $7.15 $7.75
5" - - - - - $7.15 $7.15 $7.75
6" - - - $9.60 - $7.15 $7.15 $7.75
MINUS
Cost per Ton
1/4" - - - - - $1.00 $5.00 $1.00
3/8" - - - - - $5.00 $5.00 $5.30
1/2" - - - - - $5.00 $5.00 $5.30
3/4" - - $5.55 - - $5.00 $5.00 $5.30
1" - - $5.55 - - $5.00 $5.00 $5.30
11/4" - - - - - $5.00 $5.00 $5.30
11/2" - - - - - $5.00 $5.00 $5.30
2" - - $5.55 - - $5.00 $5.00 $5.30
2 1/2" - - - - - $5.00 $5.00 $5.30
3" - - - - - $5.00 $5.00 $5.30
4" - - - - - $5.00 $5.00 $5.30
1/2 - 4 Minus Backfill - - - - - $5.00 $5.00 $5.30

COMMENTS:




BID TABULATION - CRUSHED STONE AND GRAVEL 2013

CRUSHED STONE & GRAVEL
o [MIERERTHERS] nvoneex i | CTALTIONE | CEVTRALSTONE | HIMDAD | TRATMAN | OUSSSINGE | mine quaay
11-27-12
Contract term: 3-1-13 to 2-28-14
upon approval by the County
MAC
Cost per Ton
1/4" - - - - - $8.45 $8.45 $11.00
1/2" - - - - - $8.45 $8.45 $11.00
3/4" - - - - - $8.45 $8.45 $8.95
1" - - - - - $8.45 $8.45 $8.95
2" - - - - - $7.15 $7.15 $7.75
3" - - - - - $7.15 $7.15 $7.75
3X10 - - - - - - $10.00 $10.50
OTHER
Cost Per Ton
3X10 - - $11.25 - - - $10.00 $10.50
SHOT ROCK - - $4.50 $4.50 - $4.00 $4.00 $4.00
GABION ROCK - - $11.25 - - - - $10.50
QUARRY RUN - - $5.40 - - $4.00 $4.00 $4.00
DIRTY STONE - - - - - $4.00 $4.00 $4.00
DIRT - $6.00 $1.40 $1.40 $6.00 - - -
SAND - $11.00 - - $13.00 - - $5.60
DIRTY STONE - - - - - $4.00 $4.00 $4.00
FILTER ROCK - - $13.35 - - $7.15 - $7.75
DIRTY SHOT ROCK - - $4.50 $4.50 - $4.00 $4.00 $4.00
BLANKET ROCK - - $13.35 - - $12.00 $12.00 $12.00
4 X 6 CLEAN - - - - - - - $10.50
GRAVEL PRODUCTS
P-GRAVEL $8.95 $9.75 - - $8.50 NO BID NO BID NO BID
SCREENED GRAVEL N/A $9.75 - - - NO BID NO BID NO BID
CREEK GRAVEL N/A $10.00 - - $4.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
B-GRAVEL $14.75 $7.50 - - $7.50 NO BID NO BID NO BID
C-GRAVEL $9.90 $11.00 - - $13.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
CONCRETE ROCK N/A - - - $13.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
FILTER SAND N/A $4.00 - - - NO BID NO BID NO BID
SAND $9.90 $11.00 - - $13.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
$11.00 Pulverized $6.00/top soil
DIRT $8.00 Bank run $6.00 i i $4.00/fill dirt NOBID NOBID NOBID
BLANKET ROCK N/A - - - - NO BID NO BID NO BID
SHOT ROCK N/A - - - - NO BID NO BID NO BID
3 X 10 CLEAN N/A - - - - NO BID NO BID NO BID
4 X 6 CLEAN N/A - - - $8.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID




BID TABULATION - CRUSHED STONE AND GRAVEL 2013

CRUSHED STONE & GRAVEL
PROD. 2013 WINTER BROTHERS CENTRAL STONE CENTRAL STONE H SAND AND TRAUTMAN HOUSE SPRINGS
BID OPENING MATERIAL CO DRY CREEKLLC CO.-ANTONIA CO.-MORSE MILL GRAVEL QUARRY QUARRY ANTIRE QUARRY
11-27-12
Contract term: 3-1-13 to 2-28-14
upon approval by the County
HAUL CHART
STOCK PILE
DELIVERY
0-5 $4.55 $3.50 $3.75 $3.35 $3.00 $3.20 $3.45 $3.60
5-10 $4.55 $4.00 $4.25 $3.95 $3.50 $3.60 $3.85 $4.00
10-15 $5.45 $4.50 - $4.75 $4.00 $4.10 $4.40 $4.50
15-20 $5.70 $5.00 - - $4.50 $4.80 $5.00 $5.00
20-25 $6.10 $5.50 - - $5.00 $5.30 $5.40 $5.50
25-30 $8.15 $6.00 - - $5.50 $6.00 $5.70 $6.00
30-35 $9.20 - - - $6.00 $6.70 $6.20 $6.50
35-40 $10.05 - - - $6.50 $7.40 $6.70 $7.00
40-45 $10.85 - - - $7.00 $8.00 $7.20 $8.00
45-50 $11.95 - - - $7.50 $8.70 $7.70 $9.00
+50 CALL - - - $8.00 - $8.20 N/A
ON SITE DELIVERY
0-5 $4.55 $3.50 $3.75 $3.35 $3.00 $3.20 $3.45 $3.60
5-10 $4.55 $4.00 $4.25 $3.95 $3.50 $3.60 $3.85 $4.00
10-15 $5.45 $4.50 - $4.75 $4.00 $4.10 $4.40 $4.50
15-20 $5.70 $5.00 - - $4.50 $4.80 $5.00 $5.00
20-25 $6.10 $5.50 - - $5.00 $5.30 $5.40 $5.50
25-30 $8.15 $6.00 - - $5.50 $6.00 $5.70 $6.00
30-35 $9.20 - - - $6.00 $6.70 $6.20 $6.50
35-40 $10.05 - - - $6.50 $7.40 $6.70 $7.00
40-45 $10.85 - - - $7.00 $8.00 $7.20 $8.00
45-50 $11.90 - - - $7.50 $8.70 $7.70 $9.00
+50 CALL - - - $8.00 - $8.20 N/A
$.75/TON-Gabion
COMMENTS $1.50/ton-drop ball

AFFIDAVIT COMPLETED YES YES YES YES YES YES YES YES
COPY OF INSURANCE YES NO NO NO NO YES YES YES

PROVIDED

COMMENTS




BID TABULATION - CRUSHED STONE AND GRAVEL 2013

CRUSHEI?’FS?-I(;OD,.\I;)EGRAVEL BUSSEN QUARRY- SIMPSON ARCH JOHNSTON CO DAN ALTHOFF KA PAZDERA HAULING &
BID OPENING JEFFERSON MATERIALSCOLLC INC TRUCKING EXCAV LLC FRED WEBER INC
11-27-12 BARRACKS
Contract term: 3-1-13 to 2-28-14
upon approval by the County
Council and County Executive
5000 BUSSEN RD PO BOX 250 12520 STATERD 21 4600 WALDO IND DR PO BOX 1270 2320 CREVE COEUR MILL RD
ST LOUIS MO VALLEY PARK MO DESOTO MO HIGH RIDGE MO FESTUS MO MARYLAND HEIGHTS MO
63129 63088 63020 63049 63028 63043
e s
CLEAN STONE
Cost per Ton
1/4" $11.00 N/A - $9.98 - NO BID
3/8" $11.00 N/A - $10.51 - $15.00
1/2" $11.00 N/A - $10.32 - $15.00
3/4" $8.95 $8.45 $7.95 $8.97 - $9.25
1" $8.95 $8.45 $7.95 $8.96 - $9.25
11/4" $8.95 N/A - - - NO BID
11/2" $7.75 N/A - $8.55 - $9.25
13/4" $7.75 N/A - - - NO BID
2" $7.75 $7.45 $6.90 $7.77 - $7.95
3" $7.75 N/A - $8.27 - $7.95
4" $7.75 N/A $6.90 $7.98 - $7.95
5" $7.75 $8.95 - - - NO BID
6" $7.75 N/A - $8.87 - NO BID
MINUS
Cost per Ton
1/4" $1.00 $2.50 $2.50 $4.07 - NO BID
3/8" $5.30 $2.50 - $4.57 - NO BID
1/2" $5.30 N/A - $5.28 - $4.50
3/4" $5.30 $4.70 $5.25 $5.38 - $4.50
1" $5.30 $4.70 $5.25 $5.44 - $4.50
11/4" $5.30 N/A - - - NO BID
11/2" $5.30 N/A - $5.51 - $4.50
2" $5.30 $4.70 $5.25 $5.44 - $4.50
2 1/2" $5.30 N/A - - - NO BID
3" $5.30 N/A $5.25 $5.46 - $4.50
4" $5.30 N/A $5.25 - - $4.50
1/2 - 4 Minus Backfill $5.30 $2.50 $5.25 - - NO BID
COMMENTS:




BID TABULATION - CRUSHED STONE AND GRAVEL 2013

CRUSHEIIDD;-(I;OD’.\IZEOEGRAVEL BUSSEN QUARRY- SIMPSON ARCH JOHNSTON CO DAN ALTHOFF KA PAZDERA HAULING &
BID OPENING JEFFERSON MATERIALS CO LLC INC TRUCKING EXCAV LLC FRED WEBER INC
112712 BARRACKS
Contract term: 3-1-13 to 2-28-14
upon approval by the County
MAC
Cost per Ton
1/4" $11.00 N/A - - - NO BID
1/2" $11.00 N/A - - - NO BID
3/4" $8.95 $8.45 - - - NO BID
1" $8.95 $8.45 - - - NO BID
2" $7.75 $7.45 - - - NO BID
3" $7.75 N/A - - - NO BID
3X10 $10.50 N/A - - - NO BID
OTHER
Cost Per Ton
3X10 $10.50 N/A - $10.50 - NO BID
SHOT ROCK $4.00 $5.95 $4.75 $5.36 - $5.50
GABION ROCK $10.50 $5.95 $11.50 $11.00 - $12.00
QUARRY RUN $4.00 $5.95 $5.25 $5.46 - $5.50
DIRTY STONE $4.00 N/A - - - NO BID
DIRT - N/A - - - NO BID
SAND $5.60 N/A - $5.67 - $6.35
DIRTY STONE $4.00 N/A - - - NO BID
FILTER ROCK $7.75 N/A - - - NO BID
DIRTY SHOT ROCK $4.00 $5.95 $3.50 - - NO BID
BLANKET ROCK $12.00 N/A $11.50 $12.60 - NO BID
4 X 6 CLEAN $10.50 N/A - - - NO BID
GRAVEL PRODUCTS
P-GRAVEL NO BID $8.20 - - - NO BID
SCREENED GRAVEL NO BID N/A - - - NO BID
CREEK GRAVEL NO BID N/A - - - NO BID
B-GRAVEL NO BID $12.50 - - - NO BID
C-GRAVEL NO BID $8.90 - - - NO BID
CONCRETE ROCK NO BID N/A - - - NO BID
FILTER SAND NO BID $9.50 - - - NO BID
SAND NO BID $9.50 - - - NO BID
DIRT NO BID $5.50 - - - NO BID
BLANKET ROCK NO BID N/A - - - NO BID
SHOT ROCK NO BID N/A - - - NO BID
3 X 10 CLEAN NO BID N/A - - - NO BID
4 X 6 CLEAN NO BID N/A - - - NO BID




BID TABULATION - CRUSHED STONE AND GRAVEL 2013

CRUSHE?’FSQ(T)OD’.\IZEOEGRAVEL BUSSEN QUARRY- SIMPSON ARCH JOHNSTON CO DAN ALTHOFF KA PAZDERA HAULING &
BID OPENING JEFFERSON MATERIALS COLLC INC TRUCKING EXCAV LLC FRED WEBER INC
119712 BARRACKS
Contract term: 3-1-13 to 2-28-14
upon approval by the County
HAUL CHART
STOCK PILE
DELIVERY
0-5 $3.60 N/A $3.00 $1.95 $3.30 $3.00
5-10 $4.00 N/A $3.50 $2.24 $3.85 $3.50
10-15 $4.50 N/A $4.00 $3.36 $4.40 $4.00
15-20 $5.00 N/A $4.75 $4.48 $5.25 $4.50
20-25 $5.50 N/A $5.75 $5.00 $6.35 $5.00
25-30 $6.00 N/A $6.50 $6.00 $7.15 $5.50
30-35 $6.50 N/A $7.75 $7.00 $8.55 $6.00
35-40 $7.00 N/A $8.75 $7.20 $9.65 $6.50
40-45 $8.00 N/A $9.75 $8.10 $9.90 $7.00
45-50 $9.00 N/A $10.75 $8.40 $11.00 $7.50
+50 N/A N/A $12.00 $3.90 N/A $8.00
ON SITE DELIVERY
0-5 $3.60 N/A $3.00 $2.25 - $3.00
5-10 $4.00 N/A $3.50 $2.54 - $3.50
10-15 $4.50 N/A $4.00 $3.66 - $4.00
15-20 $5.00 N/A $4.75 $4.68 - $4.50
20-25 $5.50 N/A $5.75 $5.20 - $5.00
25-30 $6.00 N/A $6.50 $6.20 - $5.50
30-35 $6.50 N/A $7.75 $7.10 - $6.00
35-40 $7.00 N/A $8.75 $7.30 - $6.50
40-45 $8.00 N/A $9.75 $8.20 - $7.00
45-50 $9.00 N/A $10.75 $8.50 - $7.50
+50 N/A N/A $12.00 $4.50 - $8.00
. $3.40 per ton-West Shed
COMMENTS :1755(§;I;SnNdi)2ch;rlll $3.00 per ton-East Shed
$4.00 per ton-North Shed
AFFIDAVIT COMPLETED YES YES YES YES YES YES
COPY OF INSURANCE
PROVIDED YES NO YES NO YES NO
COMMENTS




	1

