BID TABULATION - HEAVY TRUCK PARTS AND SUPPLIES 2012

HEAVY TRUCK PARTS
AND SUPPLIES 2012

TRACTOR TRAILER
SUPPLY CO

O'REILLY
AUTOMOTIVE
STORES INC

B & A AUTO PARTS

BID OPENING
39712 2525 NATURAL 233 S PATTERSON 146 7TH ST
BRIDGE ST LOUISMO |  SPRINGFIELD MO HILLSBORO MO
63107 65802 63050
DISTRIBUTOR STOCK
SUSPENSION
PRICE SHEET LIST LIST -
( DAYTON) PER CENT DISCOUNT 45.7% list minus 41% 59%
BRAKE & WHEEL
PRICE SHEET LIST LIST -
ATIONAL SEAL) PER CENT DISCOU 55% list minus 41% 54%
BRAKE & WHEEL
PRICE SHEET LIST LIST -
( ABEX) PER CENT DISCOUNT 48% list minus 41% 43%
BRAKE & WHEEL
PRICE SHEET LIST LIST -
( ANCHOR) PER CENT DISCOUNT 45% list minus 41% 55%
BRAKE & WHEEL
PRICE SHEET LIST LIST -
(LUCAS) PER CENT DISCOUNT 54% list minus 41% 55%
BRAKE & WHEEL
PRICE SHEET LIST LIST -
( STOP-BOX) PER CENT DISCOUNT 55% list minus 41% 43%
DRIVETRAIN
PRICE SHEET LIST LIST -
(SPICER) PER CENT DISCOUNT 50% list minus 41% 53%
DRIVETRAIN
PRICE SHEET LIST LIST -
BCA BEARING) PER CENT DISCOUN 55% list minus 41% 62%
ELECTRICAL
PRICE SHEET LIST - -
BRAND NAME BID - - WAI-GLOBAL
PER CENT DISCOUNT 40% - 56%
ELECTRICAL
PRICE SHEET - LIST -
BRAND NAME BID - WILSON WAI-GLOBAL
PER CENT DISCOUNT - list minus 41% 57%
SUSPENSION
PRICE SHEET $569.16 NO BID NO BID
LESS DISCOUNT 46% NO BID NO BID
NET AMOUNT $309.28 NO BID NO BID
ALTERNATOR
PRICE SHEET $624.40 $622.10 $473.33
LESS DISCOUNT 40% 41% 56%
NET AMOUNT $374.64 $367.04 $206.55




BID TABULATION - HEAVY TRUCK PARTS AND SUPPLIES 2012

TRACTOR TRAILER AUC')I'gIIf/II(IS'II_'\I(VE B & A AUTO PARTS
HEAVY TRUCK PARTS SUPPLY CO STORES INC
AND SUPPLIES 2012
DRIVETRAIN (107-237-10MO)
PRICE SHEET NO BID NO BID $925.33
LESS DISCOUNT NO BID NO BID 39%
NET AMOUNT NO BID NO BID $555.20
DRIVETRAIN (107-683-5MO)
PRICE SHEET NO BID NO BID $568.83
LESS DISCOUNT NO BID NO BID 39%
NET AMOUNT NO BID NO BID $341.30
BRAKE & WHEEL (55250)
PRICE SHEET $110.81 $89.67 $110.99
LESS DISCOUNT 54% 41% 42%
NET AMOUNT $51.34 $52.91 $63.70
BRAKE & WHEEL (370003A)
PRICE SHEET $76.41 $50.79 $94.49
LESS DISCOUNT 58% 41% 54%
NET AMOUNT $31.96 $29.97 $42.89
BRAKE & WHEEL (SD7654D786)
PRICE SHEET $113.22 $169.66 $133.99
LESS DISCOUNT 48% 41% 48%
NET AMOUNT $58.29 $100.10 $68.52
AFFIDAVIT COMPLETED YES YES YES
COPY OF INSURANCE PROVIDED YES NO YES
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Parts list and Pricing visit
Manufacturers price list | website. Discount of list
COMMENTS: are available on their price less 41% or better
websit or on a cd applies to all available
product lines.
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