BID TABULATION - LAW ENFORCEMENT UNIFORMS 2012

ED ROEHR SAFETY | PRIORITY PUBLIC
LAW ENFORCEMENT UNIFORMS 2012 PRODUGTS SAFETY LLC
BID OPENING
8-14-12
Contract term: 8-27-12 to 8-26-13 22?,&88,?&? 659 MARTIN DUKE VAN
ALSTYNETX 75495
63103
SHORT SLEEVE SHIRT "A’ UNIFORM
SILVERTAN W/ BROWN EPAULETS &
POCKET FLAPS POLYESTER 55
MILITARY SEWN BADGE TAB
MANUFACTURE SOUTHEASTERN NO BID
145-175 $34.44 NO BID
18- 185 $34.44 NO BID
19-20 $34.44 NO BID
22 $34.44 NO BID
LONG SLEEVE SHIRT "A’ UNIFORM
SILVERTAN W/ BROWN EPAULETS &
POCKET FLAPS POLYESTER 55
MILITARY SEWN BADGE TAB
MANUFACTURE SOUTHEASTERN NO BID
145-175 $40.53 NO BID
18-185 $40.53 NO BID
19-20 $40.53 NO BID
22 $40.53 NO BID
SHORT SLEEVE 'A” RANKING SHIRT
WHITE W/ BROWN EPAULETS &
POCKET FLAP 5 MILITARY SEWN
BADGE TAB
MANUFACTURE BLAVER NO BID
145-175 $34.44 NO BID
18- 185 $34.44 NO BID
19-20 $34.44 NO BID
22 $34.44 NO BID
LONG SLEEVE ‘A" RANKING SHIRT
WHITE W/ BROWN EPAULETS &
POCKET FLAP 5 MILITARY SEWN
BADGE TAB
MANUFACTURE BLAVER NO BID
145-175 $40.53 NO BID
18-185 $40.53 NO BID
19-20 $40.53 NO BID
22 $40.53 NO BID
MEN'S CLASS "A" POLYESTER, DUTY
TROUSERS BROWN 13 0Z. ELASTIQUE
WESTERN TOP POCKETS & KEYSTONE
BELT LOOPS
MANUFACTURE PERFECTION NO BID
28-42 $43.00 NO BID
44 - 50 $43.00 NO BID
5254 $43.00 NO BID
WOMEN'S CLASS "A" POLYESTER,
DUTY TROUSERS BROWN 13 OZ.
ELASTIQUE WESTERN TOP POCKETS &
KEYSTONE LOOPS
MANUFACTURE PERFECTION NO BID
4-18 $43.00 NO BID
20-24 $43.00 NO BID
MENS CLASS "B" SIDE CARGO POCKET
TROUSERS BROWN 65/35%
POLYESTER/COTTON 11 0Z
TWILLDOUBLE PLEATED THIGH
POCKETS W/ STRIPING UNDER POCKET
FLAP (K-9 & SPECIAL UNITS)
MANUFACTURE BLAVER NO BID
28-42 $50.00 NO BID
44 -50 $50.00 NO BID
52-54 $50.00 NO BID
WOMENS CLASS "B" SIDE CARGO
POCKET TROUSERS BROWN 65/35%
POLYESTER/COTTON 11 0Z
TWILLDOUBLE PLEATED THIGH
POCKETS W/ STRIPING UNDER POCKET
FLAP (K-9 & SPECIAL UNITS)
MANUFACTURE BLAVER NO BID
4-18 $50.00 NO BID
20-24 $50.00 NO BID
BLACK LIGHTWEIGHT TACTICAL
TROUSERS 65/35 POLYESTER/COTTON
RIP-STOP, NINE POCKET REINFORCED
SEAT & KNEES AND MATCHING BELT
MANUFACTURE PROPPER NO BID
28-46 $29.00 NO BID
48-54 $29.00 NO BID
BROWN WATERPROOF/WINDPROOF
BOMBER JACKET TASIAN
OUTERSHELL REVERSIBLE HI-VIS W/
3M SCOTCHLITE REFECTIE STRIPING &
ZIP - OUT THINSULATE INNER LINER
MANUFACTURE GERBER OR BLAVER NO BID
S-XL $114.00 NO BID
2XL $114.00 NO BID
3XL $114.00 NO BID
4XL $114.00 NO BID
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RAIN COAT 48"ANSI CLASS 3 BLACK/
HI-VIS W/ SCOTCHLITE STRIPING ,
DOUBLE TORN FLAP, ELASTICIZED
CUFFS, SIDE EQUIPMENT OPENING

MANUFACTURE GERBER NO BID
S-XL $72.00 NO BID
2XL $72.00 NO BID
3XL $72.00 NO BID
4XL $72.00 NO BID
CLARINO HI-GLOSS OXFORD SHOES
MANUFACTURE ORIGINAL SWAT NO BID
ALL SIZES $36.00 NO BID
BLACK 8" WATERPROOF SIDE ZIPPER
BOOTS LEATHER & NYLON, PLAIN TOE
MANUFACTURE THOROGOOD NO BID
ALL SIZES $69.00 NO BID
BROWN STRAW TRIPLE BRIM
CAMPAIGN STYLE HAT
MANUFACTURE ALBOUM NO BID
65-8 $69.00 NO BID
BROWN FELT TRIPLE BRIM CAMPAIGN
STYLE HAT
MANUFACTURE ALBOUM NO BID
65-8 $79.00 NO BID
3 PIECE KENTUCKY STYLE
HAT STRAP
MANUFACTURE ALBOUM NO BID
ONE SIZE $5.00 NO BID
CAMPAIGN/LAWMAN STYLE RAIN HAT
COVER
MANUFACTURE ALBOUM PREMIER EMBLEM
ALL $5.00 $2.95 EA
BROWN CLIP-ON UNIFORM TIE 100%
TEXTURED POLYESTER W/
BUTTONHOLES
MANUFACTURE BROOME PREMIER EMBLEM
145" SHORT $4.00 NO BID
18" REGULAR $4.00 $2.25 EA 22"
20" LONG $4.00 $2.25 EA
TIE BAR SHERIFF'S DEPT STAR W
BROWN ENAMEL
MANUFACTURE PREMIER PREMIER EMBLEM
N/A $5.27 $5.95 EA

J.C. COLLAR BRASS -
CLUTCH BACKIN SILVER OR GOLD

MANUFACTURE

SMITH & WARREN

PREMIER EMBLEM

9/16"

$5.29

$6.40 EA

S.0. COLLAR BRASS -
CLUTCH BACK IN SILVER OR GOLD

MANUFACTURE SMITH & WARREN PREMIER EMBLEM
9/16" $5.29 $4.75/$3.60 EA
SILVER METAL FRAME NAMEPLATES,
CLUTCH BACK W/BLACK
BACKGROUND & WHITE LETTERS
MANUFACTURE REEVES NO BID
N/A $10.20 NO BID
GOLD METAL FRAME NAMEPLATES,
CLUTCH BACK W/BROWN
BACKGROUND & WHITE LETTERS
MANUFACTURE REEVES NO BID
N/A $10.20 NO BID
AMERICAN FLAG BAR PIN RECTANGLE
13/4" LONG
MANUFACTURE PREMIER PREMIER EMBLEM
N/A $3.00 $2.50 EA
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2.25" BLACK BASKETWEAVE
BUCKLESS DUTY BELT VELCRO

CLOSURE & ATTACHMENT
MANUFACTURE SAFARILAND PREMIER EMBLEM
26-44 $50.88 $30.25 EA
46 $50.88 $33.00 EA
48 $50.88 $40.90 EA
50 $50.88 $40.90 EA
BLACK REVERSIBLE BASKETWEAVE
VELCRO INNER BELT 1.5
MANUFACTURE SAFARILAND PREMIER EMBLEM
S- XL $28.00 $12.50 EA
2XL $28.00 $14.50 EA
BLACK BASKETWEAVE LEVEL 2
RETENTION HOLSTER FORWARD
RETENTION DESIGN WITH FRONT
THUMB BREAK
MANUFACTURE G&G KROLL/SAFARILAND
GLOCK 17 $104.00 $145.95 EA
BLACK BASKETWEAVE LEVEL 2
RETENTION HOLSTER TO FIT GLOCK
22 W/ TLR-1 TACTICAL LIGHT
MANUFACTURE SAFARILAND KROLL/SAFARILAND
GLOCK 17 $108.62 $125.95 EA
BLACK BASKETWEAVE DOUBLE
MAGAZINE CASE WITH HIDDEN SNAP
CLOSURE
MANUFACTURE SAFARILAND KROLL
GLOCK 17 $27.76 $28.50 EA
BLACK BASKETWEAVE SINGLE
HANDCUFF CASE WITH HIDDEN SNAP
CLOSURE
MANUFACTURE SAFARILAND PREMIER EMBLEM
STANDARD $23.00 $12.60 EA
BLACK BASKETWEAVE OVERSIZE
HANDCUFF CASE WITH HIDDEN SNAP
CLOSURE
MANUFACTURE SAFARILAND NO BID
OVERSIZE $25.00
BLACK BASKETWEAVE MK4 OC SPRAY
CASE WITH HIDDEN SNAP CLOSURE
MANUFACTURE SAFARILAND PREMIER EMBLEM
MK4 $22.00 $12.95 EA
BLACK BASKETWEAVE VELCRO
GLOVE POUCH WITH VELCRO
CLOSURE
MANUFACTURE SAFARILAND PREMIER EMBLEM
DOUBLE $13.60 $9.50 EA
BLACK BASKETWEAVE "D" CELL
FLASHLIGHT RING
MANUFACTURE SAFARILAND PREMIER EMBLEM
“D" CELL $7.90 $4.35 EA
BLACK BASKETWEAVE UNIVERSAL
RADIO HOLDER
MANUFACTURE BOSTON PREMIER EMBLEM
UNIVERSAL $16.00 $9.99 EA
BLACK BASKETWEAVE EXPANDABLE
BATON HOLDER
MANUFACTURE SAFARILAND NO BID
21" $20.50 NO BID
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BLACK BASKETWEAVE HIDDEN SNAP

BELT KEEPER
MANUFACTURE PERFECT FIT PREMIER EMBLEM
N/A $3.18 $2.40 EA
BLACK BASKETWEAVE DOUBLE REAR
BELT KEEPER HIDDEN SNAP CLOSURE
MANUFACTURE PERFECT FIT NO BID
DOUBLE $9.00 NO BID
BLACK BASKETWEAVE OPEN TOP
STRION CASE
MANUFACTURE STALLION PREMIER EMBLEM
STRION $18.00 $6.56/$8.55 EA
BLACK BASKETWEAVE OPEN TOP
STINGER CASE
MANUFACTURE STALLION PREMIER EMBLEM
STINGER $20.00 $12.28 EA
BLACK BASKETWEAVE TACTICAL
LIGHT CASE
MANUFACTURE SAFARILAND PREMIER EMBLEM
TLR-1 $20.00 $7.95 EA
BLACK NYLON VELCRO 2 1/4" DUTY
BELT
MANUFACTURE BIANCHI PREMIER EMBLEM
S- XL $18.00 $11,50 EA/$11.95-XL
2XL $18.00 $13.68 EA
BLACK NYLON VELCRO 1.5"
UNDERBELT
MANUFACTURE BIANCHI PREMIER EMBLEM
S- XL $14.00 $6.40 EA/$8.95-XL
2XL $14.00 $8.95 EA
BLACK NYLON LEVEL 2 RETENTION
HOLSTER ROCK FORWARD RETENTION
STYLE W/ WRAP AROUND FRONT
THUMBREAK
MANUFACTURE SAFARILAND NO BID
GLOCK 22 $115.00 NO BID
BLACK NYLON DOUBLE MAGAZINE
CASE WITH HIDDEN SNAP CLOSURE
MANUFACTURE BIANCHI PREMIER EMBLEM
GLOCK 22 $19.00 $11.89 EA
BLACK NYLON SINGLE HANDCUFF
CASE WITH HIDDEN SNAP CLOSURE
MANUFACTURE BIANCHI PREMIER EMBLEM
GLOCK 22 $12.00 $8.50 EA
BLACK NYLON MK4 OC SPRAY CASE
WITH HIDDEN SNAP CLOSURE
MANUFACTURE BIANCHI PREMIER EMBLEM
MK4 $12.00 $7.00 EA
BLACK NYLON VELCRO GLOVE POUCH
MANUFACTURE BIANCHI PREMIER EMBLEM
DOUBLE $9.00 $7.00 EA
BLACK NYLON "D" CELL FLASHLIGHT
RING
MANUFACTURE BIANCHI PREMIER EMBLEM
“D" CELL $5.00 $2.85 EA
BLACK NYLON UNIVERSAL RADIO
HOLDER
MANUFACTURE BOSTON PREMIER EMBLEM
UNIVERSAL $16.00 $14.85 EA
BLACK NYLON EXPANDABLE BATON
HOLDER
MANUFACTURE BIANCHI PREMIER EMBLEM
21" $11.00 $8.00 EA
BLACK NYLON SINGLE BELT KEEPER
MANUFACTURE BIANCHI PREMIER EMBLEM
SINGLE $2.08 $3.75 (PKG 4)
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BLACK NYLON DOUBLE REAR BELT

KEEPER
MANUFACTURE PERFECT FIT NO BID
DOUBLE $9.00 NO BID
BLACK NYLON KEY RING
MANUFACTURE BIANCHI PREMIER EMBLEM
NIA $7.00 $3.15EA
PEERLESS MODEL 700 NICKEL
HANDCUFFS
MANUFACTURE PEERLESS KROLL/PEERLESS
N/A $22.00 $20.50 EA
SAFARILAND OVER/UNDERSIZE
NICKELHANDCUFFS
KROLL/SMITH
MANUFACTURE SAFARILAND WESSON
N/A $26.00 $25.95 EA
SABRE RED MK4 OC SPRAY, 3.3 0Z
MANUFACTURE SABRE KROLL/SABRE RED
MK4 $11.60 $10.99 EA
21" EXPANDABLE BATON
MANUFACTURE AsP PREMIER EMBLEM
21" $70.00 $25.02 EA
STEAMLIGHT STRION LED
RECHARGEABLE LIGHT W/ AC
CHARGER
MANUFACTURE STREAMLIGHT | KROLL/STREAMLIGHT
STRION $91.00 $94.50 EA
STREAMLIGHT STINGER DS LED
RECHARGEABLE LIGHT W/ AC
CHARGER
MANUFACTURE STREAMLIGHT | KROLL/STREAMLIGHT
STINGER $90.00 $99.95 EA
STREAMLIGHT SL-20L C4 LED
RECHARGEABLE LIGHT W/ AC
CHARGER
MANUFACTURE STREAMLIGHT | KROLL/STREAMLIGHT
SL-20L $98.00 $112.95 EA
STREAMLIGHT TLR-1 WEAPON
MOUNTED LED LIGHT C4 LED W/ 2
CR123 3V BATTERIES
MANUFACTURE STREAMLIGHT | KROLL/STREAMLIGHT
TLR-1 $88.00 $100.50 EA
ANSI CLASS 2 HI-VIS MESH SAFETY
VEST YELLOW/ORANGE STRIPING W/
SHERIFF IMPRINT FRONT & REAR IN
BLACK
MANUFACTURE GERBER PREMIER EMBLEM
ALL $35.86 $18.95 EA
BODY ARMOR BALLISTIC-RESISTANCE
VEST
ABA XTREME
MANUFACTURE NIJ LEVEL 2 NO BID
COMPLIANT
ALL $500.00 NO BID
BODY ARMOR STAB RESISTANCE VEST
SECOND CHANCE
MANUFACTURE NIJ SPIKE 2 NO BID
COMPLIANT
ALL $430.00 NO BID
OVERSHIRT BALLISTIC VEST CARRIER
ABA
INCLUDES BROWN
MANUFACTURE EPAULETS & NO BID
POCKET FLAPS
ALL $80.00 NO BID
NYLON CONTROL STRAPS "HOBBLES"
NYLON STRAP MATERIAL W/ SPRING
BUCKLES
HUMANE
MANUFACTURE RESTRAINTS NO BID
RIPP
ALL $18.00 NO BID
AFFIDAVIT COMPLETED YES YES
COPY OF INSURANCE PROVIDED YES NO

COMMENTS:
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