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RETAINING WALL
A. SMALL BLOCKS: FOR
EACH TYPE BEING OFFERED,
PROVIDE THE FOLLOWING;
1. BRAND & TYPE NQ BID ROCKWOOD 8" CLASSIC
MODULE UNITS PER PALLET NO BID 36
COURSING HEIGHT NOBID 8"
SPACING "
(CENTER TO CENTER) NOBID 18
WALL HEIGHTS .
(W/O REINFORCEMENT) NO BID 4
WEIGHT PER MODULE NO BID 80 Ibs
AVAILABLE COLORS NO BID Gray-Taupe-Goldenrod
COST PERPALLET $ NOBID $151.20 Gray
DISCOUNT FOR 10+ PALLETS NOBID 0
2. BRAND & TYPE NO BID ANCHOR HAMPTON
MODULE UNITS PER PALLET NO BID 48
COURSING HEIGHT NO BID "
SPACING "
(CENTER TO CENTER) NOBID 17
WALL HEIGHTS ,
(W/0 REINFORCEMENT) NO BID 3
WEIGHT PER MODULE NOBID 57 Ibs
AVATLABLE COLORS NO BID Gray-Tan Chocolate
COST PER PALLET § NO BID $155.20 Gray
DISCOUNT FOR 10+ PALLETS NO BID 0
3. BRAND & TYPE NO BID ANCHOR DIAMOND
MODULE UNITS PER PALLET NO BID 36
COURSING HEIGHT NO BID 6"
SPACING "
{(CENTER TO CENTER) NOBID 17
WALL HEIGHTS .
(W/O REINFORCEMENT) NO BID 4
WEIGHT PER MODULE NO BID 72 lbs
AVAILABLE COLORS NO BID Gray-Tan Ficldstone-
Rosestone
COST PER PALLET § NO BID $147.20 Gray
DISCOUNT FOR 10+ PALLETS NO BID 0
4. BRAND & TYPE NO BID ANCHOR DIAMOND PRO
MODULE UNITS PER PALLET NO BID 36
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ARNOLD READY MIX AAA ZOELLLNER
PRECAST RETAINING WALL CORP ST LOUIS HARDSCAPE MATERIALS
2012
COURSING HEIGHT NO BID 6"
SPACING ]
(CENTER TO CENTER) NO BID 18
WALL HEIGHTS .
(W/O REINFORCEMENT) NO BID 4
WEIGHT PER MODULE NO BID 80 Ibs
AVAILABLE COLORS NO BID Gray-Tan
COST PER PALLET $ NO BID $179.40 Gray
DISCOUNT FOR 10+ PALLETS NO BID 0
5. BRAND & TYPE NO BID NO BID
VIODULE UNITS PER PALLET NO BID NO BID
COURSING HEIGHT NO BID NO BID
SPACING
(CENTER TO CENTER) NOBID NO BID
WALL HEIGHTS
(W/O REINFORCEMENT) NO BID NO BID
WEIGHT PER MODULE NO BID NO BID
AVAILABLE COLORS NO BID NO BID
COST PER PALLET $ NO BID NO BID
DISCOUNT FOR 10+ PALLETS NO BID NO BID
B. LARGE INTERLOCKING
BLOCKS: FOR EACH TYPE
UNIT BEING OFFERED, NO BID
PROVIDE THE FOLLOWING;
BRAND & TYPE NO BID NO BID
AVAILABLE PATTERNS NO BID NO BID
SIZE 24 SF X 44”
COST EACH NO BID NO BID
SIZE 6 SF X 44”
COST EACH NO BID NO BID
SIZE 3 SF X 447
COST EACH NO BID NO BID
SIZE END UNIT
COST BACH NO BID NO BID
SIZE CORNER UNIT
COST EACH NOBID NOBID
SIZE DUAL FACE
COST EACH NO BID NO BID
SIZE CAP BLOCK
COST BACEH NO BID NO BID
MINIMUM ORDER NO BID NO BID
DISCOUNT FOR VOLUME NO BID NO BID
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ARNOLD READY MIX AAA ZOELLNER
PRECAST RETAINING WALL CORP ST LOUIS HARDSCAPE MATERIALS
2012
C. LARGE STACKED BLOCKS:
FOR EACH TYPE UNIT BEING NO BID
OFFERED, PROVIDE THE
FOLLOWING;
S1ZE FULL
_30"_X 60"_ $45.00 NO BID
COST EACH
SIZE HALF
30" X _30m_ $45.00 NO BID
COST EACH
SIZE CAP
15" X 60"_ 545,00 NO BID
COST EACH
SIZE Y CAP
_15" X 30" $45.00 NO BID
COST EACH
MINIMUM ORDER 12 FOR DELIVERY NO BID
DISCOUNT FOR YOLUME - NO BID
DATE BID PRICES EXPIRE 4/20/13 3/1/13 12/31/12
AFFIDAVIT COMPLETED YES YES YES
COPY OF INSURANCE
PROVIDED YES YES NO
They con provide free job
COMMENTS: Picked up price is $35.00 | site Cf)nsultatlon. They can | SEE ATTACHED PRICE
each provide samples for color SHEET

selection,




5555 Old Hwy. 21/ P.O. Box 2168
Imperial, MO 63052
Phone: 636-942-4400

Fax: 636-942-9891]
Www.aaazoellnermaterials.com

Pre-cast Concrete Blocks*
(Returned Concrete)

Knob Style Blocks (Hx W x 1): Standard block with chamfered edges.
Approximate weight 4250 Ibs. Up to 7.5 feet tall withour geogrid*

30” x 30” x 60” Full $57.50
30” x 30”x 30” Half $47.50
157 x 30” x 60” Full Cap $47.50
157 x 30” x 30” Half Cap $37.50
Approximate weight 2500 Ips. Up to 6 feet tall without geogrid*,
24” x 24”x 48” Full $50.00
24” X 24” x 24” Half $40.00
127 x 24” x 48 Full Cap $40.00
127 x 24” x 24” Half Cap $30.00

Landscape Blocks (Hx W x L): Boulder-faced, 2” offset for terracing, and
tapered ends to allow for straight walls or curved walls down to a 14 foot radius
curve. Approximate weight 2300 Ibs. Up to 6 feet tall withour geogrid*

24" x 24” x 48” Full $62.50
24” x 24” x 24” Half $52.50
24” x 24” x 48” Right Corner $65.00
24” x 24” x 48” Left Corner $65.00
24” x 24” x 48” Full Cap $62.50
24” x 24” x 24” Half Cap $52.50

Mid-Size Landscape Blocks (1 x W x L) Boulder-faced, 1” offset for
terracing, tapered ends to allow for straj ght walls or curved walls down to a 6 foot
radius curve. Approximate weight 600 [bs.

14” x 26”x 24” Full $17.50 P/U @ Plant

All'block deliveries require an 8 block minimum,

*Dependent on jobsite conditions, Engineered, site specific plans recommended.
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