BID TABULATION - PRINTER COPIER FAX SUPPLIES 2013

THE OFFICE COAST TO SUPPLY OFFICE METRO NSC
PRINTER, COPIER AND FAX SUPPLIES 2013 PAL COAST EQUIP. CONCEPTS DATAMAX QUILL SOURCE OFFICE |DIVERSIFIED
BID OPENING 10-30-12 & SUPPLIES INC SUPPLY
Contract term:1-1-13 to 12-31-13 upon approval by the POBOX2 | 10964 LIN-VALLEDR | 1585 FENPARK DR | 6717 WALDEMAR | 100 SCHELTERRD | 719 RUDDERRD | 102 E MAIN | 9677 PAGE AVE
County Council and the County Executive LAKEWOOD NJ ST LOUIS MO FENTON MO ST LOUIS MO LINCOLNSHIRE IL FENTONMO | FESTUSMO | ST LOUIS MO
08701 63123 63026 63139 60069 63026 63028 63132
SUGGESTED SUGGESTED UNIT OF
CTY ID |ITEM DESCRIPTION MANUFACTURE ITEM # MEASURE USAGE
13511 |Copier Staples - Sharp Copiers, 3 Boxes/Carton Sharp SF-Scll BOX 0 $14.62 $30.30 $29.50 $36.36 $32.50 $39.00 NO BID NO BID
13512 |Copier Staples - Sharp AR-M237 Copier, 3/Box Sharp AR-SC1 BOX 0 $15.16 $33.25 $17.25 $35.98 $36.00 $39.00 NO BID NO BID
13513 |Copier Staples - Sharp AR-M277 Copier, 3/Box Sharp AR-SC1 BOX 0 $15.16 $33.25 $19.50 $35.98 $36.00 $39.00 NO BID NO BID
13514 |Copier Staples - Sharp AR-M350 Copier AG559, 3/Box Sharp AR-SC1 BOX 0 $15.16 $30.30 $19.50 $35.98 $36.00 $39.00 NO BID NO BID
13515 |Copier Staples - Sharp AR-M620 Copier, 3/Box Sharp sci1 BOX 0 $23.40 $30.30 $21.50 $36.36 $32.50 $39.00 NO BID NO BID
Copier Staples - Canon Copier E-1 Staple Cartridge for use in Canon NP 6050
13520 |Copier & Toshiba 3560; 5,000/Case Canon E-1 0251A001AA CASE 0 $27.09 $30.30 $27.65 $48.55 $51.00 $47.00 $52.89 NO BID
Topier STaples - Ricon ATicio 270 Copier, also Tor Toshiba Studio E 35, Savin
13523 [Type G 320R-AM, Cartridges/3Case Savin Type G 9670 CASE 0 $29.79 $33.25 $31.15 NO BID NO BID $26.00 NO BID NO BID
13551 [Copier Staples - Staple Cartridge for use in Panasonic DP2500, 3/Carton Panasonic DQSS200 CARTON 0 $24.03 $33.25 $47.20 NO BID NO BID $26.00 NO BID NO BID
Copier Staples - Staple Cartridge for use In Panasonic DP4510 & DP6010 &
13552 |DP4520 &D6020H, Toshiba Estudio 603 T700 staple cartridge, bx. Panasonic FQSS66 BOX 3 $20.50 $30.30 $43.10 NO BID NO BID $29.00 NO BID NO BID
13553 | Copier Staples - Staple Cartridge for use in Panasonic DP3510 Panasonic FQSS32 CARTON 0 $24.03 $33.25 $36.50 NO BID NO BID $26.00 NO BID NO BID
Copier Staples - Staple Cartridge for use In Panasonic DP3510, 73120114 -
13554 |5/Box Panasonic FQSS50 BOX 0 $24.03 $29.11 $19.75 NO BID NO BID $26.00 NO BID NO BID
14204 [Toner - Sharp AR270 NT1 also AR310NT Sharp * SHRAR31ONT EACH 15 $54.53 $83.12 $78.15 $79.72 $109.28 $95.00 $116.27 NO BID
14205 [Toner - Sharp AR450U Sharp * SHRARASONT EACH 4 $44.04 $55.70 $47.95 $51.68 $51.00 $64.00 $74.24 NO BID
14206 |Toner - Sharp ARMB20U Sharp* SHRARG2INTL EACH » $76.99 $86.08 $67.15 $90.22 $82.00 $86.00 NO BID NO BID
14207 [Toner - Sharp ARM255N,355/455 Sharp * SHRAR4SENTL EACH 11 $50.13 $86.08 $55.15 $63.93 $89.00 $69.00 $90.48 NO BID
14303 [Toner - XEROX MFP 8560 Color, Cyan, 3/Box XEROX * XER108R00723 BOX 1 $88.00 $68.06 $108.00 $128.97 $109.17 $98.00 $124.54 NO BID
14304 [Toner - XEROX MFC 8560 Color, Magenta, 3/Box XEROX * XER108R00724 BOX 1 $88.00 $113.55 $108.00 $128.97 $109.17 $98.00 $124.54 NO BID
14305 [Toner - XEROX MFC 8560 Color, Yellow, 3/Box XEROX * XER108R00725 BOX 1 $88.00 $113.55 $108.00 $117.43 $109.17 $98.00 $124.54 NO BID
14306 [Toner - XEROX MFC 8560 Color, Black, 3/Box XEROX * XER108R00726 BOX 1 $55.00 $77.75 $71.10 $77.46 $75.54 $67.00 $83.33 NO BID
14307 [Toner - XEROX MFC 8560 Color, Black, 6/Box XEROX * XER108R00727 BOX 1 $88.00 $110.99 $105.90 $114.53 $108.84 $114.00 $129.19 NO BID
14509 [Toner - Toshiba T3500 Studio E35 and Studio E34, 4 Cartidges/Box Toshiba * TOST3500 BOX 0 $13.84 $33.40 $19.50 NO BID $21.82 $19.00 $95.60 NO BID
14601 [Toner - Toshiba E-studio 555/655 Toshiba * TOST8550 EACH 5 $84.87 $94.31 $63.70 NO BID $101.00 $59.00 NO BID NO BID
Toner - Toshiba E-Studio 523752317603, Assessor 107 17620, PZ 1a# 17475, PW
14603 |id# 17617 Toshiba * TOST7200 EACH 4 $78.30 $94.31 $77.10 NO BID $93.00 $81.00 NO BID NO BID
14604 | Toner - Toshiba 2060 Toshiba * TOST2060 EACH 0 $10.75 $33.65 $12.95 NO BID $23.56 $12.00 $25.72 NO BID
14608 [Toner - Toshiba DP 2570 Toshiba * TOST2460 EACH 0 $14.14 $40.82 $10.95 NO BID $33.32 $20.00 $37.03 NO BID
14613 [Toner - Toshiba Studio E 230/280 Toshiba * TOST2320 EACH 0 $35.33 $59.57 $17.10 NO BID $52.08 $44.00 $213.99 NO BID
14615 [Toner - Toshiba 1350, 4/Carton Toshiba * TOST1350 CARTON 0 $10.54 $27.95 $33.15 NO BID $14.82 $48.00 $77.63 NO BID
14702 [Toner - Panasonic DP2000/2500 Panasonic * DQTU18B EACH 1 $98.23 $107.50 $36.10 $112.19 $126.00 $101.95 NO BID NO BID
14703 [Toner - Panasonic DP18 WORKIO/DP1810P Panasonic * DQTU10C EACH 0 $65.06 $57.87 $33.00 NO BID $60.00 $49.00 NO BID NO BID
14704 |Toner - Panasonic DP6010 panasonic * DO-TUSSD EACH o $59.44 $63.19 $41.80 $63.58 $69.00 $54.00 NO BID NO BID
14705 [Toner - Panasonic DP4510, DP3510 Panasonic * DQTU24D EACH 0 $51.32 $61.06 $40.95 $48.91 $66.00 $50.00 $62.03 NO BID
14706 [Toner - Panasonic DP4520 Panasonic * DQTU33G EACH 4 $54.74 $63.19 $50.90 $52.18 $72.00 $54.00 $74.36 NO BID
14707 [Toner - Panasonic DP2310/3030 Panasonic * DQTU1SE EACH 2 $39.81 $55.21 $42.70 $41.31 $59.00 $43.00 $62.24 NO BID
14800 |Toner - Minolta Bizhub 222 Minolta * — EACH i $47.61 $52.93 $39.90 $52.98 $62.90 $46.00 NO BID NO BID
15101 [Laser Toner - HP Laserjet 1300 Series HP * HEWQ2613X EACH 0 $50.00 $99.22 $80.15 $98.06 $91.28 $89.00 $114.78 $39.00




BID TABULATION - PRINTER COPIER FAX SUPPLIES 2013

THE OFFICE COAST TO SUPPLY OFFICE METRO NSC
PRINTER, COPIER AND FAX SUPPLIES 2013 PAL COAST EQUIP. CONCEPTS DATAMAX QUILL SOURCE OFFICE | DIVERSIFIED
BID OPENING 10-30-12 & SUPPLIES INC SUPPLY
Contract term:1-1-13 to 12-31-13 upon approval by the PO BOX 2 10964 LIN-VALLE DR | 1585 FENPARK DR | 6717 WALDEMAR | 100 SCHELTERRD | 719 RUDDERRD | 102 E MAIN | 9677 PAGE AVE
County Council and the County Executive LAKEWOOD NJ ST LOUIS MO FENTON MO ST LOUIS MO LINCOLNSHIRE IL FENTONMO | FESTUSMO | ST LOUIS MO
08701 63123 63026 63139 60069 63026 63028 63132
CTY ID |ITEM DESCRIPTION i/IL»JAGl\IGUEFS»:CE'PURE lS.IEJEG’vfisTED aNEES?JFRE USAGE
15103 [Laser Toner - HP LaserJet 4V, 4MV Black HP * HEWC3900A EACH 0 $2.00 $48.89 $60.20 NO BID NO BID $110.00 NO BID $45.00
15104 |Laser Toner - HP LaserJet, 1012, 1020, 1022, 3020, & 3030 Series, Black HP * HEWQ2612A EACH 2 $57.70 $71.32 $63.10 $67.39 $64.89 $63.00 $70.33 $31.00
15107 |Laser Toner - HP LaserJet 4200 Series HP * HEWQ1338A EACH 11 $126.00 $144.57 $138.15 $147.90 $134.68 $139.00 $155.64 $59.00
15108 |Laser Toner - HP 8100DN Printer, Black HP * HEWC4182X EACH 0 $100.00 $199.94 $160.10 $208.73 $186.04 $160.00 $229.52 $47.00
15109 |Laser Toner - Hewlett Packard 4000, 4000N, 4000SE, 4050N HP * HEWC4127X EACH 11 $95.00 $138.46 $133.15 $141.17 $128.56 $130.00 $159.04 $41.00
15112 |Laser Toner - HP 8500 Printer, Magenta HP * HEWC4151A EACH 0 $3.00 $61.81 $140.15 NO BID NO BID $219.00 NO BID NO BID
15114 [Laser Toner - HP Color Laser Jet 4500 and 4550N Series, Black HP * HEWCA4191A EACH 2 $5.00 $39.08 $121.70 NO BID NO BID $80.00 $108.37 $49.00
15115 |Laser Toner - HP Color Laser Jet 4500 and 4550N Series, Cyan HP * HEWC4192A EACH 1 $5.00 $49.12 $121.70 NO BID NO BID $90.00 $149.37 $57.00
15116 |Laser Toner - HP Color Laser Jet 4500 and 4550N Series, Magenta HP * HEWC4193A EACH 1 $5.00 $49.12 $121.70 NO BID NO BID $90.00 $149.37 $57.00
15117 [Laser Toner - HP Color Laser Jet 4500 and 4550N Series, Yellow HP * HEWCA4194A EACH 2 $5.00 $49.12 $121.70 NO BID $127.93 $90.00 $151.26 $57.00
15118 |Drum - HP Color Laser Jet 4500 and 4550N Series HP * HEWC4195A EACH 1 $15.00 $57.58 $96.15 NO BID NO BID $80.00 NO BID NO BID
15119 |Laser Toner - HP 2100 Series, Black HP * HEWC4096A EACH 0 $50.00 $111.01 $79.90 $111.02 $103.33 $95.00 $120.74 $39.00
15120 |Laser Toner - HP 4100 Series, Black HP * HEWC8061X EACH 16 $95.00 $138.46 $132.15 $141.17 $128.56 $125.00 $154.58 $41.00
15121 |Laser Toner - HP Laserjet 1000 Series, Black HP * HEWC7115AG EACH 18 $47.00 $72.09 $63.75 $67.52 $65.02 $59.00 NO BID $31.00
15122 |Transfer Kit - HP Color Laser Jet 4500 and 4550N Series HP * HEWC4196A EACH 0 $10.00 $212.04 $219.90 $277.94 $178.91 $180.00 NO BID NO BID
15123 |Fuser Kit - HP Color Laser Jet 4500 and 4550N Series HP * HEWC4197A EACH 0 $10.00 $217.24 $221.70 NO BID $197.89 $150.00 NO BID NO BID
15124 |Laser Toner - HP Laserjet 5500 Color Printer, Black HP * HEWC9730A EACH 2 $199.00 $226.13 $219.90 $237.52 $222.04 $215.00 $262.84 $115.00
15125 [Laser Toner - HP Laserjet 5500 Color Printer, Cyan HP * HEWC9731A EACH 2 $265.00 $313.09 $307.75 $333.08 $311.37 $300.00 $368.43 $118.00
15126 |Laser Toner - HP Laserjet 5500 Color Printer, Yellow HP * HEWC9732A EACH 1 $265.00 $313.09 $307.75 $333.08 $311.37 $300.00 $368.43 $118.00
15127 |Laser Toner - HP Laserjet 5500 Color Printer, Magenta HP * HEWC9733A EACH 1 $265.00 $313.09 $307.75 $333.08 $311.37 $300.00 $368.34 $118.00
15135 |Laser Toner - HP Laserjet 4600 Color Printer, Black HP * HEWC9720A EACH 3 $129.00 $165.88 $150.15 $171.30 $156.00 $150.00 $188.57 $87.00
15136 |Laser Toner - HP Laserjet 4600 Color Printer, Cyan HP * HEWC9721A EACH 3 $163.00 $221.20 $215.00 $232.10 $216.97 $205.00 $253.46 $87.00
15137 |Laser Toner - HP Laserjet 4600 Color Printer, Yellow HP * HEWC9722A EACH 3 $163.00 $221.20 $215.00 $232.10 $216.97 $205.00 $253.46 $87.00
15138 |Laser Toner - HP Laserjet 4600 Color Printer, Magenta HP * HEWC9723A EACH 4 $163.00 $221.20 $215.00 $232.10 $216.97 $205.00 $253.46 $87.00
15139 |Laser Toner - HP Laserjet 2550N Color Printer, Black HP * HEWQ3960A EACH 8 $63.53 $82.26 $73.99 $79.41 $76.47 $76.00 $87.67 $51.00
15140 [Laser Toner - HP Laserjet 2550N Color Printer, Cyan HP * HEWQ3961A EACH 5 $76.28 $97.16 $89.90 $95.80 $94.52 $92.00 $106.64 $53.00
15141 |Laser Toner - HP Laserjet 2550N Color Printer, Yellow HP * HEWQ3962A EACH 5 $76.28 $97.16 $89.90 $95.80 $94.52 $92.00 $106.64 $53.00
15142 |Laser Toner - HP Laserjet 2550N Color Printer, Magenta HP * HEWQ3963A EACH 4 $76.28 $97.16 $89.90 $95.80 $94.52 $92.00 $106.64 $53.00
15143 |Drum Unit - HP Laserjet 2550N Color Printer HP * HEWQ3964A EACH 9 $150.00 $196.44 $191.15 $204.88 $132.97 $180.00 $232.53 NO BID
15144 |Laser Toner - HP Laserjet 2300N Printer, Black HP * HEWQ2610A EACH 10 $112.00 $131.38 $124.00 $133.39 $121.47 $118.00 $151.46 $41.00
15145 |Laser Toner - HP Laserjet 4300 Printer, Black HP * HEWQ1339A EACH 2 $160.00 $188.17 $183.15 $195.81 $184.99 $179.00 $210.06 $61.00
15146 |Drum Unit - HP Laserjet 8500 Color Printer HP * HEWC4153A EACH 0 $5.00 $94.00 $121.75 NO BID NO BID $140.00 NO BID NO BID
15147 |Laser Toner - HP Laserjet 4350 Printer, Black HP * HEWQ5942X EACH 16 $188.00 $187.87 $202.19 $217.00 $193.42 $205.00 $235.62 $63.00
15148 |Laser Toner - HP Laserjet 2400 Series, Black HP * HEWQ6511X EACH 0 $160.00 $174.52 $166.15 $200.22 $178.45 $185.00 $220.67 $59.00
15149 |Laser Toner - P3005 or M3035 Printer, Black HP * HEWQ7551A EACH 21 $106.00 $123.50 $117.75 $124.73 $113.59 $118.00 $129.96 $49.00




BID TABULATION - PRINTER COPIER FAX SUPPLIES 2013

THE OFFICE COAST TO SUPPLY OFFICE METRO NSC
PRINTER, COPIER AND FAX SUPPLIES 2013 PAL COAST EQUIP. CONCEPTS DATAMAX QUILL SOURCE OFFICE | DIVERSIFIED
BID OPENING 10-30-12 & SUPPLIES INC SUPPLY
Contract term:1-1-13 to 12-31-13 upon approval by the PO BOX 2 10964 LIN-VALLE DR | 1585 FENPARK DR | 6717 WALDEMAR | 100 SCHELTERRD | 719 RUDDERRD | 102 E MAIN | 9677 PAGE AVE
County Council and the County Executive LAKEWOOD NJ ST LOUIS MO FENTON MO ST LOUIS MO LINCOLNSHIRE IL FENTONMO | FESTUSMO | ST LOUIS MO
08701 63123 63026 63139 60069 63026 63028 63132
CTY ID |ITEM DESCRIPTION i/IL»JAGl\IGUEFS»:CE'PURE lS_IEJEG'vfisTED aNEES?JFRE USAGE
15152 |450, o 2455 plck TS 1290, 1265, 1620, 1625, 1650, 1895, 2420, Lexmark * LEX1362925 EACH 0 $10.00 $203.69 $187.15 $236.62 $208.58 $205.00 NO BID NO BID
15155 |Laser Toner - Lexmark IBM 4039 10PLUS, 4049, Black Lexmark * LEX1382150 EACH 0 $10.00 $334.80 $299.99 $390.00 $329.12 $260.00 NO BID NO BID
15156 |Laser Toner - Lexmark IBM 4037 Pageprinter, Black Lexmark * LEX1382760 EACH 0 $10.00 $226.99 $107.15 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
15157 [Laser Toner - Lexmark E234N, Black Lexmark* LEX24015SA EACH 8 $68.00 $80.00 $73.75 $76.93 $77.46 $70.00 $88.69 NO BID
15158 |Laser Toner - LEXMARK T650 Printer, Black Lexmark* LEXT650A11A EACH 10 $125.00 $132.45 $128.10 $134.57 $128.13 $130.00 $147.39 NO BID
15159 |Laser Toner - Lexmark T520, T522 Printer, Black Lexmark * LEX12A6735 EACH 2 $199.00 $354.90 $360.15 $406.83 $349.49 $380.00 $444.24 NO BID
15160 [Laser Toner - HP Laserjet 1100 Series, 3200 Series, Black HP * HEWC4092A EACH 0 $10.00 $72.26 $47.15 $68.42 $69.84 $60.00 $77.18 $31.00
15161 |Laser Toner- HP LaserJet P1606DN, Black HP * HEWCE278A EACH 10 $60.09 $71.71 $65.85 $67.83 $65.31 $68.00 $75.86 $39.00
15165 |Laser Toner - HP Laserjet 90A, Black HP * HEWCE390A EACH 0 $134.09 $153.59 $121.15 $148.86 $143.70 $155.00 $173.37 $93.00
15170 |Laser Toner - HP LaserJet 3600 Cartridge, Black HP * HEWQ2670A EACH 0 $110.00 $125.91 $100.15 $127.27 $122.85 $120.00 $140.26 $79.00
15171 |Laser Toner - HP LaserJet 3600, Cyan HP * HEWQ2671A EACH 0 $110.00 $125.42 $112.00 $126.84 $122.44 $115.00 $143.08 $81.00
15172 |Laser Toner - HP LaserJet 3600, Yellow HP * HEWQ2672A EACH 0 $110.00 $125.42 $112.00 $126.84 $122.44 $115.00 $143.08 $81.00
15173 |Laser Toner - HP LaserJet 3600, Magenta HP * HEWQ2673A EACH 0 $110.00 $125.42 $112.00 $126.84 $122.44 $115.00 $143.08 $81.00
15179 [Laser Toner - HP Laserjet 1160, 1320 Series, Black HP * HEWQ5949X EACH 1 $97.00 $128.91 $134.15 $144.88 $131.94 $130.00 $159.90 $49.00
15180 |Laser Toner - HP Color Laserjet 3800N, Black HP * HEWQ6470A EACH 1 $109.00 $115.36 $119.15 $127.27 $115.90 $118.00 $138.82 $83.00
15184 |Laser Toner - HP Color Laserjet 3600 & 3800, Cyan HP * HEWQ6471A EACH 4 $109.00 $125.42 $120.00 $126.84 $115.51 $116.00 $138.82 $71.00
15185 |Laser Toner - HP Color Laserjet 3600 & 3800, Yellow HP * HEWQ6472A EACH 5 $109.00 $125.42 $120.00 $126.84 $115.51 $116.00 $138.82 $71.00
15186 |Laser Toner - HP Color Laserjet 3600 & 3800, Magenta HP * HEWQ6473A EACH 5 $109.00 $125.42 $120.00 $126.84 $115.51 $116.00 $138.82 $71.00
15187 |Laser Toner - HP Color Laserjet P2015DN, Black HP * HEWQ7553A EACH 6 $68.73 $80.44 $75.15 $77.41 $74.54 $72.00 $81.98 $45.00
15188 |Laser Toner - HP Laserjet P1505, Black HP * HEWCB436A EACH 23 $59.70 $65.18 $63.90 $67.39 $64.89 $63.00 $70.33 $39.00
15189 [Laser Toner - HP Laserjet 4250 ONLY, Black HP * HEWQ5942A EACH 1 $127.00 $140.50 $133.00 $143.41 $130.60 $132.00 $149.43 $57.00
15190 [Laser Toner - HP Laserjet 4013 and 4014, Black HP * HEWCC364A EACH 41 $135.00 $145.51 $139.25 $148.93 $135.61 $135.00 $155.50 $75.00
15191 |Laser Toner - HP Laserjet M1212 MFP, Black HP * HEWCE285A EACH 1 $52.34 $63.89 $56.15 $59.22 $59.07 $59.00 $65.74 $39.00
15193 [Laser Toner - HP Color Laserjet CP3520/CP3530, Black HP * HEWCE250A EACH 3 $105.16 $116.23 $109.90 $116.75 $112.69 $118.00 $135.51 $97.00
15194 |Laser Toner - HP Color Laserjet CP3520/CP3530, Cyan HP * HEWCE251A EACH 1 $200.00 $218.58 $211.20 $229.22 $214.28 $226.00 $252.63 $125.00
15195 [Laser Toner - HP Color Laserjet CP3520/CP3530, Magenta HP * HEWCE253A EACH 1 $200.00 $218.58 $211.20 $229.22 $214.28 $226.00 $252.63 $125.00
15196 [Laser Toner - HP Color Laserjet CP3520/CP3530, Yellow HP * HEWCE252A EACH 0 $200.00 $218.58 $211.20 $229.22 $214.28 $226.00 $252.63 $125.00
15198 |Laser Toner - Sharp AL-1661CS Printer, Black Sharp * SHRIVRALL10TD EACH 0 $40.00 $69.79 $91.15 NO BID $84.16 $110.00 $143.78 NO BID
15199 |Drum Unit - Sharp AL-1661CS Printer Sharp * SHRAL100DR EACH 0 $50.00 $89.57 $129.00 NO BID $148.88 $80.00 $189.17 NO BID
15200 [Laser Toner - Sharp AL1655CS Printer, Black Sharp * SHRAL100TD EACH 0 $50.00 $84.19 $87.15 NO BID $103.53 $75.00 $126.38 NO BID
15201 |Drum Unit - Sharp AL-1655CS Printer Sharp * SHRAL100DR EACH 0 $40.00 $89.57 $121.15 NO BID $148.88 $75.00 $189.17 NO BID
15300 |Laser Toner - Ricoh Aficio SP C811DN Printer, Black Ricoh * RIC820000 EACH 2 $52.58 $66.45 $57.10 NO BID $71.00 $52.00 $67.38 NO BID
15301 |Laser Toner - Ricoh Aficio SP C811DN Printer, Yellow Ricoh * RIC820008 EACH 1 $160.00 $189.99 $169.90 $199.86 $215.00 $170.00 $204.41 NO BID
15302 |Laser Toner - Ricoh Aficio SP C811DN Printer, Magenta Ricoh * RIC820016 EACH 1 $160.64 $189.99 $167.90 $199.86 $215.00 $170.00 $204.41 NO BID
15303 |Laser Toner - Ridoh Aficio SP C811DN Printer, Cyan Ricoh * RIC820024 EACH 1 $182.55 $189.99 $188.15 $199.86 $215.00 $170.00 $204.41 NO BID
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15305 |Laser Toner - HP Color Laserjet CP1215/1515, Black HP * HEWCB540A EACH 0 $60.36 $65.69 $49.15 $68.13 $66.92 $64.00 $75.21 $49.00
15306 |Laser Toner - HP Color Laserjet CP1215/1515, Cyan HP * HEWCB541A EACH 2 $55.40 $66.98 $60.00 $62.62 $61.50 $58.00 $70.19 $49.00
15307 |Laser Toner - HP Color Laserjet CP1215/1515, Magenta HP * HEWCB543A EACH 3 $55.40 $66.98 $60.00 $62.62 $61.50 $58.00 $70.19 $49.00
15308 |Laser Toner - HP Color Laserjet CP1215/1515, Yellow HP * HEWCB542A EACH 0 $55.40 $66.98 $60.00 $62.62 $61.50 $58.00 $70.19 $49.00
15300 |Laser Toner - HP Laserjet P1005, HP35, black HP * HEWCB435A EACH 8 $51.80 $63.34 $57.15 $58.62 $58.46 $55.00 $63.70 $39.00
15310 |Laser Toner - HP Laserjet M2727/P2015, Black HP * HEWQ7553X EACH 0 $120.72 $126.48 $119.75 $142.91 $130.13 $130.00 $150.30 $49.00
15311 |Laser Toner - HP Laserjet P2035, Black HP * HEWCES05A EACH 8 $69.00 $79.70 $73.30 $76.61 $73.77 $71.00 $79.96 $49.00
15312 |Laser Toner - HP Laserjet 5000 Series, Black (for use in Canon FP400 printer) HP * HEWC4129X EACH 0 $100.00 $174.71 $140.90 $181.02 $161.34 $140.00 $205.51 $55.00
15313 |Laser Toner - HP Color LaserJet CM2320NF MFP, Black HP * HEWCC530A EACH 14 $88.00 $80.20 $99.90 $106.60 $99.23 $104.00 $116.60 $71.00
15314 |Laser Toner - HP Color LaserJet CM2320NF MFP, Cyan HP * HEWCC531A EACH 15 $91.00 $105.61 $99.00 $105.08 $97.81 $99.00 $115.39 $71.00
15315 |Laser Toner - HP Color LaserJet CM2320NF MFP, Magenta HP * HEWCC533A EACH 14 $91.00 $105.61 $99.00 $105.08 $97.81 $99.00 $115.39 $71.00
15316 |Laser Toner - HP Color LaserJet CM2320NF MFP, Yellow HP * HEWCC532A EACH 14 $91.00 $105.61 $99.00 $105.08 $97.81 $99.00 $115.39 $71.00
15317 |Laser Toner - HP Laserjet M4345, Black HP * HEWQ5945A EACH 0 $40.00 $188.17 $160.15 $195.81 $191.97 $180.00 $215.80 $75.00
15318 |Laser Toner - Canon MF8380CDW, Black 118 Canon * 118 BLACK EACH 1 $140.74 NO BID $111.00 $118.91 $98.80 $118.00 NO BID NO BID
15319 |Laser Toner - Canon MF8380CDW, Magenta 118 Canon * 118 MAGENTA EACH 2 $95.92 $126.37 $106.00 $116.71 $96.03 $114.00 NO BID NO BID
15320 [Laser Toner - Canon MF8380CDW, Yellow 118 Canon * 118 YELLOW EACH 2 $95.92 $126.37 $106.00 $116.71 $96.03 $114.00 NO BID NO BID
15321 |Laser Toner - Canon MF8380CDW, Cyan 118 Canon * 118 CYAN EACH 2 $95.92 $126.37 $106.00 $116.71 $96.03 $114.00 NO BID NO BID
15325 |Laser Toner - Dell 3000CN/3100CN, Black PRM - Dell * 310-5726 EACH 0 $10.00 $55.67 $27.00 $48.62 $48.99 $32.00 NO BID NO BID
15326 [Laser Toner - Dell 3000CN/3100CN, Yellow PRM - Dell * 310-5729 EACH 0 $10.00 $110.43 $31.50 $114.08 $104.99 $56.00 NO BID NO BID
15327 |Laser Toner - Dell 3000CN/3100CN, Magenta PRM - Dell * 310-5730 EACH 0 $10.00 $110.43 $31.50 $114.08 $104.99 $56.00 NO BID NO BID
15328 |Laser Toner - Dell 3000CN/3100CN, Cyan PRM - Dell * 310-5731 EACH 0 $10.00 $110.43 $31.50 $114.08 $104.99 $56.00 NO BID NO BID
15335 [Laser Toner - C610 Series, Black Okidata * OKI44315304 EACH 0 $76.11 $85.98 $72.15 $88.04 $84.94 $80.00 $94.49 NO BID
15336 |Laser Toner - C610 Series, Cyan Okidata * OKI144315303 EACH 0 $153.21 $85.98 $147.90 $175.72 $162.07 $158.00 $187.53 NO BID
15337 |Laser Toner - C610 Series, Magenta Okidata * OKI144315302 EACH 0 $153.21 $85.98 $147.90 $175.72 $162.07 $158.00 $187.53 NO BID
15338 |Laser Toner - C610 Series, Yellow Okidata * OKI44315301 EACH 0 $153.21 $163.30 $147.90 $175.72 $162.07 $158.00 $187.53 NO BID
15339 |Laser Drum - C610 Series, Black Okidata * OKI44315104 EACH 0 $76.11 $68.14 $51.70 $68.11 $84.94 $64.00 $71.02 NO BID
15340 [Laser Drum - C610 Series, Cyan Okidata * OKI44315103 EACH 0 $153.21 $72.27 $51.70 $72.95 $162.07 $68.00 $76.36 NO BID
15341 |Laser Drum - C610 Series, Magenta Okidata * OKI44315102 EACH 0 $153.21 $72.27 $51.70 $72.95 $162.07 $68.00 $76.36 NO BID
15342 |Laser Drum - C610 Series, Yellow Okidata * OKI44315101 EACH 0 $153.21 $72.27 $51.70 $72.95 $162.07 $68.00 $76.36 NO BID
15409 |Inkjet Cartridge - HP, Black HP * HEW51645A EACH 16 $26.00 $31.65 $31.95 $33.26 $32.50 $28.00 $33.86 NO BID
15411 |Inkjet Cartridge - HP 23A, Tri-Color HP * HEWC1823D EACH 10 $28.00 $38.48 $39.25 $41.79 $39.98 $34.00 $43.72 NO BID
15412 [Inkjet Cartridge - HP-2000C OR 2500C and 2200/2250 Printers, Black HP * HEWC4844A EACH 17 $30.93 $33.24 $33.90 $35.22 $34.24 $29.00 $36.86 NO BID
15420 |Inkjet Cartridge - HP Business Inkjet 2200/2250 & Design Jet 500/800, Cyan HP * HEWC4836A EACH 8 $30.93 $33.24 $33.90 $35.79 $34.24 $30.00 $38.03 NO BID
15421 |Inkjet Cartridge - HP Business Inkjet 2200/2250 & Design Jet 500/800, Magenta HP * HEWC4837A EACH 10 $30.93 $33.24 $33.90 $35.79 $34.24 $30.00 $38.03 NO BID
15422 |Inkjet Cartridge - HP Business Inkjet 2200/2250 & Design Jet 500/800, Yellow HP * HEWC4838A EACH 10 $30.93 $33.24 $33.90 $35.79 $34.24 $30.00 $38.03 NO BID
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CTY ID |ITEM DESCRIPTION i/IL»JAGI\IGUEFS»:CE'PURE lS-IEJEGN?iSTED aNEES?JFRE USAGE
15423 |Printhead - HP Business Inkjet 2200/2250 & Design Jet 500/800, Black HP * HEWC4810A EACH 3 $31.72 $34.04 $34.70 $36.70 $35.12 $31.00 $39.67 NO BID
15424 |Printhead - HP Business Inkjet 2200/2250 & Design Jet 500/800, Cyan HP * HEWC4811A EACH 2 $31.72 $34.04 $34.70 $36.70 $35.12 $31.00 $39.67 NO BID
15425 |Printhead - HP Business Inkjet 2200/2250 & Design Jet 500/800, Magenta HP * HEWC4812A EACH 1 $31.72 $34.04 $34.70 $36.69 $35.12 $31.00 $39.67 NO BID
15426 |Printhead - HP Business Inkjet 2200/2250 & Design Jet 500/800, Yellow HP * HEWC4813A EACH 2 $31.72 $34.04 $34.70 $36.69 $35.12 $31.00 $39.67 NO BID
15427 |Inkjet Cartridge - HP 600C, Black HP * HEW51629A EACH 0 $3.00 $30.87 $29.75 $33.05 $31.64 $28.00 $34.03 NO BID
15425 |G JEt caNnAge - FF, Tor use in Desk et 970C, Photosmart P000, PL100. T P - HEWCES78DN EACH 0 $27.00 $33.12 $19.90 $34.90 $34.12 $30.00 $36.46 NO BID
15430 [Inkjet Cartridge - HP Deskjet 610 & HP Fax 1120, 1120xi, Black HP * HEWC6614D EACH 3 $29.63 $31.93 $33.10 $34.27 $32.80 $28.00 $36.37 NO BID
15432 [Inkjet Cartridge - HP Officejet 6110, 6110xi, MFC PSC 1210, 2110, 2210, Black HP * HEWCG656AN EACH 37 $17.88 $22.28 $22.90 $22.73 $23.99 $19.00 $23.58 NO BID
1543 |oerCartidge - A Omcelet 6110, ’ 1210, 2110, 2210, T . HEWCE657AN EACH 1 $29.00 $34.61 $34.10 $36.75 $35.74 $30.00 $38.59 NO BID
15436 |Ink Cartridge - HP Officejet 940XL, Option 140, Black HP * HEWCA4906AN EACH 7 $31.83 $34.15 $33.00 $36.05 $32.21 $32.00 $38.08 NO BID
15437 |Inkjet Cartridge - HP Officejet 8500, 940XL, Option 140, Cyan HP * HEWCA4907AN EACH 1 $21.21 $23.43 $22.00 $24.03 $25.11 $21.00 $25.37 NO BID
15438  [Inkjet Cartridge - HP Officejet 8500, Model 940XL, Option 140, Magenta HP * HEWC4908AN EACH 1 $21.21 $23.43 $22.00 $24.03 $25.11 $21.00 $25.37 NO BID
15439 |Inkjet Cartridge - HP Officejet 8500, Model 940XL, Option 140, Yellow HP * HEWCA4909AN EACH 3 $21.21 $23.43 $22.00 $24.03 $25.11 $21.00 $25.37 NO BID
15440 [Inkjet Cartridge - HP 8600 Office Jet Premium; 940XL Black HP * HEWC15436AN EACH 2 $21.21 $34.47 $27.15 NO BID NO BID $32.00 NO BID NO BID
15441 |Inkjet Cartridge - HP 8600 Office Jet Premium; 940XL Cyan HP * HEWC15437AN EACH 1 $21.21 $23.66 $30.00 NO BID NO BID $21.00 NO BID NO BID
15442 |Inkjet Cartridge - HP 8600 Office Jet Premium; 940XL Magenta HP * HEWC15438AN EACH 1 $21.21 $23.66 $30.00 NO BID NO BID $21.00 NO BID NO BID
15443 [Inkjet Cartridge - HP 8600 Office Jet Premium, 940XL Yellow HP * HEWC15439AN EACH 1 $21.21 $23.66 $30.00 NO BID NO BID $21.00 NO BID NO BID
15444 |Inkjet Cartridge - HP 8600 Office Jet Premium, Black HP * HEWC4902AN EACH 6 $20.91 $23.12 $23.10 $23.81 $24.07 $23.00 $26.21 NO BID
15445 |Inkjet Cartridge - HP 1055 Plotter, Black P * HEWC4BT1A EACH 0 $104.57 $135.83 $119.10 $144.10 $125.93 $115.00 $153.17 NO BID
15446 |Inkjet Cartridge - HP 1055 Plotter, Yellow HP * HEWC4848A EACH 0 $104.57 $135.83 $119.10 $144.10 $125.93 $120.00 $153.17 NO BID
15447 |Inkjet Cartridge - HP 1055 Plotter, Magenta P * HEWCAB47A EACH 0 $104.57 $135.83 $119.10 $144.10 $125.93 $120.00 $153.17 NO BID
15448 |Inkjet Cartridge - HP 1055 Plotter, Cyan P * HEWCAB4GA EACH 1 $104.57 $135.83 $129.00 $144.10 $125.93 $120.00 $153.17 NO BID
15461 [Inkjet Cartridge - HP 1055 Plotter/Design Jet 1050C, & 1055CM Plotter, Cyan HP * HEWC15448A EACH 0 $104.57 $137.16 $31.10 NO BID NO BID $119.00 NO BID NO BID
15462 |Inkjet Cartridge - HP 1055 Plotter/Design Jet 1050C, & 1055CM Plotter, Magenta HP * HEWC15447A EACH 0 $104.57 $137.16 $31.10 NO BID NO BID $119.00 NO BID NO BID
15463 |Inkjet Cartridge - HP 1055 Plotter/Design Jet 1050C, & 1055CM Plotter, Yellow HP * HEWC15446A EACH 0 $104.57 $137.16 $31.10 NO BID NOBID $119.00 NO BID NOBID
15464 |Printhead - HP 1055 Plotter/Design Jet 1050C, & 1055CM Plotter, Black HP * HEWCA4820A EACH 0 $115.52 $146.89 $29.50 $156.75 $137.00 $130.00 $166.63 NOBID
15465 |Printhead - HP 1055 Plotter/Design Jet 1050C, & 1055CM Plotter, Cyan HP* HEWC4821A EACH 0 $115.52 $146.89 $137.70 $156.75 $137.00 $115.00 $166.63 NO BID
15466 |Printhead - HP 1055 Plotter/Design Jet 1050C, & 1055CM Plotter, Magenta HP* HEWC4822A EACH 0 $115.52 $146.89 $137.70 $156.75 $137.00 $115.00 $166.63 NO BID
15467 |Printhead - HP 1055 Plotter/Design Jet 1050C, & 1055CM Plotter, Yellow HP * HEWC4823A EACH 0 $115.52 $146.89 $137.70 $156.75 $136.99 $115.00 $166.63 NOBID
15468 |Inkjet Cartridge - HP Design Jet 500 Plotter, Cyan HP* HEWC4911A EACH 2 $32.93 $35.27 $36.00 $37.50 $36.46 $32.00 $40.76 NOBID
15469 [Inkjet Cartridge - HP Design Jet 500 Plotter, Magenta HP* HEWC4912A EACH 2 $32.93 $35.27 $36.00 $37.50 $36.46 $32.00 $40.76 NOBID
15470 |inkjet Cartridge - HP Design Jet 500 Plotter, Yellow HP * HEWCA4913A EACH 2 $32.93 $35.27 $36.00 $37.50 $36.46 $32.00 $40.76 NOBID
15474 |Inkjet Cartridge - HP Office Jet 7210, HP94 Black HP * HEWCB765WN EACH 0 $19.88 $22.28 $16.90 $22.80 $23.99 $19.00 $24.66 NOBID
15475 |Inkjet Cartridge - HP Office Jet 7210, HP97 Tri-Color HP * HEWC9363WN EACH 97 $29.00 $34.61 $34.15 $36.60 $35.74 $31.00 $37.51 NOBID
15476 |Inkjet Cartridge - HP Office Jet 7210, HP100 Photo Gray HP * HEWC9368AN EACH 4 $21.86 $24.08 $24.00 $25.30 $25.41 $23.00 $30.60 NOBID
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15477 _[Inkjet Cartridge - HP Office Jet 7210, HP96 Black HP * HEWCB767WN EACH 191 $21.26 $30.84 $20.95 $31.98 $31.61 $21.49 $33.16 NO BID
15478 |Inkjet Cartridge - HP Office Jet 7210, HP99 Photo Black HP * HEWC9369WN EACH 4 $24.12 $26.37 $26.10 $27.90 $35.74 $23.00 $30.02 NOBID
15480 |Inkjet Cartridge - HP Deskjet 3940/3920/1400, Tri-Color HP * HEWC9352AN EACH 0 $16.61 $18.78 $14.25 $18.91 $19.85 $15.00 $20.23 NOBID
15482 |Inkjet Cartridge - HP Deskjet 4140, HP21 Black HP * HEWC9351AN EACH 0 $12.55 $14.80 $17.25 $14.42 $15.15 $15.00 $15.17 NOBID
15484 |Inkjet Cartridge - HP Officejet, 88XL Black HP * HEWC9396AN EACH 6 $33.00 $35.34 $35.25 $37.58 $36.54 $32.00 $39.44 NOBID
15485 [Inkjet Cartridge - HP Officejet, 88XL Cyan HP* HEWC9391AN EACH 6 $20.68 $22.89 $21.70 $23.92 $24.72 $20.00 $24.72 NO BID
15486 [Inkjet Cartridge - HP Officejet, 88XL Magenta HP* HEWC9392AN EACH 3 $20.68 $22.89 $21.70 $23.92 $24.72 $20.00 $24.72 NOBID
15487 |Inkjet Cartridge - HP Officejet, 88XL Yellow HP * HEWC9393AN EACH 2 $20.68 $22.89 $21.70 $23.92 $24.72 $20.00 $24.72 NOBID
15489 |Inkjet Cartridge - HP Deskjet F4140, Tri-Color HP * HEWC9352AN EACH 0 $16.61 $18.78 $17.90 $18.91 $19.85 $15.00 $20.23 NOBID
15495 |Printhead - HP Officejet Pro L7680, HP88 Black/Yellow HP * HEWC9381A EACH 2 $58.69 $66.71 $61.60 $67.89 $62.74 $57.00 $73.64 NOBID
15496 |Printhead - HP Officejet Pro L7680, HP88 Magenta/Cyan HP* HEWC9382A EACH 2 $58.69 $66.71 $61.60 $67.89 $62.74 $57.00 $73.64 NOBID
15497 |Inkjet Cartridge - HP95 Tri-Color HP * HEWCB766WN EACH 0 $23.46 $25.70 $19.90 $26.72 $27.28 $23.00 $27.60 NOBID
15498 |Printhead - HP Officejet Pro 8500 All-in-One , HP940 Black/Yellow HP * HEWCA4900A EACH 0 $48.31 $53.81 $51.10 $55.89 $53.30 $50.00 $64.97 NOBID
15499 |Printhead - HP Officejet Pro 8500 All-in-One , HP940 Cyan/Magenta HP* HEWCA4901A EACH 0 $48.31 $53.81 $53.10 $55.89 $49.68 $50.00 $64.97 NOBID
15502 [Inkjet Cartridge - Epson Photo R 300 Printer, Black Epson * EPST048120 EACH 0 $15.56 $17.21 $14.90 $17.25 $15.83 $14.00 $18.93 NOBID
15503 [Inkjet Cartridge - Epson Photo R 300 Printer, Cyan Epson * EPST048220 EACH 0 $12.44 $14.15 $11.90 $13.93 $12.61 $10.00 $14.87 NO BID
15504 [Inkjet Cartridge - Epson Photo R 300 Printer, Light Cyan Epson * EPST048520 EACH 0 $12.44 $14.15 $11.90 $13.93 $12.61 $10.00 $14.87 NO BID
15505 |Inkjet Cartridge - Epson Photo R 300 Printer, Magenta Epson * EPST048320 EACH 0 $12.44 $14.15 $11.90 $13.93 $12.61 $10.00 $14.87 NOBID
15506 |Inkjet Cartridge - Epson Phato R 300 Printer, Light Magenta Epson * EPST048620 EACH 0 $12.44 $14.15 $11.90 $13.93 $12.61 $10.00 $14.87 NOBID
15507 [Inkjet Cartridge - Epson Photo R 300 Printer, Yellow Epson * EPST048420 EACH 0 $12.44 $14.15 $11.90 $13.93 $12.61 $10.00 $14.87 NOBID
15508 |Inkjet Cartridge - Standard Print Cartridge, MB260, 280, 290 Okidata * OKI56123401 EACH 3 $95.99 $103.26 $101.15 $111.58 $114.00 $105.00 NO BID NOBID
15531 |Inkjet Cartridge - Lexmark, 17 Black Lexmark * LEX10N0217 EACH 0 $19.41 $21.51 $14.90 $23.00 $23.73 $15.00 $23.23 NOBID
15588 |Inkjet Cartridge - HP 6540 Series, 5740 series, Tri-Color HP * HEWCB766WN EACH 0 $23.46 $25.70 $19.50 $26.72 $27.28 $23.00 $27.60 NOBID
15589 [Inkjet Cartridge - HP12A Black HP* HEWQ2612A EACH 4 $58.70 $64.87 $63.15 $67.38 $64.89 $63.00 $70.33 NOBID
15602 |Ribbon - Printer, IBM Lexmark * LEX1040930 EACH 4 $9.35 $11.38 $10.00 $10.90 NOBID $9.70 NO BID NOBID
15609 |Ribbon - Oki® Microline 420, 420N, 421, 490 and 491 printers Okidata * OKI42377801 EACH 36 $9.47 $11.00 $10.75 $10.87 $10.85 $10.00 $13.94 NO BID
15610 |Ribbon - Epson Ribbon Cartridge for TM-U675 Printer EPSON * EPSERC-32B EACH 0 $1.74 $16.71 $2.10 $1.88 $3.00 $4.00 NO BID NOBID
16103 |Fax Cartridge - Brother PPF 4750, Black Brother * BRTTN460 EACH 2 $60.04 $72.25 $64.00 $69.10 $66.61 $59.00 $73.30 $37.00
16104 Eg;o(?ir;r?iggMec— Brother Thermal Ribbon Cartridge PFC1170, 1270, 1570, 1770, Srother * BRTPC20L Each 5 $10.91 $22.65 $21.85 $23.46 $22.51 $20.00 $27.76 $14.00
16105 |Fax Cartridge - Brother 2800, Toner Cartridge Brother * BRTTN250 EACH 4 $20.00 $37.13 $28.90 $31.34 $28.73 $23.00 $33.14 $14.00
16107 |Fax Drum Cartridge - Brother 4750 Brother * BRTDR400 EACH > $110.19 $129.42 $120.75 $133.91 $109.97 $118.00 $143.63 $79.00
16108 |Fax Cartridge - Brother 775, Thermal Ribbon Cartridge Brother * BRTPC301 EACH 0 $14.97 $17.52 $12.10 $17.93 $16.93 $15.00 $21.74 $11.00
16109 [Fax Drum Cartridge - Brother 2800 Brother * BRTDR250 EACH 1 $80.00 $162.97 $153.25 $178.47 $140.87 $135.00 $181.68 $89.00
16110 |Fax Cartridge - Brother DCP 7020, MFC-7220 Brother * BRTTN350 EACH 11 $44.84 $56.49 $47.90 $51.59 $50.61 $43.00 $54.58 $33.00
16111 |Fax Cartridge - Brother 950C Brother * BRTTNS50 EACH 10 $54.00 $65.98 $57.15 $62.00 $60.94 $52.00 $66.32 $36.00
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Fax Cartridge - Canon L200/L220/L240/L250/L 2601/ 280/L290/L300/L350/L.360,
16113 |MUPASS L60ILo0 Canon* CANFX3 EAch 0 $50.00 $67.52 $41.17 $6148 $66.65 $48.00 $69.58 NO BID
16115 |Fax/Copier Cartridge - Brother DCP-8020 Brother * BRTTN530 EACH 1 $25.00 $62.41 $52.15 $60.53 $57.05 $42.00 $64.04 $37.00
16116 |Fax Cartridge - Brother TN540 Brother * BRTTN540 EACH 15 $54.00 $65.98 $56.75 $63.60 $60.94 $50.00 $68.47 $39.00
16117 |Fax Drum Cartridge - Brother DR510 Brother * BRTDRS510 EACH 1 $121.24 $140.88 $71.19 $150.17 $120.52 $110.00 $143.63 $79.00
16118 |Fax Drum Cartridge - Brother DR350 Brother * BRTDR350 EACH 0 $81.75 $94.76 $76.50 $99.08 $82.54 $87.00 $101.59 $59.00
16119 |Fax Drum Cartridge - Brother DR520 Brother * BRTDRS20 EACH i $140.26 $155.41 $147.75 $164.15 $133.90 $132.00 $177.74 $79.00
Plus 500, 510, 520; Deskwriter 510, 520, 540, 550C, 560C; Fax 200, 300, 310,
16120 |700, 750, 900 and 950, Black HP * HEWS51626A EACH 0 $3.00 $31.31 $27.15 $33.56 $32.12 $28.00 $36.41 NO BID
16123 |Fax Toner Cartridge - Brother MFC 8480DN Brother * BRTTN620 EACH 3 $45.13 $56.79 $47.97 $53.17 $51.02 $46.00 $55.00 $35.00
16124 |Fax Drum Cartridge - Brother DCP 80250, DR500 Brother * BRTDR500 EACH 0 $70.00 $140.88 $127.15 $152.69 $142.49 $129.00 $143.63 $79.00
16135 |Fax Cartridge - Sharp UX355L, Thermal Transfer Refill Ribbon, Black, 2/Box Sharp * SHRUX3CR EACH 0 $10.67 $13.29 $10.10 $11.12 $18.16 $11.00 $16.29 NO BID
Multi-Function Machine Toner - DCP-7030, DCP-7040, HL-2140, HL-2170W,
17000 |MFC-7340, MFC-7345N, MFC-7440N, MFC-7840W Brother * BRTTN330 EACH 0 $29.87 $40.97 $27.15 $34.45 $32.80 $31.00 $37.36 $35.00
3075CW, MFC-9010CN, MFC-9120CN, MFC-9125CN, MFC-9320CW, MFC-
17005 |93250W. Black Brother * BRTTN210BK EACH o $45.14 $56.80 $44.15 $52.30 $51.03 $48.00 $56.20 NO BID
3075CW, MFC-9010CN, MFC-9120CN, MFC-9125CN, MFC-9320CW, MFC-
17006 |93050W. Cyan Brother BRTTN210C Each 0 $42.14 $53.69 $39.70 $48.83 $47.63 $48.00 $5230 NO BID
3075CW, MFC-9010CN, MFC-9120CN, MFC-9125CN, MFC-9320CW, MFC-
17007 |93250W Magenta Brother BRTTN210M Each 0 $42.14 $53.69 $39.70 $48.83 $47.63 $48.00 $5230 NO BID
3075CW, MFC-9010CN, MFC-9120CN, MFC-9125CN, MFC-9320CW, MFC-
17008 |oa2eCW. Yellow Brother BRTTN210Y Each 0 $42.14 $53.69 $39.70 $48.83 $47.63 $48.00 $5230 NO BID
AFFIDAVIT YES YES YES YES YES YES YES YES
COPY OF INSURANCE NO YES NO NO NO NO YES NO
BID
COMMENTS COMPATIBLE

TONER
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