BID TABULATION - ROADWAY SIGNS 2013

9" HI-INTENSITY STREET SIGN BLANKS

CUSTOM CLEN ROAD RUNNER
ROADWAY SIGNS 2013 VULCAN INC. | DORLAC SIGN CO | ROCAL INC. PRODUCTS INDUSTRIES MD SOLUTIONS mEHKEm.MWSOHw SIGNTECH INC
BID OPENING
11-27-12
Coniract term: 2-17-13 to 2-16-14 upon approval by 16 SHARTON 10600 SECANT
25
the County Councit and County Executive rosoxisso | ZIZNTEMAN | gip6crsso | po Boxsaom|  waver | swmsestateEsmewy e T AVE
ROLEY AL CRYSTAL CITY MO FRANKFORT JACKSON MS CHESTERFIELD PLAIN CITY OH MO ANJOV QC
36536-1850 63018 OH 45628 35288-4091 MO 43064 63701 CANADA

9" X 24" ALUM BLANK

Price without 1150 everlay.

511,57 $20.14 $10.53 $15.70 $15.28 NOEBID $16.58 519.62
9" X 50" ALUM BLANK 5l4.14 526,16 $13.20 319.63 518.64 NOBID $20.23 524.60
9" X 36" ALUM BLANK 517.05 531.08 §15.80 $23.54 $22.07 NOBID $24.04 $28,70
$" X 42" ALUM BLANK $20.00 $35.70 518.46 $27.47 %2532 NORID $27.71 533.24
$" X 48" ALUM BLANK $22.68 339.82 $21.06 $31.24 523.61 NO BID $31.16 $37.77
9" X 54" ALUM BLANK $25,55 $46.19 $23.73 $35,14 $31.96 NOBID §34.81 $42.32
" X 60" ALUM BLANK, 528.36 Na $26.33 $39.02 $36.22 NQBID $38.43 546.85
5* HIINTENSITY STREET SIGNS

9" X 24" STREET SIGN $16.60 526.82 $21.20 $36.21 $18.95 $16.43 $33.04 $33.13
9" X 30" STREET SIGN 520.65 $33.51 $24.54 $38.15 $22.91 $20.22 $34.60 $34.55
9" X 36" STREET SIGN 524.75 $39.46 $27,80 $40.02 326.94 $24.66 $34.60 $43.55
9" X 42" STREET SIGN $28.01 $44.35 531.14 $46.95 $31.33 $27.69 542.06 £50.42
9" X 48" STREET SIGN $32.95 $49,26 $34.40 $54.63 $35.92 £31.95 548,62 $57.28
9" X 54" STREET SIGN $37.09 $56.34 $37.74 $63.52 340.29 §36.48 $36.25 $64.15
9" X 60" STREET SIGN 541.19 N/A 341.00 $73.60 34546 $39.95 565.90 £71.03

Street name signs

Do Not have 1150

overlay. These are

produced by printing
COMMENTS agreen 3m brand
approved foil over
the whit and applied
to the sign blanks
HI-INTENSITY PRISMATIC, TYPE Il SHEETING
R1.1-8TOP HI 24" 315,30 $25.84 $16.20 $17.67 $23.51 NOBID $17.50 $34.06
R1-1-STOP HI 30" $23.60 $40,09 $25.31 526,22 $27.34 NOBD $25.67 $51.12
R1-1-STOP HI 3" $34,25 $55.24 $36.43 $38.3% $41.43 NG BID $36.18 $68.45
R1-2 YIELD K 30" $12.86 521,96 B17.80 514.20 $15.90 NGO BID 514.8% $51.12
R1-2 YIELD HI 36" §17.27 83221 $17.8¢ $18.06 32538 WO BID $1B.40 $68.45
‘Wi-8 CHEVRON HI 18"%24" 51214 $21.08 1215 $13,52 $15.90 NG BID $14,28 $27.62
G105 HAZARD Hi 10" X 30" $12.59 §16,27 $8.42 510.13 $11.57 NOBID 511,12 $22.23
RF-9RED ONRED 13" 513,04 $27.00 527,50 $19.08 $22.93 NO BID £19.77 $22.45
DIAMOND GRADE PRISMATIC TYPE XI SHEETING]
$1-1 SCHOOL ZONE D{ 30" $38.92 $M.72 541.50 547,85 53833 NO BID 546,67 $70.47
§1-1 SCHOOL ZONE DG 36" $59.31 $103.45 $59.76 $68.87 £94.05 NQ BID $65.97 $96.32
21-1 SCHOQL ZONE DG 48" $112,65 $181.98 51048.24 $122,11 $172.97 NO BID $118.40 $166.03
SCHOOL BUS STOP SYMBOL 30" % 30" $44.21 §71.72 $41.50 345.60 557,55 NC BID 348.17 $70.47
"$CHOQOL" 24" X 8" $9.81 $17.69 58,83 $10.37 51319 NO BID $12.01 $19.78
W16-7F DIAGCNAL ARRQW DG 30" X 18* $26.70 $44.52 524,50 525,24 $34.54 NO BID $25.27 44,73
WI16-9P " " DG 30" X 18" §26.70 $44.53 $24.90 $29.24 534.54 NO BID $29.97 34473
COMMENTS




BID TABULATION - ROADWAY SIGNS 2013

cusToM CLEN ROAD RUNNER
ROADWAY SICNS 2013 VULCAN INC. | DORLAC SIGN CO PRODUCTS | mopusSTRIs | MDSOLUTIONS |SAFETY SERVICES| SIGN TECHING
BID OPENING
2712
HIGHWAY SIGNS - HLINTENSITY
SN $2.25 $5.56 £2.94 $2.30 $5.11 WO BID 84.01 £8.06
107 X 30" 5891 $15.55 12.46 51013 1157 NOBD sli22 2.3
2" Xe" $2.51 £6.56 $4.50 $3.19 $3.72 NO BID 5473 £9.32
2" X9 $3,51 $7.91 §5.99 £4.78 £4.89 NO BID $6.27 511.68
X1z 5424 945 5749 55.14 55.08 NOBID 5727 51330
2% 15 s631 1166 s899 5729 $8.58 NOBID 98,58 $17.01
12X 36" $12.14 2044 s17.97 $13.52 $15.90 NO BID 1438 s77.21
1 xe 5339 27 $5.99 5478 5461 NOBD 56.20 SIL73
Ty 7.95 51254 $11.26 10,80 $5.97 NOBID 51015 520.00
18" 13" 9.15 $17.41 s3.43 $10.83 $12.65 NOBD 1197 s22.45
KL 35.99 $17.09 $13.12 $10.55 ) NOBD 51169 $21.95
24 X6 5433 $9.60 $7.49 $6.14 5614 NO BID 5737 $13.41
YT $5.58 151 9.47 s6.48 $5.24 NO BD 5787 $15.70
24" X 10" £6.97 $13.30 $10.00 $3.09 $8.86 NO BID £3.30 §18.26
X1 $8.22 516,06 1198 972 $10.61 NOBD 11,73 %2030
24 X 18" s12.14 $22.57 1797 $13.52 $15.90 NOBID $14.48 52765
24" N 24 $16,15 £26.40 $23.96 £18.00 $20.64 NO EID $18.36 $34.06
24 X 30" 520.05 3421 29.95 $22.44 52538 NOBD 523,48 172
24X 36" 5.7 $38.90 $35.94 526,25 18 NOBD 526,73 $47.62
24 X 45 3172 35541 547.02 #3501 $22.10 NO B 83382 56160
TR I8 1431 $25.15 52075 S22 1827 NOBD $15.00 52977
K15 $13.25 $21.89 $18.75 £14.09 £16.61 NO BID $15,90 £29.10
30X 1E $15.90 32692 2245 $16.5% $19.90 NG BD 81754 $33.16
30" X 30" $24,44 $42.45 $37.44 $27.33 $30,30 NO BID $26.88 $51.12
30" X 36" 529.56 5022 $44.93 53282 535.15 NOBD 3195 $59.71
30" K4z $36.95 $57.62 s52.41 =529 44,05 NO B $37.69 $45.56
30" X 48" $39.57 558,32 $55.90 $43.56 $49,89 NOBID $42.34 $76.88
30" X 0 4920 $35.24 7455 55452 561.54 NOBD $52.95 $92.48
3" Xe" 5641 $7.14 $8.99 $7.29 $10.05 NO BID $3.52 $16.98
36X 12" s1z.14 52244 $17.97 1352 $15.90 NOBD $14.48 52728
3 X15 18,15 1.5 5269 $20.25 2358 NOBD 2139 36.51
36 X 20" 2120 $32.88 $29.95 $22.44 326,01 NOBD $23.70 4100
36X 2e 523.73 541.96 $35.04 526.25 .89 NO BID 526,73 $97.55
36" X 30 529,36 $50.22 $44.93 $3z.82 $35.19 NO BID 3273 $50.72
36 X 36" $35.52 6133 55391 $39.20 545,80 NOEBD 538.22 $55.45
36 X 45 $47.52 8124 $7L88 %5227 $62.49 NOBD $50.19 525.03
40" X 15 52225 s32.85 52985 224 $27.02 NO BID 338 $14.33
45 X" 1234 520,70 53504 $13.52 $16.21 NOBID $15.28 2738
2 X1 523.82 54196 535,04 $26.25 $30.87 NO BID 526.73 548.91
45 X30" 535,57 $68.32 59,90 $43.56 $51.81 NOBID $42.04 §76.93
28 X8 $63.36 $107.87 595,54 568.28 58219 NOBD $54.48 $11647
54X 42" 566,78 $109.49 $94,34 368,30 $76.70 NOED £64.65 $120.20
0" K 24" 539.40 $69.08 $56.90 $43.56 $49.89 NOBD 4521 $75.47
60" X 30" $49.20 $8524 574,58 5542 61,63 NOBD 5191 $92.58
50 X 36" $39.10 $101.40 §85.35 365,19 $7221 N0 BID 172 $109.70
50X SIGN BRACKET 5296 .57 NOBD 54.22 53.00 5275 275 0
180X SIGN BRACKET 5296 5369 NO BD sa2z 3.00 5275 $2.75 3
CROSS PIECE BATA e 5410 NOBD $5.25 $3.55 5275 802 0
CROSS PIECE [INLV 457X $4.25 $4.20 NO BID $4,22 §3.55 $3.40 $3.30 Q
COMMENTS

Price without 1150 overlay




BID TABULATION - ROADWAY SIGNS 2013

CusTOM CLEN ROAD RUNNER
ROADWAY SIGNS 2013 VULCANTNC. | DORLAC SIGN CO | ROCAL INC. PRODUCTS INDUSTRIES MD SOLUTIONS msﬂtﬂwﬂwﬂwﬁhﬁm SIGN TECH INC
BID OPENING
11-27-12
STOP/SLOW 18" NR 60" HANDLES
1-11 §16.89 $35.94 NO BID 517.1% $22.93 NO BID $17.57 0
12+ §16.89 $31.80 NOBID 516,14 $21.77 NO BID £17.57 ]
STOP/SLOW 18" EG 60" HANDLES
1-11 $16.85 $41.43 NOBID $23.10 $27.23 NOBID $23.02 Q
12+ $16.85 $38.79 NO BID $22.05 $24.57 NO BID $23.02 0
STOP/SLOW 18" HI 60" HANDLES
1-11 521.72 $50.49 NOBID $34,52 530,57 NOBID $33,03 0
12+ 521,72 $46,35 NOBID $32.33 $26.20 NOBID $33.03 0
CAUTION TAPE YLW-BLK 3" X 1,000"
1-11 $33.67 N/A NOBD $13.27 N/A NO BID 4,80 a
12+ $33.67 N/A NOEBID $11.37 N/A NO BID $4.80 ]
TEMPORARY YELLOW MARXING TAPE
1-11 NO BID N/A NO BID $54.17 N/A NO BID $34.67 [H
12+ NO BID N/A NO BID $50.00 N/A NOBD $34.67 ¢
TEMPORARY WIITTE MARKING TAYE
1-11 NOBID NIA NO BID $54.17 NiA NO BID $34.67 [H
12+ NQ EID NiA NO BID 550.00 N/A NQO BID 534,67 [s]
‘WHITE HI LETTERS & NUMBERS
2" SERIES B $4.95 $6.25 $6.95 $2.43 $4.43 $4.55 $6.10 §2.13
3" SERIES B $5.25 $9.25 $9.37 2421 57,70 $5.77 58.40 $2.47
4" SERIES B §7.95 $10.62 $13.50 $5.99 5921 $6.99 $9.60 $2.81
5" SERIES B $2.55 $15.23 $17.36 £14,36 $14,18 $3.91 $13.55 $3.15
&" SERIES B $12.55 $19.25 521,88 $10.98 $18.62 $15.10 $16.70 $3.47
2" SERIES C $4.93 56.30 $6.99 $2.83 $4,50 54,55 $7.05 $2.36
3"SERIES C $6.25 $10,00 $9.37 34.70 58,52 $5.77 $9.50 $2.81
4" SERIES C $7.95 $11.62 513.80 $7.01 $10.30 56.95 $11.00 53.26
5" SERIES C $9.55 516.00 $17.36 $9.63 $15.07 $8.91 514,00 $3.70
6" SERIES C §12.55 $21,37 $21.88 $14.19 $20.85 $15.10 315.00 5415
2" SERIES D $4.95 38.00 $5.99 $4.10 56,33 $4.53 $7.50 $2.58
3" SERIES D 56,23 $12.31 £9.37 58.06 B11.05 85.77 $11.25 §2.15
4" SERIES D $7.95 $13.68 $13.80 $7.97 $12.56 $6.99 $12.40 33.70
5"SERIES D $9.55 318.88 $17.36 $11.28 518,22 $8.91 $16.30 $4.26
6" SERIES D $12,55 $27.50 521.88 528,54 $25.44 815.10 $24,00 $4.81
5" SERIES E HIGHWAY 31285 546,36 $17.36 $7.64 $27.84 $16.85 340,25 $4.81
6" SERIES E HIGHWAY $17.75 $55.12 521.88 $23,13 $3296 $23.88 $47.10 $5.48
LOWER CASE LETTERS 6" SERIES B §11.75 $29.93 521.88 336.00 $27.24 §15.10 $26,20 §3.47
LOWER CASE LETTERS 3" SERIES B 56.15 §13.50 $9,37 $12.00 $11.70 $5.77 312.80 52.47




BID TABULATION - RCADWAY SIGNS 2013

cusToM CLEN ROAD RUNNER
ROADWAY SIGNS 2615 VULCANING. | DORLACSIGN o | RocaLmve, | COSTOM |~ CLEN | smsorumions |saFeTy (SERVICES| SIGN TECR INC
BID OPENING
11-27-12
BLACK HI LETTERS & NUMBERS

2" SERTES B $3.50 $432 53.08 5167 5247 .95 55.45 $1.50

3" SERIES B £4.25 $5.00 $4.69 $2.57 $3.28 54,23 $5.60 $1.51

4" SEREES B 5495 3,04 35.30 523 237 $290 %660 142

5" SERIES B %355 .18 s11.91 5.45 581 5.7 .50 5153

& SERIES B 735 5869 51513 1172 $7.56 735 875 154

2% SERTES .50 54,50 .98 5186 52.69 355 3450 8156

3"SERIES C .25 5544 $4.69 52.72 378 P $6.33 222

+* SERIBS C $4.95 56.25 5630 $5.65 072 $4.90 $7.20 $2.45

5" SERIES C $£5.95 $7.63 51191 84,55 56,32 $5.77 $8.10 $2.68

&' SERIES C w735 5932 815.13 $7.04 $5.29 7.35 59.45 5293

2" SERIES D 5350 $4.63 3.5 5249 5283 $3.55 %560 228

3*SERIES D $4.25 $5.75 $4,69 $4.77 $4.14 3423 55,60 $2.68

+'SERIES D .95 56.99 £330 403 3553 5490 753 $.10

5" SERIES D $5.05 5,57 31191 5531 5742 5577 58.85 3.50

5 SERIES D 5735 1082 1513 $16.75 510,04 5735 $10.65 w391

5 SERIES E FIGHWAY .10 52031 SILol .64 1812 5635 $19.25 Y

6" SERIES E HIGHWAY $7.35 520.57 $15.03 $25.15 $25.43 $7.a4 522.25 $4.40
LOWER CASE LETTERS 6" SERTES B $7.05 1338 15,05 526,00 512.70 5735 81270 $1.55
LOWER CASE LETTERS 5" SERIES B §azs 5707 4,69 5695 57.65 =2 7.65 1.1

MINIMUM ORDER FOR NO SETUP 50 - 10 25 15 . 20 0




SID TABULATION - ROADWAY SIGNS 2013

CUSTOM CLEN ROAD R ER
ROADWAY SIGNS 2013 VULCAN INC. { DORLAC SIGNCO | ROCAL INC. PRODUCTS INDUS " MD SOLUTIONS SAFLTY HmaMNSﬁHm SIGN TECH INC
BID OPENING
11-27-12
SETUP FEES FOR
12X 18 52500 $25.00 £100.00 $25.00 $25.00 NOBID 525,00 -
18X 18 $25.00 £30,00 $100.00 $35.00 $30.00 NOBID §30.00 i
18X24 $25.00 $30,00 $100.00 $35.00 $30.00 NOBDD $30.00 -
24X24 $25.00 $30.00 $100.00 $35.00 $30.00 NOBID §35.00 -
2430 $25.00 $40.00 $100.00 $40.00 $30.00 NOBID $35.00 -
30X30 $30.00 $40.00 §100.00 $40.00 $30.00 NOBDD $40.00 -
MINIMUM DPOLLAR AMOUNT 8500.00 $50.00 - $250,00 $1,000,00 - $200.00 -
NUMEBER OF DAYS TO DELIVER 30 - 30-45 DAYS 30 10-15 business days 14-30 30DAYS 20
2116114
We will hold prices
as long as possible
LENGTH OF TIME TO HOLD RID PRICES - 13 60DAYS - but reserve the sight 1 YEAR 2116714 ONE YEAR
to notify you within
60 days in writing if'
prices ware to
change
AFFIRAVIT COMPLETED NO YES YES YES YES YES YES YES
COPY OF INSURANCE PROVIDED NG YES NO NO YES NO NO NO
Pricing good for 6 Minismum order
mths £1000.00 on
COMMENTS: Minimum erder of Highwe .mm 5, e SEE ATTACHMENT
$1,500.90 per order to n_.“. umw.: WP

get quantity pricing.




- —

Road Runner Safety Services, Inc.

P O Box 552 —
Jackson, MO 63755 Date stimate
11/20/12 837
Narne / Address
Jetferson County
Dept Of The County Clerk
729 Maple St/ PO Box 100
Hillsboro, MO. 63050-0100
Project
item Description Qty Cost Total
RRICCPSS924E... |Sireet Sign Exiruded Blank, .080 Aluminum, 9"HX24"W, | 1 16.58 16.58
Sheeted front and back with Hi-intensity Prismatic
reflective, Green, No legend
RRJICCPSS930E... |Street Sign Extruded Blank, .080 Aluminum, 9"HX30"W, I 2023 20.23
Sheeted front and back with Hi-Intensity Prismatic
reflective, Green, No legend
RRICCPSS936E... {Street Sign Extruded Blank, .080 Aluminum, 9"HX36"W, 1 24.04 24.04
Sheeted front and back with Hi-Intensity Prismatic
reflective, Green, No legend
RRJCCPSS942E... |Strect Sign Extruded Blank, ,080 Aluminum, $"HX42"W, I 27.71 27.71
Sheeted front and back with Hi-Intensity Prismatic
reflective, Green, No legend
RRICCPSSO48E... |Street Sige Extruded Blank, .080 Aluminum, 9°"HX48"W, 1 316 3Ll16
Sheeted front and back with Hi-Intensity Prismatic
reflective, Green, No legend
RRICCPSS954E... | Street Sign Extruded Blank, .080 Aluminum, 9"HX54"W, I 34.81 34.81
Sheeted front and back with Hi-Intensity Prismatic
reflective, Green, No legend

Acceptance of order

Authorized Signature

——— . .

Page 1

Total

_— . —
FWE appreciate the Opportunity to offer this quote. If YOu have any questions please contact BPave at
be add.cd if items are not in stock. This quote is for pick up at our shep. Quote contin
quote 1s good for 30 days. We alsp have Jocations in Springfield, MO at 417-833-815

573-204-0060. Tax to be added, Shipping to
gent on availability of equipment at the time of order. This
3 and Kansas City , MO at 816-472-5457.

S



Road Runner Safety Services, Inc.

P O Box 552 —
Jackson, MO 63755 Date Estimate
H20n2 837
Name / Address
Jefferson County
Dept Of The County Clerk
729 Maple St / PO Box 100
Hilisboro, MO. 63050-0100
Project
ltem Description Qty Cost Total
RRICCPSS960E... Street Sign Extruded Blank, .080 Aluminum, 9"HX60"W, 1 38.43 3843
Sheeted front and back with Hi-Intensity Prismatic
reflective, Green, No legend
RRICCPSS924FH... { Street Sign, Flat 080 Aluminum, 9"H X24"W, Green 1 33.04 33.04
HIP sheeted on 2 sides, with a combination of 6" UPPER
CASE and 4.5" Jower case (series B) 3M HI- Intensity
white legend, 2 sided
RRICCPSS930FH... Street Sign, Flat .080 Aluminum, 9"H X30"W, Green i 34.60 34.60
HIP sheeted on 2 sides, with a combination of 6" UPPER
CASE and 4.5" lower case (series B) 3M HI- Intensity
white legend, 2 sided
RRICCPSS936FH.. Street Sign, Fiat .080 Aluminum, 9"H X36"W, Green 1 34.60 34.60
HIP sheeted on 2 sides, with a combination of 4" UPPER
CASE and 4.5" lower case (series B) 3M HI- Intensiry
white legend, 2 sided
RRICCPSS942FH. Street Sign, Flat .080 Aluminum, 9"H X42"W, Green 1 42,06 42.06
HIP sheeted on 2 sides, with a combination of 6" UPPER
CASE and 4.5" [ower case (series B) 3M HI- Intensity
white legend, 2 sided
Acceptance of order
Authorized Signatyre TOtal
| We appref:u_ite the Opportunity to offer thig quote. If you havc—at;y @TQ&E&B@?&&E&EW at 573-204-0060. Tax to be added, Shipping to
be added if jlems are not in stock. This qQuote is for pick up at our shop. Quote contingent on availabifity of equipment at the time of order., This

Page 2

City, MO at 816-472-5457,

-



Road Runner Safety Services, Inc.

P O Box 552 -
Jackson, MO 63755 Date | Estimate#
11/20/12 837
Estimate
Name / Address
Tefferson County
Dept Of The County Clerk
729 Maple St /PO Box 100
Hillsboro, MO, 63050-0100
Project
ltem Description Qiy Cost Total
RRICCPSS948FH... | Sireet Sign, Flat .080 Aluminun, 9"H X48"W, Green 1 48.62 48.62
HIP shested on 2 sides, with a combination of 6" UPPER
CASE and 4.5" lower case (series B) 3M HI- Intensity
white fegend, 2 sided
RRICCPSS954FH... | Street Sign, Flat .080 Atuminum, 9"H X54"W, Green ) i 56.25 56.25
HIP sheeted on 2 sides, with a combination of 6" UPPER
CASE and 4.5" lower case (series B) 3M Hi- Intensity
whitc legend, 2 sided
RRICCPSSO60FH... | Strect Sign, Flat .080 Aluminum, 9"H X60"W, Green i 65.90 65.90
HIP sheeted on 2 sides, with a combination of 6" UPPER
CASE and 4.5" lower case (series B) 3M HI- Intensity
white legend, 2 sided
RRICCPSSRI1-1H.., Stop Sign, .080 Aluminum, 24", Hi-Intensity Prismatic, 1 17.50 17.50
Red with white legend and barder, Single sided
RRICCPSSRI-1H... Stop Sign, .080 Aluminum, 30", Hi-Intensity Prismatic, ] 25.67 25.67
Red with White legend and border, Single sided
RRICCPSSRI-1H... Stop Sign, .080 Aluminum, 36", Hi-Intensity Prismatic, 1 36.18 36.18
Red with White legend and border, Single sided
Acceptance of order
Authorized Signature TOtaI

We appreciaie the opportunig;[g offer this quote. If you hge y questions please contact Dave at 573-204-0060. Tax to be added. Shipping to
be add.ed if items are not in stock, This quote is for pick up at our shop. Quote contingent on availability of equipment at the time of order. This
quote is good for 30 days. We aiso have locations in Springfield, MO at 417-833-8155 and Kansas City , MO at 816-472-5457.

—_—




Road Runner Safety Services, Inc,

P O Box 552 ‘
Jackson, MO 63755 ‘ Date Estimate #
11/20/12 837
Name / Address

Jefferson County

Dept Of The County Clerk

729 Maple St/ PO Box 100

Hillshoro, MO. 63050-0100

Project
Item Description Qly Cost Total

RRICCPYSR!-2... |Yield Sign, (R1-2), .080 Aluminum, Hi-Intensity 1 14.89 14.89
Prismatic, 30", Single sided

RRICCPYSR1-2... |Yield Sign, (R1-2), .080 Aluminum, Hi-Intensity i 18.40 18.40
Prismatic, 36", Single sided

RRICCPCHIP182... | Sign, .080 Aluminum, (W1-8) Chevron, Hi-Intensity 1 14.28 14,28
Prismatic, 18" X 24" Single sided

RRICCPHOM!103... | Hazard Object Marker; .080 Aluminum, 10" X 30", 1 H.12 11.12
Hi-Intensity Prismatie, Single sided

RRICCPRF9/NS... Sign, .080 Aluminum, Red Hi-Intensity Prismatic with 1 19.77 19.77
red reflectors, 18", (RF-9 or N-5), Single sided

RRICCPSZS]1-1D.., { Sign, .080 Aluminum, (S1-1) Diamond Grade Prismatic, i 46.67 46.67
Yellow/Green, School Zone » 30", Single sided

RRICCPSZS1-1D... Sign, .080 Aluminum, (S1 =1) Diamond Grade Prismatic, 1 65.97 65.97
Yellow/Green, School Zone, 36", Single sided

RRICCPSZS1-1D... | Sign, .080 Aluminum, (S1-1) Diamond Grade Prismatic, 1 118.40 118.40
Yellow/Green, School Zone, 48", Single sided

Acceptance of order

Total

Authorized Signature

We appreciate the Oppartunity io offer this quote. If you have-gly quesﬁm please cal‘t;ct Dave at 573-204-0060. Tax to be added. Shipping to

be adch if items are not in stock, This quote is for pick up at our shop. Quote contingesit on availability of equipment at the time of order, This
quote is good for 30 days, We also have locations in Springfield, MO at 4] 7-833-8155 and Kansas City, MO at 816-472-5457




Road Runner Safety Services, Inc.

P O Box 552 _
Jackson, MO 63755 , Date Estimate #
11/20/12 837
Estimate
Name / Address
Jefferson County
Dept Of The County Clerk
729 Maptle St/ PO Box 100
Hillsboro, MQ. 63050-0100
Project
ftem Description Qty Cost Total
RRICCPSBSASS... |Sign, .080 Aluminum, (83-1) Diarnond Grade Prismatic, t 49.17 49.17
Yellow Green, School Bus Stop Ahead {Symbol), 30",
Single sided
RRICCPSS84-3DG... | Sign, .080 Aluminum, (S4-3) Diamond Grade Prismatic, 1 12.01 12.01
Yellow/ Green, SCHOOL, 24" X 8", Single sided
RRICCPDAWI16-... | Sign, Placard, .080 Aluminum, (W16-7P) Diamond ' 1 29.27 26.27
Grade Prismatic, Yellow/Green, Diagonal Arrow, 30" X
18", Single sided
RRICCPAPWI6-... |Sign, Placard, .080 Aluminum, (W16-9F), Diamond 1 29.97 29.97
Grade Prismatic, Yellow/Green, AHEAD, 30" X 18",
Single sided
RRICCPS7HIPF Sign, .080 Flat Aluminum, 5"X7", 3M Hi-Intensity 1 4.01 4.01
Prismatic Sheeting, Single sided, with or without one
color MUTCD legend
RRJCCP1030HIPF | Sign, .080 Flat Aluminum, 10"X30", 3M Hi-Intensity i 11.22 11.22
Prismatic Sheeting, Single sided, with or without ane
color MUTCD legend
Acceptance of order
Authorized Signature TOtaI
We oo o o — : — -
(We apprchaltte the oppeitunity to offer this quote. If you have any questions please contact Dave at 5 73-204-0060. Tax to be added. Shipping to
be add'ed if items are not in stock. This quote is for pick up at our shop. Quote contingent on availability of equipment at the time of order, This
quote 15 good for 30 days. We also have locations in Springfield, MO at 417-833-8155 and Kansas City , MO at 816-472-5457,




£

Road Runner Safety Services, Inc.

P O Box 552 —

Jackson, MO 63755 Date Estimate

11720412 837
Estimate
Name / Address

Jefferson County

Dept Of The County Clerk

729 Maple St/ PO Box 100

Hilisboro, MO. 63050-0100

Project
item Description Qty Cost Totai

RRICCP126HIPF Sign, .080 Flat Aluminum, 2" X 6", 3M Hi-Intensiry 1 473 4.73
Prismatic Sheeting, Single sided, With or without one
color MUTCD legend

RRICCP129HIPF Sign, .080 Flat Aluminum, 12" % 9", 3M Hi-Intensity 1 6.27 6.27
Prismatic Sheeting, Single sided, With or without 1 color
MUTCD legend

RRICCP1212HIPF Sign, .080 Flat Aluminum, 12" ¥ 12" 3M Hi-Intensity I 7.27 7.27
Prismatic Sheeting, Single sided, With or without one
color MUTCD legend

RRICCP1218HIPF Sign, .080 Fiat Aluminum, 12" X 18" 3 Hi-Tntensity 1 8.58 8.58
Prismatic Shesting, Single sided, With or withoui one
color MUTCD legend

RRICCP1236HIPF Sign, .080 Flat Aluminum, {2*x 36", 3M Hi-Intensity 1 14,38 14.38
Prismatic Sheeting, Single sided, With or without one
color MUTCD legend

RRICCP186HIPF Sign, .080 Flat Aluminum, 18" % 6", 3M Hi-Intensity I 6.20 6.20
Prismatic Sheeting, Single sided, With or without one
color MUTCD legend

Acceptance of order

Authorized Signature

Bt on availabili

0 days. We also have locations in Springfield, M) at 417-833-8155 and Kansas City , MO ot 816-472-5457,

—_— —

— ,‘.k__.fkgif—‘ﬁ

~204-0060. Tax to be added. Shipping to
ty of equipment at the (ime of order. This

]




Road Runner Safety Services, Inc,

P O Box 552 —
Jackson, MO 63755 Date Estimate
11720712 837
Estimate
Name / Address j

Jefferson Coun

Dept Of The County Clerk

729 Mapie St / PO Box 100

Hillsbore, MO, 63050-0100

Project
tem Description Qty Cost Total

RRICCP1815HIpPF Sign, .080 Flat Aluminum, 18" X 15" 3M Hi-Intensity 1 10.15 10.15
Prismatic Sheeting, Single sided, With or without one
color MUTCD legend

RRICCPi818HIPF Sign, .080 Flat Aluminum, 18" X 18", 3M Hi-Intensity 1 [1.97 11.97
Prismatic Sheeting, Single sided, With or without one
color MUTCD legend

RRICCP2115HIPF Sign, .080 Flat Aluminum, 21" X 15", 3M Hi-Intensity 1 11.69 11.69
Prismafic Sheeting, Single sided, With or without one
color MUTCD legend

RRICCP246HIPF Sign, .080 Fiat Aluminum, 24" X 6" 3\ Hi-Intensity 1 7.37 7.37
Prismatic Sheeting, Single sided, With or without one
color MUTCD legend

RRICCP248H1pPE Sign, .080 Flat Aluminum, 24" X 8 30 Hi-Intensity i 7.87 7.87
Prismatic Sheeting, Single sided, With or without one
color MUTCD | egend

RRICCP2410HIPF Sign, .080 Flat Aluminum, 24" ¥ 10", 3Mm Hi-Intensity 1 9.30 9.30
Prismaiic Sheeting, Single sided, With or without one

color MUTCD legend

|

Acceptance of order

Authorized Signature

r pick up at our shop. Quote contingent on availability of
-8155 and Kansas City , M

0060. Tax to be added, Shipping to
equipment at the time of order., This
O at 816-472.5437,

———

S



Road Runner Safety Services, Inc.

P O Box 552 - :
Jackson, MO 63755 Date Estimate #

11720/12 837

Estimate

Name / Address

Jefierson County

Dept Of The County Clerk
729 Maple St/ PO Box 100
Hillsboro, MO. 63050-0100

Project

ltem Description Oty Cost Total

RRICCP2412HIPF Sign, .080 Flat Aluminum, 24" X 12" 35 Hi-Intensity 1 1175 11.75
Prismatic Sheeting, Single sided, With or without one
color MUTCD legend

RRICCP2418HIPF Sign, .080 Flat Aluminum, 24" X 18" 3M Hi-Intensity 1 14,48 14.48
Prismatic Sheeting, Single sided, With or without one
color MUTCD legend

RRICCP2424HIPF Sign, .080 Flat Aluminum, 24" X 24" 3 Hi-Intensity | 18.36 18.36
Prismatic Sheeting, Single sided, With or without one
color MUTCD [egend

RRICCP243011PF Sign, .080 Flat Aluminum, 24" X 30" 3 Hi-Intensity 1 23.48 23.48
Prismatic Sheeting, Single sided, With or without one
color MUTCD legend

RRICCP2436HIPF Sign, .080 Fiat Aluminum, 24" X 36", 3M Hi-Intensity 1 26.73 26.73
Prismatic Sheeting, Singie sided, With or withont one
color MUTCD legend

RRICCP2448HIPF Sign, .080 Flat Aluminum, 24" X 48", 3M Hi-Intensity 1 33.82 33.82
Prismatic Sheeting, Single sided, With or without one
color MUTCD legend

Acceptance of order

Authorized Signature

e

; ppPortunity to offer thig quote. If you have any questions please contact Dave at 573-204-0060. Tax to be added. Shipping to
NS are not in stock. This quote is for pick up at our shop. Quote contingent on availability of equipment at the time of order. This
or 30 days. We also have locations in Springfield, MO at 417-833-8155 and Kansas City , MO at § 16-472-5457,




Road Runner Safety Services, Inc.

P O Box 552 - .
Jackson, MO 63755 " Date Estimate #

1172002 837

Estimate

Name / Address

Jeffersen County

Dept Of The County Clerk
729 Maple St/ PO Box 100
Hillsboro, MO. 63050-0100

Project

item Description Qty Cost Total

RRICCP2718HIPF Sign, .080 Flat Aluminum, 27" X 18", 3M Hi-Intensity | 1 18.00 18.00
Prismatic Sheeting, Single sided, With or without one
color MUTCD legend

RRICCP301SHIPF Sign, .080 Flat Aluminum, 30" X 15", 3M Hi-Intensity ] 15.90 15.90
Prismatic Sheeting, Single sided, With or without one
color MUTCD Tegend

RRICCP3018HIPF Sign, .080 Flat Aluminum, 30" X 18", 3M Hi-Intensity 1 17.84 17.84
Prismatic Sheeling, Single sided, With or without one
color MUTCD legend

RRICCP3030HIPF Sign, .080 Flat Aluminum, 30" X 30, 3M Hi-Intensity 1 26.88 26.88
Prismatic Sheeting, Single sided, With or without one
color MUTCD legend

RRICCP3036HIPF Sign, .080 Flat Aluminum, 30" X 36", 30 Hi-Intensity 1 31.73 31.73
Prismatic Sheeting, Single sided, With or without one
color MUTCD legend

RRICCP3042HIPF Sign, .080 Flat Alominurn, 30" X 42" 3M Hi-Intensity 1 37.69 37.69
Prismatic Sheeting, Single sided, With or without ane
color MUTCD legend

Acceptance of order

Authorized Signature

uestions please contact Dave at 573-204-0060. Tax to be added. Shipping to
uofe contingent on availability of equipment at the titne of order, This
ty . MO at 816-472-5457.

]




Road Runner Safety Services, Inc.

P O Box 552 ato
Jackson, MO 63755 Date Estimate
11/20/12 837
Estimate
Name / Address
Jefierson County
Dept Of The County Clerk
729 Maple St / PO Box 100
Hillsboro, MO, 63050-0100
Project
ltem Description Qty Cost Total
RRICCP3048HIPF Sign, .080 Flat Aluminum, 30" X 48", 3M Hi-Intensity 1 4234 42,34
Prismatic Sheeting, Single sided, With or without one
color MUTCD legend
RRICCP3060HIPE Sign, .080 Flat Aluminum, 30" X 60", 3M Hi-Intensity 1 52.93 52.93
Prismatic Sheeting, Single sided, With or without one
color MUTCD legend
RRICCP366HIPF Sign, .080 Flat Aiuminum, 36" X 6", IM Hi-Intensity i 8.52 8.52
Prismaiic Sheeting, Single sided, With or without one
color MUTCDH legend
RRICCP3612H1PR Sign, .080 Fiat Aluminum, 36" X 12" 3Mm Hi-Intensity 1 14.48 14.48
Prismatic Sheeting, Single sided, With or without one
color MUTCD legend
RRICCP3618HIPF Sign, .080 Fiat Aluminum, 36" X 18 3pm Hi-Intensity 1 21.39 21.39
Prismatic Sheeting, Single sided, With or without one
color MUTCD legend
RRICCP3620HIPF Sign, .080 Flat Aluminum, 36" X 20", 3M Hi-Intensity I 23.70 23.70
Prismatic Sheeting, Single sided, With or without one
color MUTCD legend
Acceptance of order
I
Authorized Signature TOta :




Road Runner Safety Services, Inc.

P O Box 552 ]
Jackson, MO 63755 Date Estimate #
11/20/12 837
Name / Address
Jefferson County
Dept Of The County Clerk
729 Maple St/ PO Box 100
Hillsboro, MO, 63050-0100
- Project
tem Description Qty Cost Total
RRICCP3624HIPF Sign, .080 Flat Aluminum, 36" X 24", 3M Hi-Intensity 1 26.73 26.73
Prismatic Sheeting, Single sided, With or without one :
color MUTCD legend
RRICCP3630HIPF Sign, .080 Fiat Aluminum, 36" X 30", 3M Hi-Intensity 1 3273 32.73
Prismatic Sheeting, Single sided, With or withou one
color MUTCD lepend
RRICCP3636HIPF Sign, .080 Flat Aluminur, 36" X 36", 3M Hi-Intensity 1 38.22 3822
Prismatic Sheeting, Single sided, With or without one
color MUTCD legend
RRICCP3648HIPR Sign, .080 Flat Aluminum, 36" X 48", 3M Hi-Intensity ] 50.19 50.19
Prismatic Sheeting, Single sided, With or without one
color MUTCD legend
RRICCP4018HIPF Sign, .080 Flat Aluminum, 40" X 18", 30 Hi-Intensity | 23.38 2338
Prismatic Sheeting, Single sided, With or without ong
color MUTCD legend
RRICCP489HIPF Sign, .080 Flat Aluminum, 48" X 9", 3M Hi-Intensity I 15.28 15.28
Prismatic Sheeting, Single sided, With or without one
color MUTCH legend
Acceptance of order
Authorized Signatyre TQta,

ciate the opport!.mlty to offer this quote. If you have any questions please contact Dave at 573-204-0060. Tax to be added. Shipping to
'€d If items are not in stock. This quote is for pick up at our shop. Guote contingent on availability of equipment at the time of order. This
quote is good for 30 days. We also have locations in Springfield, MO at 417-833-8] 55 and Kansas City , MO at 816-472-5457,

—_————

Page 11




Road Runner Safety Services, Inc,

P O Box 552 ‘ -
Jackson, MO 63755 _ Date Estimate #

11720112 337

Estimate

Name / Address j

Jefferson County

Dept Of The County Clerk
729 Maple St/ PO Box 160
Hillsboro, MO, 63050-0100

L 1 Project

L Iltem Description Qty Cost Totai

RRICCP4818HIPF Sign, .080 Flat Aluminum, 48" X 18", 3M Hi-Intensity ] 26.73 26.73
Prismatic Sheeting, Singje sided, With or without one
color MUTCD legend

RRICCP4830HIPF Sign, .080 Flat Aluminum, 48" X 30", 3m Hi-Intensity i 42.34 42.34
Prismatic Sheeting, Single sided, With or without one
color MUTCD legend

RRICCP4848HIPF Sign, .080 Flar Aluminum, 48" X 48", 3M Hi-Intensity 1 64.48 64.48
Prismatic Sheeting, Single sided, With or without ong
color MUTCD legend

RRICCPS142HIPF Sign, .080 Flat Aluminum, 54% X 42", 3M Hi-Intensity I 64.65 64.65
Prismatic Sheeting, Single sided, With or without one
color MUTCD legend

RR.ICCPGO_24H]PF Sign, 080 Flgt Aluminum, 60" % 24" 3M Hi-Intensity 1 43.21 43.21
Prismatic Sheeting, Single sided, With or without one
color MUTCD legend

RRICCP6030HIPF Sign, .080 Fiat Aluminum, 60" X 30", 3m Hi-Intensity 1 51.93 51.93
Prismatic Sheeting, Single sided, With or without one
color MUTCD | egend

Acceptance of order

l Authorized Signature
,H_“R_ﬁl_\% o

be added if iterns are not in stock. This quote is for pick up at pur shop. Quote cont
We also have locations in Springfield, MO at 4] 7-833

Page 12

ﬁ_i__ﬁ—_____—___-—_.__ﬁ—g—————___




Road Runner Safety Services, Inc.

P O Box 552 . —
Jackson, MO 63755 Date Estimate #
11/20/12 837
Name / Address
Jefferson County
Dept Of The County Clerk
729 Maple St/ PO Box 100
Hillsboro, MO. 63050-0100
Project
Item Description Qty Cost Total
RRICCPGO36HIPF Sign, .080 Flat Aluminum, 60" X 36", 3M Hi-Intensity 1 61.72 61.72
Prismatic Sheeting, Single sided, With or without one
color MUTCD legend
RRICCPSB90XS.5" Sign bracket, 90X style, 5.5" extruded street sign slot, for 1 275 275
mounting to U-Channe] post
RRICCPSB180X... Sign bracket, 180X style, 5.5" extruded street sign slot, i 2.75 275
for mounting to U-Channel post
| RRICCPSBCBA7... Sign bracket, Cross with 3.5" extruded street sign slot, for 1 4.02 4.02
attaching 2nd street sign to existing sign, BA7A style
RRICCPSBUNIV Sign bracket, Unjv 457X Style 1 3.30 3.30
RRICCPSSP1860... Stop/Slow Paddie, .040 Aluminum, 18", Non Reflective, i 17.57 17.57
' with 60" wooden handle
RRICCPSSP1860... Stop/Slow Paddle, .040 Aluminum, 18, 3M Engineer 1 23.02 23.02
Grade Prismatic, with 60~ wooden handle
RRICCPSSP1860.,.. Stop/Slow Paddle, .040 Alumninum, 18", 3M Hi-Infensity 1 33.03 33.03
Prismatic, with 0" wooden handle
Acceptance of order
-
Authorized Signature Tot“!

be added if items are not in stock. This quote is for pick up at gur shop. Quote contingent

quole is good for 30 days. We also haye Iocations in Springfield, MO a 417-833-8155 and .

Dave at 573-204-006
on availability of equi
ansas City , MO at

0. Tax to be added, Shipping to

pment at the time of order. This
816-472-5457, ’
—_—




Road Runner Safety Services, Inc.

P O Box 552

Jackson, MO 63755

Estimate

Name / Address

Jefferson County

Depi Of The County Clerk
729 Maple St / PO Box 100
Hillsboro, MO. 63050-0100

Date

Estimate #

11/20/12

837

Project

ltem

Description

Qty

Cost

Total

RRCSCT310002M

RRPMT4X50MOW

RRPMT4X50MOY

RRICGSLNBS2"HT

RRJCGSLNBS3"HI

RRICGSLNES4"H]

RRICGSLNBS5"H]

Tape, Caution, 3"X 1000 rofl, yellow, 2 mil, contractor
grade

Tape, Pavermnent Marking, Highway stripping, 4" X 50
yard roll, Wet reflective, White, MODOT Spee

Tape, Pavement Marking, Highway stripping, 4" X 50
yard roll, Wet reflective, Yellow, MODOT Spec

Letters or Numbers, without sheeting or substrate, White
M Hi-Intensity Grade Reflective, Pressure sensitive, 2",
Series B, per pack of 25 of same letter or number

Letters or Numbers, withoui sheeting or substrate, White
M Hi-Intcnsity Grade Reflective, Pressure sensitive, 3",
Series B, per pack of 25 of same letter or number

Letters or Numbers, without sheeting or substrate, White
M Hi-Intensity Grade Refleciive, Pressure sensitive, 4",
Series B, per pack of 25 of same letter or number

Letters or Numbers, without sheeting or substrate, White
M Hi-Intensity Grade Reflective, Pressure sensitive, 57,
Series B, per pack of 25 of same [etter or number

4.80

34.67

34.67

6.10

8.40

9.60

13.55

4.80

34.67

34.67

6.10

8.40

13.55

Accepiance of order

Authorized Signature

Total

e
We appreeiate the Opportunity to offer this quote. If you have an

be added if items are not in stock. This quote is for

quote is good for 30 days. We also have locations in Springfiald

pick up at oy

_—
Y questions please contact Dave at 573-204-0060, Tax to
r shop. Quote contingent on availability of equipment at t

Page 14

be added, Shipping to
he time of order. This

, MO at 417-833-8155 and Kansas City , MO at 816-472-5457.

——————



Road Runner Safety Services, Inc.

P O Box 552
Jackson, MO 63755

Estimate

Name / Address

Jefferson County

Dept Of The County Clerk
729 Maple St/ PO Box 100
Hillsboro, MO, 63050-0100

Date

Estimate #

11/20/12

837

Project

ltem Description

Qty

Cost

Tota!

RRICGSLNBS6"HI Letters or Numbers, without sheeting or substrate, White
3M Hi-Intensity Grade Reflective, Pressure sensitive, 6",
Series B, per pack of 25 of same letter or number

RRICGSLNCS2"HI Letters or Numbers, without sheeting or substrate, White
3M Hi-Intensity Grade Reflecti ve, Pressure sensitive, 27,
Series C, per pack of 25 of same letter or humber

RRJCGSLNCS?:"HI Letters or Numbers, without sheeting or substrate, White
M Hi-Lntensity Grade Reflecti ve, Pressure sensitive, 3",
Series C, per Pack of 25 of same letter or number

RRICGSLNCS4"Ly Letters or Numbers, withont sheeting or substrate, White
3M Hi-lntensity Grade Reflective, Pressure sensitive, 4"
Series C, per pack of 25 of same letter or number

RRICGSLNCS5"H] Leiters or Numbers, withaut sheeting or substrate, White
iM Hi-Intensity Grade Reflective, Pregsure sensitive, 5",
Series C, per pack of 25 of same letter or nirmber

RRICGSLNCS6HI Letters or Numbers, without sheeting or substrate, White
M Hi~Intensity Grade Reflective, Pressure sensitive, 6",
Series C, per pack of 25 of same letier or mumber

1 16.70

1 7.05

1 8.50

] 11.00

I 14,00

i 19.00

16.70

7.05

9.50

11.00

14.00

19,06

Acceptance of order

Authorized Signature

—

.

_E_RE_H_____H_
f_ We appieciate the Opportunity to offer this quote. If you have any questions please gontact Dave at 573
be added if items are not in stock. This quote s for pick up at oyr shop. Quote contingent on availahl;
quote is good for 30 days. We also have locations in Springfield, MO at 41 7-833-8155 and Kansas Cj

—_—

-204-0069. Tax to be added. Shipping 1o
ty of equipment at the tim
ty , MO at 816-472-5457,

e of order, This

S ]




Road Runner Safety Services, Inc,

P O Box 552
Jackson, MO 63 755

Estimate

Name / Address

Jefferson County

Dept Of The County Clerk
729 Maple St/ PO Box 100
Hillsboro, MO, 63050-0100

Date

Estimate #

11720112

837

Project —l

item Description

Qty

Cost

Total

3IM Hi-Intensity Grade Reflective,

RRICGSLNDSs"HI Letters or Numbers, without sheetin

RRICGSLNDS?"[1 Letters or Numbers, without sheeting or substrate, White
M Hi-Intensity Grade Reflective, Pressure sensitive, 2",
Series D, per Pack of 25 of same letter or number

RRICGSLNDS3 "1 Letters or Numbers, without sheeting or substrate, White
M Hi-Intensity Grade Reflective, Pressure sensitive, 3",
Series D, per pack of 25 of same letier or number

RRICGSLNDS4"HI Letiers or Numbers, without sheeting or substrate, Whife
M Hi-Intensity Grade Reflective, Pressure sensitive, 4",
Series D, per pack of 25 of same letter or number

RRICGSLNDS5"H1 Letters or Numbers, without sheeting or substrate, White
M Hi-Intensity Grade Reflective, Pressure sensitive, 5,
Series D, per pack of 25 of same letter or number

g or substrate, White
Pressure sensitive, 6",
Series D, per pack of 25 of same letter or number

7.50

11.25

12.40

16.30

24.00

7.50

11.25

12.40

16.30

24.00

Aceeptance of order

Authorized Signature

We appreciate the Opportumity to offer thig quote. If'you have any questi
be added if jtems are not in stock, This quote is for pick up at our shop,
quote is pood for 39 days. We also have locations in Springfield, MO at

ons please confact Daye at 573-204
Quote contingent on ay

H7-833-8155 and Kansas City |

-0060. Tax to be ad
ailability of cquipment at the tf
MO at 816-472-5457,

ded. Shipping to
me of order. This




Road Runner Safety Services, Inc.

P O Box 552 )
Jackson, MO 63755 Date Estimate #
11/20/12 837
Estimate
Name / Address
Jefferson County
Dept Of The County Clerk
729 Maple St/ PO Box 100
Hillsboro, MQ. 63050-0100
Project
ftem Brescription Qty Cost Total
RRICGSLNESS L Letters or Numbers, without sheeting or Substrate, White I 40.25 40.25
M Hi-Intensity Grade Reflective, Pressura sensitive, 5",
Series E (Highway) , per pack of 25 of same letter of
number
RRICGSLNES6"HI Leiters or Numbers, without sheeting or substrate, White 1 47.10 47.10
M Hi-Intensity Grade Reflective, Pressure sensitive, 6",
Series E (Highway) , per pack of 25 of same letter or
number
RRJCGSLCLSBé... Letters, lower case, without sheeting or substrate, White 1 26.20 26.20
13m Hi-Intensity Grade Reflect] ve, Pressure sensitive, 6",
Series B, per Pack of 25 of same letter or tiumber
RRICGSLCLSBS... Letters , Lower case, without sheeting or substrate, White 1 12.80 i2.80
M Hi-Intensity Grade Reflective, Pressyre sensitive, 3",
Series B (Highway), per pack of 25 of same [oter or
number
RRICGSLNB2'N... Letters or Numbers, without sheeting or substrate, Black I 5.45 5.45
non reflective 3M vinyl, 2" series B, per pack of 25 of
same letter or number

Acceptan

ce of order

Authorized Signature

be added if itejng 8re not in stock, Thig
quute is good for 30 days,

We also have locations in Sprin

e ffer thie oo 1o .
appreciate the Gppartunity to offer this quote. If you have any ques

tions ple;;gﬁ?gé?ga\'
quote is for pick up at oyr shop. Quote contingent
gfield, MO at 417-833-8155 an

an availability of equipment at the time of order, This
d Kansas City , MO at

¢ at 573-204-0060. Tax 1o be added. Shipping to

816-472-5457.

—_—



Road Runner Safety Services, Ing,

P O Box 552
Jackson, MO 63755 : Date Estimate #
11720712 837
Name / Address
Jefferson County
Dept Of The County Clerk
729 Maple St/ PO Box 100
Hillsboro, MO, 63050-0100
Project
ltem Description Qty Cost Total
RRJCGSLNB3"™N... Letters or Numbers, without sheeting or substrate, Black i 5.60 5.60
non reflective 3M vinyl, 3" series B, per pack of 25 of
same letter or number
RRICGSLNB4"N . Letiers or Numbers, without sheeting or Substrate, Black 1 6.60 6.60
non reflective 3M vinyl, 4 SS€Ties B, per pack of 25 of
same letter or number
RRJCGSLNB35"N... Letters or Numbers, withont sheeting or substrate, Black 1 7.50 7.50
non reflective 3M vinyl, 5" series B, per pack of 25 of
same letter or numper
RRJCGSLNB6"N... Letters or Numbers, without sheeting or substrate, Black 1 875 8.75
non reflective 3IM vinyl, 6" series B, per pack of 25 of
same letier or aumber
RRICGSLNC2'™N... Letters or Numbers, without sheeting or substrate, Rlack 1 490 4.90
non reflective 3M vinyl, 2" series C, per pack of 25 of
sane letier or number
RRICGSLNC3I'N... Letters or Nuimbers, without sheeting or substrate, Black 1 6.35 6.35
non reflective 3M vinyl, 3 »series C, per pack of 25 of
same letter or number
Acceptance of order
Lo |
Authorized Signature TGtﬁ!




Road Runner Safety Services, Inc.

P O Box 552 -
Jackson, MO 63755 Date Estimate #
11/20/12 837
Name / Address
Jefferson County
Dept Of The County Clerk
729 Mapie St/ PO Box 100
Hiilsboro, MO, 63050-0100
Project
ltem Description Qty Cost Total
RRICGSLNC4*N... Letters or Numbeys, without sheeting or substrate, Black 1 7.20 7.20
non reflective 3M vinyl, 4" series C, per pack of 25 of
same letier or number
RRICGSLNCS"N... Letters or Numbers, without sheeting or substrate, Black I 8.10 8.10
non reflective 36 vinyl, 5" series €, per pack of 25 of
same letter or number
RRICGSLNCs™N... Letters or Numbers, without sheeting or substrate, Black 1 9.45 9.45
non reflective 3M vinyl, 6" series C, per pack of 25 of |
same letter or number
RRICGSLNDS2",.. Letters or Numbers, without sheeting or substrate, Black 1 5.60 3.60
non reflective 3M vinyl, 2" serjes D, per pack of 25 of
same letter or number
RRICGSLNDS3"... Letters or Numbers, without sheeting or substrate, Black 1 0.60 6.60
noit reflective 30 vinyl, 3" series D, per pack of 25 of
same lefter or number
RRICGSI.NDS4".., Leiters or Numbers, withgut sheeting or substrate, Black 1 7.55 7.55
non reflective 30 vinyl, 4" series D, per pack of25 of
same letter or number

Acceptance of order

Authorized Signature

H%‘H‘“‘ o
We appreciate the Opportunity io offer this quote. Ifyou have any questiong please contact Dave af 573-204-0060, Tex o be added. Shipping to
be adqed if items are not in stock. This quote is for pick up at cur shop. Quote contingent on availability of equipment at the time of order, Thig
quote is good for 3¢ days. We also have locations in Springfield, MO at 41 7-833-8155 and Kansas City , MO at 816-472.545 7.
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Road Runner Safety Services, Inc.

P O Box 552 —
Jackson, MO 63755 Date Estimate
11720712 837
Estimate
Name / Address

Jefferson County

Dept Of The County Clerk

729 Maple St/ PO Box 100

Hillshoro, MO. 63050-0100

Project
item Description Qty Cost Total

RRICGSLNDSS"... [Letters or Numbers, without shecting or stbstrate, Black 1 8.85 8.85
non reflective 3M vinyl, 5" serfes D, per pack of 25 of
same letter or number

RRICGSLNDS6"... {Letters or Numbers, without shesting or subsirate, Black 1 10.65 10.65
non reflective 3M vinyl, 6" ,series D, per pack of 25 of
same letter or number

RRICGSLNESS". . Lettersror Numbers, without sheeting or substrate, Black 1 19.25 19.25
non reflective 3M vinyl, 5" series E (Highway), per pack
of 25 of same letter or number .

RRICGSLNESS"... Letters or Numbers, without sheeting or substrate, Black 1 22.25 2225
non reflective 3M viny}, 6" series E (Highway), per pack
of 25 of same letter or number

RRICGSLCLSEé... Letters, Lower case, without sheeting or substrate, Black 1 12.70 12.70

’ non reflective 3M vinyl, 6" series B, per pack of 25 of

same letter or number

RRICGSLCLSB3... Letters , Lower case, without sheeting or stibstrate, Black 1 7.65 7.65
non reflective 3M vinyl, 3" »series B, per pack of 25 of
same letter or number

Acceptance of order
Authorized Signature TOta‘l
We appreciate the opportunity to offer this quote. If you have any questions ple_as?c;r;act Dave at 573-204-0060. Tax to be added. Shipping to
be added if items are not in stock. This quote is for pick up at our shop. Quote contingent on availability of equipment at the time of order. This

quote is good for 30 days. We also have

L

locations in Springfield, MO at 417-833-8155 and Kansas City , MO at 816-472-5457,

—



Road Runner Safety Services, Inc.

P O Box 552
Jackson, MO 63755

Date Estimate #

11720712 837

Estimate

Name f Address

Jefferson County

Dept Of The County Clerk
729 Maple St/ PO Box 100
Hilisboro, MO. 63050-0100

Project

ftem Description Qty Cost Total

Minimum order of signs for NO setup fee: 20.

Set up fee for follow sign sizes: 12"X18":$25.,
18"X18"$30., 18"X24":330, 24"X24":835.,
24"X30":$35.,30"X30":540.,

Minimum order: $200.

Number of days between order date and delivery to
location:30 day (contingent on stock availability at time
of order)

Quoted pricing good for one year from Bid Date,
10-27-12.

Freight additional on orders totaling less than $3500. Free
shipping on orders totaling $3500, shipped direct to your
location in Hillsboro, MO. Single shipment, single
location,

Bracket styles 90X,180X,Cross BA7A, Cross UNIV457X
sold in carton quantities of 50 brackets per style.

Estimated sign pricing is for 1 color signs. Please add
20% for each additional color,

This is a sales estimate and no installation of site
maintenance is offered.

Acceptance of order

Total

Authorized Signature

We appref:ia_tte the opportunity to offer this quote. If you have any questions please contact Dave at 573-204-0060. Tax to be added. Shipping to
be add_cd if items are not in stock, This quote is for pick up at our shop. Quote contingent an availability of equipment at ihe time of order. This
quote is good for 30 days. We also have locations in Springfield, MO at 417-833-8155 and Kansas City , MO at 816-472-5457.
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Road Runner Safety Services, Inc.

P O Box 552 :
Jackson, MO 63755 Date Estimate #
112012 837
Name / Address
Jefferson County
Dept Of The County Clerk
729 Maple St/ PO Box 100
Hillsboro, MO. 63050-0100
Project
ltem Description Qty Cost Total
For RFB: Roadway Signs 2013.
Contact Number: Department of the County Clerk
Jetferson County MO.
729 Maple ST/ PO Box 100
Hillsboro, MO. 63050-0100
Vickie Pratt
Department of Administrative Services
Ph 636-797-5382
Sales Tax 0.00% 0.00
Acceptance of order
$2,764.20
Aunthorized Signature TOtaI
We appref;igte the opportunity to offer this quote. If you have any guestions please contact Dave at 573-204-0060. Tax to be added. Shipping to
be acld_cd if items are not in stock. This quote is for pick up at our shop. Quote contingent on availability of equipient at the time of erder. This
quote is good for 30 days. We also have locations in Springfield, MO at 417-833-8155 and Kansas City , MO at 816-472-5457.
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