
BID TABULATION - SAFETY VESTS 2013

MTS SAFETY 
PRODUCTS

MIDWEST 
CONSTRUCTION 

SERVICES

CLEN INDUSTRIES 
INC

SUNWEST SALES 
COMPANY

PRODUCTS 
UNLIMITED

STROUD SAFETY 
APPAREL

THE STRONG 
GROUP INC

GLOBE 
ELECTRIC CO. 

INC.

150 SECOND ST
BELMONT MS

38827

516 N MAIN
DESOTO MO 

63020

16 WHARTON WAY 
CHESTERFIELD MO

63017

2359 LINCOLN AVE
HAYWARD CA

PO BOX 339
JUSTIN TX

76247

414 WEST 4TH ST
STROUD OK

74079

222 ATLANTIC AVE
OCEANSIDE NY

11572

PO BOX 710548
HOUSTON TX

77271

VEST SIZE & QUANTITY

LARGE 1 - 99 $16.63 $15.00 $14.12 $11.20 $14.75 $11.98 $11.95 $12.99

LARGE 100 + $16.63 $15.00 $13.29 $10.10 $14.45 $11.76 $11.95 $12.49

VEST SIZE & QUANTITY

X - LARGE 1 - 99 $16.63 $15.00 $14.56 $11.20 $15.31 $12.71 $12.40 $13.60

X - LARGE 100 + $16.63 $15.00 $13.70 $10.10 $14.45 $12.23 $12.40 $12.99

VEST SIZE & QUANTITY

2X - LARGE 1 - 99 $17.33 $16.00 $15.25 $11.70 $15.71 $13.05 $12.95 $13.99

2X - LARGE 100 + $17.33 $16.00 $14.35 $10.80 $15.09 $12.81 $12.95 $13.49

AFFIDAVIT COMPLETED YES YES NO YES YES YES YES YES
COPY OF INSURANCE 

PROVIDED
NO NO NO YES NO NO NO NO

COMMENTS: Price includes shipping.

Iron Horse safety 
#C2MCHEV-Y 1.5"
Delivery 2 weeks - 

freight included

SAFETY VESTS 2013                                                                       
BID OPENING                                             

11-27-12
Contract term: 3-1-13 to 2-28-14  

upon approval by the County 
Council and County Executive



BID TABULATION - SAFETY VESTS 2013

ENVIROSUPPLY & 
SERVICE

IRON HORSE 
SAFETY NUWAY

1791 KAISER AVE
IRVINE CA

92614

11410 PAGEMILL RD
DALLAS TX                       

75243

4190 HOFFMEISTER
ST LOUIS MO 

63125

$7.69 NO BID $15.13

$7.69 NO BID $15.13

$7.69 NO BID $15.13

$7.69 NO BID $15.13

$7.86 NO BID $15.13

$7.86 NO BID $15.13

YES YES 

NO NO

Samples only.
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