JANITORIAL SUPPLIES 2014 BID TABULATION

JANITORIAL SUPPLIES

2014 BID
OPENING
DESOTO PYRAMID CALICO
10-8-13 DASH MEDICAL | CENTRAL POLY QUILL ALL AMERICAN CONTINENTAL INTERBORO
Contract term:1-1-14 to 12-31-|  GLOVES INC BAG CORP ECOLABING | ELECTRICA | corporATION POLY P RESEARCH | PACKING CORP | MEPPART | HPPRODUCTS | - INDUSTRIES XPEDX
14 upon approval by the
County Council and County
Executive
9635 S FRANKLIN DR| 2400 BEDLE PLACE (370 WABASHA STN| 12561 HWY 21 100SCHELTERRD | 40 TURNERPLACE | esionsTHsT | 180 CE%LRAL IND | 114 BRACKENRD | 1901 10TH AVE AZZOTS:/?ITARO gOAE’A‘:\‘UNNACJ(;fg DR} 2089 Csts RATE
FRANKLIN WI LINDEN NJ STPAUL MN DESOTO MO LINCOLNSHIREIL | PISCATAWAY NJ TAMPA FL sTLousMo | MONTGOMERY NY | BROOKLYNNY | o bos oo | JuneTion Mo STLOUIS MO
53132 07036 55102 63020 60069 08854 33610 63110 12549 11215 46268 20701 53026
Item #1 - 80z Foam Cups
How Packaged - - 100 per case 1000 per case - 1000 per case - - 1000 per case - 1000 per case
Quantity per case - - 1000 1000 - 1000 - - 1000 - 1000
Bid Price - - NO BID $30.90 $18.27 - $18.98 N/A - - $18.60 - $16.95
. . HP #121671 Dart Dart 818
Comments Dart Bid 8J8 Dixie #0CC8J8 818 2025884
Item #2 - Jumbo Toilet Tissue
How Packaged - 12/cs 12 pack 12 rolls/case - - - - - 12
Sheets per roll - 2000 2000 1000 - - - 1000 - 9" dia.
Rolls per case - 12 12 12 - - - 12 - 12
Bid Price - $29.90 NO BID $60.35 $16.29 - NO BID N/A - - $20.93 - $21.32
Brighton Bid HP #152000 CAS Reliable 4442260
Comments Atlas #A700 Kimberly clark 9 4097 North River 2,000- 2ply 12"
365379 "
JRT dia. Roll
Item #3 - Small Toilet Tissue
How Packaged - 96 per case 96 per case 96 per case - 96 per case - - 96 per case - 96 per case
Sheets per roll - 500 500 500 - 500 - - 500 - 5003.75 x 45
Rolls per case - 96 96 96 - 96 - - 96 - 96
Bid Price - $46.60 NO BID $68.60 $34.03 - $33.98 N/A - - $28.10 - $32.04
. HP #155495 CAS
Brighton Bid Boardwalk . .
Comments Atlas #A250 265377 HBWKE150 4064 Nortth River Reliable 4226040
Bath Tissue
Item #4 - Kitchen Towels
How Packaged - 30 per case 30 per case - 30 per case - - 30 per case - 30 per case
Sheets per roll - 90 85 - 90 - - 90 - 90 11" x 9" 2 ply
Quantity per case - 30 30 - 30 - - 30 - 30
Bid Price - $29.99 NO BID $37.65 NO BID - $25.75 N/A - $18.94 - $18.10
Ecosoft HP #140930 Bay
Comments Atlas #A585 HWAU41000 West 41000 PRT Reliable 4440560
Ecosoft
Item #5 - Large Trash Bags
Bag Size - 40 x 46 40 x 46 (.75 mil) 40" X 46" 40 X 48 - 40 x 46 40 X 48 40 x 46 clear
How packaged - 200/cs 100 ct 200 per case 200/cs - 10/rolls 25 per roll 200/case 125
Bags per case - 200 200 200 200 - 250/cs 200 125/cs
Bid Price - $19.30 NO BID $34.70 NO BID $22.72 NO BID N/A $15.48 - $23.94 $16.48 $12.94
Hp #161814
Comments - WT-4048-4 pricing good till 3-| Calico 9939233 | Reliable 6153956
31-14
Item #6 - Small Trash Bags
Bag Size - 23x33 24 x 32 (.30 mil) 23" 33" 24X 33 - 23x33 24x33 24x32
How packaged - 1000/cs 1000/cs 500 per case 1000/cs - 20/rolls 50 per roll 1000/case 1000
Bags per case - 1000 1000 1000 N/A 1000 - 1000 1000 1000
Bid Price - $13.60 NO BID $34.10 NO BID $24.45 NO BID $13.98 - $37.70 $15.42 $21.18
HP #166434 "
Comments WT-2433-L pricing good till 3- Calico 9970005 Reliable 6153964
Black
31-14
Item #7- Liquid Tide Laundry Soap
How packaged - - 2.5 Gallon 100 0z/4 pack - - - 6/500z/cs - 4fctn
Bid Price - - $59.99 $79.75 NO BID - NO BID N/A - - $62.85 - $100.14
Ecolab Inc. y
s Hp #134550 Tide 5441883 150 oz
Comments Flexlite #10356 Ultra Strength 96 load Lig. Tide

2.5 gallon
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Item #8 - Bar Hand Soap
Oz per bar - - - 3/40Z - - - 1.50z - .75
How packaged - - - 1000 case - - - 1.502/500/cs - wrapped
Bars per case - - - 1000 case - - - 500 - 1000
Bid Price - - NO BID - $59.39 - NO BID N/A - - $70.06 - $504.40
I Hp #133383 Dial 2042374 Dial
Comments Dial Bid DIA06009 Unwrapped Pure & Nat.
Item #9 - Single Fold Towels
Sheet size - 9x10 91/8"x91/2" 9x10 - - - 9x10 - 9x10
How packaged - 4008/cs 16 pk/case 250/ pk - - - - - 4000/cs
Sheets per package - 334 250/pk 250 - - - 250 - 250
Packages per case - 15 15 16 - - - 16 - 15
Bid Price - $19.33 NO BID $33.30 $21.16 - NO BID N/A - - $14.88 - $15.71
Putney #P600 9.25 . Hp #119411 GP Reliable 4441810
Comments X 10.25 12/334/cs Envision Bid 23504 235-04 Envision 10.25x9.125
Item #10- Ice Melt
How packaged - -- 49 bags/pallet - bag/box - - bag/box - bag/box
Lbs per bag - - 50 - 50 - - 50 - 50
Bid Price - - NO BID $458.65/pallet NO BID - NO BID $0.99 - - $7.30/bg - $7.28
Hp #109652 Knox MorgroSnoPlow
Comments - 49/ pallet Melt away - \ce Melter 5062331
Item #11- Facial Tissue
Tissues per box - 100 100 125 - 100 - - 110 - 100
How packaged - 30 per case 30 per case 30 per case - 30 per case - - 30 per case - 30 per case
Boxes per case - 30 - 30/ bxs case - 30 bx/cs - - 30 - 30
Bid Price - $18.33 NO BID $32.75 $42.95 - $16.29 N/A - - $17.50 - $16.91
Angel Soft Bid Hp #131224 Bay Reliable 4441950
Comments 48560 Marcal #2930 West 13000 82x7.9
Item #12- Maxi Pads
Pads per box - - 1 1 - 1 - - 1 - 1 each
How packaged - - 100 250 case - 250 case - - 250/cs - 250/cs
Boxes per case - - 250 250 - 250 - - 250 - 250
Bid Price - - NO BID $31.50 $47.71 - $27.98 N/A - - $29.40 - $25.79
RMC Naturelle Bid Hp #113014 2028079
Comments 04 Gards #147A Hospeco Gards Hospeco MT 4
Item #13 - Non-Latex Exam Gloves
How packaged 10/100 Case - 100/ bx - 100/bx 10bx/cs 1000 case - - 10/100/case 10 x 100/cs
Gloves per box 100 - 100 - 100 100 - 100 100 100
Boxes per case 10 - 10 - 10 10 - 10 10 10
Bid Price $24.30 - NO BID $88.80 NO BID - $27.90 N/A $25.00 - $29.30 $22.40 $24.63
. . Hp .
Comments Dasr\‘/:\:“:‘;'g ask Blue Nitrile - Tradex #V200 Med P"dEe “VPFG- #106718,106717, Sa(fs\tyDZS"e \Qr':i'_rgg’::'
4 106716, 106719
Item #14- Plastic Forks
How packaged - - Bulk case Bulk case - - - Bulk case Bulk case Bulk case
Forks per box - - 1000 1000 - - - 1000 1000 1000
Boxes per case - - 1 1 - - - 1 1 1
Bid Price - - NO BID $68.40 $41.12 - NO BID N/A - - $8.00 $6.54 $8.27
Hp #165591
Comments Solo Bid 10805 Netchoice  Calico 632491W Medz"s\’zt;‘;'gp“’p
406010MW PP
Item #15 - Plastic Spoons
How packaged - - Bulk Bulk case - - - Bulk Bulk Bulk
Spoons per box - - 1000 1000 - - - 1000 1000 1000
Boxes per case - - 1 1 - - - 1 1 1
Bid Price - - NO BID $68.40 $41.12 - NO BID N/A - - $8.00 $6.54 $8.27
Hp #165593
Comments Solo Bid 108216 Netchoice 406014 Calico 632404wy ™ed Wt Polyprop
2335438
MW PP
Item #16- 20" Polish Pads
How packaged - - - 5 pads/case - 5/cs - - - 5/cs 5/case 5/cs
Pads per box - - 5 5 - 5 5 - - 5 5 5
Boxes per case - - 1 1 - 1 1 - - 1 1 1
Bid Price - - NO BID $37.25 $19.16 - $10.89 $71.50 - - $14.92 $11.84 $11.48
Reliable 2152741
Premier Bid Hp #116525 3M . White
Comments 4020WEQ white ACS #41-20 Niagara4100N  AMENC0 401220 o o pocich 175-

600rpm
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Item #17 - 20" Buff or Burnish Pads
How packaged - - - - 5/cs - - 5/cs 5/case 5/cs
Pads per box - - 5 - 5 - - 5 5 5
Boxes per case - - 1 - 1 - - 1 1 1
Bid Price - - NO BID $35.35 NO BID $10.89 N/A - - $15.93 $12.34 $11.96
Reliable 2152743
Comments ACS #34-20 FIL’T:];EZSSA?]SI’:IA Americo 430620 Tan burnishing
9 1500-3000rpm
Item #18 - 20" Stripping Pads
How packaged - - - 5 pads/case - 5/cs - - 5/cs 5/case 5/cs
Pads per box - - 5 5 - 5 - - 5 5 5
Boxes per case - - 1 1 - 1 - - 1 1 1
Bid Price - - NO BID $38.65 $19.16 - $10.89 N/A - - $15.35 $12.14 $11.48
Premier Bid Reliable 2152748
Comments PAD4020BLA ACS #72-20 Hp #116258 3M Americo 400120 Black 175-
Niagara 7200N
black 600rpm
Item #19- 16" Stripping Pads
How packaged - - 5 pads/case - 5/cs - - 5/cs - 5/cs
Pads per box - - 5 - 5 - - 5 - 5
Boxes per case - - 1 - 1 - - 1 - 1
Bid Price - - NO BID NO BID $13.38 - $7.98 N/A - - $10.79 - $17.32
Premier Bid -
Comments PAD4016BLA ACS #72-16 Hp #126216 3M 2030601 3M 16
Niagara 7200N black
black
Item #20 - Vacuum Cleaner Bags Style
How packaged - - Bulk - Bulk - - Bulk - -
Bags per package - - 3pk - 3 ea/pkg - - 3 - -
Packages per case - - 6 - 6 pkglcs - - 1 - -
Bid Price - - NO BID $34.25 NO BID - $20.79 N/A - - $3.76/pkg - -
Comments 58183A Hp #118495 EU
Item #21 - Vacuum Cleaner Bags Style AA
How packaged - - Bulk - Bulk - - Bulk - -
Bags per package - - 3 - 3 ea/pkg - - 3 - -
Packages per case - - 6 - 6 pkaglcs - - 1 - -
Bid Price - - NO BID $20.15 NO BID - $12.45 N/A - - $2.46/pkg - -
Hp #115480
Comments 58236C 58236C-6,
58236A
Item #22 - 160z Mop Heads
How packaged - - - - 6/case - - Bulk - -
Mop Heads per case - - - - 6 - - 6 - -
Bid Price - - NO BID - NO BID - $17.34 N/A - - $15.24 - -
Comments ABCO Hp #134835 RM
#CM22201 F566 Prem
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Item #23- Liquid Bleach
How packaged - - Case Case - - - Case - 4/case
Gallons per case - - 6 4 - - - 6 - 4
Bid Price - - NO BID $16.40 $7.25 - NO BID N/A - - $7.30 - $5.91
Comments 96 0z Pure Bright Bid Hp #108596 KIK 6006332
Bleach 4
Item #24 - Wooden Handle Brooms
How packaged - - - 12/case - - Doz -
Bid Price - - NO BID NO BID NO BID - $54.12 N/A - - NO BID $79.14 -
Comments - - - Magnolia #15018 - - specs attached
Item #25 - Food Service Gloves
How packaged CASE - Case - 100/bx 10bx/cs Case - Case Case -
Gloves per case 1000 - 1000 - 1000 1000 - 10,000 1000 -
Bid Price $41.30 - NO BID $57.50 NO BID - $44.90 N/A $44.95 - $54.00 $4.34 -
Dash Vitalgard Tradex . Hp #107130 Clear|  Safety Zone
Comments Latex PF #LLG5201 Aurelia Lrg LPFG Poly GDPE-LG
Item #26- Food Service Caps
How packaged - - - - - Case Case Case
Caps per case - - - - - 1000 1000 1000
Bid Price - - NO BID NO BID NO BID - NO BID N/A - - $45.72 $17.44 $19.74
Safety Zone 5132060 21"
Comment Hp #105809 DBWH-19  white non-woven
Item #27- Aerosol Air Neutralizer
How packaged - - - 12-200z cans/cs - - - 12/cs - -
Cans per case - - - 12 12 - - 12 - -
Bid Price - - NO BID NO BID NO BID - $28.29 $210.00 - - $39.72 - -
Hp #165657 proprietary
Comments Chase #4113 Nodor Claire Low VOC product
Item #28- No Rinse Floor Stripper
How packaged - - 2.5 gallon - - - 1 gallon pail - 1 gallon pail
Quantity Per Case - - one - - - 5 gallon pail - -
Bid Price - - $33.88 NO BID NO BID - NO BID N/A - - $40.36 - $35.67
Ecolab Inc.
e . ) Carestrip L.O. Hp #119965 G;ESMDEEII?:E
omments #61183458 - 2.5 Spartan v Duty Flr.

gallon

Stripper
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Item #29- One Coat Floor Wax
How packaged - - 2.5 gallon 1 gallon pail - 1 gallon pail - - 1 gallon pail - 4 gallon/ctn
Quantity per case - - one 4 - - - - 5 gallon pail - -
Bid Price - - $41.49 $56.30 NO BID - NO BID $53.00 - - $57.50 - $47.69/ctn
GEEmC;’t':rbp'ggns Hp #119949 6140812 Reliable
Comments Double Wear Spartan On an' On High Glosss 25%
#61189791- 2.5 n
High Solids Solids
gallon
Item #30- Toilet Seat Covers B
How packaged - 5000/cs - - 250/bx 20bx/cs - - 5000/cs - 5000
Sheets per box - 5000 5000 - 5000 - - 5000 - 5000
Boxes per case - 20 20 - 20 - - 20 - 20
Bid Price - $52.53 NO BID $90.80 NO BID - $25.49 N/A - - $33.04 - $27.12
Roch Midland .
Comments 4E0RAA Hp# 112986 Reliable 2255555
Item #31 - Sanitizer Concentrate for pit toilets
How packaged - - - - - 5 gallon pail - -
Bid Price - - NO BID NO BID NO BID - NO BID N/A - - $54.26 - -
Hp #120113
Comments Spartan Consume
Ecolyzer
Item #32 - Deodorizer Concentrate for pit toilets
How packaged - - - - - 5 gallon pail - -
Bid Price - - NO BID NO BID NO BID - NO BID N/A - - $54.26 - -
Hp #120113
Comments - Spartan Consume
Ecolyzer
Item #33 - Plastic Spray Container
How packaged - - 12 per case - 12 per case - - 12 per case 12 pr case 12 per case
Bid Price - - NO BID $16.40 NO BID - $8.64 N/A - - $9.72 $0.80 .38 each
Trigger -
Continental . 5391610 Impact
Comments - 49328 + Hp #ﬁiggé 1& Hp . 3%;';%’3 oy | #4902 bottle
902RW9 5096059 Impact
5032HG
Item #34- 10 inch Deck Brushes Wood Handle
How packaged - - 12 per case - 12 per case - - 12 per case 12 per case -
Bid Price - - NO BID $79.85 NO BID - $57.48 N/A - - $23.76 $47.47 -
Hp #156184 & Hp Abco
Greenwood # #135310 Rm 9B36
Comments - 4272 + #414 Deck Brush 00008/01113
specs attached
Polypropylene
Item #35 - Vacuum Cleaner Bags Style LS
How packaged - - - Bulk - - Bulk - -
Bags per Package - - - 3/ pkg - - 3 - -
Packages per Case - - - 6 pkglcs - - 6 - -
Bid Price - - NO BID NO BID NO BID - $21.98 N/A - - $27.54 - -
Hp #134759
Comments 61820B 61820-A PPR
Bags
Item #36- Disposal Bags for Sanitary Napkins
How packaged - 500 pe case - - 500 per case - 500 per case - 500 per case
Bid Price - $25.89 NO BID - NO BID - $12.59 N/A - - $14.93 - $12.58
Hospeco
Comments - #17 Hospeco #KL260 Hp #113028 - 2367914 KL 7.5
HOSPECO
x3.5x10.25
Item #37 - Non-Alcohol Foaming Hand Sanitizer
How packaged - - - - 6/bx 1250ml cs 4/cs 100ml - -
Bid Price - - NO BID NO BID NO BID - NO BID N/A - $57.60 $59.56 - -
Dermarite Hp #137217
Comments 400109F/1000m! Rubbermaid TC

50593
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Item #38 - White Roll Towels
How packaged - - - - - - 8 per case - 12rls/cs
Bid Price - - NO BID NO BID NO BID - NO BID $49.00 - - $63.03 - $104.79
2194274
Hp #114402 KC01000
Comments - Wypall Kimberly Clark - 8"x1000' 1 ply
01000 HRT white towel
12/ctn
Item #39 - Antibacterial Hand Soap
How packaged - - - - 10/bx 1000ml bags  1000ml/6cs - -
Bid Price - - NO BID NO BID NO BID - NO BID N/A - $33.90 $36.86 - -
Comments : Dermarite Hp #135899 Kutol
#0092BB EZ Foam
Item #40 - Liquid Chlorox Bleach 5 gal.
How packaged - - - - - 5 gallon pail - 5gal
Bid Price - - NO BID NO BID NO BID - NO BID N/A - - $34.67 - 26.38
Hp #135453 ACS Sodium
Spartan Hypochloride
Comments Clothesline Color bleach 5 gal
Safe 5544651
Item #41 - Downy Fabric Softener
How packaged - 5 gallon pail - - - 5 gallon pail - 5gal
Bid Price - - $59.19 NO BID NO BID - NO BID N/A - - $67.70 - $52.28
Comments a So Fresh, #14310 Hp #135598 ACS Liquid Softy
5 gallon pail Spartan 6045676
Item #42- Urinals Screen with Deodorizing Blocks
How packaged - 12 prenrgC:Z;]mU 12 per case 12 per case - 12 per case 12 per case - - 12 per case - 12 per case
Bid Price - - $29.09 $25.90 per case $9.02 - $9.18 $134.00 - - $16.92 - $12.16
Aﬁ’;’:ﬂirggzy Reliable 4 oz
Comments wiscreen Krystal bid Continental #165- Big Dadd Hp #115886 4297910
KR41001 4 g Daddy HOSPECO winonpara
#61144200 - enzyme block
12/100 mg case Y
Item #43 - Dawn Dishwashing Detergent 24 oz Bottles
How packaged - - 9/32 0z 10/ case - - - - 12qts/cs - 10/cs
Bid Price - - $41.31 $42.60 per case NO BID - - N/A - - $30.96 - $29.20
. Hp #119859
Comments - Pantastic #13003 - - Spartan Blue Glo 5523680 Ivory Dish det
9/32 oz case
Pot/Pan Detergent
Item # 44 - Large Aerosol Disinfectant Can Deodorizer Spray 15.5 0z
How packaged - - 12/box - 12-16.5 oz cans/cs - - - 12/200z/cs - 12/cs
Bid Price - - NO BID $68.80 NO BID - $22.41 $127.00 - - $29.90 - $28.61
Comments Lysol Brand 11| Chaso spraypak Triple Play Hp #115216 HP 4161100 Reliable
Item #45- Lemon Pledge 9.7 oz
How packaged - - 12/box - 12-9.70z/cs - - 12/200z/cs - 12/cs
Bid Price - - NO BID $54.15 NO BID - $48.98 N/A - - $27.56 - $24.73
Hp #115156 HP 4158490 Reliable
Comments Pledge Lemon oil Lemon Aero
#DRKCBT23725 Furniture Polish Polish 19 0z
Item #46- Pinesole Cleaner 16 oz
How packaged - - 12/box - - - 240z/12/cs - -
Bid Price - - NO BID $30.75 NO BID - NO BID N/A - - $27.66 - -
Comments 240z Hp #173139 Pine-
Sol
Item #47- Black Trash Bags 60 gal.
How packaged - 100/cs 100 count 100 box 100 per case - 100 case - 100/cs 100/case 100/cs
Bid Price - $35.00 NO BID $37.90 $36.28 $24.30 NO BID $54.00 $28.95 - $24.99 $20.46 $29.91
Hp #146816 HP .
. . . Reliable 6153948
Comments Central Poly Brighton Bid Rhino Bags Alufl 1BS INT - 46. X 50 Can I__lner #9911099 2 mil black
814888 3858- Super pricing good till 3- LLDPE

31-14



JANITORIAL SUPPLIES 2014 BID TABULATION

JANITORIAL SUPPLIES

2014 BID
OPENING DESOTO PYRAMID CALICO
10-8-13 DASH MEDICAL | CENTRAL POLY QuILL ALL AMERICAN CONTINENTAL INTERBORO
Contract term:1-1-14 to 12-31-|  GLOVES INC BAG CORP ECOLABINC E:;sg;slc(fé" CORPORATION POLY P;%'g%‘é; RESEARCH PACKING CORp | MEDPART HP PRODUCTS 'NDL:ZER'ES XPEDX
14 upon approval by the
County Council and County
Executive
9635 S FRANKLIN DR| 2400 BEDLE PLACE (370 WABASHA STN| 12561 HWY 21 100SCHELTERRD | 40 TURNERPLACE | esionsTHsT | 180 CE'\[');RAL IND | 114 BRACKEN RD | 1901 10TH AVE AZZO,fQEIL:ARO QOAZLUNNfJASE DR} 2089 CzRgg RATE
FRANKLIN WI LINDEN NJ STPAUL MN DESOTO MO LINCOLNSHIREIL | PISCATAWAY NJ TAMPA FL sTLOUISMO | MONTGOMERY NY | BROOKLYNNY |\ o o | JuNGTION MD STLOUIS MO
53132 07036 55102 63020 60069 08854 33610 3110 12549 11215 46268 20701 53026
Item #48 - Quickie Scrub Brush with handle
How packaged - - 72-case - - - 12/cs - -
Bid Price - - NO BID $190.80 NO BID - NO BID N/A - - $9.24 - -
Hp #104512
Comments Rubbermaid 6482
Item #49 - Old English 16 oz
How packaged - - 6/box - - - 12/200z/cs - -
Bid Price - - NO BID $27.40 NO BID - NO BID N/A - - $27.56 - -
Hp #115156 Hp
Comments Lemon Oil
Furniture Polish
Item # 50 - Spray glass cleaner 19 oz cans
How packaged - - 12/box - 12-20 oz cans/cs - - - 12/200z/cs - 12/cs
Bid Price - - NO BID $37.20 NO BID - $21.89 $114.00 - - $21.20 - $17.24
Hp #104517 Hp RZ"::’;;?;::;'O
Comments - Chase #4101 Awesome Gleme Glass
Multi Surface
Cleaner Aerosol
190z
Item # 51 - Lysol Toilet Bow Cleaner 24 oz
How packaged - - 12/box 1 each - 12-24 oz cans/cs - - 12qts/cs - 12/cs
Bid Price - - NO BID $32.40 $2.26 each - $28.99 N/A - - $14.36 - $16.22
Hp #119809 6140918 Reliable
Comments Lysol Bid Lysol Spartan M95 9.5% Nonacid
REC85020 #REC62522 HCL Bowl Disenfectant
Cleaner Cleaner
Item # 52 - BIO Conquerer
How packaged - - - - - Gallon - 4/gal/cs
Bid Price - - NO BID NO BID NO BID - NO BID N/A - - $34.92 - $36.63
Hp #119855 5429991 Liquid
Spartan Consume .
Comments - L alive enzyme
Liquid Digestant digester
Gal 3097 4/cs 9
Item # 53 - Screw on mop handles
How packaged - - - units of 12 - - units of 12 units of 12 units of 12
Bid Price - - NO BID NO BID NO BID - $44.16 N/A - - $35.64 $40.18 $3.47 each
Hp #114838 RM
For layflat H316Bolt on Wet | #H316 12/case |  C-0C09t
Comments - mopheads ABCO Mon Handle 60" | specs attached Goldenstar
#01210NB P P HWMIIESF
12/cs
Item # 54 - Dishwashing Detergent
How packaged - - 5 gallon pail per case 25 lbs - - - 4gallcs - -
Bid Price - - $70.79 NO BID $51.69 - NO BID N/A - - $41.09 - -
Hp #161793
Ultra Klene Cream suds Bid Sunburst Result
Comments - #12716 5 gallon 100 Liquid
02120 .
pail Automatic
Dishwash 620201
Item # 55 - Dishwashing Sanitizer
How packaged - - 2.5 gallon - - - 5 gal pail - -
Bid Price - - $16.99 NO BID NO BID - NO BID N/A - - $19.67/pail - -
Hp #133078
Ultra San #13965 Sunburst Sunbrite
Comments -

2.5 gallon pail

Sanitizer 5.25%
5gl.




JANITORIAL SUPPLIES 2014 BID TABULATION

JANITORIAL SUPPLIES

2014 BID
OPENING
DESOTO PYRAMID CALICO
10-8-13 DASH MEDICAL | CENTRAL POLY QUILL ALL AMERICAN CONTINENTAL INTERBORO
Contract term:1-1-14 to 12-31-|  GLOVES INC BAG CORP ECOLABING | ELECTRICAL | corpoRraTION POLY P RESEARCH | PACKING CORp | MEPPART | HPPRODUCTS | INDUSTRIES XPEDX
14 upon approval by the
County Council and County
Executive
9635 S FRANKLIN DR| 2400 BEDLE PLACE (370 WABASHA STN| 12561 HWY 21 100SCHELTERRD | 40 TURNERPLACE | 6s1onsTHsT | 180 CE%LRAL IND | 114 BRACKENRD | 1901 10TH AVE 42205;\/(\5&;\}20 gOAE’A‘:\‘UNNACJ(;fg DR} 2089 ijf[fs RATE
FRANKLIN WI LINDEN NJ STPAUL MN DESOTO MO LINCOLNSHIREIL | PISCATAWAY NJ TAMPA FL sTLousMo | MONTGOMERY NY | BROOKLYNNY | |\ boe oo | JuneTion Mo STLOUIS MO
53132 07036 55102 63020 60069 08854 33610 63110 12549 11215 46268 20701 53026
Item # 56 - Dishwashing Rinse
How packaged - - 4.5 gallon - - - 4gllcs - -
Bid Price - - $99.89 NO BID NO BID - NO BID N/A - - $52.91 - -
Hp #103025
Comments a ET Ultra Dry Sunburst XP
#15172 Sunshine Rinse
4/cs
Item # 57 - WW - Delimerhd
How packaged - - 4/1 gallon case - - - 4gllcs - -
Bid Price - - $33.89 NO BID NO BID - NO BID N/A - - $26.69 - -
Lime Away Hp #140.736
Comments - 418700 4/1 gallon Sunburst Lime Be
9 Gone 663001
Item # 58 - Spic n Span 3 n 1 multisurface, glass, disinfectant cleaner
How packaged - - 2.5 gallon 2 x1gallon - - - - -
Bid Price - - $101.88 NO BID $80.26 - NO BID N/A - - NO BID - -
Peroxide Multi-
surface Cleaner Spic n Span Bid
Comments : #6100302 2.5 PG32538
gallon
Item # 59 - Comet cleaner with bleach
How packaged - - - 3-1 gallcs - - - -
Bid Price - - NO BID NO BID NO BID - $59.98 per case N/A - - NO BID - -
Comments Comet
#PGC02291
Item # 60 - Febreze odor eliminator
How packaged - - - - - - -
Bid Price - - NO BID NO BID NO BID - NO BID N/A - - NO BID - -
Comments
Item # 61 - Mr. Clean Finished floor cleaner
How packaged - - 2.5 gallon - 3x1gal - - - -
Bid Price - - $55.69 NO BID NO BID - $54.98 N/A - - NO BID - -
Comments Qasis 100 #14522 Mr Clean
2.5 gallon #PGC02621
Item # 62 - Disenfectant Floor Cleaner
How packaged - - 4 x 1 gallon - 4 x 1 gallon - - - -
Bid Price - - $73.80 NO BID NO BID - NO BID $32.00 - - NO BID - -
Neutral
Comments Disinfectant Everyday
Item # 63 - Quicke Bowl Brush
How packaged - - 72/case Sold per each - - - 24/CS 12/case -
Bid Price - - NO BID $200.90 case $1.83 per each - NO BID N/A - - $32.64/CS $14.54 -
Hp #109982 RM .
Comments Rubbermaid Bid 6310 Toilet Bowl #3033??2'0?&'“
6310WE Brush 14 1/2 P
attached
Polypro
Affidavit Completed YES YES YES YES YES YES YES YES YES YES YES YES YES
Copy of Insurance Provided NO NO YES NO YES YES NO NO YES YES YES but expired NO NO
2 CASE .
COMMENTS: MINIMUM We deliver 10-14 Minimum orQEr of| Alternates Item 5
ORDER days ARO. $300 per delivery. &6




JANITORIAL SUPPLIES 2014 BID TABULATION

JANITORIAL SUPPLIES

2014 BID
OPENING TRONEX
10-8-13 ALL TYPE VACUUM & | AOSS MEDICAL BUCKEYE INDUSTRIAL SOAP | ROYAL PAPERS
Contract term:1-1-14 to 12-31- JANITORIAL SUPPLY UNIPAK CORP | |\ TERNATIONAL 'NTER’;‘,’E'ONAL INC
14 upon approval by the
County Council and County
Executive
300 ZODIAC IND CT | 300 INTERNATIONAL | 722 S VANDEVAENTER
10678 TRENTON AVE | 4971 CENTRAL AVE| PO BOX 300027 |\l ” 0 % P oo DR AVE 2701 HEREFORD ST
ST LOUIS MO MONROE LA BROOKLYN NY ST LOUIS MO
63130 71203 11280 MO MOUNT OLIVE NJ ST LOUIS MO 53130
63043 07828 63110
Item #1 - 80z Foam Cups
How Packaged 1000 per case - - 1000 per case 1000 per case
Quantity per case 1000 - - 1000 1000
Bid Price 17.52/cs NO BID - NO BID - $15.70 $16.81
Comments Dart 818 1000/cs
Item #2 - Jumbo Toilet Tissue
How Packaged 12/cs - 6lcs - 12 rolls/cs 12/cs
Sheets per roll 2000 - 2000 - 2000 2000
Rolls per case 12 - 12 - 12 12
Bid Price $25.70 NO BID - $22.35/cs - $20.15 $20.33
Comments Boardwalk 6100 Baywest BW20020
Item #3 - Small Toilet Tissue
How Packaged 96 per case - 96/cs - 96 per case 96 per case
Sheets per roll 500 - 500 - 500 500
Rolls per case 96 - 96 - 96 96
Bid Price $35.28 NO BID - $34.03 - $29.75 $31.10
Comments Boardwalk 6150 Baywest BW54000
Item #4 - Kitchen Towels
How Packaged 30 per case - 30/cs - 30 per case 30 per case
Sheets per roll 80 - 90 - 85 90
Quantity per case 30 - 30 - 30 30
Bid Price $17.93 NO BID - $18.58 - $17.50 $20.23
Vintage Baywest BW41000
Item #5 - Large Trash Bags
Bag Size 40 x 46 40 X 60 40 X 60 .6 mil - 40 x 46 40 x 46
How packaged 250/cs 200 100/cs - 250 250
Bags per case 250/cs 200 200 - - 200
Bid Price $26.81 NO BID $18.35 $12.01 - $17.94 $20.80
Vintage Clear
Comments VH404817N RBCR46H13 250/case
Item #6- Small Trash Bags
Bag Size 24x33 2433 22 x33.4mil - 24x32 23x33
How packaged 1000/cs 1000 500/cs - 1000 1000
Bags per case 1000 1000 1000 - 1000 1000
Bid Price $16.91 NO BID $15.75 $14.89 - $23.80 $18.14
Vintage
Comments ClearVH243306N RBCR46H13
Item #7 - Liquid Tide Laundry Soap
How packaged - 2.5 GAL - 4/150 ounce/cs 2.5gal
Bid Price NO BID NO BID - $130.58 - $118.00 $110.78
Comments - Tide #23064




JANITORIAL SUPPLIES 2014 BID TABULATION

JANITORIAL SUPPLIES

2014 BID
OPENING TRONEX
10-8-13 ALL TYPE VACUUM & | AOSS MEDICAL BUCKEYE INDUSTRIAL SOAP | ROYAL PAPERS
Contract term:1-1-14 to 12-31- JANITORIAL SUPPLY UNIPAKCORP | |\ TERNATIONAL 'NTERT’\”E'ONAL co INC
14 upon approval by the
County Council and County
Executive
10678 TRENTON AVE | 4971 CENTRAL AVE| PO BOX 300027 Mfgifg:@ﬁ_:g%a;s 30 'NTE';';AT'ONAL 228 VA'L?/EEVAENTER 2701 HEREFORD ST
ST LOUIS MO MONROE LA BROOKLYN NY ST LOUIS MO
63132 71203 11230 MO MOUNT OLIVE NJ ST LOUIS MO 63139
63043 07828 63110
Item #8 - Bar Hand Soap
Oz per bar - - .75 -
How packaged - - 1000 -
Bars per case - - 1000 -
Bid Price NO BID NO BID - NO BID - $73.00 -
Comments ISC Lisa Bar Soap
Item #9 - Single Fold Towels
Sheet size 9x10 - 9x10 - 9x10 9x10
How packaged 4000/cs - 16pk/cs - 16 pkg 16/250 cs
Sheets per package 16 x 250 - 268 per pk - 250 250
Packages per case 16 - 15 - - 16
Bid Price $18.09 NO BID - $15.29 - $14.80 $16.73
Comments Boardwalk 6210 Baywest BW47000
Item #10 - Ice Melt
How packaged bag/box - 50 bag/pallet - bag/box bag/box
Lbs per bag 50 - 50 - 50 50
Bid Price 8.06 bag NO BID - .63 per bag, $381.50/pal - $21.84 $7.15
Comments SWI 150# bag -
Item #11 - Facial Tissue
Tissues per box 100 100 - 100 - 100 100
How packaged 30 per case 30 per case - 30/cs - 30 per case 30 per case
Boxes per case 30/100 30BXS/CS - - - 30 30
Bid Price $13.83 $28.00/CS - $16.23 - $13.20 $19.60
Comments Nova/Silky Baywest BW13000
Item #12 - Maxi Pads
Pads per box 1 each - 1 each - 1 each 1 each
How packaged 250/cs - 250/cs - 250/case case
Boxes per case 250 - 250 - 250 250
Bid Price 39.95/cs NO BID - $30.00 - $24.44 $33.72
Comments Gards-14502147 HOS147A
Item #13 - Non-Latex Exam Gloves
How packaged 10 x 100 100/bx 10/cs - 100/bx 10bx/cs 100gal/bx/10bx/cs 10/100 per case Case
Gloves per box 100 100 - 100 100 100 100
Boxes per case 10 10 - 10 10 10 10
Bid Price $35.09/cs $29.00 - $47.94 $26.40 $23.80 $22.60
Simply vinyl
Comments Sterex P.F.glovesor H &
H Brand
Item #14 - Plastic Forks
How packaged Bulk case - - Bulk case Bulk case
Forks per box 1000 - - 1000 1000
Boxes per case 1 - - 1 1
Bid Price $7.06/cs NO BID - NO BID - $7.50 $7.11
Vintage 175001-
Comments LCIVITS
Item #15 - Plastic Spoons
How packaged Bulk - - Bulk Bulk case
Spoons per box 1000 - - 1000 1000
Boxes per case 1 - - 1 1
Bid Price $7.06 NO BID - NO BID $7.50 $7.11
Vintage 175002-
Comments LCIVITS
Item #16 - 20" Polish Pads
How packaged 5/cs - 5/CS - 5/cs Case
Pads per box 5 - 5 - 5 5
Boxes per case 1 - 1 - 1 1
Bid Price $13.28 NO BID - $13.45 - $10.92 $13.85
Comments ETC S80200 E.SUPWHT20




JANITORIAL SUPPLIES 2014 BID TABULATION

JANITORIAL SUPPLIES

2014 BID
OPENING TRONEX
10-8-13 ALL TYPE VACUUM & | AOSS MEDICAL BUCKEYE INDUSTRIAL SOAP | ROYAL PAPERS
Contract term:1-1-14 to 12-31- JANITORIAL SUPPLY UNIPAK CORP INTERNATIONAL INTER’;‘S(;”ONAL co INC
14 upon approval by the
County Council and County
Executive
10678 TRENTON AVE | 4971 CENTRAL AVE| PO BOX 300027 MSAD;Z(EE,'\‘/T)CF:EIZE;S 300 INTERNATIONAL | 722 S VANDEVAENTER | 51 pegerorp st
ST LOUIS MO MONROE LA BROOKLYN NY ST LOUIS MO
63132 71203 11230 MO MOUNT OLIVE NJ ST LOUIS MO 63139
63043 07828 63110
Item #17 - 20" Buff or Burnish Pads
How packaged 5/cs - 5/cs - 5/cs Case
Pads per box 5 - 5 - 5 5
Boxes per case 1 - 1 - 1 1
Bid Price $13.28 NO BID - $13.45 - $10.92 $13.85
Comments ETC S06200 E.NATLIT20
Item #18 - 20" Stripping Pads
How packaged 5/cs - 5/cs - 5/cs Case
Pads per box 5 - 5 - 5 5
Boxes per case 1 - 1 - 1 1
Bid Price $13.28 NO BID - $13.45 - $10.92 $13.85
Comments ETC S10200 E.BLK20
Item #19 - 16" Stripping Pads
How packaged 5/cs - 5/cs - 5/cs Case
Pads per box 5 - 5 - 5 5
Boxes per case 1 - 1 - 1 1
Bid Price $9.16 NO BID - $9.30 - $7.15 $10.43
Comments ETC S10160 E.BLK16
Item #20 - Vacuum Cleaner Bags Style Y
How packaged Bulk - Bulk - -
Bags per package 3x16 - 3 - -
Packages per case 6pks/3ea-18/cs - - - -
Bid Price $22.24 NO BID - $6.40/pk - NO BID -
EV58183A6
Comments 18BAGS/CS HEE-S8183
Item #21 - Vacuum Cleaner Bags Style AA
How packaged Bulk - Bulk - -
Bags per package - - - - -
Packages per case 12 x 3= 36 case - 3 - -
Bid Price $22.01 NO BID - $4.20/pk - NO BID -
Comments Jan - EVAA-2 HEE-S8236
Item #22 - 160z Mop Heads
How packaged 12/cs - 12/cs - 6/CS Bulk
Mop Heads per case 12 - 6 - 6 6
Bid Price $36.46 NO BID - $39.12 - $19.20 $25.50

Comments ZER20016

COAG503316-12




JANITORIAL SUPPLIES 2014 BID TABULATION

JANITORIAL SUPPLIES

2014 BID
OPENING TRONEX
10-8-13 ALL TYPE VACUUM & | AOSS MEDICAL BUCKEYE INDUSTRIAL SOAP | ROYAL PAPERS
Contract term:1-1-14 to 12-31- JANITORIAL SUPPLY UNIPAKCORP | |\ TERNATIONAL 'NTERT’\’E'ONAL co INC
14 upon approval by the
County Council and County
Executive
10678 TRENTON AVE [ 4971 CENTRAL AVE| PO BOX 300027 M?gif::@ﬁ_:g%a;s 300 INTERNATIONAL | 722 S VANDEVAENTER| 51 eperorp st
ST LOUIS MO MONROE LA BROOKLYN NY ST LOUIS MO
313 71203 11230 MO MOUNT OLIVE NJ ST LOUIS MO 63130
63043 07828 63110
Item #23 - Liquid Bleach
How packaged Case - 6lcs - Case Case
Gallons per case 6 - 4 - 4 4
Bid Price $10.04 NO BID - $12.84 - $5.88 $6.52
BUNS500020015 6gal/cs L.CLO02490-6
Item #24 - Wooden Handle Brooms
How packaged Dz - 12/cs - 12 per bundle Dz
Bid Price 60.36/dz NO BID - $26.52/cs - $134.28 $107.88
Comments Prison Broom E505018 COFS07000-12 - 1SC 1233 Magnolia
Item #25 - Food Service Gloves
How packaged Case - Case Case Case
Gloves per case 1000 - 1000 1000 2000
Bid Price $25.16 NO BID - NO BID $7.20 $39.50 $12.73
Comments 1000/cs HYBF003 - Tronex #2100-30 Double Pack 2000
INTE. FIT 100bx/10bx/cs in
Item #26 - Food Service Caps
How packaged Case Case - 500/case Case Case
Caps per case 1000 1000 - 1000 1000 1000
Bid Price $33.11 $31.00/cs - $14.12 $14.40 $23.50 NO BID
Tronex 4040W
Comments RP110NW21 - HOSDA -BL210 100bx/5bx/cs
Item #27 - Aerosol Air Neutralizer
How packaged 12cs/190z 12/cs - 12 12
Cans per case 12 - 12 - 12 12
Bid Price $21.91 NO BID - $35.88 - $56.64 $38.20
Comments 4334113 Timermist Air
Sanitizer
Item #28 - No Rinse Floor Stripper
How packaged 5 gallon pail - 1 gallon pail - 1 gallon pail 1 gallon pail
Quantity Per Case 1 - 4lcs - 4 gal 4
Bid Price $61.53 NO BID - $48.28 - $33.45 $31.56
Comments VAR 3250G05 B.SWANAGL ISC Blast Off Rinse

Free




JANITORIAL SUPPLIES 2014 BID TABULATION

JANITORIAL SUPPLIES
2014 BID
OPENING TRONEX
10-8-13 ALL TYPE VACUUM & | AOSS MEDICAL BUCKEYE INDUSTRIAL SOAP | ROYAL PAPERS
Contract term:1-1-14 to 12-31- JANITORIAL SUPPLY UNIPAKCORP | |\ TERNATIONAL 'NTERTC;—'ONAL co INC
14 upon approval by the
County Council and County
Executive
10678 TRENTON AVE | 4971 CENTRAL AVE| PO BOX 300027 M?gifg&ﬁ_:g%a;s 30 'NTEE';AT'ONAL 228 VA'L?/EEVAENTER 2701 HEREFORD ST
ST LOUIS MO MONROE LA BROOKLYN NY ST LOUIS MO
63132 71203 11230 MO MOUNT OLIVE NJ ST LOUIS MO 63139
63043 07828 63110
Item #29 - One Coat Floor Wax
How packaged 5 gallon - 1 gallon pail - 1 gallon pail 1 gallon pail
Quantity per case 1 - 4lcs - 4 gal 4
Bid Price $62.73 NO BID - $86.20 - $48.60 $57.84
Comments VAR3005605 B.CASTAP ISC Grand Glaze
Item #30- Toilet Seat Covers
How packaged 5000/cs - - 5000/cs - 20/250 per case Case
Sheets per box 5000 5000 - 5000 - 5000 5000
Boxes per case 20 20 - 20 - 20 20
Bid Price $35.09 $52.00 - $30.00 - $25.37 $25.96
Comments Boardwalk K5000 HOSPS-5000
Item #31 - Sanitizer Concentrate for pit toilets
How packaged - 5 gal - 4gallcs
Bid Price NO BID NO BID - $62.47 - $18.70/cs NO BID
Comments B.LEMQUAAP ISC Lemonex
Sanitizer
Item #32 - Deodorizer Concentrate for pit toilets
How packaged - 5 gal - 4gallcs
Bid Price NO BID NO BID - $62.47 - $15.34/cs
Comments B.LEMQUAAP ISC Biotreat Enzyme
Item #33 - Plastic Spray Container
How packaged 12 per case - 12 per case - 12 per case 12 per case
Bid Price .70 ea/ bulk NO BID - $11.88 - $7.02 $13.08
Comments 902RW9/932GG 10902 RW 9-700
Item #34 - 10 inch Deck Brushes Wood Handle
How packaged 12 per case - 12 per case - 12 per case 12 per case
Bid Price $89.57/cs NO BID - $62.52 - $60.32 $62.28
Comments Brush-41310, Pole-21654| COI0G3010-12
Item #35 - Vacuum Cleaner Bags Style LS
How packaged Bulk - Bulk - Bulk -
Bags per Package 12 x 2=24 - 3 - 150 -
Packages per Case 12x2=24 - - - 50 pkgs of 3 per case -
Bid Price $23.86/cs NO BID - $6.54/pk - $135.70 -
Comments Jan - EVLS-2 HEE 618ZU
Item #36 - Disposal Bags for Sanitary Napkins
How packaged 500 per case 500 per case - 500 per case 500 per case
Bid Price $19.82/cs NO BID - $14.12 - $12.60 $19.90
Rochester
Comments 25025088 - HOS KL - Hospeco KL260 N
Midland
Item #37 - Non-Alcohol Foaming Hand Sanitizer
How packaged 6/1 Liter Bottle - 6/bx - 1250ml case -
Bid Price $36.96/cs NO BID - $59.94 - NO BID NO BID
DEB 55857 6/1 Liter
Comments Bottles cs & Free B.90151120

Dispensers




JANITORIAL SUPPLIES 2014 BID TABULATION

JANITORIAL SUPPLIES

2014 BID
OPENING TRONEX
10-8-13 ALL TYPE VACUUM & | AOSS MEDICAL BUCKEYE INDUSTRIAL SOAP | ROYAL PAPERS
Contract term:1-1-14 to 12-31- JANITORIAL SUPPLY UNIPAKCORP ||\ TERNATIONAL 'NTER';'S-C'—'ONAL INC
14 upon approval by the
County Council and County
Executive
10678 TRENTON AVE [ 4971 CENTRAL AVE| PO BOX 300027 M?gif::@ﬁ_:g%a;s 30 'NTERD';AT'ONAL 228 VA'L?/EEVAENTER 2701 HEREFORD ST
ST LOUIS MO MONROE LA BROOKLYN NY ST LOUIS MO
63130 71203 11230 MO MOUNT OLIVE NJ ST LOUIS MO 3130
63043 07828 63110
Item #38 - White Roll Towels
How packaged 12-1000ft rolls cs - - 12 rolls Case
Bid Price $117.56 NO BID - NO BID - $65.77 $56.95
Kimberly Clark
Comments KCC01000 01000 Royal Paper
Item #39 - Antibacterial Hand Soap
How packaged 6/1 Liter Bottle - 6bx - 1250ml/cs - Case
Bid Price $30.21 NO BID - $71.34 - NO BID $37.25
DEBANT IL 6/1Liter
Comments Bottles cs & Free Kutol
Dispensers
Item #40 - Liquid Chlorox Bleach 5 gal.
How packaged - 1gal - 5 gal
Bid Price NO BID NO BID - $2.14 per gal - NO BID $44.20
Comments L.CLOXZ440-6 P&G
Item #41 - Downy Fabric Softener
How packaged - 64 oz - 5 gallon
Bid Price NO BID NO BID - $35.83 - NO BID $96.55
Comments L.PGC35511 P&G
Item #42- Urinals Screen with Deodorizing Blocks
How packaged 12/cs - 12/cs - 12 pr case 12 per case
Bid Price $8.96 NO BID - $14.63 - $9.06 $12.72
Comments 165-1 HOS01905 1SC 4307 Rochester
Item #43 - Dawn Dishwashing Detergent 24 oz Bottles
How packaged - - 8/380z per case Case
Bid Price NO BID NO BID - NO BID - 34.65 34.25
Comments Dawn Dish Detergent| P&G
Item # 44 - Large Aerosol Disinfectant Can Deodorizer Spray 15.5 oz
How packaged 12/190z cans cs - 12/cs - 12/200z Case
Bid Price $20.63/cs NO BID - $58.08 - $24.65 $30.90
Comments Chase 4334104 Buckeye Sanicare 11 B. ISC Imeact Seanan
Item #45- Lemon Pledge 9.7 oz
How packaged 12/190z cans - - 12/200z Case
Bid Price $23.65/cs NO BID - NO BID - $19.94 $28.13
Comments Chase 4334109 ISC Lemon Glo Johnson Wax
Item #46- Pinesole Cleaner 16 oz
How packaged 4/1 gal/cs - - 4/1 gallcs pse of 3 1440z bottl
Bid Price $34.84 NO BID - NO BID - $24.80 $25.74
Comments Varley 508601 P.G.C.6 ISC Pine - O-Lene
Item #47- Black Trash Bags 60 gal.
How packaged 100/cs - 200/cs - 200/cs Case of 200
Bid Price $22.31 NO BID - $25.07 - $22.40 $23.80
I1SC #6504-00000 38
43 x 47 Black
Comments \L434720B RBN386016CRE X 60 HXVY Coreless Royal

Rolls




JANITORIAL SUPPLIES 2014 BID TABULATION

JANITORIAL SUPPLIES

2014 BID
OPENING TRONEX
10-8-13 ALL TYPE VACUUM & | AOSS MEDICAL BUCKEYE INDUSTRIAL SOAP | ROYAL PAPERS
Contract term:1-1-14 to 12-31- JANITORIAL SUPPLY UNIPAKCORP ||\ TERNATIONAL 'NTER';',\/E'ONAL INC
14 upon approval by the
County Council and County
Executive
10678 TRENTON AVE [ 4971 CENTRAL AVE| PO BOX 300027 Maﬁgifi:\gc'_:g%a;s 30 'NTERD';AT'ONAL 228 VA'L?IEEVAENTER 2701 HEREFORD ST
ST LOUIS MO MONROE LA BROOKLYN NY ST LOUIS MO
63130 71203 11230 MO MOUNT OLIVE NJ ST LOUIS MO 3130
63043 07828 63110
Item #48 - Quickie Scrub Brush with handle
How packaged 12/cs - 12/cs - 12
Bid Price $16.80/cs NO BID - $17.64 $29.76 NO BID
Comments Continental 1601000 C01601000-12 Rubbermaid 6482
Item #49 - Old English 16 o0z
How packaged 12/32pz Bottles RTU - -
Bid Price $47.64/cs NO BID - NO BID - NO BID -
Comments Woody-VAI3218C32
Item # 50 - Spray glass cleaner 19 oz cans
How packaged 12/190z cans/cs - 12/CS - 12/200z /cs 12/cs
Bid Price $18.55 NO BID - $46.80 - $17.76 $23.40
Buckeye Star Spray
Comments Chase 4334101 B.TASPRA ISC Fanfare #816 Rlsee Klear
Item # 51 - Lysol Toilet Bow Cleaner 24 oz
How packaged 12/320z Bottles/cs RTU - 12qt bottles/12cs - 12/320z -
Bid Price $32.28/cs NO BID - $51.48 - $18.48 -
. DY Phare Buckeye I1SC Honey Bowl
Comments Clinger Bowl Cleaner B.DYPHAQT Cleaner
Item # 52 - BIO Conquerer
How packaged - - 4gallcs 4gallcs
Bid Price NO BID NO BID - NO BID - $15.34 $57.00
Comments ISC BioTreat Fresh
Item # 53 - Screw on mop handles
How packaged 12/CS - 12/cs - units of 12 units of 12
Bid Price $34.83/CS NO BID - $45.00 - $39.00 $68.88
Magnolia Solid
Comments Zephyr 21054 COA71302-12 1SC 5355 end cap will not
come off -
prisoner safe
Item # 54 - Dishwashing Detergent
How packaged - 4-1gal/cs - 4 gal
Bid Price NO BID NO BID - $49.52 - NO BID $48.25
Buckeye Dysh
Comments B.DYSHGL Pechs
Item # 55 - Dishwashing Sanitizer
How packaged - 4-1gal/cs - 4 gal 4x1gal
Bid Price NO BID NO BID - $59.40 - $32.00 $42.10
Comments Buckeye Saniq Swisher Low Pechs

temperature Sanitizer




JANITORIAL SUPPLIES 2014 BID TABULATION

JANITORIAL SUPPLIES
2014 BID
OPENING TRONEX
10-8-13 ALL TYPE VACUUM & | AOSS MEDICAL BUCKEYE INDUSTRIAL SOAP | ROYAL PAPERS
Contract term:1-1-14 to 12-31- JANITORIAL SUPPLY UNIPAK CORP | |\ TERNATIONAL 'NTER’;‘,’E'ONAL INC
14 upon approval by the
County Council and County
Executive
10678 TRENTON AVE [ 4971 CENTRAL AVE| PO BOX 300027 MSADL';\Z(EE:\:T)CF:EEE‘TFS 0 'NTEE'\F'(AT'ONAL 228 VA“L[:?EVAENTER 2701 HEREFORD ST
ST LOUIS MO MONROE LA BROOKLYN NY ST LOUIS MO
63130 71203 11280 MO MOUNT OLIVE NJ ST LOUIS MO 3130
63043 07828 63110
Item # 56 - Dishwashing Rinse
How packaged - - 4 gal 4x1gal
Bid Price NO BID NO BID - NO BID - $58.00 $49.90
Comments Swisher LDYV Pechs
temperature Rinse
Item # 57 - WW - Delimerhd
How packaged 4/1GAL/CS - - 4 gal 4x1gal
Bid Price $63.44/CS NO BID - NO BID - $53.00 $53.94
Valley Go lime Swisher Delimer
Comments concentrate VAR4024 40149 Pechs
Item # 58 - Spic n Span 3 n 1 multisurface, glass, disinfectant cleaner
How packaged - - 2x1gal
Bid Price NO BID NO BID - NO BID - NO BID $76.40
Comments P&G
Item # 59 - Comet cleaner with bleach
How packaged - - 2x1gal
Bid Price NO BID NO BID - NO BID - NO BID $43.20
Comments P&G
Item # 60 - Febreze odor eliminator
How packaged - - 2x1gal
Bid Price NO BID NO BID - NO BID - NO BID $108.40
Comments P&G
Item # 61 - Mr. Clean Finished floor cleaner
How packaged - 4-1 gallcs - 3x1gal
Bid Price NO BID NO BID - $38.88 - NO BID $38.10
B.STRUPGL, B..VESE
Straight up P&G
Item # 62 - Disenfectant Floor Cleaner
How packaged - 4-1 gallcs - 4x1gal
Bid Price NO BID NO BID - $51.76 - NO BID $57.40
Comments B.LEMQUAGL P&G
Item # 63 - Quicke Bowl Brush
How packaged 12/cs - 12/BX - each
Bid Price $14.16/cs NO BID - $14.88/CS - NO BID $1.65
Comments Continental 501001 C0Js01001-12 Wilen
Affidavit Completed YES YES YES YES YES YES NO
Copy of Insurance Provided YES NO YES NO NO NO NO

COMMENTS:

For Destination base|

on minumum of 40
cases. Can be mixed
with other items bid,




