

MISC. OPERATIONAL SUPPLIES BID OPENING 4-5-11	DOOR SERVICE, INC 1114 LINDBERGH BUSINESS CT SAINT LOUIS MO 63125-7833	WIRELESS USA 2063 SOUTHWAY DR ARNOOLD MO 63010	MOTIVE FACTORY MOTOR PARTS 11109 LINDBERGH BUSINESS CT SAINT LOUIS MO 63125-7839	THE EBELIN CO INC 6556 OMAS PL SAINT LOUIS MO 63134-1017	UNPAK CORP PO BOX 30027 BROOKLYN NY 11250-0027	PLUMBMASTER INC PO BOX 650 CONCORDVILLE PA 19331-0650	HAMEL & ROWE 210 N MAIN ST DE SOTO MO 63028-1712	HILTI INC 3400 S 122ND EAST AVE TULSA OK 74146	CRESCENT PLUMBING SUPPLY CO 640 ROSEDALE AVE ST LOUIS MO 63112	BUTLER SUPPLY 4106 HUNT RD PARKINGTON MO 63640	VOSS LIGHTING 1846 FENPARK DR FENTON MO 63026	MILFORD SUPPLY 10943 LIN VALLE DR ST LOUIS MO 63123	HOPSON LUMBER CO 918 S MAIN ST DESBORO MO 63020
SUPPLIES CATEGORY	-	RADIO SUPPLIES	AUTO SHOP SUPPLIES	-	NO BID	PLUMBING	HARDWARE & TOOLS	INDUSTRIAL SUPPLIES	INDUSTRIAL SUPPLIES	HARDWARE SUPPLIES	GENERAL ELECTRICAL SUPPLIES	PLUMBING SUPPLIES	HARDWARE SUPPLIES
PRICING OFFERED	-	RETAIL	SEE ATTACHED	-	NO BID	PRICE LIST	RETAIL	WSCA-NASPO n 15-2011	CONTRACTOR	WHOLESALE	GOVERNMENT	CONTRACTOR	MSRP
DISCOUNT	-	10% OFF LIST	-	-	NO BID	20%	x 95%	40% off Tools & 45% off Consumables	PER MFG	10%	PER STATE CONTRACT	30-70%	10%
SUPPLIES CATEGORY	-	-	-	-	NO BID	-	CLEANING & PAINT	-	-	PLUMBING SUPPLIES	-	-	PLUMBING SUPPLIES
PRICING OFFERED	-	-	-	-	NO BID	-	RETAIL	-	-	WHOLESALE	-	-	MSRP
DISCOUNT	-	-	-	-	NO BID	-	x 95%	-	-	5%	-	-	10%
SUPPLIES CATEGORY	-	-	-	-	NO BID	-	PLUMBING & ELECTRIC	-	-	GENERAL ELECTRICAL SUPPLIES	-	-	BUILDING LUMBER SUPPLIES
PRICING OFFERED	-	-	-	-	NO BID	-	RETAIL	-	-	WHOLESALE	-	-	RETAIL
DISCOUNT	-	-	-	-	NO BID	-	x 95%	-	-	10-15%	-	-	10%
SUPPLIES CATEGORY	-	-	-	-	NO BID	-	EMERGENCY SUPPLIES	-	-	ELECTRICAL SUPPLIES	-	-	GENERAL ELECTRICAL SUPPLIES
PRICING OFFERED	-	-	-	-	NO BID	-	RETAIL	-	-	WHOLESALE	-	-	MSRP
DISCOUNT	-	-	-	-	NO BID	-	x 95%	-	-	5%	-	-	10%
SUPPLIES CATEGORY	-	-	-	-	NO BID	-	-	-	-	-	-	-	-
PRICING OFFERED	-	-	-	-	NO BID	-	-	-	-	-	-	-	-
DISCOUNT	-	-	-	-	NO BID	-	-	-	-	-	-	-	-
AFFIDAVIT COMPLETED	NO	NO	YES	YES		NO	YES	YES	YES	NO	YES	YES	YES
COPY OF INSURANCE PROVIDED	NO	NO	NO	NO		NO	NO	NO	YES	NO	NO	NO	YES
COMMENTS:	Minimum order requirement \$25.00.			One Man Hourly Rate \$98. Service Charge per Call \$60. Overtime Rate \$147. 24 Hour Emergency Service \$196				* Mark Unit on Section 2.4 Price, 2.9 Warranty and 2.16 Termination.			Lamps & Ballasts	Pipes, Valves & Fittings	

LINE	CAT	PC	Description	Discount %
BLK			BLACK JACK TIRE REP	10.00%
BLK	1		TIRE REPAIR	10.00%
BLK	2		WHEEL WEIGHTS	10.00%
BLK	2	1	LEAD	10.00%
BLK	2	2	STEEL	10.00%
BLK	2	3	HD TRUCK	10.00%
BLK	3		VALVE STEMS	10.00%
BLK	3	4	RUBBER	10.00%
CML			CHEMICALS	10.00%
CML	1		ANTIFREEZE	10.00%
DEL	10		DELCO CHEMICALS	10.00%
DOR			DORMAN	12.00%
EVR	1		BATTERIES	30.00%
FOX	1		WINDSHIELD WASH	30.00%
FUS			LITTLEFUSE-FUSES	30.00%
FVP	21		FVP Chemicals	22.00%
IDL	1		HOSE CLAMPS	28.00%
KBC			KIMBERLY CLARK	18.00%
MMM			3M PRODUCTS	11.00%
MTC	28		CHEMICAL	5.00%
PER			PERMATEX	20.00%
PRY			PENRAY PRODUCTS	20.00%
PYR			PYROIL CHEMICALS	20.00%
RAZ			RAZOR BLADES	28.00%
SYL			SYLVANIA LAMPS	30.00%