
BID TABULATION - TRACTION SAND  2013

KA PAZDERA 
HAULING LLC

BOBBY 
HOELSCHER 

TRUCKING INC

FRED WEBER INC,                               
IRON MOUNTAIN 

TRAP ROCK

H SAND AND 
GRAVEL

PO BOX 1270
FESTUS MO

63028

24477 WINDY LANE
WARRENTON MO

63383

2320 CREVE COEUR MILL 
RD

MARYLAND HEIGHTS MO
63043

PO BOX 69
IMPERIAL MO 

63052

BASE BID PER CU YD                           HAUL RATES 
ONLY NO BID NO BID $17.00

BASE BID PER TON                          HAUL RATES 
ONLY NO BID NO BID $13.00

ALTERNATE #1 HAUL RATES 
ONLY NO BID $6.00 $13.00

ALTERNATE #2 HAUL RATES 
ONLY $4.00 $6.00 plus hauls $13.00

HAUL RATE PER TON

DELIVER TO 5275 STATE HWY 
B HILLSBORO, MO $11.55 $9.80 $11.00 $5.00

DELIVER TO 2960 LEE PYLE 
ROAD DESOTO, MO $10.00 $11.90 $9.50 $3.00

 O 6460 STATE HWY MM, HOUSE S $13.10 $6.95 $12.50 $8.00

LOCATION OF STOCKPILED 
MATERIAL Fred Weber

CHARAH
3435 Labadie Bottom 

Rd. Labadie, MO 
63055

325 Highway N
Ironton, MO 63650

2960 Harness 
Road

PRICES FIRM TILL OCT. 2014 OCTOBER 31, 2014 10-31-14 per 
specifications 10/1/14

AFFIDAVIT COMPLETED YES YES YES YES

COPY OF INSURANCE 
PROVIDED NO YES NO NO

COMMENTS: Material is ECO 
Sand

TRACTION SAND 2013                                                                   
BID OPENING                                             

10-1-13
Contract term:11-1-13 to 10-31-14 upon 

approval by the County Council and 
County Executive
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