ALUMINUM STEEL TYPE 2 PIPE BID TABULATION

ALUMINIZED STEEL

TYPE 2 PIPE
BID OPENING METAL CULVERTS|METAL CULVERTS|METAL CULVERTS| = THOMPSON THOMPSON THOMPSON
1-30-07 INC INC INC CULVERT CO. CULVERT CO. CULVERT CO.
2 2/3 x 1/2 Corrugation COST/FOOT CONNECTING GALV. FLARED COST/FOOT CONNECTING GALV. FLARED
16 GAUGE RIVITED BANDS EA. END EA. RIVITED BANDS EA. END EA.
12" $7.03 $7.03 $42.15 $7.92 $7.92 $66.23
15" $8.85 $8.85 $53.55 $9.50 $9.50 $84.02
18" $10.51 $10.51 $69.40 $11.88 $11.88 $108.93
24" $14.06 $14.06 $103.55 $15.05 $15.05 $162.61
30" $17.22 $25.83 $174.70 $19.01 $19.01 $296.80
36" $20.54 $30.81 $281.55 $22.97 $34.46 $478.44
42" $24.02 $36.03 $531.00 $26.93 $40.40 $902.41
48" $27.33 $40.99 $618.00 $30.10 $45.15 $1,050.19
[ 3xlCorrugation | COST/FOOT | CONNECTING | GALV.FLARED | COST/FOOT | CONNECTING | GALV.FLARED |
16 GAUGE RIVITED BANDS EA. END EA. RIVITED BANDS EA. END EA.
54" $37.30 $55.95 $732.50 $44.60 $66.90 $1,381.06
60" $41.24 $82.48 $1,098.00 $49.06 $73.59 $2,071.62
66" $45.11 $90.22 $1,180.00 $53.52 $107.04 $2,226.95
72" $49.06 $98.12 $1,309.30 $58.87 $117.74 $2,468.68
84" $58.80 $117.63 $1,547.35 $68.68 $137.36 $2,917.52
96" $66.95 $133.90 $2,052.75 $77.60 $155.20 $3,870.46
| COSIFOOT | CONNECTING | GALV.FLARED | COST/FOOT | CONNECTING | GALV.FLARED |
14 GUAGE RIVITED BANDS EA. END EA. RIVITED BANDS EA. END EA.
108" $99.77 $199.54 N/A $116.64 $233.28 NO BID
| COSIFOOT | CONNECTING | GALV.FLARED | COST/FOOT | CONNECTING | GALV.FLARED |
12 GUAGE RIVITED BANDS EA. END EA. RIVITED BANDS EA. END EA.
120" $141.12 $282.24 N/A $177.68 $355.76 NO BID
| COSIFOOT | CONNECTING | GALV.FLARED | COST/FOOT | CONNECTING | GALV.FLARED |
16 GAUGE RIVITED BANDS EA. END EA. RIVITED BANDS EA. END EA.
17x 13 $9.48 $9.48 $53.85 $9.86 $9.86 $84.53
21x 15 $11.14 $11.14 $63.15 $12.33 $12.33 $99.12
24 x 18 $12.96 $12.96 $76.80 $13.97 $13.97 $120.60
28 x 20 $15.01 $15.01 $90.00 $15.62 $15.62 $142.06
35 x 24 $18.17 $27.25 $140.10 $19.73 $19.73 $238.05
42X 29 $21.65 $32.48 $221.55 $29.59 $44.39 $376.53
| COSIFOOT | CONNECTING | GALV.FLARED | COST/FOOT | CONNECTING | GALV.FLARED |
12 GAUGE RIVITED BANDS EA. END EA. RIVITED BANDS EA. END EA.
49 x 33 $43.85 $65.78 $381.80 $46.85 $70.28 $648.78
57 x 38 $49.85 $74.78 $476.10 $53.43 $80.15 $808.98




ALUMINUM STEEL TYPE 2 PIPE BID TABULATION

ALUMINIZED STEEL

TYPE 2 PIPE
BID OPENING METAL CULVERTS|METAL CULVERTS|METAL CULVERTS| = THOMPSON THOMPSON THOMPSON
1-30-07 INC INC INC CULVERT CO. CULVERT CO. CULVERT CO.
3x 1 Corrugation COST/FOOT CONNECTING GALV. FLARED COST/FOOT CONNECTING GALV. FLARED
14 GAUGE RIVITED BANDS EA. END EA. RIVITED BANDS EA. END EA.
60 x 46 $48.56 $72.84 $695.00 $56.24 $84.36 $1,280.92
66 X 51 $53.87 $107.74 $918.90 $61.77 $92.66 $1,691.79
73 x 55 $58.93 $117.86 $1,233.10 $68.23 $136.46 $2,270.15
81 x 59 $64.24 $128.48 $1,298.75 $74.68 $149.36 $2,391.01
95 X 67 $75.70 $151.40 $1,453.55 $86.67 $173.34 $2,675.87
COST/FOOT CONNECTING GALV. FLARED COST/FOOT CONNECTING GALV. FLARED
12 GAUGE RIVITED BANDS EA. END EA. RIVITED BANDS EA. END EA.
112x 75 $118.98 $237.96 $1,883.00 $135.53 $271.06 $3,466.48
128 x 83 $133.99 $267.98 N/A $155.43 $310.86 NO BID
COST/FOOT CONNECTING GALV. FLARED COST/FOOT CONNECTING GALV. FLARED
10 GAUGE RIVITED BANDS EA. END EA. RIVITED BANDS EA. END EA.
142 x 91 $192.29 $384.58 N/A $220.43 $440.86 NO BID

COMMENTS:




