CIRCUIT CLERK OFFICE FURNITURE BID TABULATION

CIRCUIT CLERK OFFICE

COMMERCIAL

INTERIORS CONCEPTS &
FURNITURE KLOG ATD - UNLIMITED METRO |COMMERCIAL| FURNITURE
BID OPENING QUALITY AMERICAN INTERIORS (BROKE- OFFICE CONCEPTS & | ALTERNATE
10-16-07 FURNITURE CO. AMERICON UNLIMITED DOWN) SUPPLY FURNITURE BID
| woouproners: | 0 1
12 (twelve) 28 mobile pedestals,
16” wx 237 d x 28” h NO BID NO BID $385.00 $2,360.40 $196.70 $373.00 $373.58 $310.81
6 (six) 28” w x 48” d, desk peninsula NO BID NO BID $1,495.00 $1,828.32 $304.72 $249.00 $253.03 $210.52
6 (six) left desk tops 24” w x 60” d NO BID NO BID $682.00 $1,447.80 $241.30 $259.00 $264.44 $219.98
6 (six) right desk tops 24” w x 60” d NO BID NO BID $682.00 $1,447.80 $241.30 $256.00 $264.44 $219.98
12 (twelve) ergonomic retractable
keyboard trays with mouse
attachment NO BID NO BID $302.50 $1,349.64 $112.47 $99.00 $123.26 $102.55
6 (six) 12” h x 60” |
high fabric panels NO BID NO BID $165.00 $1,465.62 $244.27 $139.00 $209.05 $173.93
FILING EQUIPMENT:
(all units in sand color)
6 (six) 5”x 8” card file cabinet,
7 drawer, cabinet dimensions:
19” wx 28” d x 53” h NO BID NO BID $1,028.00 $4,381.02 $730.17 $769.00 $714.61 $714.61
7 (seven) fixed 6 shelf lateral file,
134" d, 78’ h, 34 ¥ w, 9 %" height
per shelf NO BID NO BID $1,010.50 $1,643.95 $234.85 $359.00 $329.72 $329.72
1 (one) 18”d x 36” w x 72" h
storage cabinet NO BID NO BID $1,644.50 $213.50 $213.50 $229.00 $233.45 $233.45
1 (one) 30-drawer organizer, letter
size, cabinet dimensions:
305/8”wx115/8”dx337/16” h
drawer dimensions:
9”wx11%”dx2%"”h NO BID NO BID $1,921.22 $283.65 $283.65 $295.00 $312.98 $312.98
1 (one) 20” w x 36” d x 36” h
service cart with wheels NO BID NO BID $671.01 $432.55 $432.55 $745.00 $317.83 $317.83
OTHER COSTS $1,943.75 $1,943.75 $1,900.00

TOTAL COST FOR PROJECT

COMMENTS:

$49,085.01

$18,798.00

ITEMS ARE

$18,798.00

PRE-

$21,378.09

$19,367.80

$17,366.44




