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County ID # NO BID NO BID
$22 00 N13510 $22.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $17.74

13511 $24.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $39.52 $43.64
13512 $22.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $45.47 $44.65
13513 $22.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $45.47 $44.65
13514 $22.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $45.47 $44.65
13515 $24.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $39.52 $44.65
13521 $20.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $40.19 $33.74 NO BID
13523 $29.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $19.58 NO BID
13525 $28.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
13526 $24.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
13527 $22.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
13550 $36.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
13551 $39.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
13552 $40.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
13554 $46.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
14200 $38.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $65.66 $61.53 $141.34
14202 $36.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $48.17 NO BID
14203 $17.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $27.42 $25.22 NO BID
14204 $90.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $110.08 $105.98
14205 $50.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID $60.32 $70.75 $68.16 NO BID
14206 $87.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $130.09 $98.93 NO BID
14207 $67.00 $63.13 NO BID NO BID $64.78 NO BID $82.44 NO BID
14210 $60.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
14509 $76.00 $15.48 NO BID $88.00 $73.17 NO BID $22.73 $59.53
14551 $124.00 $142.26 NO BID $172.97 $151.89 $165.55 $179.93 $66.19
14602 $74.00 NO BID NO BID $81.92 $61.29 $88.14 $82.60 $87.45
14604 $22.00 NO BID NO BID $25.89 $24.87 $28.32 $23.15 $11.71
14605 $22.00 $9.85 NO BID $118.20 $53.86 $127.19 $106.12 $18.80
14606 $52.00 $9.32 NO BID $0.00 $63.76 $74.36 $18.59 $10.80
14608 $22.00 NO BID NO BID $37.60 NO BID $41.22 $24.05 $12.90
14609 $74.00 $15.48 NO BID $88.00 $73.17 $94.71 $22.64 $59.53
14610 $26.00 $17.73 NO BID $33.90 $31.92 $36.48 $24.28 $100.60
14611 $18.00 $10.12 NO BID $25.86 $24.87 $28.32 $23.52 $11.71
14613 $60.00 $0.00 NO BID $56.93 $169.23 $206.57 $46.12 $65.75
14702 $46.00 $0.00 NO BID $0.00 NO BID NO BID $84.20 NO BID
14703 $46.00 $0.00 NO BID $63.60 $52.88 $68.44 $58.37 $62.54
14705 $55.00 $61.25 NO BID $72.89 $60.59 $78.42 $61.23 $71.34
14706 $54.00 $0.00 NO BID $0.00 NO BID NO BID $73.87 NO BID
14707 $45.00 $0.00 NO BID $0.00 NO BID NO BID $46.40 $63.55
15100 $139.00 $161.36 $170.00 $187.39 $159.21 $185.50 $173.12 $196.10
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15102 $66.00 $72.00 $70.00 $78.89 $71.03 $78.06 $73.10 $87.50
15103 $118.00 $124.14 $0.00 $0.00 $33.93 NO BID $129.50 $150.60
15104 $61.00 $56.00 $55.00 $63.19 $55.25 $62.51 $56.12 $68.06
15105 $162.00 $163.12 $160.00 $179.89 $160.95 $178.02 $166.89 $198.28
15106 $89.00 $88.38 $86.00 $98.79 $89.95 $97.77 $91.60 $107.43
15107 $126.00 $122.70 $118.00 $135.54 $121.10 $133.97 $123.01 $149.15
15108 $144.00 $150.95 $145.00 $169.96 $148.94 $168.25 $153.34 $187.23
15109 $101.00 $102.26 $99.40 $111.37 $100.89 $110.25 $102.50 $124.29
15110 $87.00 $100.43 $90.00 $114.83 $90.10 $113.69 $116.06 $116.09
15111 $138.00 $155.82 $139.00 $177.59 $139.92 $175.81 $176.56 $172.38
15112 $142.00 $155.82 $139.00 $177.59 $139.92 $175.81 $176.56 $172.38
15113 $142.00 $155.82 $139.00 $177.59 $139.92 $175.81 $176.56 $172.38
15114 $69.00 $80.34 $71.00 $88.83 $71.93 $87.73 $77.20 $83.60
15115 $100.00 $110.17 $97.00 $132.20 $98.49 $130.88 $116.21 $130.80
15116 $100.00 $110.17 $97.00 $132.20 $106.57 $130.88 $116.21 $121.34
15117 $106.00 $110.17 $97.00 $132.20 $98.49 $130.88 $116.21 $133.90
15118 $68.00 $72.75 $67.00 $84.92 $65.18 $84.07 $74.41 NO BID
15119 $79.00 $80.34 $79.40 $87.70 $79.27 $86.82 $80.63 $97.66
15120 $100.00 $102.26 $99.40 $112.78 $100.89 $111.65 $104.58 $127.47
15121 $49.00 $49.31 $49.00 $45.40 $48.64 $53.75 $50.35 $61.46
15122 $140.00 $172.89 $172.00 $196.20 $171.43 $192.04 $179.94 $76.64
15124 $172.00 $179.56 $175.00 $201.32 $177.16 $199.31 $163.79 $218.25
15125 $248.00 $252.00 $244.00 $277.72 $248.63 $274.95 $257.67 $306.29
15126 $248.00 $252.00 $244.00 $277.72 $248.63 $274.95 $257.67 $306.29
15127 $249.00 $252.00 $244.00 $277.72 $248.63 $274.95 $257.67 $306.29
15128 $127.00 $121.74 $0.00 $139.48 $120.11 $138.08 $145.40 $147.96
15129 $264.00 $247.73 $0.00 $283.88 $244.92 $281.02 $295.05 $301.10
15130 $264.00 $247.73 $0.00 $283.88 $244.92 $281.02 $295.05 $301.10
15131 $264.00 $247.73 $0.00 $283.88 $244.42 $281.02 $295.05 $301.10
15132 $222.00 $213.64 $0.00 $258.54 $211.84 $278.21 $260.75 $297.77
15133 $260.00 $237.37 $0.00 $281.17 $235.38 $302.56 $283.56 $329.47
15134 $320.00 $284.86 $0.00 $344.72 $282.47 $367.65 $347.67 NO BID
15135 $124.00 $124.17 $121.00 $137.26 $122.51 $135.88 $127.32 $150.93
15136 $163.00 $167.99 $163.00 $188.41 $165.75 $186.53 $174.81 $204.19
15137 $163.00 $167.99 $163.00 $188.41 $165.75 $186.53 $174.81 $204.19
15138 $164.00 $167.99 $163.00 $188.92 $165.75 $186.53 $174.81 $204.19
15139 $66.00 $66.34 $65.00 $78.92 $65.46 $78.13 $68.38 $80.65
15140 $80.00 $79.92 $78.00 $88.79 $78.85 $87.90 $82.36 $97.14
15141 $80.00 $79.92 $78.00 $88.79 $78.85 $87.90 $82.36 $97.14
15142 $80.00 $79.92 $78.00 $88.79 $78.85 $87.90 $82.36 $97.14
15143 $80.00 $138.77 $138.00 $165.07 $137.61 $163.42 $153.14 $119.60
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15144 $97.00 $96.17 $94.10 $106.07 $94.89 $105.01 $96.40 $198.28
15145 $167.00 $163.12 $164.00 $179.82 $160.95 $178.02 $166.89 $219.73
15146 $100.00 $138.77 $139.00 $164.03 $124.94 $162.39 $177.01 $202.71
15147 $183.00 $180.78 $175.00 $213.91 $179.37 $211.77 $181.20 $132.54
15148 $164.00 $166.78 $162.00 $197.04 $164.55 $195.07 $182.80 $69.59
15149 $114.00 $103.47 $161.00 $121.73 $102.09 $120.52 $112.92 $218.75
15150 $71.00 $69.03 $0.00 $83.69 $72.93 $90.06 $71.85 $224.61
15151 $279.00 $272.66 $0.00 $307.89 $285.57 $332.02 $249.00 $340.24
15152 $182.00 $183.76 $179.60 $205.31 $193.60 $203.26 $179.00 $151.94
15153 $280.00 $280.27 $0.00 $318.02 $296.24 $342.22 $249.00 $340.75
15154 $82.00 $124.09 $120.00 $153.43 $126.66 $165.11 $143.63 $104.08
15155 $280.00 $292.18 $285.00 $333.94 $311.63 $359.36 $249.00 $125.23
15156 $117.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 NO BID NO BID $112.78 $128.73
15159 $340.00 $309.80 $308.00 $396.70 $334.27 $426.89 $356.06 $127.99
15170 $100.00 $105.90 $103.00 $126.61 $104.50 $125.35 $117.46 $127.99
15171 $106.00 $105.30 $103.00 $124.69 $103.89 $123.44 $115.67 $127.99
15172 $106.00 $105.30 $103.00 $124.69 $103.89 $123.44 $115.67 $127.99
15173 $106.00 $105.30 $103.00 $124.69 $103.89 $123.44 $115.67 $127.99
15174 $126.00 $124.17 $121.00 $137.26 $122.51 $135.88 $127.32 $150.19
15175 $164.00 $167.99 $163.00 $188.47 $165.75 $186.53 $174.81 $204.19
15176 $169.00 $167.99 $163.00 $188.47 $165.75 $186.53 $174.81 $204.19
15177 $167.00 $167.99 $163.00 $188.47 $165.75 $186.53 $174.81 $204.19
15178 $80.00 $60.86 $0.00 $0.00 $29.67 NO BID $89.14 $108.84
15179 $108.00 $104.69 $101.00 $125.64 $103.30 $124.39 $104.94 $127.25
15180 $116.00 $105.90 $104.00 $130.69 $104.50 $129.38 $115.59 $128.73
15184 $111.00 $105.30 $102.00 $124.69 $103.89 $129.38 $115.59 $127.99
15185 $111.00 $105.30 $102.00 $0.00 $103.89 $129.38 $115.59 $127.99
15186 $111.00 $105.30 $102.00 $0.00 $103.89 $129.38 $115.59 $127.99
15400 $22.00 $0.00 $23.80 $0.00 NO BID $26.60 $28.29 $30.96
15401 $23.00 $0.00 $0.00 $31.33 NO BID $33.70 $32.29 $30.83
15402 $23.00 $0.00 $26.60 $31.33 NO BID $33.70 $32.29 $31.48
15405 $22.00 $0.00 $0.00 $30.38 NO BID $32.69 $27.09 $25.55
15406 $23.00 $0.00 $0.00 $32.01 NO BID $33.50 $33.25 $32.91
15407 $23.00 $0.00 $26.60 $31.12 NO BID $33.50 $33.25 $35.31
15408 $23.00 $0.00 $26.60 $31.12 NO BID $33.50 $33.25 $32.91
15409 $23.00 $0.00 $23.20 $26.20 NO BID $25.94 $23.54 $29.09
15411 $26.00 $26.59 $25.80 $33.14 $26.50 $32.81 $29.89 $32.45
15412 $25.70 $26.18 $25.60 $28.76 NO BID $28.47 $25.99 $31.83
15413 $27.00 $26.18 $25.60 $28.76 $25.84 $28.47 $25.99 $34.00
15414 $27.00 $26.18 $25.60 $28.76 $25.84 $28.47 $25.99 $34.00
15415 $28.00 $26.18 $25.60 $28.76 $25.84 $28.47 $25.99 $34.00
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15416 $28.00 $26.85 $26.60 $30.71 $26.63 $30.40 $31.72 $35.16
15417 $28.00 $26.85 $26.60 $30.71 $26.63 $30.40 $31.72 $34.88
15418 $28.00 $26.85 $26.60 $30.71 $26.63 $30.40 $31.72 $34.88
15419 $28.00 $26.85 $26.00 $30.71 $26.63 $30.40 $31.72 $34.88
15420 $28.00 $26.18 $25.60 $31.25 $25.84 $30.93 $26.37 $31.83
15421 $28.00 $26.18 $25.60 $31.25 $25.84 $30.93 $26.37 $31.83
15422 $28.00 $26.18 $25.60 $31.25 $25.84 $30.93 $26.37 $31.83
15423 $26.00 $26.85 $26.60 $30.71 $26.63 $30.40 $27.86 $32.65
15424 $24.00 $26.85 $26.60 $30.71 $26.63 $30.40 $27.86 $32.65
15425 $25.00 $26.85 $26.60 $30.71 $26.63 $30.40 $27.86 $34.88
15426 $26.00 $26.85 $26.60 $30.71 $26.63 $30.40 $27.86 $32.65
15427 $22.00 $0.00 $0.00 $29.64 $25.50 $29.35 $26.93 $31.73
15428 $26.00 $26.85 $25.80 $29.86 $26.50 $29.56 $26.95 $32.65
15430 $23.00 $0.00 $24.40 $30.58 $24.49 $30.27 $25.79 $30.54
15431 $22.60 $22.61 $0.00 $25.02 $22.52 $24.77 $22.67 $27.55
15432 $16.00 $16.15 $16.00 $18.04 $15.93 $17.86 $15.99 $19.45
15433 $25.00 $26.85 $26.20 $29.86 $26.50 $29.56 $26.23 $32.65
15434 $23.00 $17.49 $17.40 $19.24 $17.26 $19.05 $17.55 $21.28
15435 $19.00 $23.21 $22.60 $25.67 $22.89 $25.41 $23.18 $28.21
15460 $114.00 $104.09 $104.00 $124.10 $102.70 $122.86 $123.70 $126.53
15461 $110.00 $104.09 $104.00 $124.10 $102.70 $122.86 $123.70 $126.53
15462 $109.00 $104.09 $104.00 $124.10 $102.70 $122.86 $123.70 $126.53
15463 $109.00 $104.09 $104.00 $124.10 $102.70 $122.86 $123.70 $126.53
15464 $106.00 $94.02 $0.00 $113.79 $93.22 $122.44 $112.34 $122.06
15465 $106.00 $94.02 $0.00 $113.79 $93.22 $122.44 $112.34 $114.28
15466 $106.00 $94.02 $0.00 $113.79 $93.22 $122.44 $112.34 $114.28
15467 $104.00 $94.02 $0.00 $113.79 $93.22 $122.44 $112.34 $114.28
15468 $28.00 $0.00 $28.60 $33.81 $29.15 $33.47 $36.74 $35.91
15469 $26.00 $0.00 $28.60 $33.81 $29.15 $33.47 $36.74 $35.91
15470 $26.00 $0.00 $28.60 $33.81 $29.15 $33.47 $36.74 $35.91
15471 $26.00 $26.85 $0.00 $30.71 $26.62 $30.40 $27.99 $32.65
15473 $26.00 $26.85 $0.00 $30.71 $26.62 $30.40 $27.99 $32.65
15474 $16.00 $16.15 $15.60 $19.18 $15.93 $18.99 $15.97 $19.50
15475 $26.00 $26.85 $26.60 $29.86 $26.50 $29.56 $26.52 $32.65
15476 $20.00 $0.00 $20.00 $0.00 $19.44 $22.14 $20.34 NO BID
15477 $24.00 $24.21 $28.60 $28.77 $23.89 $28.48 $23.81 $29.44
15478 $23.00 $0.00 $20.00 $0.00 $29.89 NO BID $20.52 NO BID
15479 $18.00 $16.15 $16.00 $19.00 $16.85 $18.81 $18.07 $19.64
15500 $22.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $20.70 NO BID $19.59 NO BID
15501 $17.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 NO BID NO BID $19.74 NO BID
15502 $11.00 $12.97 $13.80 $15.56 $13.58 $15.40 $13.99 $16.95
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15503 $9.00 $9.22 $9.50 $10.29 $9.70 $10.19 $9.99 $12.40
15504 $9.00 $9.22 $9.50 $10.29 $9.70 $10.19 $9.99 $12.40
15505 $9.00 $9.22 $9.50 $10.29 $9.70 $10.19 $9.99 $12.40
15506 $9.00 $9.22 $9.50 $10.29 $9.70 $10.19 $9.99 $12.40
15507 $9.00 $9.22 $9.50 $10.29 $9.70 $10.19 $9.99 $12.40
15510 $22.00 $0.00 $0.00 $15.26 $15.81 $15.10 $15.99 $45.86
15520 $27.00 $28.42 $0.00 $33.61 $30.60 $33.28 $32.92 $35.16
15521 $26.00 $29.20 $0.00 $36.02 $29.98 $38.76 $33.12 $39.20
15522 $23.00 $30.31 $0.00 $34.97 $31.05 $34.62 $31.75 $37.44
15523 $23.00 $36.14 $0.00 $43.62 $36.99 $46.94 $42.71 NO BID
15524 $26.00 $0.00 $0.00 $35.94 $31.92 $35.59 $30.83 NO BID
15526 $28.00 $29.27 $0.00 $31.86 $29.95 $31.54 $27.46 $20.25
15527 $22.00 $27.69 $27.80 $31.87 $27.94 $31.55 $25.75 $18.81
15528 $26.00 $23.72 $0.00 $26.80 $23.94 $26.53 $22.99 $12.81
15529 $27.00 $25.79 $0.00 $29.51 $26.07 $29.22 $26.91 $22.94
15530 $26.00 $23.74 $23.60 $28.12 $23.94 $27.84 $25.72 $19.48
15531 $12.00 $16.56 $16.60 $19.38 $16.73 $19.18 $15.55 $18.56
15581 $8.00 $0.00 $8.80 $9.91 $9.09 $9.49 $11.18 $11.88
15582 $8.00 $0.00 $0.00 $9.91 $9.09 $9.49 $11.18 $11.88
15583 $8.00 $0.00 $0.00 $9.91 $9.09 $9.49 $11.18 $11.88
15584 $14.00 $0.00 $14.20 $17.13 $16.26 $16.96 $14.84 $19.59
15585 $8.00 $0.00 $8.00 $9.67 $8.96 $9.57 $8.29 $10.78
15586 $8.00 $0.00 $8.00 $9.67 $8.96 $9.57 $8.29 $10.78
15587 $8.00 $0.00 $8.00 $9.67 $8.96 $9.57 $8.29 $10.78
15602 $7.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $8.66 NO BID $10.67 $17.48
15603 $6.00 $0.00 $0.00 $4.66 $4.09 $4.61 $4.29 NO BID
15606 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
15608 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $29.18 NO BID $31.39 $6.09 NO BID
15609 $9.00 $0.00 $9.20 $11.70 $9.32 $11.58 $12.14 $11.30
15611 $0.00 $62.53 $0.00 $0.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
16100 $26.00 $0.00 $22.00 $0.00 $31.44 $35.92 $37.33 NO BID
16103 $51.00 $0.00 $63.00 $60.90 $60.00 $60.29 $54.96 $134.00
16104 $19.00 $0.00 $24.00 $22.83 $20.75 $22.61 $21.11 $25.45
16105 $22.00 $0.00 $24.00 $25.59 $23.74 $25.33 $23.74 $27.54
16107 $111.00 $0.00 $114.00 $129.27 $111.86 $127.97 $113.04 $134.00
16108 $16.00 $0.00 $18.00 $17.60 $16.52 $17.42 $16.30 $9.48
16109 $129.00 $0.00 $134.00 $141.23 $130.89 $139.82 $127.42 $156.81
16110 $38.00 $0.00 $44.00 $47.06 $40.91 $46.59 $39.95 $49.05
16111 $47.00 $47.50 $50.00 $51.51 $45.45 $51.00 $55.16 $56.60
16112 $22.00 $0.00 $30.00 $31.03 NO BID $30.72 $29.30 NO BID
16113 $69.00 $0.00 $58.00 $64.21 NO BID $63.57 $53.58 $44.46
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16114 $69.00 $0.00 $58.00 $62.56 NO BID $59.92 $63.09 $44.62
16130 $27.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID $35.63
16132 $36.00 $53.30 $0.00 $83.60 $59.62 $80.06 $67.12 $44.13
16133 $58.00 $0.00 $53.00 $72.49 $59.57 $69.42 $65.04 $44.56
16134 $19.00 $0.00 $0.00 $32.43 $26.97 $31.06 $28.52 $28.78
16135 $11.00 $9.93 $0.00 $13.04 $9.59 $12.91 $11.99 $6.81
16136 $68.00 $0.00 $0.00 $68.04 $55.96 $65.16 $61.05 $30.60
16150 $20.00 $22.51 $0.00 $28.26 $27.08 $27.06 $24.99 $16.98
16151 $18.00 $23.19 $0.00 $25.92 $27.67 $25.55 $23.57 $10.91

COMMENTS

DELIVERY 10 
TO 14 DAYS 

AFTER PO - IF 
ORDERING AT 
LEAST $800.00 

SHIPPING IS 
FREE 


