CORRUGATED METALLIC STEEL CULVERT PIPE BID TABULATION

CORRUGATED
METALLIC STEEL
CULVERT PIPE METAL METAL METAL METAL METAL METAL
Bid Opening CULVERTS, CULVERTS, CULVERTS, CULVERTS, CULVERTS, CULVERTS,
1-30-07 INC INC INC INC INC INC
Zinc-Coated
22/3 X 1/2 IN. 16 GAUGE CONNECTING FLARED END
CORRUGATION RIVETED BANDS SECTIONS
12" $6.41 12" $6.41 12" $42.15
15" $8.06 15" $8.06 15" $53.55
18" $9.58 18" $9.58 18" $69.40
21" $11.09 21" $11.09 21" $83.50
24" $12.82 24" $12.82 24" $103.55
30" $15.70 30" $23.55 30" $174.70
36" $18.72 36" $28.08 36" $284.55
42" $21.89 42" $32.84 42" $531.00
48" $24.91 48" $37.37 48" $618.00
Zinc-(:oated—
3X1IN. 16 GAUGE CONNECTING FLARED END
CORRUGATION RIVETED BANDS SECTIONS
54" $34.19 54" $56.29 54" $732.50
60" $37.81 60" $75.62 60" $1,098.00
66" $41.35 66" $82.70 66" $1,180.00
72" $44.97 72" $89.94 72" $1,309.30
84" $53.90 84" $107.80 84" $1,547.35
96" $61.37 96" $122.74 96" $2,052.75
108" 14 GA $91.35 108" 14 GA $182.70 108" 14 GA N/A
120" 12 GA $129.08 120" 12 GA $258.16 120" 12 GA N/A
Zinc-Coated
2/3 X 1/2 IN. 16 GAUGE CONNECTING FLARED END
CORRUGATION RIVETED BANDS SECTIONS
17 X 13 $8.64 17 X 13 $8.64 17 X 13 $53.85
21 X 15 $10.15 21 X 15 $10.15 21 X 15 $63.15
24 X 18 $11.81 24 X 18 $11.81 24 X 18 $76.80
28 X 20 $13.68 28 X 20 $13.68 28 X 20 $90.50
35X 24 $16.56 35X 24 $24.84 35X 24 $140.10
42 X 2914 GA $24.62 42 X 2914 GA $36.93 42 X 2914 GA $221.55
49 X 3312 GA $39.96 49 X 3312 GA $59.94 49 X 3312 GA $381.80
57 X 38 12 GA $45.43 57 X 38 12 GA $68.15 57 X 38 12 GA $476.10
Zinc-Coated
3X1IN. 16 GAUGE CONNECTING FLARED END
CORRUGATION RIVETED BANDS SECTIONS
60 X 46 $44.46 60 X 46 $66.69 60 X 46 $695.00
66 X 51 $49.32 66 X 51 $98.64 66 X 51 $918.90
73 X 55 $53.96 73 X 55 $107.92 73 X 55 $1,233.10
81 X 59 $58.82 81 X 59 $117.64 81 X 59 $1,298.75
95 X 67 $69.31 95 X 67 $138.62 95 X 67 $1,453.55
112 X 75 $108.83 112 X 75 $217.66 112 X 75 $1,883.00
128 X 83 $122.55 128 X 83 $245.10 128 X 83 N/A
142 X 91 $175.88 142 X 91 $351.76 142 X 91 N/A
Polymer Coated
22/3 X 1/2 IN. 16 GAUGE CONNECTING FLARED END
CORRUGATION RIVETED BANDS SECTIONS
12" $8.19 12" $8.19 12" $42.15
15" $10.30 15" $10.30 15" $53.55
18" $12.24 18" $12.24 18" $69.40




CORRUGATED METALLIC STEEL CULVERT PIPE BID TABULATION

Polymer Coated

CORRUGATED
METALLIC STEEL
CULVERT PIPE METAL METAL METAL METAL METAL METAL
Bid Opening CULVERTS, | CULVERTS, | CULVERTS, | CULVERTS, | CULVERTS, | CULVERTS,
1-30-07 INC INC INC INC INC INC

21" $14.17 21" $14.17 21" $83.50
24" $16.38 24" $16.38 24" $103.55
30" $20.06 30" $30.09 30" $174.70
36" $23.92 36" $35.88 36" $281.55
42" $27.97 42" $41.96 42" $531.00
48" $31.83 48" $47.75 48" $618.00

Polymer Coated

3X1IN. 16 GAUGE CONNECTING FLARED END
CORRUGATION RIVETED BANDS SECTIONS

54" $43.07 54" $64.61 54" $732.50
60" $47.63 60" $95.26 60" $1,098.00
66" $52.09 66" $104.18 66" $1,180.00
72" $56.65 72" $113.30 72" $1,309.30
84" $67.90 84" $135.80 84" $1,547.35
96" $77.31 96" $154.62 96" $2,052.75

108" 14 GA $115.39 108" 14 GA $230.78 108" 14 GA N/A

120" 12 GA $163.50 120" 12 GA $327.00 120" 12 GA N/A

Call after regular
hours

Yes

22/3X1/21IN. 16 GAUGE CONNECTING FLARED END
CORRUGATION RIVETED BANDS SECTIONS
17 X 13 $11.04 17 X 13 $11.04 17 X 13 $53.85
21 X 15 $12.97 21 X 15 $12.97 21 X 15 $63.15
24 X 18 $15.09 24 X 18 $15.09 24 X 18 $76.80
28 X 20 $17.48 28 X 20 $17.48 28 X 20 $90.50
35X 24 $21.16 35X 24 $31.74 35X 24 $140.10
42 X 29 14 GA $31.46 42 X 29 14 GA $47.19 42 X 29 14 GA $221.55
49 X 3312 GA $51.06 49 X 3312 GA $76.59 49 X 3312 GA $381.80
57 X 3812 GA $58.05 57 X 3812 GA $87.08 57 X 3812 GA $476.10
Polymer Coated
3X1IN. 16 GAUGE CONNECTING FLARED END
CORRUGATION RIVETED BANDS SECTIONS
60 X 46 14 GA $56.16 60 X 46 14 GA $112.32 60 X 46 14 GA $695.00
66 X 51 14 GA $62.30 66 X 51 14 GA $124.60 66 X 51 14 GA $918.90
73 X 55 14 GA $68.16 73 X 55 14 GA $136.32 73 X 55 14 GA $1,233.10
81 X 59 14 GA $74.30 81 X 59 14 GA $148.60 81 X 59 14 GA $1,298.75
95 X 67 14 GA $87.55 95 X 67 14 GA $175.10 95 X 67 14 GA $1,453.55
112 X 7512 GA $137.85 112 X 7512 GA $275.70 112 X 7512 GA $1,883.00
128 X 83 14 GA $155.23 128 X 83 14 GA $310.46 128 X 83 14 GA N/A
142 X 91 10 GA $222.78 142 X 91 10 GA $445.56 142 X 9110 GA N/A

Contact

Greg Brauner

Telephone Number

573-690-1533




CORRUGATED METALLIC STEEL CULVERT PIPE BID TABULATION

CORRUGATED
METALLIC STEEL
CULVERT PIPE
Bid Opening THOMPSON THOMPSON THOMPSON THOMPSON THOMPSON THOMPSON
1-30-07 CULVERT CO. | CULVERT CO. | CULVERT CO. | CULVERT CO. | CULVERT CO. | CULVERT CO.
Zinc-Coated
22/3 X 1/2 IN. 16 GAUGE CONNECTING FLARED END
CORRUGATION RIVETED BANDS SECTIONS
12" $6.62 12" $6.62 12" $44.08
15" $7.94 15" $7.94 15" $56.01
18" $9.93 18" $9.93 18" $72.62
21" $11.25 21" $11.25 21" $87.36
24" $12.58 24" $12.58 24" $108.41
30" $15.89 30" $15.89 30" $197.87
36" $19.20 36" $28.80 36" $318.96
42" $22.51 42" $33.77 42" $601.61
48" $25.16 48" $37.74 48" $700.13
Zinc-(:oated—
3X1IN. 16 GAUGE CONNECTING FLARED END
CORRUGATION RIVETED BANDS SECTIONS
54" $37.10 54" $55.65 54" $920.70
60" $40.81 60" $61.22 60" $1,381.07
66" $44.52 66" $89.04 66" $1,484.63
72" $51.61 72" $103.22 72" $1,645.78
84" $60.21 84" $120.42 84" $1,945.01
96" $68.03 96" $136.06 96" $2,580.30
108" 14 GA $98.64 108" 14 GA $197.28 108" 14 GA NO BID
120" 12 GA $150.43 120" 12 GA $300.86 120" 12 GA NO BID
Zinc-Coated
2/3 X 1/2 IN. 16 GAUGE CONNECTING FLARED END
CORRUGATION RIVETED BANDS SECTIONS
17 X 13 $8.30 17 X 13 $8.30 17 X 13 $56.35
21 X 15 $10.38 21 X 15 $10.38 21 X 15 $66.08
24 X 18 $11.76 24 X 18 $11.76 24 X 18 $80.39
28 X 20 $13.15 28 X 20 $13.15 28 X 20 $94.71
35X 24 $16.61 35X 24 $16.61 35X 24 $158.69
42 X 2914 GA $20.07 42 X 2914 GA $30.11 42 X 2914 GA $251.02
49 X 3312 GA $29.06 49 X 3312 GA $43.59 49 X 3312 GA $432.51
57 X 38 12 GA $44.98 57 X 38 12 GA $67.47 57 X 38 12 GA $539.34
Zinc-Coated
3X1IN. 16 GAUGE CONNECTING FLARED END
CORRUGATION RIVETED BANDS SECTIONS
60 X 46 $47.09 60 X 46 $70.64 60 X 46 $853.94
66 X 51 $51.72 66 X 51 $77.58 66 X 51 $1,127.86
73 X 55 $57.13 73 X 55 $114.26 73 X 55 $1,513.43
81 X 59 $65.77 81 X 59 $131.54 81 X 59 $1,594.01
95 X 67 $76.33 95 X 67 $152.66 95 X 67 $1,783.90
112 X 75 $86.88 112 X 75 $173.76 112 X 75 $2,310.99
128 X 83 $143.88 128 X 83 $287.76 128 X 83 NO BID
142 X 91 $204.05 142 X 91 $408.10 142 X 91 NO BID
Polymer Coated
22/3 X 1/2 IN. 16 GAUGE CONNECTING FLARED END
CORRUGATION RIVETED BANDS SECTIONS
12" $9.80 12" $9.80 12" $44.08
15" $11.76 15" $11.76 15" $56.01
18" $14.70 18" $14.70 18" $72.62




CORRUGATED METALLIC STEEL CULVERT PIPE BID TABULATION

CORRUGATED

CULVERT PIPE

METALLIC STEEL

Polymer Coated

Bid Opening THOMPSON THOMPSON THOMPSON THOMPSON THOMPSON THOMPSON
1-30-07 CULVERT CO. | CULVERT CO. | CULVERT CO. | CULVERT CO. | CULVERT CO. | CULVERT CO.
21" $16.66 21" $16.66 21" $87.36
24" $18.62 24" $18.62 24" $108.41
30" $23.52 30" $23.52 30" $197.87
36" $28.43 36" $42.65 36" $319.96
42" $33.33 42" $50.00 42" $601.61
48" $37.25 48" $55.88 48" $700.13

Polymer Coated

3X1IN. 16 GAUGE CONNECTING FLARED END
CORRUGATION RIVETED BANDS SECTIONS

54" $57.23 54" $85.85 54" $920.70
60" $62.95 60" $94.43 60" $1,381.07
66" $68.67 66" $137.34 66" $1,484.63
72" $75.54 72" $151.08 72" $1,645.78
84" $91.36 84" $182.72 84" $1,945.01
96" $103.23 96" $206.46 96" $2,580.30

108" 14 GA $147.42 108" 14 GA $294.84 108" 14 GA NO BID

120" 12 GA $224.82 120" 12 GA $449.64 120" 12 GA NO BID

Call after regular

22/3X1/21IN. 16 GAUGE CONNECTING FLARED END
CORRUGATION RIVETED BANDS SECTIONS

17 X 13 $12.14 17 X 13 $12.14 17 X 13 $56.35

21 X 15 $15.18 21 X 15 $15.18 21 X 15 $66.08

24 X 18 $17.20 24 X 18 $17.20 24 X 18 $80.39

28 X 20 $19.22 28 X 20 $19.22 28 X 20 $94.71

35X 24 $24.28 35X 24 $24.28 35X 24 $158.69

42 X 29 14 GA $27.94 42 X 29 14 GA $41.91 42 X 29 14 GA $251.02

49 X 3312 GA $40.47 49 X 3312 GA $60.71 49 X 3312 GA $432.51

57 X 3812 GA $62.63 57 X 3812 GA $93.95 57 X 3812 GA $539.34

Polymer Coated
3X1IN. 16 GAUGE CONNECTING FLARED END
CORRUGATION RIVETED BANDS SECTIONS

60 X 46 14 GA $71.74 60 X 46 14 GA $107.61 60 X 46 14 GA $853.94
66 X 51 14 GA $78.79 66 X 51 14 GA $118.19 66 X 51 14 GA $1,127.86
73 X 55 14 GA $87.02 73 X 55 14 GA $174.04 73 X 55 14 GA $1,513.43
81 X 59 14 GA $95.26 81 X 59 14 GA $190.52 81 X 59 14 GA $1,594.01
95 X 67 14 GA $114.49 95 X 67 14 GA $228.98 95 X 67 14 GA $1,783.90
112 X 7512 GA $179.05 112 X 7512 GA $358.10 112 X 7512 GA $2,310.99

128 X 83 14 GA $207.90 128 X 83 14 GA $415.80 128 X 83 14 GA NO BID

142 X 91 10 GA $294.84 142 X 91 10 GA $589.68 142 X 9110 GA NO BID

hours N/A
Contact N/A
Telephone Number N/A




