
CRUSHED STONE & GRAVEL BID TABULATION

CRUSHED STONE 
& GRAVEL       

BID OPENING     
1-30-07

PLATTIN 
VALLEY    

S & G

DRY CREEK 
MATERIALS 

INC
ANTIRE 

QUARRY
BUSSEN 
QUARY

TRAUTMAN 
QUARRY

HOUSE 
SPRINGS 

QUARRY & 
MATERIALS 

INC

ARCH 
JOHNSTON 

CO LA FARGE
FRED 

WEBER INC
CENTRAL 
STONE CO

SIMPSON 
CONSTRUCTION 

MATERIALS

CLEAN STONE    
Cost per Ton

1/4" NO BID NO BID $10.00 $10.00 $8.00 $8.50 NO BID NO BID NO BID N/A N/A
3/8" NO BID $9.00 $10.00 $10.00 $8.00 $8.50 NO BID NO BID $8.55 $8.50 N/A
1/2" NO BID $9.00 $10.00 $10.00 $8.00 $8.50 NO BID NO BID $8.55 $8.50 N/A
3/4" NO BID $7.25 $8.00 $8.00 $7.50 $7.50 $6.95 NO BID $6.55 $7.60 $7.45
1" NO BID $7.50 $8.00 $8.00 $7.50 $7.50 $7.15 NO BID $6.55 $7.60 $7.45

1 1/4" NO BID $7.50 $8.00 $8.00 $7.50 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID N/A N/A
1 1/2" NO BID NO BID $6.95 $6.95 $3.30 $6.50 NO BID NO BID $6.55 N/A N/A
1 3/4" NO BID NO BID $6.95 $6.95 $6.30 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID N/A N/A

2" NO BID $6.20 $6.95 $6.95 $6.30 $6.50 $5.95 NO BID $5.50 $6.95 $6.55
3" NO BID $6.20 $6.95 $6.95 $6.30 $6.50 $5.95 NO BID $5.50 N/A N/A
4" NO BID $6.20 $6.95 $6.95 $6.30 $6.50 $5.95 NO BID $5.00 N/A N/A
5" NO BID NO BID $6.95 $6.95 $6.30 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID N/A N/A
6" NO BID NO BID $6.95 $6.95 $6.30 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID N/A N/A

MINUS           
Cost per Ton

1/4" NO BID NO BID $1.00 $1.00 $1.00 $4.10 $2.50 NO BID NO BID $1.65 $2.25
3/8" NO BID $2.50 $4.80 $4.80 $4.60 $4.10 NO BID NO BID $4.10 $4.10 $2.25
1/2" NO BID $2.50 $4.80 $4.80 $4.60 $4.10 NO BID NO BID $4.10 N/A N/A
3/4" NO BID $4.50 $4.80 $4.80 $4.60 $4.50 $4.50 NO BID $4.10 $4.75 $4.30
1" NO BID $4.50 $4.80 $4.80 $4.60 $4.50 $4.50 NO BID $4.10 $4.90 $4.30

1 1/4" NO BID NO BID $4.80 $4.80 $4.60 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID N/A N/A
1 1/2" NO BID NO BID $4.80 $4.80 $4.60 $4.50 NO BID NO BID $4.10 N/A $4.20

2" NO BID $4.50 $4.80 $4.80 $4.60 $4.50 $4.50 NO BID $4.10 $4.75 $4.20
2  1/2" NO BID NO BID $4.80 $4.80 $4.60 $4.50 NO BID NO BID NO BID N/A N/A

3" NO BID $4.50 $4.80 $4.80 $4.60 $4.50 $4.50 NO BID $4.10 N/A N/A
4" NO BID NO BID $4.80 $4.80 $4.60 $4.50 NO BID NO BID $4.10 N/A N/A

1/2 - 4 Minus 
Backfill NO BID $2.50 $4.80 $4.80 $4.60 $2.50 NO BID NO BID NO BID N/A N/A
 MAC             

Cost per Ton
1/4" NO BID NO BID $10.00 $10.00 $7.50 $8.50 NO BID NO BID N/A N/A N/A
1/2" NO BID NO BID $10.00 $10.00 $7.50 $8.50 NO BID NO BID N/A N/A N/A
3/4" NO BID NO BID $8.00 $8.00 $7.50 $7.50 NO BID NO BID N/A N/A $7.45
1" NO BID NO BID $8.00 $8.00 $7.50 $7.50 NO BID NO BID N/A N/A $7.45
2" NO BID NO BID $6.95 $6.95 $6.30 $6.50 NO BID NO BID N/A N/A $6.55
3" NO BID NO BID $6.95 $6.95 $6.30 $6.50 NO BID NO BID N/A N/A N/A

3 X 10 NO BID NO BID $9.25 $9.25 NO BID $8.50 NO BID $8.00 N/A N/A N/A
3 X 10 Other NO BID $8.00 $9.25 $9.25 NO BID $8.50 NO BID NO BID N/A N/A N/A



CRUSHED STONE & GRAVEL BID TABULATION

CRUSHED STONE 
& GRAVEL       

BID OPENING     
1-30-07

PLATTIN 
VALLEY    

S & G

DRY CREEK 
MATERIALS 

INC
ANTIRE 

QUARRY
BUSSEN 
QUARY

TRAUTMAN 
QUARRY

HOUSE 
SPRINGS 

QUARRY & 
MATERIALS 

INC

ARCH 
JOHNSTON 

CO LA FARGE
FRED 

WEBER INC
CENTRAL 
STONE CO

SIMPSON 
CONSTRUCTION 

MATERIALS
SHOT ROCK NO BID $3.75 $3.50 $3.50 $3.50 $4.75 $3.85 $5.00 $4.15 N/A $5.00

GABION ROCK NO BID $8.00 $9.25 $9.25 NO BID NO BID $8.00 NO BID $8.05 N/A N/A
QUARRY RUN NO BID $4.50 $3.50 $3.50 $3.50 $4.75 NO BID NO BID $4.15 $4.30 $5.00
DIRTY STONE NO BID NO BID $2.50 $2.50 $2.50 $2.50 NO BID NO BID NO BID N/A $5.00

DIRT NO BID $5.00 N/A N/A NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID N/A N/A
SAND NO BID $11.00 $4.80 $4.80 NO BID NO BID NO BID $1.00 $5.45 N/A N/A

DIRTY STONE NO BID NO BID $2.50 $2.50 $2.50 $2.50 NO BID NO BID NO BID $3.65 N/A
FILTER ROCK NO BID NO BID $6.95 $6.95 $6.30 $8.50 NO BID NO BID NO BID N/A N/A
DIRTY SHOT 

ROCK NO BID $3.75 $2.50 $2.50 $2.50 $2.50 NO BID NO BID NO BID $2.75 $5.00
BLANKET ROCK NO BID $8.00 $10.25 $10.25 $10.00 $9.00 $8.00 NO BID NO BID $9.15 N/A

4 X 6 CLEAN NO BID $6.20 $9.25 $9.25 $10.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID N/A N/A

OTHER:

18" x 24" 
Granite Rip 
Rap $8.00 

per ton
GRAVEL 

PRODUCTS
P-GRAVEL $6.50 $8.50 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID N/A $7.45
SCREENED 

GRAVEL NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID N/A N/A
CREEK GRAVEL $5.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID N/A N/A

B-GRAVEL $8.00 $7.50 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID N/A $9.50
C-GRAVEL $6.50 $11.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID N/A $7.85

CONCRETE ROCK NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID N/A N/A
FILTER SAND NO 7.50 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID N/A N/A

SAND
$50.00 T/A  
$35.00 S/A $11.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID N/A $8.40

DIRT  NO BID $50.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID N/A $5.00 TON
BLANKET ROCK NO BID $8.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID N/A N/A

SHOT ROCK NO BID $3.75 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID N/A N/A
3 X 10 CLEAN NO BID $8.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID N/A N/A
4 X 6 CLEAN NO BID $6.20 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID N/A N/A

HAUL CHART     
STOCK PILE

0-5 $3.50 $3.25 $3.40 $3.40 $2.85 $3.05 $2.75 NO BID $3.00 $2.95 $2.70
5-10 $3.75 $3.50 $3.80 $3.80 $3.25 $3.55 $3.25 NO BID $3.50 $3.60 $2.95

10-15 $4.00 $3.75 $4.30 $4.30 $3.75 $3.95 $3.50 NO BID $4.50 $4.35 $3.25
15-20 $4.25 $4.00 $4.80 $4.80 $4.45 $4.60 $4.10 NO BID $4.80 N/A $3.40
20-25 $4.50 $4.25 $5.30 $5.30 $4.95 $5.00 $4.60 NO BID $5.50 N/A $3.75
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25-30 NO BID $4.50 $5.80 $5.80 $5.65 $5.50 $5.30 NO BID $5.80 N/A $4.33
30-35 NO BID $4.75 $6.30 $6.30 $6.35 $6.00 $6.00 NO BID $6.20 N/A N/A
35-40 NO BID $5.00 $6.80 $6.80 $7.05 $6.50 $6.70 NO BID $6.50 N/A N/A
40-45 NO BID $5.25 $7.80 $7.80 $7.65 $7.00 $7.30 NO BID $7.65 N/A N/A
45-50 NO BID $5.50 $8.80 $8.80 $8.35 $7.50 $8.00 NO BID $8.40 N/A N/A
+50 NO BID $5.75 NO BID NO BID NO BID $8.00 $0.30 NO BID NO BID N/A N/A

ADD ON PRICE    
ON SITE

0-5 $3.50 NO BID $3.40 $3.40 $2.85 $3.05 $2.75 NO BID $3.00 $2.95 $2.70
5-10 $3.75 NO BID $3.80 $3.80 $3.25 $3.55 $3.25 NO BID $3.50 $3.60 $2.95

10-15 $4.00 NO BID $4.30 $4.30 $3.75 $3.95 $3.50 NO BID $4.50 $4.35 $3.25
15-20 $4.25 NO BID $4.80 $4.80 $4.45 $4.60 $4.10 NO BID $4.80 N/A $3.40
20-25 $4.50 NO BID $5.30 $5.30 $4.95 $5.00 $4.60 NO BID $5.50 N/A $3.75
25-30 NO BID NO BID $5.80 $5.80 $5.65 $5.50 $5.30 NO BID $5.80 N/A $4.33
30-35 NO BID NO BID $6.30 $6.30 $6.35 $6.00 $6.00 NO BID $6.20 N/A N/A
35-40 NO BID NO BID $6.80 $6.80 $7.05 $6.50 $6.70 NO BID $6.50 N/A N/A
40-45 NO BID NO BID $7.80 $7.80 $7.65 $7.00 $7.30 NO BID $7.65 N/A N/A
45-50 NO BID NO BID $8.80 $8.80 $8.35 $7.50 $8.00 NO BID $8.40 N/A N/A
+50 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $8.00 $0.30 NO BID NO BID N/A N/A

COMMENTS:

Add $1.00 
per ton for 
gabion & 

riprap

Add $1.00 
per ton for 
gabion & 

riprap

Haul is 
subject to a 
14 ton min 
haulper .

Add $1.00 
per ton for 

rock blanket 
and quarry 

run

All delivery loads 
will be a 15 ton 

min. Waiting tiome 
will be at the rate of 
$70 an hr. after the 
initial fifteen min. 

of arrival


