EQUIPMENT TRAILER BID TABULATION

EQUIPMENT TRAILER
BID OPENING
8-7-07

WHEELER
STEEL WORKS
INC

TRUK TRAILER -
TRACTOR
REPAIR INC

HOLDEN
INDUSTRIES INC

STALLION
TRAILERS INC

BOBCAT OF
ST.LOUIS

PRICE PER EQUIPMENT TRAILER NO BID NO BID $6,569.00 $5,562.00 $5,540.00
Spare wheel NO BID NO BID $60.00 $75.00 $90.00
$197.00
Spare wheel and tire NO BID NO BID LR-G $165.00 $230.00
$150.00
$153.00 $150.00 PER FOOT UP
Additional deck lengths NO BID NO BID PER 2 FEET PER FEET TO 20 FEET
3 “ pintle eye NO BID NO BID N/C $100.00 N/C
$1.25 $20.00
Additional stake pockets NO BID NO BID $16.00 PAIR EACH EACH
$15.00 $30.00
D Rings NO BID NO BID $38.00 PAIR EACH EACH
Chain basket with locking lid NO BID NO BID $140.00 $150.00 $270.00
Chain basket without lid NO BID NO BID N/A $100.00 $218.00
Expanded metal on top of ramps NO BID NO BID $60.00 $50.00 $130.00
Diamond plate on top of ramps NO BID NO BID $48.00 $150.00 $160.00
Wood filled ramps NO BID NO BID $149.00 $125.00 $180.00
Knife edge on ramps NO BID NO BID INCLUDED $25.00 $130.00
Oil bath bearings NO BID NO BID INCLUDED N/A $57.00
3” Rubrail outside of stake pockets NO BID NO BID $40.00 $75.00 $280.00
$250.00
Torflex axles (factory quote) NO BID NO BID $123.00 EACH $414.00
Gooseneck with 2 5/16” ball
coupler NO BID NO BID $260.00 $895.00 $1,400.00
Gooseneck with Brinkley 5" wheel NO BID NO BID $788.00 N/A $1,800.00
Color match factory quote PER PAINT
(no metallics) NO BID NO BID $1,307.00 $600.00 SPECS
7 way RV style trailer plug NO BID NO BID N/C $25.00 $50.00
QUOTE DOES NOT | STANDARD DECK
INCULDE ANY LENGTH IS 18 FOOT
OPTIONAL NOT 24 FT AS IN
FEATURES. THE BID SPECS. 78'
DELIVERY FROM DECK WIDTH
BROCHURE | AwWARDED BID - 45 | MAXIMUM ON THE
COMMENTS: INCULDED DAYS TORFLEX AXLES.




