BID TABULATION-AUTOMOTIVE PARTS AND SUPPLIES-2014.xs

AUTOMOTIVEPARTS & | AUTOTIRE& | B&AAUTO FACTORY | , OREILLY | pryrmER rorD WEIR WEIR
PARTS CO PARTS MOTOR PARTS AUTOMOTIVE INC CHERVROLET & | WHOLESALE
SUPPLIES 2014 STORES INC BUICK GMC INC | PARTS LLC
E 1D
OF 4N18Nﬁ B 120 FLETCHER ST 146 7TH STREET ”;ggsggg:g{ 233 §PATTERSON | 98 MERUIT 1107 § MAIN FOBOX 69
DESOTOMO €302¢ | HILLSBOROMO 63030 | "0t 063123 |SPRINGFIELD MO 65802 43043 RED BUD IL 62278 RED BUD . 62278
DELIVERY
How many delivery vehicles do you 92 2 23 Over 13,000 2 56 56
currently maintain in service?
‘Will you provide vour normal delivery
service at no charge (Y/N)? YES YES YES YES YES YES YES
If yes, i3 there a minimum order
requirement (Y7 NO NO NO NO NO NO NO
If yes, what is r.'he minimum order NiA WA ) $0.00 N/A NiA
requirement?
If vou charge for delivery service, what is
the amount per delivery? A ) $6.00 NA NIA
If you charg_a _for delivery service, what is NO NO NO NO NO
the minimum order required?
REGULAR BUSINESS HOURS ARE:
Monday (open-close) TAM-6PM T:30AM-6PM 7:30AM-5:30PM 7:30AM-9FM 7:30AM-6PM 6AM-5PM 6AM-5PM
Tuesday (open-close) TAM-6PM 7:30AM-6PM 7:30AM-5:30PM 7:30AM-9PM 7:30AM-6PM 6AM-5PM 6AM-3PM
Wednesday {open-close) TAM-6PM 7:30AM-6PM 7:30AM-5:30PM 7:30AM-9PM 7:30AM-6PM 6AM-5PM 6AM-5PM
Thursday (open-close) 7AM-6PM 7:30AM-6PM 7:30AM-5;30PM 7:30AM-9PM 7:30AM-6FM 6AM-5PM 6AM-5PM
Friday (open-close) 7TAM-6PM 7:30AM-6PM 7:30AM-5:30PM 7.3CAM-SPM 7:30AM-6PM 6AM-5PM GAM-5PM
Saturday (open-close) SAM-2PM 9AM-1PM 8AM-1PM 7:30AM-SPM 9AM-2PM N/A N/A
Sunday (open-close) CLOSED CLOSED 8AM-EPM CLOSED N/A N/A
In an emergency can we call you after
regular hours (Y/N)? YES YES YES NO YE3 YES YES
Ron Pearson Daniel Kennedy Steve Switzer Warren Robinson. | Leave Voice Mail | Leave Voice Mail
If yes, name and number of party to call

636-337-8312

636-543-1311

618-363-4239

314-704-7622

1-800-334-1379

1-855-712-8831




BID TABULATION-AUTOMOTIVE PARTS AND SUPPLIES-2014.xIs

AUTOMOTIVEPARTS & | AUTOTIRE& | B&AAUTO FACTORY OREILLY | o EUTHER FORD WEIR WEIR
PARTS CO PARTS MOTOR PARTS AUTOMOTIVE INC CHERVROLET & | WHOLESALE
SUPPLIES 2014 . STORES INC BUICK GMC INC PARTS LLC
OPENING BID 120 FLETCHER ST 146 7TH STREET ";;Z;I]‘;‘?SB?;EH 253 § PATTERSON m&immo 1107 § MAIN POBOX 69
4-8-14 DESQTOMO 63020 | HILLSBOROMO63050 | " 0 = | SPRINGFIELD MO 65802 a3043 RED BUD IL 62278 RED BUD IL. 62278
BID ONE DISCOUNT FOR ITEMS
LISTED
Ajr Conditioner (compressor, dryers,
clutch fans, thermostatic Freon)
B . ACDelco
rand Name Napa Delphi ACDelco Murray Ford/Motorcraft GM Motocraft
Q, M 0,
Percent Discount 3-10 up to 120 40.00% 8% List Less 41% or 25.00% L-30% 27.00%
10% Better
Alternators, Generators, Starters
{drives)
Ultima, Wilson,
Brand Name Napa Remy MPA MasterPro, Best Test Ford/Motorcraft GM Motocraft
1 Q,
Percent Discount J-5uptoJ20 49.00% 12.00% List L;?Sm:rl % or 25.00% 1-30% 27.00%
Bearings (all roller and ball)
Brand Name Napa Federal Mogul BCA BCA Ford/Motorcraft GM Ford
1 [+
Percent Discount *19 63.00% 14.00% List L];:ﬁ: 7 or 25.00% L-30% 27.00%
Throw Out Bearing
BCA
Brand Name Napa Federal Mogul ACDelco BCA Ford/Motorcraft GM Ford
o, H 0,
Percent Discount 118 63.00% 14% List Less 41% or 25.00% 1-30% 27.00%
15% Better
Brakes (break pads with premium
lining)
Brand Name Napa GRI Bendix Wegner, . Ford/Motorcraft GM Motocraft
Performance Friction
3 0,
Percent Discount 15 50.00% 15.00% List ngsﬁ Z’rl % ox 25.00% L-30% 27.00%
Brakes , Hydraulic (parts, cylinder kits)
Brand Name Napa Raybestos Bendix Al Cardone Ferd/Motoreraft GM Ford
1 0,
Percent Discount 315 59.00% 15.00% List L;S:n:rl % or 25.00% L-30% 27.00%
Carburetors (carburetor rebuild kit)
Brand Name Napa Tomco ACDelco Walker, Borg Ford/Motorcraft GM Motocraft
ACDelco ‘Warner
0, 1 0,
Percent Discount 117 54.00% 3% List Less 41% or 25.00% 1-30% 27.00%
15% Better




BID TABULATION-AUTOMOTIVE PARTS AND SUPPLIES-2014.xIs

AUTOMOTIVE PARTS & | AUTOTIRE & B & A AUTO FACTORY AU?rléixH(“)I:r‘fvm REUTHER FORD CHER‘&S“LET N WHI)VI.].:EISRALE
SUPPLIES 2014 PARTS CO PARTS MOTOR PARTS INC
STORES INC BUICK GMC INC PARTS LLC
OPENING BID 120 FLETCEER ST 146 7TH STREET uégs;%n;?:gg}{ 233 § PATTERSON E;im 1107 S MAIN PO BOX 69
4-8-14 DESOTOMO 63026 | HILLSBOROMO 83030 | " orne'o "o |SPRINGFIELD Mo 65802 c3048 MO | rEDBUDL ezzme RED BUD L 62278
Chassis Parts (king pins, ball joints,
suspensions, spring shackle, tie rods,
cemponents)
B Mevotech
rand Name Napa Raybestos Moog Monroe, Moog Ford/Motorcraft GM Ford
0, N 0,
Percent Discount 10 up to J-19 59.00% ;g; List L;Zit:rl % or 25.00% L-30% 27.00%
Clutch and Pressure Plates (vebuilt
pressure plate)
Brand Name Napa AMS No Bid Sachs Ford/Motorcraft GM Ford
3 0,
Percent Discount 1-10 40.00% No Bid List ngzstt:: % or 25.00% L-30% C+10%
Rebuilt clutch dise, with ¥L.D. organic
lining
Brand Name Napa AMS No Bid Sachs Ford/Motorcraft GM Ford
1 0,
Percent Discount J-10 40.00% No Bid List L;?;:: % or 25.00% L-30% C+10%
Rebuilt clutch dise, with H.D. ceramic
buttons
Brand Name Napa AMS No Bid Sachs Ford/Motorcraft GM Ford
3 [}
Percent Discount 310 40.00% No Bid HistTess 41% or 25.00% L-30% C +10%
Engine Parts (pistons, rings, bearings,
valves, rods, crankshaft, oil pump)
Brand Natme Sealed Power Federal Mogul No Bid Sealed Power Ford/Motoreraft oM Ford
T 0,
Percent Discount 325 51.00% No Bid List L;Zi:rl % or 25.00% L-30% 27.00%
Exhaust System {mufflers, pipes,
hangers, exhaust sealing clamps)
Brand Name Napa AP No Bid ROL, Walker Ford/Motorcraft GM Ford
3 [+)
Percent Discount 10 59.00% No Bid List Less 136 or 25.00% L-30% 27.00%
Filters (oil, air, fuel WIX, NAPA or
HASTINGS only)
Brand Name Napa WIX No Bid WIX Ford/Motorcraft - Motocraft
1 0,
Percent Discount 157 75.00% No Bid List Less 41% or 25.00% ; 27.00%

Better




BID TABULATION-AUTOMOTIVE PARTS AND SUPPLIES-2014.x1s

AUTOMOTIVE PARTS & AUTO TIRE & B & A AUTO FACTORY OREILLY REUTHER FORD WEIR WEIR
; PARTS CO PARTS "MOTOR PARTS AUTOMOTIVE INC CHERVROLET & | WHOLESALE
SUPPLIES 2014 STORES INC BUICK GMCINC| PARTSLLC
0PE4NISNE EID 120 FLETCHER ST 146 7TH STREET “;giﬂ:g?gﬂ 233 § PATTERSON EE;?&MMO 1107 S MAIN PO BOX 69
~0= DESOTOMO$3020 | HILLSBOROMOS30S0 | o0 0w S o |SPRINGFIELD MO 65802 3088 RED BUD IL 62278 RED BUD IL 62278
Gaskets (seals, packing)
Brand Name Fel-Pro National Felpro Fel-Pro Ford/Motorcraft GM Ford
H Q,
Percent Discount 10 62.00% 5,00% List L;Z;:: 7o 0r 25.00% L-30% 27.00%
Gears (sprockets, chains)
Brand Name Napa Cloyes No Bid - Ford/Metorcraft GM Ford
Percent Discount J-10 55.00% Ne Bid - 25.00% L-30% 27.00%
Ignition (electrical, distributors, rotors,
coils, swithces, brushes, points,
regulators)
Brand Name Napa-Echlin Wells Standard BorgWamer, Ford/Motorcraft GM Motocraft
MasterPro
3 a,
Percent Discount 17 45.00% 18.00% List L;Zit:rl % or 25.00% L-30% 27.00%
Xgnition (wire set, cables, ignition wire)
Brand Name Napa-Beldin General Wire Standard BorgWamer, Ford/Motoreraft GM Muotocraft
FVP Omnispark
0, M D,
Percent Discount 310 51.00% 13;’ List L;Z;‘:rl 7 or 25.00% L-30% 27.00%
(]
Batteries (group 31 with 200 RC or
more 1000 CCA or more with 36 month
warranty)
Brand Neme Napa East Penn ACDelco SuperStart Ford/Motorcraft GM Motocraft
1 0,
Percent Discount 140 48.00% 10.00% List L;fn :r] % or 25.00% L-30% C+10%
Glow Phags
Brand Name Charnpion Auto Lite ACDelco Champion, ACDelco| Ford/Motorcraft GM Motocraft
3 0,
Percent Discount 115 42.00% 20.00% List Lgii‘;rl % or 25.00% L-30% 27.00%
Lamps (headlights, bulbs)
Brand Name Napa Phillips ‘Wagner Sylvania Ford/Motorcraft GM Ford
3 o,
Percent: Discount 110 up to 22 42.00% 20.00% List L;an‘:rl %01 25,00% L-30% 27.00%
Pumps Fuel (new)
Brand Name Napa Delphi ACDelco Precision Ford/Motorcraft GM Motocraft
3 o,
Percent Discount 313 44.00% 4.00% HistLess 41% or 25.00% L-30% 27.00%
Pumps Water (new)
Brand Name Napa GMB ACDelco MasterPro Select Ford/Motoreraft GM Motocraft
H o,
Percent Discount 710 48.00% 13.00% List Less 41% or 25.00% L-30% 27.00%

Better




BID TABULATION-AUTOMOTIVE PARTS AND SUPPLIES-2014.xls

AUTOMOTIVE PARTS & | AUTO TIRE & B & A AUTO FACTORY OREILLY = | 2 ¥ UTHER FORD WEIR WEIR
PARTS €O PARTS MOTOR PARTS AUTOMOTIVE NG CHERVROLET & | WHOLESALE
SUPPLIES 2014 , STORES INC BUICK GMC INC | PARTS LLC
O o mrErcuERsT | wsrrasRmsr | WIOLNDBRRGH | cpuprpey | BBMOWIT T o roBox e
-0 DESOTOMO 63020 | HILLSBOROMO 63050 | ") "m0 |SPRINGFIELD MO 65802 208z RED BUD IL 62278 RED BUD I\, 62278
Pumps Water (rebuilt)
Brand Name Napa Cardone ACDelco Al Cardone Ford/Motorceraft GM N/A
H 0,
Percent Discount 1310 46.00% 13.00% List L;S:té: % or 25.00% L-30% NIA
Rubber Products (v-belts, hoses,
clampns)
Brand Name Napa-(Gates Gates Goodyear Gates, MasterPro Ford/Motorcraft GM Motocraft
M o,
Percent Discount 514 59.00% 5.00% List Lgx: o or 25.00% 1-30% 27.00%
Shock Absarbers
Brand Name Napa KYB KYB Monroe Ford/Motoreraft GM Motacraft
H o,
Percent Discount 312 47.00% 20.00% List L;Zit:rl 7 or 25.00% L-30% 27.00%
Spark Plugs (regular, resister)
Brand Name Champion A/C Delco ACDelco Autolite, Champion | Ford/Motorcraft GM Motocraft
i [}
Percent Discount 15 51,00% 20.00% Hist Less 41% or 25.00% L-30% 27.00%
Transmission (automatic overhaul kits)
Brand Name ATP Pioneer No Bid Pioneer, Powertorque| Ford/Motorcraft GM Ford
1 0,
Percent Discount 1-18 46.00% No Bid List L;iit;‘rl % or 25.00% L-30% 27.00%
Universal Joints
Brand Name Napa GMB ACDelco Precision Ford/Motorcraft GM Ford
M 0,
Percent Discount S2upto 112 54.00% 15.00% List L;Z;irl % or 25.00% L-30% 27.00%
SAMPLE PRICING SHEET (Jobber)
BRAKES
1 Set (ome axle) $5-7574-X metallic
brale pads with premium lining
Brand Napa PDP Bendix Wagner Motorcraft - -
No. 88-7574x PXD65OH MEDE99 MHES BRI1269 - -
List Price $82.49 $65.9% 347.41 $59.10 $68.68 - -
Less % Discount 61.30% 50,00% 15.00% 41.,00% 25.00% - -
Net Amount $31.91 $34.99 $40.30 $34.87 $51.51 n -




BID TABULATION-AUTOMOTIVE PARTS AND SUPPLIES-2014.xIs

AUTOMOTIVE PARTS & AUTO TIRE & B & A AUTO FACTORY AU‘;‘;EMIB%'VE REUTHER FORD CHER‘:,E&ET & WH:)WI?EHSQALE
SUPPLIES 2014 PARTS CO PARTS MOTOR PARTS STORES INC INC BUICK GMC INC PARTS LLC
s | s | e | nie | e Lol | o, | e

97, LOUIS MO 63123 63048
1 Set (one axle) S8-8269-X metallic
brake pads with premium lining
Brand Napa PDP Bendix Wagner Motorcraft - -
No. 55-8260x PXD1159H MKD1159 MX1159 BRSD777 - -
List Price $89.99 $68.99 $47.41 $86.31 $75.98 - -
Less % Discount 61.30% 50.00% 15.00% 41.00% 25.00% - -
Net Amount 334.81 $34.99 $40.30 550.92 $59.58 - -
1 Set (one axle) $5-7950-X metallic
brake pads with premium lining
Brand Napa PDP Bendix Wagner - - -
No. §S-7950x PXD1047TH MKD1047 QCI04TA - - -
List Price 589.99 $74.49 $47.41 $79.98 - - -
Less % Discount 61.30% 50.00% 15.00% 41.00% - - -
Net Amount $34.81 $37.24 $40.30 547.19 - - -
MUFFLER AND SEALING CLAMPS
For a 2006 Ford 3/4 Ton 4WD 5.4L
Brand Napa, AP No Bid Walker Ford - -
No. 733-574 16254 / H212 No Bid 2o 6C3Z5230G ; -
List Price $6.20 $193.99/$3.99 No Bid B $988.34 - ;
Less % Discount 61.70% 63% / 62% No Bid 41.00% 25.00% - -
Net Amount 52.41 §71.77/51.51 No Bid i $741.26 - -
CLUTCH AND PRESSURE PLATES
14" Rebuilt clutch dise, 1-1/2" ten
spline with H.D. organic lining part
H#E1023
Brand HCL No Bid - Ford - -
No. RC1047604% No Bid - YC3Z7L556AA - -
List Price $590.73 (371.00 core} No Bid - $789.94 - -
Less % Discount 40.00% No Bid - 25.00% - -
Net Amount $354.44 No Bid - $592.46 -




BID TABULATION-AUTOMOTIVE PARTS AND SUPPLIES-2014.xIs

AUTOMOTIVE P AR‘IS & AUTO TIRE & B & A AUTOC FACTORY AU%?)?‘IEOL.I'}I{VE REUTHER FORD CHER‘:']I];:BI:'.;ET & WH:)VI?E%{ ALE
SUPPLIES 2014 PARTS CO PARTS MOTOR PARTS STORES INC INC BUICK GMC INC PARTS LLC
V| e | e [ S | e [ ot | ase, | uee

$T. LOUIS MO 63123 63048
14" Rebuilt clutch dise, 1-1/2" ten
spline with ELID. ceramic buttons part
H#E1023CB6
Brand HCL No Bid - - - -
o v : : : :
List Price %655511' ?570({’;’,711_335 :;:)) No Bid ; - ; .
Less % Discount 40% / 40% No Bid - - - -
Net Amount z:géég No Bid - - - -
OIL FILTERS
For a 2007 International DT466 (wix
57744)
Brand Napa WIX No Bid WIX Motorcraft - -
No. T744XD 84744XD No Bid 57744XD FL19935 - -
List Price $102.74 $106.99 No Bid $51.58 $15.07 - -
Less % Discount 85.00% 76.06% No Bid 41.00% 25.00% - -
Net Amount $15.29 32567 No Bid $30.59 $11.30 - -
BATTERIES
Group 31 with 200 RC or more 1250
CCA or more with 36 month warranty
Brand Batt. East Perm FVP S5B Motocraft - -
No. 7236 praitcebd SDBUS312 315 BXT65-850 - -
List Price $173.99 :ngg $218.78 $169.47 $129.95 - -
Less % Discount 59.70% 48% / 48% 10.00% 41.00% 15.00% - -
Net Amount $69.99 39031 $196.90 399.99 $110.45 . ;
$99.31
ALTERNATOR
2001 Crown Vic. 213-3130
Brand Napa ERE MPA USL Motocraft - -
No. 213-3130 77954 7795610 3612161 FBAZ10V346ABRM - -
List Price $283.50 $284.99 $133.20 $322.01 $251.20 - -
Less % Discount 56.30% 45.00% 12.00% 41.00% 25.00% - -
Net Amount $123.99 514534 $117.22 3189.99 $188.40 - -




BiD TABULATION-AUTOMOTIVE PARTS AND SUPPLIES-2014 xIs

AUTOMOTIVE PARTS & | AUTOTIRE & B & A AUTO FACTORY OREILLY | £y UTHER FORD WEIR WEIR
PARTS CO PARTS MOTOR PARTS AUTOMOTIVE INC CHERVROLET & | WHOLESALE
SUPPLIES 2014 STORES INC BUICK GMC INC PARTS LLC
OPE}:TI’;NE BID 120 FLETCHER ST 146 7TH STREET ! 1;%;%: CE.[;gH 233 S PATTERSON }E;ﬁimTMo 1107 $ MAIN PO BOX 69
DESOTOMO 63020 | HILLSBOROMO 63050 | " onto o o [SPRINGFIELD MO 65802 3048 RED BUD IL 62278 RED BUD IL 62278
OIL FILTERS
For a 2007 Impala NAPA 1522
Brand Napa WIX No Bid WIX Motocraft - -
No. 1522 85522 No Bid 51522 FL321 - -
List Price 511.54 $13.39 No Bid $6.71 $8.42 - -
Less % Discount 83.00% 75.00% No Bid 41.00% 30.00% - -
Net Amount $1.9% $3.35 No Bid $3.96 $5.80 - -
AJR FILTERS
2005 International DT466 (wix 46870)
Brand Napa WIX No Bid WIX Motocraft - -
No. 6870 38870 No Bid 46870 FA1778 - -
List Price $142.49 $147.99 No Bid $72.19 $79.17 - -
Less % Discount 85.00% 76.00% No Bid 41.00% 25.00% - -
Net Amount $21.29 $35.52 No Bid $42.59 $59.38 - -
AFFIDAVIT COMPLETED YES YES YES YES YES YES YES
COPY OF INSURANCE PROVIDED NO YES YES NG YES NO NO
See Attachemnts:
There are modified
sections on pg 4, sec
L12B,C. pg 5, sec
2.4 is crossed out, ,
See Attachments For notes added atthe | See Attached Sheet %?:;Eﬁ;:i:ﬂf Engines and
COMMENTS: Additional Pricing bottorn of the page, For Additional (Dealer net T/L cost Transmissions are
Information. pg7sec2.16 A, D Pricing, ca e sold at cost + $100.
plus $100 plus core)

have mark outs, pg
12 and 13 have
modifications, see
additional notes
attached.
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JEFFERSON COUNTY
DEPARTMENT OF ADMINISTRATIVE SERVICES =
729 MAPLE ST / PO BOX 100
HILLSBORO MO 63050
WWW JEFFCOMO.ORG

Invitation for Bid: AUTOMOTIVE, PARTS AND SUPPLIES  Date Issued: 3-12-14

2014

BiDS SHALL BE ACCEPTED UNTIL: TUESDAY, APRIL 8, 2014. AT 2:00 P.M. LOCAL TIME.

Specification
Contact:

Contract
Contact:

Mail (3) Three
Complete Copies
With Vendor And
Bid Information As
Shown In Sample:

Contract Term:

UPON APPROVAL OF THE
COUNTY COUNCIL AND
COUNTY EXECUTIVE

Vendor
Information:

Invitation For Bid and Bid Form

JASON JONAS
Department of Public Works
636-797-5369
Jionas@jeffcomo.org

VICKIE PRATT
Department of Administrative Services
636-797-5382

SAMPLE ENVELOPE

VENDOR NAME
FENDOR 4 DDRESS
CONTACT NUMBER DEPARTMENT OF THE COUNTY CLERK
JEFFERSON COUNTY MISSOURI

729 MAPLE ST/PO BOX 104

HILLSBORO MO 63050-0100

SEALED BID: (BID NAME)

The undersigned certifies that hef/she has the authority to bind this company in an
agreement/contract to supply the commodity or service in accordance with all terms,
conditions, and pricing specified. This Bid, if accepted, will constitute an Agreement and
Contract with Jefferson County, Missouri, upon approval of the County Council and County
Executive. Prices are firm during this agreement term, unless agreed upon in writing by the
County. The County has the option to renew this agreement at the same terms and conditions
as the original agreement for one additional one-year term with the written consent of the
successtul Bidder. Price increases for renewals are not authorized unless approved in writing
by the County,

?)a-@t Rude PCLV“{": ’D(mie,l P\ennecQ,w

Cempany Nanie Authorized Agent (Prin\)

14l TR Sleeet A&WDJW

Address Signature/’
(Hitlsboro Mo L3oso — Ooner
City/State/Zip Codé 63 -189-Q68€ Title

63 - 194 0900 Ths/il puys3d1T
Telephone # Date Tax ID #
lhand 4 pﬂrf.s@-;gme,@m 626-13Y - jo14.
E-muail Fax #

Bidder's Initials: @6——

Page 1 of 18



BID ONE DISCOUNT FOR ITEMS LISTED

DESCRIPTION BRAND(S) NAME PER CENT
BID DISCOUNT
AIR CONDITIONER - Compressor,
clutch fans, thermostatic Freon £, ¢ 9562 Del p i 0

L BoaT__ &40
ALTERNATORS, GENERATORS, STARTERS

drives #=# 7T45 A Re,f)‘]\'] qci
Lt agd, 49 C1145. b
BEARINGS - all roller and ball 4 Qo4y- ,\‘-"F’ &.C{c’,i“al Wlaguf é’ 3

L' 5.49 c:l4.4?

Throw out bearing # Gidod Fe&@%ﬁ é_z_

L177.99 C12885
BRAKES , "
Brake pads with premium lining#f-Px D 6519 H G RIT 50

Ly .99 ¢ H.99
BRAKES, HYDRAULIC- Parts, cylinder kits Rcu;,{ beskos 59
4t (5065 '

L1039 g5
CARBURETORS - Carburctor rebuild kits#g - 976 Teco 54

L 62.99 ¢ 2g.a’
CHASSIS PARTS - King pinsBall joint
suspensions, spring shackle, tie rods, ¢ ges- 12 59
(Rcu,{ hestes 59

components

L 122,44 C:56.4
CLUTCH AND PRESSURE PLATES -

Rebuilt pressure plate, 44 oUote Y A vl S L( O
Liik]. 8 ¢l 4.0l Fu\\\%‘i’( o

Rebuilt clutch disc, | o2 7 o

with FL.D. organic lining —-?f@‘ / T/0 bre? A W15 L( O

Rebuilt clutch disc, A WA S L{ O

with H.D. ceramic buttons

ENGINE PARTS - Pistons, rings, bearings, —

valves, rods, crankshaﬁ,:[i(oot- 1047 k@ g!gm, Mf[i%i@ ! 5
Lln O\.O'gg ! bl'?)(ﬁ

EXHAUST SYSTEMS Mufflers} pipes,

hangers, Exhaust sealing clamps S LYY A P 5 G‘l

L. %0.%% 21 33 g
Invitation For Bid and Bid Form Page 14 of 18 Bidder's lnitial&@&%('




BID ONE DISCOUNT FOR ITEMS LISTED

DESCRIPTION

FILTERS{ Oilyair, fuel 4 355 2QAm P
WIX, NAP% or HASTINGS only

L 1d. C'-E’nlo

GASKETS , packmg:ti 2687

L A3 el i
GEARS ~Sprockets; chains 44 ¢ Loy 7

Liag.qq Ciyd, &
IGNITION - Electrical,g%ﬁ@
rotors, coils, switches, brushes,
points, regulators H &2~ [3Rle

L4839 ¢ 7919
IGNITION -(ire s8, G- L35S

cables, ignition wire
Ll hg.49 Ciayg .ol
BATTERIES - Group 31 with 200
RC or more 1000 CCA or more,
with 36 month warranty 2IHD P30
L %6, 49 C1LAaq .« 3
GLOW PLUGS - 4% )|} Y

L3040 cit1-L5
LAMPS (Headlight3 bulbs o330
Liv [3‘701 Cis‘oo
PUMPS - FUEL - NEWdi = G,Oaéq

Li #6990  ¢i300 .20

PUMPS - WATER - NEW £ 5'/~j—4

L 1%.99 clidien
PUMPS - WATER —-REBUILT 14 |p .58 D

L\g7.0 ¢! 0.9~
RUBBER PRODUCTS -/-belis) hoscs, clampsg pbCAR3
Ll g .d4 Ci28,0%
SHOCK ABSORBERS -. R
PLL&6.SE  Clag.05
SPARK PLUGS - Regular, resisterf Rl 5T,
cig.5 ! C) 2,20 i 2
TRANSMISSION - automatic overhaul kits 7530
Ll Y125 Cy 130,33
UNIVERSAL JOINTS - _, 2% -5153

LS.y C B Uoe

Invitation For Bid and Bid Form Page 15 of 18

BRAND(S) NAME PER CENT

BID DISCOUNT
Wit X 5
Nadioneal A
| Cloyes 55
el s ks
Generd Wire 51
East [Zan Ug
Aide Lide 4
Phidli ps U2
Delphi 4
Gmi 48

Cavrdene Ui

C;&les 5‘5{
KY B L7
Ale Deleo 5¢f
Ploneer Yl
b 54

Bidder's Im’ﬁalw



SAMPLE PRICING SHEET

The items listed below should be priced showing current price, discount and net price after using discount
offered on the proceeding pages. Brand(s) number should also be shown. This is a sample price sheet for
evaluation purposes, and should indicate actual prices.
DESCRIPTION LIST LESS % NET

PRICE DISCOUNT AMOUNT

Brakes - 1 Set (one axle) §5-7574-X
metallic brake pads with premium lining

BrandpDP NO.WD LAY $ Q)Ol\qq . 50 o g Sl-chf

1 Set (one axle) $5-8269-X
metallic brake pads with premium lining

mand PP NoDXDIUSH 56899 50 4 5 3491

1 Set (one axle) $S-7950-X
metallic brake pads with premium lining

Brand pbp No. PXD\GH?H $ 7L[‘Lidi . bo o g 3‘7',2'4

Muffler and sealing clamps for a 2006 Ford % Ton 4WD 541

16 254 G2 99 (3 710,77
Brand A P No. H R 1A $§ 389 - . % $ /. 5]

Clutch and Pressure Plates -

14" Rebuilt clutch disc, 1-1/2" ten spline with H.D. organic lining

part # E1023
Brand H (L. No.RCAD 47{9(54% $ §?0‘73 . q O % $ 35‘,—;' Lz“-,f
71.60 CorE
14" Rebuilt cluich disc 1-1/2" ten spline with H.D. ceramic buttons
Part # E1023CB6 ’ ;
RLILSe6UOX as) 651,87 HO 294,12

Brand HCL No.R(;lco%(o{go‘IXCDfese‘) $ 551.50 - 40 % $ 3%0.90

71 .80 CalE

Oil filter for 2007 International DT466 (wix 57744)
Brand (N [ ¥ No. 34744 XD $ /Q(D-qq- 706 % h 9?5—'6.?

Batteries - Group 31 with 200 RC or more 1250 CCA or more,

with 3§En;)2tiwarranty. L HbP30 /90, ?? /8 99, 3]
Brand [o.n No. 3\ HDS 230 $/90.99 - 4% Yo $ 3/
Alternator - 2001 Crown Vic. 213-3130

Brand f £E- No.1145 A $ ;284.?? - "/C} % $ /45: 3(7{
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Oil Filters 2007 Impala NAPA 1522

Brand U\Jlx No.%%‘j-(;l;l $ \'))‘/5‘3[ - 75 % $ 5r55
Air Filters 2005 International DT466 (wix 46870)

Brand W1 X No.&&870 $ ILI'ZC"T 76 -, $ 355_‘;
NOTE:

Bidder is encouraged to offer discount from list prices’ on other low value commonly used { Red L:hﬂ)
miscellancous automotive supplies and repair parts. List below the catalogs and/or price sheets and numbers and

the percent discount that would apply.
Ot

WiX — R§ss22mp H4.dd - 0% 51,77
Ot
Wix - R35%12mP HoUA - LoYe t 1.7
WX - B53us 2679 -59%  4g.56
th~ﬁ‘3ﬂgmq 1.5% - 599, $ 3,13
FRT Rotor
Brake b The - 5HOLO  7%99 - 50/, 35,3
CxDIUE
GRY -~ %’;&mm\ ¢ Yool 149 - 5% $ 2543
wire Set _
Bow - aane 0.9%- 599,  $au.7d
ufPr Pedl Join-t o0
Ainia - PR 8LTS 2%.9 — 1de/y, D6
pwor Ball o ]
W - Sseee 30T - 44%%  $170b
Fenco- R513137 14594 - 47%  $711.%4
Avle Shutkass ‘ —
RDY  — AX-36I19 1 7,94 i e $45H6
gt Loo lant Temp _ -
wells- 56 (L - Yo/, B,eR
E‘{‘G}VO — %QOO“‘? /.99 — L/?SO/O ¥ 5,75
[)WJ%LWQ‘;E’.QV'M\.") $ . )
Gaa'dmm; aLoaL%&P 6999 — 5) % 3o
0L Sieertiney Presiliejjc e .
Plews/lfo\elmanm - %n??);/ %9’5%.5% - r‘-[g‘% + 23,15
— W e Bigahe ]
Wieo — ;Ep;;:;_g'p_o 939 ~ Gl % $3.63
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JEFFERSON COUNTY

DEPARTMENT OF ADMINISTRATIVE SERVICES
729 MAPLE ST /PO BOX 100

HILLSBORO MO 63050

WWW JEFFCOMO.ORG

Invitation for Bid: AUTOMOTIVE PARTS AND SUPPLIES

Date Issued:

2014

BIDS SHALL BE ACCEPTED UNTIL: TUESDAY, APRIL 8, 2014, AT 2:00 P.M. LOCAL TIME.

Specification
Contact:

Contract
Contact:

Mail (3) Three
Complete Copies
With Vendor And
Bid Information As
Shown In Sample:

Contract Term:

UPON APPROVAL OF THE
COUNTY COUNCIL AND
COUNTY EXECUTIVE

Vendor
Information:

Invitation For Bid and Bid Form

JASON JONAS
Department of Public Works
636-797-5369
jjonas@jeffcomo.org

VICKIE PRATT
Department of Administrative Services
636-797-5382

SAMPLE ENVELOPE
VENDOR NAME
FENDOR ADDRESS
CONTACT NUMBER DEPARTMENT OF THE COUNTY CLERK

JEFFERSON COUNTY MISSOURI

729 MAPLE ST /PO BOX 100

HILISBORO MO 63050-0100
SEALED BID: (BID NAME)

The undersigned certifies that he/she has the authority to bind this company in an
agreement/contract to supply the commodity or service in accordance with all terms,
conditions, and pricing specified. This Bid, if accepted, will constitute an Agreement and
Contract with Jefferson County, Missouri, upon approval of the County Council and County
Executive. Prices are firm during this agreement term, unless agreed upon in writing by the
County. The County has the option to renew this agreement at the same terms and conditions
as the original agreement for one additional one-year term with the written consent of the
successful Bidder, Price increases for renewals are not authorized unless approved in writing

by BRERYYAUTOMOTIVE STORES, INC.
dba O'REILLY AUTO PARTS \(&nrzssa Cres N
Authorized Agent (Print)

Company Name

233 e rson

Address ignature

Sr!txswg;\ %ch MO SB0A _ Bid ﬂma_@us+ [/

City/State/¥ip Code

%Lj—h%‘( / #52—32(0’74 x 744 4/& /{4 eéf%/you
probids@oreiliyauto.com On- 90?5.— D899

E-mail Fax #

Page 1 0f18
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1.10

1.12

1.13

bid clauses must be clearly noted on the bid form, The County may accept or reject alternate bids; whatever is most advantageous to the
County.

INCORPORATION OF DOCUMENTS:

The terms of the Bid Invitation, Bid Specifications, Bid Form are and shall be incorporated into the contract as if fully setout therein.
The Bid, if accepted and approved by the County Council and County Executive shall constitute the terms of a Contract or Agreement
with Jefferson County, Missouri, subject to any further Amendments, Memoranda or other documents or specifications which must be

set forth in writing and signed by all parties.

ADDENDA:
Addenda to bid specifications are incorporated by reference as if fully setout herein. It is the responsibility of the vendor to insure and
verify that they are in receipt of and completed all attached addenda’s prior to submission of bid forms. Verification is made by

contacting the Office of Contracts and Grants at (636) 797-5382, or by reviewing the County Web Site, (www.jeffcomo.org).

INSURANCE:

The Vendor/Contractor shall purchase and maintain insurance with an insurance company licensed to do business in the State of
Missouri or in the state where the vendor is incorporated or otherwise licensed to do business and which shall remain, at all times during
the term of any contract with the County, in full force and effect. Preference will be given to a Vendor/Contractor who provides
insurance with an insurance company licensed to do business in the State of Missouri, but in any event said Vendor/Contractor shall
provide said insurance at its own expense. Such insurance shall be provided as will protect the Vendor/Contractor from claims which
may arise out of or result from the Vendor/Contractor’s execution of the work, whether such execution be by himself, his employees,
agents, or by anyone for whose acts any of them may be liable. If any such work covered by the Contract is to be performed on County
owned or leased premises, the Vendor agrees to carry liability and workman’s compensation insurance, satisfactory to the County, and to
indemnify the County against all liability, luss, and damage arising out of any injuries to persons and property caused by the Vendor, his
sub-contractors, employees or agents. The insurance coverage shall be such as to fully protect the County and the general public from
any and all claims for injury and damage resulting by any actions on the part of the Vendor/Contractor or its’ forces as enumerated
above. All policies must name the County as an additional insured and provide for thirty (30) days written prior to any material changes
or cancellation, Any disputes regarding a breach, insurance amounts, liabilily, coverage, lapse or otherwise shall be litigated in the
Circuit Court of Jefferson County, Missouri and the same shall be incorporated into any Contract agreed to by the parties.

THE COUNTY REQUIRES A CURRENT AND VALID CERTIFICATE OF INSURANCE OR BINDER SHOWING REQUIRED
INSURANCE COVERAGE MUST BE PROVIDED WITH EACH BID. JEFFERSON COUNTY MUST BE ADDED AS AN
ADDITIONAL INSURED AFTER AWARD OF THE BID. ANY LAPSE TN INSURANCE COVERAGE OR CANCELLATION
THEREOF BY THE CONTRACTOR OR SUB-CONTRACTORS DURING THE TERMS OF THE CONTRACT SHALL
IMMEDIATELY BE DEEMED A MATERIAE BREACH UNDER THE TERMS OF ANY CONTRACT.

A. (X )Required ( ) Not Required  Comprehensive General Liability Insurance

The Vendor/Contracter shall maintain and keep in full force and effect during the terms of this Contract such comprehensive
general liability insurance as shall protect them from claims which may arise from operations under this Contract, whether such
operations be by themselves or by anyone directly or indirectly employed by them. The amounts of insurance shall be not less
than $1,000.000.00 combined single limit for any one oceurrence covering both bodily injury and property damage, including
accidental death.

~B.__(X)Required { ) Not Required Professional Liability Insurance

e p?

' ~ e g
The Vendor/Contractor shall provide the County with proof of Professionat T-iability Insurance, whittrshallprotect the County
_against any and all claims, whick might avise-as# 10 of the operation of the Vendor/Contractor in fultilling the terms Bt
Contract during Eh__g:_ﬁfu)ﬁ*ﬂ'fé" Tantract. The minimum ameunts of such insurance will be $1 ,000,000.00. Should any work be

_ﬂg}ﬂmete’d‘,"ﬂwse limits will also apply.
L A————

C. (X )Required ( ) Nol Required Worker’s Compensation Insurance:
per Missouri Revised Statutes Chapter 287

The Vendor/Contractor or his sub-contractor or contractors, shall maintain and keep in force of this Contract such worker's
compensation insurance limits as required by the statues of the Stale of Missouri and Employer's Liability with limits no less
than $500,000.00.

BID SUBMISSIONS )
Bids submitted on separate forms are NOT acceptable unless specified in the Bid Document, Failure to complete bid forms to the

satisfaction of the County may result in rejection of your bid. It is the responsibility of each Bidder before submitting a bid to examine

Invitation For Bid and Bid Form Page 4 of 18 Bidder's Initials:\gﬂ/



1.14

1.15

2.0

2.1

22

2.3

ﬂi“PRTCE.

~“Tocati

ALL documents thoroughly, and request written or oral interpretation of clarifications soon after discovering any conflicts, ambiguities,
errois, or omissions in the bidding documents. Request for clarification must be received prior to bid openings.

BID OPENINGS
Bids will be publicly opened and read aloud at the time indicated on page [. The Bidders and the public are invited but not required to

attend the formal opening of the bids. No decisions relating to the award of a contract or agreement will be made at the opening,

BID TABULATIONS
Bid Tabuiations are not available for 5 to 7 business days fellowing the Bid Opening. Bid submissions are open for public review at the

time of the Bid Opening. Bid tabulations are posted on the County’s web-site address, www.jeffcomo.ore. NO COPIES of bid
tabulations are sent to vendors.

BID RESPONSE AND CONTRACT

BIDDER REPRESENTATIONS:
The Bidder, by executing the Bid form certifies that:
A. The bid complies with Invitation for Bid form and Bid Specifications.
B. Bidder is not debarred or suspended from participation in Federal Assistance programs.

TAXES:
No bid or proposal shall be awarded by Jefferson County unless the prospective Bidder provides proof that the Bidder does not owe

delinquent real or personal property taxes to Jefferson County, The prospective Bidder is required to provide proof in the form of an
original paid tax receipt issued by the Jefferson County Collector or a verified affidavit stating that the applicant does not own any real
or personal property in Jefferson County, Tax receipts for the past 3 years are required and may be obtained at
hitp:/fjeffersonmo.devnetwedge.com/ or a notarized affidavit stating that the applicant does not own any real or personal property in

Jefferson County on company letterhead.

Section 135.040 of the Jefferson County Code of Ordinances {Ord. No. 10-0411) requires that ne bid or
proposal shall be awarded by Jefferson County unless the prospective Bidder provides proof that the Bidder does
net owe delinquent real or personal property, or that the Bidder does not own any real or personal property in
Jefferson County. All delinquent real or personal property taxes shall be paid, in-full, prior to the award of any
bid, or proof shall be provided that the Bidder does not ewn any real or personal property in Jefferson County
prior to the award of any bid. Jefferson County considers that the failure to pay any and all real or personal
property taxes due Jefferson County, Missouri, the failure to report all real or personal property awned, held or
used in Jefferson County, the failure to provide proof thereof, and/or the failure to keep said tax bills current shall
be deemed a material breach of the confract and will subject the contract to immediate cancellation. All taxes, due
and owing, must be paid in full at the time the bid is awarded by Jefferson County and remain paid during the
entire term of the contract unless the prospective Bidder provides proof that the Bidder dees not own real or
personal property in Jefferson County. This requirement shall not apply to the award of bids for projects which
are tunded in whole or in part by Federal funds.

CERTIFICATION OF INDEPENDENT PRICE DETERMINATION:
A. The prices in the bid shall be independently determined, without consultation, communication, or agreement for the purpose of

restricting competition as to any matter relating to price with any Bidder or other person.
B. Unless otherwise required by law, the prices shall not have been knowingly disclosed by the Bidder prior to opening,
C. No attempt has been made or will be made by the Bidder to induce any other person or firm to submit or not to

submit a bid.

The price(s) specified in this bid shall be firm and not subject to contingency or reservation. If the Vendor fails to honor stated prices as

ubmitted in the Bid Form or Contract, the County reserves the right to obtain the same items from the next IO‘WUECI
a bid price for the ~—Fhe-odginalo 1 shall be responsible for the difference in price and required-te: testitution to the
gsanT

County for the difference in price. The Bidder represents priced Sikmificd-nethe-titdinet-excead.current selling price for the same or
substantially similar good or service, and 43 or lower than other prices charged to the Bidder’s most favoréd tustomes—In
the event the stated prices.are~defermined to be higher than the prices for which Supplier has sold the items, or services, to others, this
contragt.priecshall be reduced accordingly, Bid prices are ALL INCLUSIVE: (Shipping, Handling, Delivery, and Assembly to
ons specified by the County). Prices shall be firm for ALL County departments and locations for term of the agreement.

2.5

MISSOURI DOMESTIC PRODUCT PROCUREMENTACT:

’{’ D'\Smﬂwﬁfﬁﬁa%inrﬁ Qimn ‘pi ' ‘FT)r Waggibhm ot PMOCI . Ridder's lnitials:@‘/

ER
N

\ngb' Wit industy Pluchrodions . Diae 4o
W\ &?La‘- oy n\tht?'ufm Pl @&%ﬂ&g no ‘uzg?pnu Ur\wn%ﬂ# mri’.



2.15

2.16

2.17

2.18

2.19

Supplier shall not enter into any subcontract(s) in excess of $25,000 or 20% of this contract price; whichever is less, for any goods
without County's prior written approval.

CHOICE OF LAW:
This bid and contract shall be governed and interpreted according to the laws of the State of Missouri. Venue for any court action shall

be in Jefferson County, Missouri.

TERMINATION: :
A. General: Performance of work may be terminated by the County in whole, or from time to time in part, whenever County

shall determine that such termination is in the best interests of County with a thirty (30) day written notice. The Vendor may

terminate the Agreement/Contract upon a " 2day prior notice in writing. Ie=the-suent-of-any=tesmination—of-tme
Agreement/Contract by the Yendorethe-G ..m,‘ AR e se-such-suppliesandfomservices-similardathoseterminatedsand=for

—theduration of the Agreement/Cantract-periad-thedendorwilt-betubie-foratreosnrmescesseftheestablished-eonizact-pricing,

B. Bankruptcy or Insolvency: In the event bankruptcy proceedings are commenced by or against Supplier or under any
provisions of the United States Bankruptcy Act or for the appointment of a receiver or trustee or a general assignment for the
benefit of creditors of either party, County shall be entitled to terminate without further cost or liability. The County may cancel
the Agreement/Contract or affirm the Contract and hold the Vendor responsible for damages.

C. Section 135,040 of the Jefferson County Code of Ordinances (Ord. No. 10-0411) requires that no bid or proposal
shall be awarded by Jefferson Counfy unless the prospective Bidder provides proof that the Bidder does not owe
delinquent real or personal property, or that the Bidder does not own any real or personal property in Jeffersont
County, All delinquent real or personal property taxes shall be paid, in-full, prior to the award of any bid, or proof
shall be provided that the Bidder does not own any real or persenal property in Jefferson County prior to the
award of any bid. Jefferson County considers that the failure to pay any and all real or personal property taxes
due Jefferson County, Missouri, the failure to report 2Hl real or personal property owned, held or used in Jefferson
County, the failure to provide proof thereof, and/or the failure to keep said tax bills current shall be deemed a
material breach of the contract and will subject the contract to immediate cancellation, All taxes, due and owing,
must be paid in full at the time the bid is awarded by Jefferson County and remain paid during the entire term of
the contract unless the prospective Bidder provides proof that the Bidder does not own real or personal property in
Jefferson County, This requirement shall not apply to the award of bids for projects which are funded in whole or
in part by Federal funds.

D. Default: County may terminate the whole Contract or any part in either of the following circumstances:

D-1.If supplier fails to deliver the items required by the contract within the time specified; or

D-2.If suppiier fails to perform any of the other provisions of the contract, or so fails to make progress as to endanger
performance of the contract in accordance with its terms, and in either of these two circumstances does not cure such
failure within a period of ten (10) days after notice from Counly specifying such failure. In the event of termination
under subparagraph 1, County shall have the right to procure, on such terms and in such manner as it may deem
appropriate, items s:ml}ar to those terminated, and=to~rscover~from=Supplict=themexcasseconttbir-such=smmiar-term
providedhoweVET, Supplier shall not be liable for such excess costs where the failure upen which the termination is
based has arisen out of causes beyond the control of Supplier and without the fault or negligence of Supplier, Such
causes shall be deemed to include fires, floods, earthquakes, strikes, and acts of the public enemy. The righis of County
provided in subparagraph 1 shall be in addition to any other rights provided by law or the contract,

D-3.1n the event of the Supplier's non-compliance with the provisions as set forth, this Contract may be cancelled, terminated
or suspended in whole or in part and the supplier may be declared ineligible for further County contracts. The rights and
remedies of the County provided in this paragraph shall not be exclusive but are in addition to any remedies provided in
this Contract or as provided for by law.

NOTICE AND SERVICE THEREOF:
Any notice from the County shall be in writing and considered delivered and the scrvice thereof completed when said notice is posted,
by certified or regular mail, to the Supplier, at the address stated on the bid form.

CONTRACT TERM;

Performance shall be governed solely by the terms and conditions as set forth in the Invitation for Bid, Bid Specifications, Bid Form and
the Coniract notwithstanding any language contained on any invoice, shipping order, bill of lading or other document furnished the
Seller at any time and the acceptance by the County for any goods furnished.

COMPLIANCE WITH APPLICABLE LAWS:

Supplier warrants it has complied with all applicable laws, rules and ordinances of the United States, Missouri or any other
Governmental authority or agency in the manufacture or sale of the goods, including but not limited to all provisions of the Fair Labor

Invitation For Bid and Bid Form FPage 7 of 18 Bidder's Initials: &@/



If you charge for delivery service.

State amount: $ - per delivery.
Minimum order required?  YES NO / $
What are your regular business hours?

OPEN CLOSE

Monday 3D am. _Q_____P.M
Tuesday 150D =
Wednesday 120 4
Thursday 130D 9
Friday o 9
Saturday 130 Of
Sunday oS 4

NO/

In emergency, can we call you after regular hours? YES

If yes, name party to call:

—

Telephone Number - — -

GENERAL

Pricing is based on pick-up at vendor's place of business.

Contract shall be based on net price resulting from percentage discount from ‘&
—tigto

Bidder must supply the County with a toll free telephone number for placing orders,

Dao not use chain discounts; show one discount only.

Price increase/decrease by the manufacturer will be allowed under this contract; however, the percentage

Invitation For Bid and Bid Form Page 12 of 18 Bidder's lni:ials\vée/



discount shall remain the same. Ihe-@@untgz.shal.l-be-net;é" Hee-inerease-ondagreass, PWE. Ho e
fAumbuer of muhuﬁo.c.’rurz (s VLpresinted by O Euih{ ,nohu mmu. Lhd.nga!..als nok ayailable

Current-JOBBER-BEHWE-SHEE R prive-tistswiti-be required-te-be-on-file at the County. Tnie will ba avedlable

onling
Vendor is instructed to contact Jason Jonas, P.E., Director of Public Works (636) 797-5369, regarding any and

all questions concerning this contract.

OBSOLESCENCE PROGRAM

Supplier shall provide a program to review County inventory stock every 6 months. Parts for vehicles or
equipment which are no longer needed, are out of date, or obsolete shall be taken back for exchange for current

stock needs.

TERM OF CONTRACT
This contract will remain in effect for 12 months from the date of acceptance.
CONTRACT RENEWAL
The County of Jefferson reserves the right to renew this contract for another 12 month period at the same
discounts, terms and conditions.
TECHNICAL SPECIFICATIONS & DISCOUNT SHEET

AUTOMOTIVE PARTS - SUPPLIES

Brands bid should be of equal quality to original equipment manufacturer. Bidder shall complete spaces
provided for brands bid and percentage discount from sanufactusess-list price. Bidder may insert more than

one brand per item, if desired.

The County has maintenance sheds at the following locations:
2960 Lee Pyle Road off Hwy 67 south of 110 in DeSoto.
5275 Hwy B in Hillsboro

6460 Hwy MM in House Springs

355 Elm in Hillsboro

Invitation For Bid and Bid Form Page 13 0f 18 Bidder's Initials\&



Oil Filters 2007 Impala NAPA 1522

Brandl(\“& No. )! “zéa $ Lﬂlr_” - ‘—” % $ 50&2

Air Filters 2005 International DT466 (wix 46870)

Brand JAJ| X No. 4’0%'7(3 sTA9 . 1—“ % $ L_)Zaf)msol

NOTE:

Bidder is encouraged to offer discount from list prices' on other low value commonly used
miscellaneous automotive supplies and repair parts. List below the catalogs and/or price sheets and numbers and

the percent discount that would apply.

We offor o discount of list less 4% or bother onoll
oy s e copplels parts ek up and prices,
pleane. vistt wy ot www. firstpallonling ooy
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JEFFERSON COUNTY

DEPARTMENT OF ADMINISTRATIVE SERVICES
729 MAPLE ST/ PO BOX 100

HILLSBORO MO 63050

WWW.JEFFCOMO.ORG
Invitation for Bid: AUTOMOTIVE PARTS AND SUPPLIES  Date Issued: 3-12-14
2014

BIDS SHALL BE ACCEPTED UNTIL: TUESDAY, APRIL 8, 2014. AT 2:00 P.M. LOCAL TIME.

Specification
Contact:

Contract
Contact:

Mail (3) Three
Complete Copies
With Vendor And
Bid Information As
Shown In Sample:

Contract Term:

UPON APPROYAL OF THE
COUNTY COUNCIL AND
COUNTY EXECUTIVE

VYendor
Information:

Invitation For Bid and Bid Form

JASON JONAS
Department of Public Works
636-797-5369
Jjonas@jeffcomo.org

VICKIE PRATT
Department of Administrative Services
636-797-5382

SAMPLE ENVELOPE

FENDOR NAAME

FENDOR ADDRESS

DEPARTMENT OF THE COUNTY CLERK
JEFFERSON COUNTY MISSCURI

729 MAPLE ST/ PO BOX 100

HILLSBORO MO 63050-8109

CONTACT NUMBER

SEALED BIDH{BID NAA

The undersigned certifies that hefshe has the authority to bind this company in an
agreement/contract to supply the commodity or service in accordance with all terms,
conditions, and pricing specified. This Bid, if accepted, will constitute an Agreement and
Contract with Jefferson County, Missouri, upon approval of the County Council and County
Executive. Prices are firm during this agreement term, unless agreed upon in writing by the
County. The County has the option to renew this agreement at the same terms and conditions
as the original agreement for one additional one-year term with the written consent of the
successful Bidder, Price increases for renewals are not authorized unless approved in writing

by the County. / i
Jieoma foed T, /Jﬁﬁe{:/« S A5 /

Company Name , Author 1z%ant {Print)
7

(525 W A w77 /(,2,__,5 ;
Address ! Signature
/é‘/é}f’c:d@#fd&»’m f% éfﬁ%? ;gxé’f /772%’/%/ TER
‘City/State/Zip Code Tlt e
éjw %9‘{”?&?{@ O6- 877 "7%/546'296/72_7'
Telephﬂne # Date Ta_x 1D #
@ St It Comt 34 LS -HS
‘E-mail Fax #
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Oil Filters 2007 Impala NAPA 1522

Braon%?/ No.//:ZJ{/:‘)*/ $ gﬁ . (ﬁ'/?%/“ $ ‘”j/g;&_

Air Filters 2005 International DT466 (wix 46870)

ot b w0 f)778 7T A 55T

NOTE:

Bidder is encouraged to offer discount from list prices' on other low value commonly used
miscellaneous automotive supplies and repair parts. List below the catalogs and/or price sheets and numbers and

the percent discount that would apply. )
' RS ;. ; &
%Zz%/aﬁ%f{ briree o)L - A5%
A~ A5H
— 7ot
sy REET
SLEL LD S
VA i e I 7 Ve oA S o
i -
7 /7/ :‘; 4 e (/ . AT ’3"—:’: i "/;-';f-/? 1V gy 7—
77 /é’?j}f__ AT A (S e e W
3 7 ¥ , ra =

(Vo e Coner e llpd — 5%
| wless - A5

BV i = Y a7 e
/ —Tesncon)  fvE sk
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