HIGHWAY STRIPING BID TABULATION

HIGHWAY STRIPING
BID TABULATION

BID OPENING AMERICA'S PARKING
3-29-07 REMARKING PARK-MARK INC.
ACRYLIC WATERBORNE PAINT
15 MILS 4" PVT MKG ~ WHITE LINE $0.0499 $0.0615
15 MILS 4" PVT MKG ~ YELLOW LINE $0.0499 $0.0615
15 MILS 4" PVT MKG ~ YELLOW DASHED LINE $0.0499 $0.0615
RIGHT/LEFT/STRAIGHT ARROWS $25.00 $30.00
COMBINATION ARROWS $30.00 $30.00
RXR CROSSING $150.00 $100.00
YIELD BARS $150.00 $50.00
STOP BARS PER SQ. FT. $0.50 $1.00
CROSS WALKS PER SQ. FT. $0.50 $1.00
VOC COMPLIANT ACRYLIC COPOLYMER
TRAFFIC PAINT
15 MILS 4" PVT MKG ~WHITE LINE $0.0549 $0.0615
15 MILS 4" PVT MKG ~ YELLOW LINE $0.0549 $0.0615
15 MILS 4" PVT MKG ~ YELLOW DASHED LINE $0.0549 $0.0615
RIGHT/LEFT/STRAIGHT ARROWS $25.00 $30.00
COMBINATION ARROWS $30.00 $30.00
RXR CROSSING $150.00 $100.00
YIELD BARS $150.00 $50.00
STOP BARS PER SQ. FT. $0.50 $1.00
CROSS WALKS PER SQ. FT. $0.50 $1.00
EXTRUDED THERMOPLASTIC PAVEMENT
MARKING (NEW PAVEMENT)
15 MILS 4" PVT MKG ~WHITE LINE NO BID $0.45
15 MILS 4" PVT MKG ~ YELLOW LINE NO BID $0.45
15 MILS 4" PVT MKG ~ YELLOW DASHED LINE NO BID $0.45
RIGHT/LEFT/STRAIGHT ARROWS NO BID $50.00
COMBINATION ARROWS NO BID $50.00
RXR CROSSING NO BID $200.00
YIELD BARS NO BID $100.00
STOP BARS PER SQ. FT. NO BID $2.00
CROSS WALKS PER SQ. FT. NO BID $2.00
EXTRUDED THERMOPLASTIC PAVEMENT
MARKING (OLD PAVEMENT)
15 MILS 4" PVT MKG ~WHITE LINE NO BID $0.45
15 MILS 4" PVT MKG ~ YELLOW LINE NO BID $0.45
15 MILS 4" PVT MKG ~ YELLOW DASHED LINE NO BID $0.45
RIGHT/LEFT/STRAIGHT ARROWS NO BID $50.00
COMBINATION ARROWS NO BID $50.00
RXR CROSSING NO BID $200.00
YIELD BARS NO BID $100.00
STOP BARS PER SQ. FT. NO BID $2.00
CROSS WALKS PER SQ. FT. NO BID $2.00
PRE-FORMED THERMOPLASTIC PAVEMENT
MARKING
4" PVT MKG ~WHITE LINE $1.25 $1.85
4" PVT MKG ~ YELLOW LINE $1.25 $1.85
4" PVT MKG ~ YELLOW DASHED LINE $1.25 $1.85
SINGLE ARROWS $155.00 $250.00
COMBINATION ARROWS $225.00 $350.00
RXR $625.00 $500.00
YIELD BARS $235.00 $300.00
STOP BARS PER SQ. FT. $3.91 $6.00
CROSS WALKS PER SQ. FT. $3.91 $6.00
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HIGHWAY STRIPING
BID TABULATION
BID OPENING AMERICA'S PARKING
3-29-07 REMARKING PARK-MARK INC.
MILLING/REMOVING OLD THERMOPLASTIC
4" PVT. MGK. LINE $0.50 $0.50
SINGLE ARROWS $20.00 $50.00
COMBINATION ARROWS $30.00 $75.00
RXR CROSSING $50.00 $150.00
YIELD BARS $40.00 $250.00
STOP BARS PER SQ. FT. $1.00 $3.00
CROSS WALKS PER SQ. FT. $1.00 $3.00
REMOVAL OF ACRYLIC WATERBORNE OR
ACRYLIC COPOLYMER PAYMENT MARKING
MILLING
4" PVT. MGK. LINE $0.50 $0.40
SINGLE $20.00 $35.00
COMBINATION ARROWS $30.00 $50.00
RXR CROSSING $50.00 $200.00
YIELD BARS $40.00 $150.00
STOP BARS PER SQ. FT. $1.00 $2.00
CROSS WALKS PER SQ. FT. $1.00 $2.00
HYDRO BLASTING
4" PVT. MGK. LINE NO BID $0.40
SINGLE NO BID $35.00
COMBINATION ARROWS NO BID $50.00
RXR CROSSING NO BID $200.00
YIELD BARS NO BID $150.00
STOP BARS PER SQ. FT. NO BID $2.00
CROSS WALKS PER SQ. FT. NO BID $2.00
REMOVAL EPOXY PAVEMENT MARKING
MILLING
4" PVT. MGK. LINE $0.50 $0.65
SINGLE $20.00 $50.00
COMBINATION ARROWS $30.00 $75.00
RXR CROSSING $50.00 $300.00
YIELD BARS $40.00 $200.00
STOP BARS PER SQ. FT. $1.00 $3.50
CROSS WALKS PER SQ. FT. $1.00 $3.50
HYDRO BLASTING
4" PVT. MGK. LINE NO BID $0.65
SINGLE NO BID $50.00
COMBINATION ARROWS NO BID $75.00
RXR CROSSING NO BID $300.00
YIELD BARS NO BID $200.00
STOP BARS PER SQ. FT. NO BID $3.50
CROSS WALKS PER SQ. FT. NO BID $3.50

BID BOND AMOUNT $15,000.00 $15,000.00

COMMENTS:




