LAW ENFORCEMENT UNIFORMS BID TABULATION

LAW ENFORCEMENT UNIFORMS

Short Sleeve Duty Shirt White 100% Polyester,
Button Front Closure

BID OPENING ROBINSON HEROS IN IMAGE
4-10-07 TEXTILES INC STYLE LEON UNIFORM SOLUTIONS
Short Sleeve Shirt Silvertan w/ Brown Epaulets
& Pocket Flaps
HORACE
Manufacture NO BID SMALL SOUTHEASTERN HS 1252
S- XL NO BID $36.99 $36.25 $33.09
2XL NO BID $39.99 $39.75 $39.71
3XL NO BID $43.99 $39.75 $39.71
4XL NO BID $47.99 $47.25 $39.71
Long Sleeve Shirt Silvertan w/ Brown Epaulets
& Pocket Flaps
HORACE
Manufacture NO BID SMALL SOUTHEASTERN HS 1152
145-17.5 NO BID $38.99 $39.95 $35.84
18-18.5 NO BID $42.99 $43.95 $43.01
19 NO BID $46.99 $43.95 $43.01
20 NO BID $46.99 $46.95 $43.01

Short Sleeve Duty Shirt White 100% Polyester,
Button Front Closure

HORACE MAKE LIKE HS
Manufacture NO BID SMALL ELBECO 1252
145-17.5 NO BID $36.99 $42.25 $35.60
18- 20 NO BID $39.99 $46.25 $42.72
22 NO BID $47.99 $50.25 $42.72

Class A Duty Trousers Brown 13 0z. 100% Visa
Polyester, Elastique Quarter Top Pockets &
Keystone Belt Loops

HORACE MAKE LIKE HS
Manufacture NO BID SMALL ELBECO 1152
145-17.5 NO BID $36.99 $44.95 $38.80
18- 20 NO BID $39.99 $49.95 $46.56
22 NO BID $53.95 $53.95 $46.56

Womens Class A Duty Trousers Brown 13 o0z.
100% Visa Polyester, Elastique Western Top
Pockets & Keystone Belt Loops

HORACE
Manufacture NO BID SMALL FECHHEIMER HS 2138
28 - 42 NO BID $46.99 $47.50 $52.94
44 - 50 NO BID $51.99 $51.50 $61.53
52 - 54 NO BID $54.99 $55.50 $61.53

Brown Light Weight Bomber Jacket B-Dry
Waterproof / Breathable Inner Barrier Taslan
Outershell and Zip-Out B-Warm Liner

HORACE
Manufacture NO BID SMALL FECHHEIMER HS 2200
4-18 NO BID $46.99 $47.50 $52.94
20 - 24 NO BID $51.99 $51.50 $61.53

HORACE
Manufacture NO BID SMALL BLAUER HS 3316
S-XL NO BID $115.99 $120.00 $172.48
2XL NO BID $122.99 $132.00 $206.98
3XL NO BID $132.99 $144.00 $206.98




LAW ENFORCEMENT UNIFORMS BID TABULATION

LAW ENFORCEMENT UNIFORMS

Brown Clip-on Uniform Tie 100% Textured
Polyester w/ Buttonholes

BID OPENING ROBINSON HEROS IN IMAGE
4-10-07 TEXTILES INC STYLE LEON UNIFORM SOLUTIONS

Brown Straw Campaign Hat Triple Brim
Manufacture NO BID STRAHON ALBOUM NO BID
6.5-8 NO BID $73.95 $75.00 NO BID

Brown Felt Campaign Hat Triple Brim
Manufacture NO BID STRAHON ALBOUM NO BID
6.5-8 NO BID $85.99 $84.00 NO BID
3 Piece Kentucky Style Hat Strap

Manufacture NO BID STRAHON ALBOUM NO BID
One Size NO BID $5.80 $7.00 NO BID

Campaign/Lawman Style Rain Hat Cover
Manufacture NO BID STRAHON ALBOUM NO BID
All NO BID $5.95 $6.00 NO BID

ANSI Class 3 Reversible Raincoat Black / Hi-
Vis Yellow w/ Scotchlite Striping and
Removable Hood

SAMUEL
Manufacture NO BID BROOME BROOME NO BID
14.5" Short NO BID $4.00 $4.50 NO BID
18" Regular NO BID $4.00 $4.50 NO BID
20" Long NO BID $5.00 $5.50 NO BID

Black BDU Cargo Trousers 65/35% Polyester /
Cotton Rip-Stop Fabric

Manufacture NO BID SPIEWAK SPIEWAK NO BID
S-XL NO BID $74.99 $70.00 NO BID
2XL NO BID $79.99 $77.00 NO BID
3XL NO BID $84.99 $84.00 NO BID

15/16" Full Color Enamel Missouri Seal with
Clutch Back Attachment, Silver or Gold

Manufacture NO BID PROPPER PROPPER HS 2348
S-XL NO BID $31.99 $33.00 $41.54
2XL NO BID $33.99 $37.00 $49.85
3XL NO BID $35.99 $40.00 $49.85

Manufacture

NO BID

PREMIER

LEON

NO BID

15/16"

Tie Clasp Sheriff Dept Star w/Brown Enamel
Available in Silver or Gold Finish

NO BID

$4.99

$10.00

NO BID

Manufacture NO BID PREMIER HOOKFAST NO BID
Silver NO BID $6.50 $6.50 NO BID
Gold NO BID $6.50 $7.00 NO BID
J.C. Silver Collar Brass - Clutch Back
SMITH &
Manufacture NO BID WARREN SMITH WARREN NO BID
9/16" NO BID $5.25 $6.00 NO BID
J.C. Gold Collar Brass - Clutch Back
SMITH &
Manufacture NO BID WARREN SMITH WARREN NO BID
9/16" NO BID $5.85 $6.00 NO BID
S.0. Silver Collar Brass - Clutch Back 9/16"
SMITH &
Manufacture NO BID WARREN SMITH WARREN NO BID
9/16" NO BID $5.25 $6.00 NO BID




LAW ENFORCEMENT UNIFORMS BID TABULATION

LAW ENFORCEMENT UNIFORMS

Black 8" Duty Boots

BID OPENING ROBINSON HEROS IN IMAGE
4-10-07 TEXTILES INC STYLE LEON UNIFORM SOLUTIONS
S.0. Gold Collar Brass - Clutch Back 9/16"
SMITH &
Manufacture NO BID WARREN SMITH WARREN NO BID
9/16" NO BID $5.85 $6.00 NO BID
Male Clarino Oxford Shoes
Manufacture NO BID THOROGOOD BATES NO BID
All Sizes NO BID $72.99 $79.00 NO BID
Female Durashock Clarino Oxford Shoes
Manufacture NO BID THOROGOOD BATES NO BID
All Sizes NO BID $72.99 $79.00 NO BID

Female Black 8" Duty Boots

HITEL
Manufacture NO BID MAGNUM ROCKY NO BID
ALL NO BID $64.99 $65.00 NO BID

Basketweave Velcro Duty Belt 2.25"

HITEL
Manufacture NO BID MAGNUM ROCKY NO BID
ALL NO BID $64.99 $65.00 NO BID

BOSTON
Manufacture NO BID LEATHER G+G NO BID
26 - 44 NO BID $49.99 $53.00 NO BID
46 NO BID $59.99 $62.00 NO BID
48 NO BID $59.99 $62.00 NO BID
50 NO BID $59.99 $62.00 NO BID
e B ] R e ——
Basketweave Velcro Inner Belt 1.5"
Manufacture NO BID BOSTON G+G NO BID
S-XL NO BID $28.99 $32.00 NO BID
2XL NO BID $34.99 $35.00 NO BID
e B ] R e ——
Basketweave L2 Retention Holster
Manufacture NO BID UNCLE MIKE G+G NO BID
Glock 17 NO BID $85.99 $106.00 NO BID
e B ] R e ——
Basketweave Double Magazine Case
Manufacture NO BID BOSTON G+G NO BID
Glock 17 NO BID $27.99 $29.00 NO BID
e B ] R e ——
Basketweave Handcuff Case
Manufacture NO BID BOSTON G+G NO BID
Single NO BID $21.99 $27.00 NO BID
e B ] R B —
Basketweave MK4 OC Spray Case
Manufacture NO BID BOSTON G+G NO BID
MKIV NO BID $15.99 $25.00 NO BID
e B ] R e ——
Basketweave Velcro Glove Pouch
Manufacture NO BID BOSTON G+G NO BID
N/A NO BID $12.99 $15.00 NO BID
e B ] R e ——
Basketweave "D"Cell Flashlight Ring
Manufacture NO BID BOSTON G+G NO BID
"D" Cell NO BID $6.99 $8.50 NO BID
e B ] R e ——
Basketweave Universal Radio Holder
Manufacture NO BID BOSTON DUTYMAN NO BID
Universal NO BID $19.99 $18.00 NO BID
e B ] R e ——
Peerless Model 700 Nickel Chain Handcuffs
Manufacture NO BID PEERLESS PEERLESS NO BID




LAW ENFORCEMENT UNIFORMS BID TABULATION

LAW ENFORCEMENT UNIFORMS

BID OPENING ROBINSON HEROS IN IMAGE
4-10-07 TEXTILES INC STYLE LEON UNIFORM SOLUTIONS
N/A NO BID $25.99 $24.00 NO BID
Sabre Red MKIV 10% Pepper OC Spray 3.3 0z
SECURITY
Manufacture NO BID EQUIP. SABRE NO BID
MKIV NO BID $13.99 $12.00 NO BID
Expandable Baton Holder, Black, Black Weave
21"
Manufacture NO BID BOSTON G+G NO BID
N/A NO BID $14.99 $21.00 NO BID
Metal Frame Nameplates, Gold or Silver,
22/8" X 5/8"1Line
Manufacture NO BID REEVES #50 REEVES NO BID
N/A NO BID $9.99 $10.00 NO BID
Metal Frame Nameplates, Gold or Silver,
2 3/4" X 3/4" 2 Line
Manufacture NO BID REEVES L8 REEVES NO BID
N/A NO BID $9.99 $10.00 NO BID
Professional Duty Visguard Safety Vest
HORACE
Manufacture NO BID SMALL SPIEWAK HS 3338
All NO BID $20.99 $39.00 $31.68

Comments:




