BID TABULATION - PAPER SUPPLIES 2014

QUILL XPEDX SUPPLY OFFICE
PAPER SUPPLIES 2014 CORPORATION CONCEPTS DEPOT
BID OPENING 11-5-13
Contract term:1-1-14 to 12-31-14 upon approval by the 100 scHELTERRD | 2% C%F;:\C/)EATE * | 1585 FENPARKDR | 6600 NORTH MILITARY
County Council and the County Executive LINCOLNSHIRE IL FENTON MO FENTON MO TRAIL
60069 63026 BOCA RATON, FL 33496
63026
e e ) e e | e
SUGGESTED SUGGESTED UNIT OF
CTY ID |ITEM DESCRIPTION USAGE
MANUFACTURE ITEM # MEASURE
BID 50562 Envelopes - Coin Envelopes White Wove - Printmaster, SFI, #5-1/2,
10300 |24, 3-1/8 x 5-1/2, Gummed, Mailpoint Flap (500/Box, 5000/Ctn) Quality Park 5170832 BOX 14 NO BID $27.50 $11.00 $10.77
2256159 Envelope - Booklet Envelopes, 6 x 9, White, #6-1/2, 24, 20M,
10306 |Gummed, Wallet Flap (500/Ctn) National 2256159 BOX 22 $9.99 $12.50 $12.00 $26.92
Envelopes - Catalog Envelopes Brown Kraft OECS - Seville, SFI, #10-1/2, 28, 9
10307 [x 12, Kraft, Vellum, Gummed, Mailpoint Flap (250/Ctn) National 5252741 BOX 40 $9.67 $32.93 $16.95 $11.90
Envelopes - Catalog Envelopes Brown Kraft OECS - #15, 10 x 15, Vellum,
10311 |Gummed, Mailpaint Flap (500/Ctn) National 2198401 BOX 0 NO BID $52.18 $50.75 $70.29
Envelopes - Commercial Envelopes White Wove OSDS Chip Box - #6-3/4, 3-
10313 [5/8 x 6-1/2, White, , Gummed, Commercial Flap (500/Box, 5000/Ctn) National 33933 BOX 2 $6.81 $8.48 $8.50 $5.96
Envelopes - #10 Window, Commercial Window Envelopes, 4-1/8 x 9-1/2,
10314 |White, Gummed, Commercial Flap, Poly Window (500/Box, 2500/Ctn) National 2140238 BOX 190 $8.92 $9.96 $11.90 $7.78
Envelopes - #9 Regular, Commercial Envelopes White, 3-7/8 x 8-7/8,
10315 |Gummed, Commercial Flap (500/Box, 2500/Ctn) National 2139741 BOX 53 $9.07 $8.51 $9.10 $10.85
Envelopes - #10 Regular, Commercial Envelopes White, 4-1/8 x 9-1/2,
10316 |Gummed, Commercial Flap (500/Box, 2500/Ctn) National 2256150 BOX 188 $6.65 $8.69 $9.10 $5.29
Envelopes - #10 Window, Commercial Window Right Hand Envelopes, White,
10317 |4-1/8 x 9-1/2, 14M, Gummed, Commercial Flap, (500/Box, 2500/Ctn) National 2256120 BOX 29 $8.93 $12.22 $13.10 $12.35
Envelopes - #9 Window, Commercial Window Envelopes, White, 3-7/8 x 8-7/8,
10319 [Gummed, Commercial Flap, Poly Window (500/Box, 2500/Ctn) National 2256161 BOX 16 $10.97 $10.13 $11.00 $10.85
Envelopes - Catalog Envelopes Brown Kraft - #6, 7-1/2 x 10-1/2, Gummed,
10322 |Mailpoint Flap (500/Ctn) National 2251406 BOX 1 NO BID $36.20 $33.10 $132.04
10323 |Envelopes - Catalog Envelope, Side Seam, 9 x 12, White, 250/Box National 2215036 BOX 0 | $8.96 $26.12 $14.00 $39.89
Copy Paper - Letter, 92 Brightness, 20lb, White, 500 Sheets/Ream, 10
10700 |Reams/Carton Universal UNV21200 REAM 8604 NO BID $2.95 $2.87 $26.95
10701 |Copy Paper - Letter, 20lb, Pink, 500 Sheets/Ream, 10 Reams/Carton Universal UNV11224 REAM 5 | $3.81 $4.62 $3.99 $3.85
10702 |Copy Paper - Letter, 20lb, Canary, 500 Sheets/Ream, 10 Reams/Carton Universal UNV11201 REAM 110 | $3.81 $4.62 $3.99 $3.85
10703 |Copy Paper - Letter, 20lb, Goldenrod, 500 Sheets/Ream, 10 Reams/Carton Universal UNV11205 REAM 8 | $3.81 $4.62 $3.99 $3.85
10704 |Copy Paper - Letter, 20lb, Green, 500 Sheets/Ream, 10 Reams/Carton Universal UNV11203 REAM 63 | $3.81 $4.62 $3.99 $3.85
10705 |Copy Paper - Letter, 20lb, Blue, 500 Sheets/Ream, 10 Reams/Carton Universal UNV11202 REAM % | $3.81 $4.62 $3.99 $3.85
10706 |Copy Paper - Letter, 20lb., Buff, 500 Sheets/Ream, 10 Reams/Carton Universal UNV11206 REAM 0 | NO BID $4.62 $3.99 $3.85
Copy Paper - Legal, 92 Brightness, 20lb, White, 500 Sheets/Ream, 10
10707 |Reams/Carton Universal UNV24200 REAM 38 $4.53 $4.82 $2.87 $37.98
Copy Paper - 11 x 17, 92 Brightness, 20lb, White, 500 Sheets/Ream, 10
10711 |Reams/Carton Universal UNV28110 REAM 55 $7.41 $7.58 $6.60 $29.68
Letterhead - 8-1/2 x 11, 20lb, White, 91 Bright, Perfect Laser, 25% Cotton
10713 |Fibers, Watermarked, (500/Pkg, 5000/Ctn) Capitol 2085221 REAM 0 $17.07 $11.63 $12.00 $19.31
10800 |Card Stock - Letter, 90#, White, 250 Sheets/Ream, 8 Reams/Carton Springhill 2227280 REAM 86 | NO BID $5.49 $5.95 $3.76
Cover - Letter, 80#, 94 Brightness, Laser Capatible, White, 250 Sheets/Ream,
10802 |8 Reams/Carton Wausau 56981 2276022 REAM 3 NO BID $13.58 $7.90 NO BID
10804 [Card Stock - Letter, 90#, Buff, 250 Sheets/Ream, 8 Reams/Carton Wausau 2288963 REAM 1 | NO BID $5.79 $7.90 $12.63
10805 [Card Stock - Letter, 65#, White, 250 Sheets/Ream, 8 Reams/Carton Finch 2063740 REAM 42 | $10.01 $5.38 $8.90 $12.33
10806 |Card Stock - Letter, 65#, Green, 250 Sheets/Ream, 8 Ream/Carton Wausau 2288007 REAM 19 | $4.54 $5.90 $8.90 $12.33
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10807 |Card Stock - Letter, 110#, Cherry, 250 Sheets/Ream, 8 Reams/Carton Wausau 2262297 REAM 1 | NO BID $6.89 $8.90 NO BID
Card Stock - Astroparche Vellum Cover, 65Ib, Ancient Gold, 8-1/2 x 11,
10810 |250/Pkg Astroparche 60055237 SHEET 250 NO BID $13.95 $12.95 NO BID
NCR Paper - Heavyweight, 20lb, Smooth, 2 Part, Reverse, 8-1/2 x 11 (2/Set,
10900 |500/Pkg, 5000/Ctn) Mead 2063251 REAM 144 NO BID $8.39 $13.00 $189.99
NCR Paper - Heavyweight, 20lb, Smooth, 3 Part, Reverse, 8-1/2 x 11 (500/Pkg,
10901 |5000/Ctn) Mead 2241308 REAM 162 NO BID $9.50 $13.75 $24.12
NCR Paper - Heavyweight, 20lb, Smooth, 4 Part, Reverse, 8-1/2 x 11 (500/Pkg,
10902 |5000/Ctn) Mead 2241305 REAM 349 NO BID $10.13 $14.25 NO BID
10903 |NCR Paper - Heavyweight, 20Ib, 4 Part, Straight, 8-1/2 x 11 (500/Pkg, 5000/Ctn Mead 2216205 REAM 9 | NO BID $10.13 $14.25 NO BID
NCR Paper - Heavyweight, 20lb, 5 Part, Reverse, 8-1/2 x 11 (500/Pkg,
10904 [s000/Ctn Mead 5060750 REAM 5 NO BID $10.40 $14.90 NO BID
NCR Paper - Heavyweight, 20lb, 5 Part, Straight, 8-1/2 x 11 (500/Pkg,
10905 |5000/Ctn) Mead 5062311 REAM 15 NO BID $10.40 $14.90 NO BID
NCR Paper - Heavyweight, 20lb, 2 Part, Reverse, 8-1/2 x 14 (500/Pkg,
10018 |5000/Ctn) Mead 5202999 REAM 13 NO BID $11.62 $15.95 NO BID
NCR Paper - Heavyweight, 20lb, 3 Part, Reverse, 8-1/2 x 14 (500/Pkg,
10019 |5000/Ctn) Mead 2241309 REAM 0 NO BID $13.14 $16.10 NO BID
NCR Paper - Heavyweight, 20lb, 4 Part, Reverse, 8-1/2 x 14, (500/Pkg,
10920 [s000/Ctn Mead 2230434 REAM 74 NO BID $14.02 $16.10 NO BID
10923 [NCR Padding Compound - 1 Gallon, Liquid (4/Ctn) Mead 5000301 GALLON 1 | NO BID $116.96 $10.00 $46.07
Computer Paper - 14 7/8" x 11", 1/2" Green Bar, One-Part, Continuous Feed,
10951 [2500 Sheets Per Ctn IBM 5231088 CARTON 0 NO BID $44.18 $46.20 $26.89
10960 |Crack-N-Peel - 8 1/2" x 11", White, 100/Pkg Fasson 5156903 PACKAGE 0 | NO BID $23.10 $23.00 NO BID
10970 |Padding Compound - 1 Gallon, White, 4/Carton SKH 2040908 GALLON 0 | NO BID $18.90 $25.00 NO BID
10971 |Padding Compound - 1 Gallon, Red, 4/Carton Color 5077953 GALLON 0 NOBID $18.90 $25.00 NOBID
Paper - 3 Hole Punch, Letter, 20#, 92 Bright, Smooth, Left, White, 500
10972 |Sheets/Ream, 10 Reams/Carton International Paper 2251795 REAM 170 $3.94 $3.79 $3.55 $37.77
Color Copy Paper - Letter, 28#, 100 Bright, Smooth, Photo White (500 NO SUBSTITUTE
10980 |Sheets/Ream, 8 Reams/Carton Hammermill * 2312967 REAM 10 NOBID $9.76 $8.30 $61.15
AFFIDAVIT YES YES YES YES
COPY OF INSURANCE YES NO NO YES
$400.00 MINIUMUM Submitted insurance that
ORDER expired 11-1-13
COMMENTS PRICES ADJUSTED CHANpGES IN TERMS
TO REFLECT

AND CONDITIONS




