
BID TABULATION-BITUMINOUS MATERIAL 2015

COASTAL 

ENERGY CORP

FRED WEBER 

INC
MINERAL AREA 

ASPHALT LLC

MISSOURI 

PETROLEUM 

PRODUCTS CO 

LLC

NB WEST 

CONTRACTING

PACE 

CONSTRUCTION 

COMPANY

SIMPSON 

MATERIALS CO 

LLC

PO BOX 218 

WILLOW SPRINGS 

MO 65793

2320 CREVE COEUR 

MILL RD 

MARYLAND 

HEIGHTS MO 63043

PO BOX 637 

FESTUS MO 63028

1620 WOODSON RD

ST LOUIS MO 63114

2780 MARY AVE

BRENTWOOD MO 

63144

1620 WOODSON RD

ST LOUIS MO 63114

PO BOX 250

VALLEY PARK MO 

63088

LIQUID BITUMINOUS MATERIAL

DELIVERED COST PER GALLON

MC-30 $3.54 No Bid $3.50 $2.87 No Bid N/A

MC-3000 $3.15 No Bid $3.26 $2.87 No Bid N/A

CRS-2 $2.09 No Bid $2.31 No Bid No Bid N/A

CRS-2P $2.54 No Bid $2.69 $2.19 No Bid N/A

SS-1H $2.19 No Bid $2.31 $2.42 No Bid N/A

HFE-150 $2.34 No Bid $2.44 No Bid No Bid N/A

LIQUID BITUMINOUS MATERIAL

BULK COST PER GALLON

MC-30 $3.50 No Bid $3.34 $2.80 No Bid N/A

MC-3000 $3.10 No Bid $3.10 $2.80 No Bid N/A

CRS-2 

Cost Per 5 Gallon Bucket Per Bucket

$2.05

NB

No Bid

No Bid

2.15

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid
No Bid N/A

CRS-2P $2.50 No Bid $2.53 $2.15 No Bid N/A

SS-1H

Cost Per 5 Gallon Bucket Per Bucket

$2.15

NB

No Bid

$10.00 per gal

$2.15

$27.00

$2.35

No Bid

$33.00

No Bid

N/A

$44.50

HFE-150 $2.30 No Bid $2.28 No Bid No Bid N/A

COLD MIX

PLANT PICK UP - COST PER TON No Bid N/A No Bid $65.00
$86.00 (Antire Plant 

Only)
N/A

MODIFIED COLD MIX (EZ Street)

PLANT PICK UP - COST PER TON

(South Festus)

$100.00 (North & 

Kingshighway)

N/A No Bid $110.00 UPM No Bid N/A

HOT MIX

PLANT PICK UP - COST PER TON

$46.00 (South & 

North)

$62.00 

(Kingshighway)

$50.00 (Festus)

$45.75 No Bid $45.75 $47.00 $47.25

Box checked that you are willing to 

provide monthly price adjustments to 

the county, no later than the final 

Thursday of the month before the 

adjustment takes effect. (Y/N)

YES YES YES YES YES YES

DATE YOUR BID PRICE EXPIRES:

4-30-15 then subject 

to change on a 

monthly basis

3-1-15 Month to Month 6-1-15 1-31-15

Attachment "A"

HAUL CHART MILEAGE ADD ON 

PRICE PER TON COLD MIX FOR 

STOCK PILE DELIVERY

0-5 miles $4.25 No Bid $3.75 $4.25 N/A

5- 10 miles $5.00 No Bid $4.50 $4.75 N/A

10-15 miles $5.75 No Bid $5.15 $5.50 N/A

15-20 miles $6.50 No Bid $6.00 $6.25 N/A

20-25 miles $7.25 No Bid $6.60 $6.85 N/A

25-30 miles $8.00 No Bid $7.10 $7.00 N/A

30-35 miles $9.00 No Bid $7.55 $7.75 N/A

35-40 miles $10.00 No Bid $8.15 $8.20 N/A

40-45 miles $11.00 No Bid $8.75 $8.80 N/A

45-50 miles $12.00 No Bid $9.25 $9.40 N/A

Over 50 miles $13.00 No Bid
9.25 + $.10 per ton 

mile
$9.40 + $0.20/Mile N/A

BITUMINOUS MATERIAL

2015

BID OPENING 

1-20-15



BID TABULATION-BITUMINOUS MATERIAL 2015

COASTAL 

ENERGY CORP

FRED WEBER 

INC
MINERAL AREA 

ASPHALT LLC

MISSOURI 

PETROLEUM 

PRODUCTS CO 

LLC

NB WEST 

CONTRACTING

PACE 

CONSTRUCTION 

COMPANY

SIMPSON 

MATERIALS CO 

LLC

PO BOX 218 

WILLOW SPRINGS 

MO 65793

2320 CREVE COEUR 

MILL RD 

MARYLAND 

HEIGHTS MO 63043

PO BOX 637 

FESTUS MO 63028

1620 WOODSON RD

ST LOUIS MO 63114

2780 MARY AVE

BRENTWOOD MO 

63144

1620 WOODSON RD

ST LOUIS MO 63114

PO BOX 250

VALLEY PARK MO 

63088

BITUMINOUS MATERIAL

2015

BID OPENING 

1-20-15

Attachment "B"

HAUL CHART MILEAGE ADD ON 

PRICE PER TON HOT MIX FOR 

DELIVERY TO JOB SITE

0-5 miles $4.25 No Bid $3.75 $4.25 N/A

5- 10 miles $5.00 No Bid $4.50 $4.75 N/A

10-15 miles $5.75 No Bid $5.15 $5.50 N/A

15-20 miles $6.50 No Bid $6.00 $6.25 N/A

20-25 miles $7.25 No Bid $6.60 $6.85 N/A

25-30 miles $8.00 No Bid $7.10 $7.00 N/A

30-35 miles $9.00 No Bid $7.55 $7.75 N/A

35-40 miles $10.00 No Bid $8.15 $8.20 N/A

40-45 miles $11.00 No Bid $8.75 $8.80 N/A

45-50 miles $12.00 No Bid $9.25 $9.40 N/A

Over 50 miles $13.00 No Bid
9.25 + $.10 per ton 

mile
$9.40 + $0.20/Mile N/A

NOTARIZED WORK AFFIDAVIT 

COMPLETED
NO YES YES YES YES YES YES

COPY OF INSURANCE PROVIDED NO YES YES YES NO YES YES

TAX RECEIPTS OR NOTARIZED 

LETTER STATING NO REAL OR 

PERSONAL PROPERTY OWNED IN 

JEFFERSON COUNTY

NO YES NO YES NO YES YES

COOPERATIVE BID FORM (Y/N) YES YES YES YES YES YES YES

COOPERATIVE CONTACT INFO: YES YES YES YES YES YES YES

COMPANY INFORMATION AND 

SIGNATURE
NO YES NO YES YES YES YES

BID DEPOSIT REQUIRED N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A

COMMENTS:

Pages 9-10 and 12-

15 were not 

submitted with the 

bid. 

Delivery is subject to 

an 18 ton minimum 

haul charge per load. 

Delivery is subject to 

Waiting Time after 

15 minutes on the job 

at $60.00 per hour. 

Note:  When mix is 

delivered by Pace:

Waiting Time: The 

City/County shall be 

allowed (1) minute 

per ton to unload hot 

mix from delivery 

trucks (e.g. if the 

truck has 15 tons of 

asphalt, 15 minutes 

shall be allowed for 

unloading from the 

time the truck arrives 

on the job)

After the period 

allowed for unloading 

trucks has expired, 

the supplier shall be 

reimbursed for 

waiting time at the 

rate of $1.10 per 

minute per truck. 


