BID TABULATION - CRUSHED STONE AND GRAVEL 2015

BUSSEN BUSSEN
CRUSHED STONE AND ARCH JOHNSON BUSSEN QUARRIES QUARRIES CENTRAL CENTRAL DRY CREEK FRED WEBER
GRAVEL 2015 QUARRIES STONE CO STONE CO
COINC JERRERSON TRAUTMAN LLC INC
BID OPENING ANTIRE PLANT BARRACKS PLANT ANTONIA MORSE MILL
2-10-15
12520 STATE 6800 BUSSEN DR 5000 BUSSEN 8799 TRAUTMAN 3224 N HWY 67 3224 NHWY 67 | 10200 STATERD C Ccféé%ﬁiilj
ROUTE 21 DESOTO EUREKA MO 63025 ROAD ST LOUIS QUARRY ROAD FLORISSANT MO | FLORISSANT MO HILLSBORO MO MARYLAND
MO 63020 MO 63129 PEVELY MO 63070 63033 63033 63050 HEIGHTS MO 63043
CLEAN STONE
Cost per Ton
1/4" $11.30 $11.30 $10.80 No Bid
3/8" $11.30 $11.30 $10.80 $9.25 $8.00 No Bid
1/2" $11.30 $11.30 $10.80 No Bid
3/4" $8.70 $9.30 $9.30 $8.70 $8.90 $9.95
1" $8.70 $9.30 $9.30 $8.70 $8.90 $7.65 $9.95
1&1/4" $9.30 $9.30 $8.70 No Bid
1&1/2" $8.00 $8.00 $7.40 $7.90 $9.95
1&3/4" $8.00 $8.00 $7.40 No Bid
2" $8.70 $8.00 $8.00 $7.40 $8.25 $6.95 $8.50
3" $7.40 $8.00 $8.00 $7.40 $8.50 $6.85 No Bid
4" $7.40 $8.00 $8.00 $7.40 $8.50
5" $8.00 $8.00 $7.40 No Bid
6" $8.00 $8.00 $7.40 $8.25 $8.35 No Bid
MINUS
Cost per Ton
1/4" $2.50 $1.00 $1.00 $1.00 $1.00 (.SCR_ $1.00 No Bid
screenings)
3/8" $5.50 $5.50 $5.20 No Bid
1/2" $5.50 $5.50 $5.20 No Bid
3/4" $5.20 $5.50 $5.50 $5.20 $5.35 $4.50
1" $5.20 $5.50 $5.50 $5.20 $5.35 $5.00 $4.50
1&1/4" $5.50 $5.50 $5.20 No Bid
1&1/2" $5.50 $5.50 $5.20 $5.35 $4.50
2" $5.20 $5.50 $5.50 $5.20 $5.35 $5.00 $4.50
2&1/2" $5.50 $5.50 $5.20 No Bid
3" $5.20 $5.50 $5.50 $5.20 $5.35 $5.00 No Bid
4" $5.50 $5.50 $5.20 $4.50
1/2" - 4" Minus Backfill $5.50 $5.50 $5.20 No Bid




BID TABULATION - CRUSHED STONE AND GRAVEL 2015

BUSSEN BUSSEN
CRUSHED STONE AND ARCH JOHNSON BUSSEN QUARRIES QUARRIES CENTRAL CENTRAL DRY CREEK FRED WEBER
GRAVEL 2015 QUARRIES STONE CO STONE CO
BID OPENING COINC ANTIRE PLANT JERRERSON TRAUTMAN ANTONIA MORSE MILL LLC INC
BARRACKS PLANT
2-10-15
MAC
Cost per Ton
1/4" $11.30 $11.30 $8.70 No Bid
1/2" $11.30 $11.30 $8.70 No Bid
3/4" $9.30 $9.30 $8.70 No Bid
1" $9.30 $9.30 $8.70 No Bid
2" $8.00 $8.00 $7.40 No Bid
3" $8.00 $8.00 $7.40 No Bid
3" X 10" $11.00 $11.00 - No Bid
OTHER
Cost Per Ton
3" X 10" $11.00 $11.00 - No Bid
SHOT ROCK $4.95 $5.00 $5.00 $5.00 $4.80 $5.20 $6.25
GABION ROCK $12.50 $11.00 $11.00 - $10.25 $8.35 $16.00
QUARRY RUN $5.20 $5.00 $5.00 $5.00 $5.20 $4.60 $6.25
4" X 6" CLEAN $11.00 $11.00 - No Bid
DIRT - - - $1.40 $2.30 No Bid
SAND (RIVER) $17.50 $6.25 $6.25 - No Bid
FILTER ROCK $8.00 $8.00 $7.40 No Bid
DIRTY SHOT ROCK $3.50 $5.00 $5.00 $5.00 $3.75 No Bid
BLANKET ROCK $12.50 $13.00 $13.00 $13.00 $12.00 No Bid
GRAVEL PRODUCTS
Cost Per Ton
P-GRAVEL $11.00 No Bid
SCREENED GRAVEL $11.00 No Bid
CREEK GRAVEL $11.00 No Bid
B-GRAVEL $9.00 No Bid
C-GRAVEL $13.00 No Bid
CONCRETE ROCK - No Bid
FILTER SAND $11.00 No Bid
SAND $13.00 No Bid
DIRT $10.00 No Bid
BLANKET ROCK - No Bid
SHOT ROCK - No Bid
3" X 10" CLEAN $12.00 No Bid
4" X 6" CLEAN $12.00 No Bid




BID TABULATION - CRUSHED STONE AND GRAVEL 2015

BUSSEN BUSSEN
CRUSHED STONE AND ARCH JOHNSON BUSSEN QUARRIES QUARRIES CENTRAL CENTRAL DRY CREEK FRED WEBER
GRAVEL 2015 QUARRIES STONE CO STONE CO
BID OPENING COINC ANTIRE PLANT JERRERSON TRAUTMAN ANTONIA MORSE MILL LLC INC
BARRACKS PLANT
2-10-15
HAUL CHART MILEAGE
ADD ON PRICE PER TON
FOR STOCK PILE DELIVERY
0-5 miles $3.60 $3.60 $3.20 $3.75 $3.35 $3.50
5-10 miles $4.00 $4.00 $3.60 $4.25 $3.95 $4.25
10-15 miles $4.50 $4.50 $4.10 $4.75 $4.75 $5.00
15-20 miles $5.00 $5.00 $4.80 $5.75
20-25 miles $5.50 $5.50 $5.30 $6.50
25-30 miles $6.00 $6.00 $6.00 $7.25
30-35 miles $6.50 $6.50 $6.70 $8.00
35-40 miles $7.00 $7.00 $7.40 $9.00
40-45 miles $8.00 $8.00 $8.00 $10.00
45-50 miles $9.00 $9.00 $8.70 $11.00
over 50 miles N/A N/A - $11.00 + 0.25
ADD ON PRICE PER TON
FOR ON SITE DELIVERY
0-5 miles $3.00 $3.60 $3.60 $3.20 $3.75 $3.35 $3.50
5-10 miles $3.50 $4.00 $4.00 $3.60 $4.25 $3.95 $4.25
10-15 miles $3.75 $4.50 $4.50 $4.10 $4.75 $4.75 $5.00
15-20 miles $4.25 $5.00 $5.00 $4.80 $5.75
20-25 miles $4.50 $5.50 $5.50 $5.30 $6.50
25-30 miles $4.75 $6.00 $6.00 $6.00 $7.25
30-35 miles $5.50 $6.50 $6.50 $6.70 $8.00
35-40 miles $5.75 $7.00 $7.00 $7.40 $9.00
40-45 miles $6.25 $8.00 $8.00 $8.00 $10.00
45-50 miles $6.75 $9.00 $9.00 $8.70 $11.00
over 50 miles $7.25 N/A N/A - $11.00 + .25
NOTARIZED WORK
AFFIDAVIT COMPLETED YES YES YES YES YES YES YES YES
COPY OF INSURANCE
PROVIDED YES YES YES YES YES YES NO YES
TAX RECEIPTS OR
NOTARIZED LETTER STATING
NO REAL OR PERSONAL YES YES YES YES YES YES NO YES
PROPERTY OWNED IN
JEFFERSON COUNTY
COOPERA-I(—\I(\//'E)BID FORM YES YES YES YES YES YES YES YES
COOPERAT,\II\;S:CONTACT YES YES YES YES YES YES YES YES
COMPANY INFORMATION
AND SIGNATURE YES YES YES YES YES YES YES YES
BID DEPOSIT REQUIRED N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A




BID TABULATION - CRUSHED STONE AND GRAVEL 2015

CRUSHED STONE AND BUSSEN BUSSEN
ARCH JOHNSON BUSSEN QUARRIES QUARRIES CENTRAL CENTRAL DRY CREEK FRED WEBER
GRAVEL 2015 QUARRIES STONE CO STONE CO
CO INC ANTIRE PLANT JERRERSON TRAUTMAN ANTONIA MORSE MILL LLC INC
BID OPENING BARRACKS PLANT
2-10-15
*Materials are
subject to
availability
*Premium on large
rock (Shot Rock,
Gabion, Quarry run)
Plus $1.00/Ton - | Plus $1.00/Ton - add $1.00 per ton
Gabion Gabion based on 18 ton load
g : .
COMMENTS $1.75/Ton Rip Rap |  $1.75/Ton Drop Delivery is subject
to and 18 ton
and Larger Back -
minimum haul

charge per load
*Delivery is subject
to Waiting Time
after 15 minutes on
the job at $60.00 per|
hour




BID TABULATION - CRUSHED STONE AND GRAVEL 2015

HSAND AND |HOUSE sPRINGs| K/ PAZDERA SIMPSON WINTER BROTHERS
CRUSHED STONE AND GRAVEL QUARRY :ngc\ﬁé‘ MATER@LS CO| MATERIAL COMPANY
GRAVEL 2015
BID OPENING
2-10-15 5200 HILLSBORO
PO BOX 69 11866 STATE ROAD PO BOX 250
IMPERIALMO | HOUSESPRINGS 17 oo restysmo | VALLEY PARK Mo| 13098 GRAVOIS ROAD ST
63052 RD HOUSE 63008 63088 LOUIS MO 63127
SPRINGS MO 63051
CLEAN STONE
Cost per Ton
1/4" $10.35 N/A N/A
3/8" $9.50 $10.40 N/A
1/2" $9.50 $10.40 N/A
3/4" $9.30 $8.90 N/A
1" $9.30 $8.90 N/A
1&1/4" $9.30 N/A N/A
1&1/2" $8.00 $7.90 N/A
1&3/4" $8.00 N/A N/A
2" $8.00 $7.90 N/A
3" $8.00 N/A N/A
4" $8.00 N/A N/A
5" $8.00 N/A N/A
6" $8.00 N/A N/A
MINUS
Cost per Ton
14" $5.50 N/A N/A
3/8" $5.50 $2.50 N/A
1/2" $5.50 N/A N/A
3/4" $5.50 $5.30 N/A
1" $5.50 $5.30 N/A
1&1/4" $5.50 N/A N/A
1&1/2" $5.50 $5.20 N/A
2" $5.50 $5.20 N/A
281/2" $5.50 N/A N/A
3" $5.50 N/A N/A
4" $5.50 N/A N/A
1/2" - 4" Minus Backfill $5.50 $2.50 N/A




BID TABULATION - CRUSHED STONE AND GRAVEL 2015

H SAND AND |HOUSE SPRINGS f—iii?jl\Dl(E? MA‘SrII;I?F;,SAig‘ co WINTER BROTHERS
CRUSHED STONE AND GRAVEL QUARRY EXCAVING e MATERIAL COMPANY
GRAVEL 2015
BID OPENING
MAC
Cost per Ton
1/4" $9.30 N/A N/A
1/2" $9.30 N/A N/A
3/4" $9.30 $8.90 N/A
1" $9.30 $8.90 N/A
2" $8.00 $7.90 N/A
3" $8.00 N/A N/A
3" X 10" $10.80 N/A N/A
OTHER
Cost Per Ton
3" X 10" $10.80 N/A N/A
SHOT ROCK $5.00 $7.15 N/A
GABION ROCK - N/A N/A
QUARRY RUN $5.00 $7.15 N/A
4" X 6" CLEAN - N/A N/A
DIRT $6.00 - N/A N/A
SAND (RIVER) $13.00 - $9.00 N/A
FILTER ROCK - N/A N/A
DIRTY SHOT ROCK $5.00 N/A N/A
BLANKET ROCK $13.00 N/A N/A
GRAVEL PRODUCTS
P-GRAVEL $8.50 $8.95 $9.45 (Torpedo Gravel)
SCREENED GRAVEL N/A N/A
CREEK GRAVEL $4.00 N/A N/A
$16.00 (Special B Gravel-
B-GRAVEL $7.50 $15.75 ASTM C 33/D 448/ AASHTO
M 43 Size No. 4)
$10.40 (Commerical concrete
coarse aggregate-ASTM C
C-GRAVEL $13.00 $9.90 33/D 448/ gA?AS?HTO M 43 Size
No. 57
CONCRETE ROCK $13.00 N/A N/A (See C-Gravel above)
FILTER SAND $10.40 N/A
$10.40 (Commerical concrete
SAND $13.00 $10.40 fine aggregate-Medium Sand-
ASTM C 33 Specification E 11)
$6.00/Top Soil $11.00 Pulverized
DIRT $4.00/Fill Dirt $5.00 $8.00 Blank Run
BLANKET ROCK N/A N/A
SHOT ROCK N/A N/A
3" X 10" CLEAN N/A N/A
4" X 6" CLEAN $8.00 N/A N/A




BID TABULATION - CRUSHED STONE AND GRAVEL 2015

H SAND AND |HOUSE SPRINGS KA PAZDERA SIMPSON WINTER BROTHERS
CRUSHED STONE AND GRAVEL QUARRY :ngi/'\‘ﬁ\é‘ MATELR&LS €Ol MATERIAL COMPANY
GRAVEL 2015
BID OPENING
HAUL CHART MILEAGE
ADD ON PRICE PER TON
FOR STOCK PILE DELIVERY
0-5 miles $3.00 $3.45 $3.30 N/A $4.55
5-10 miles $3.50 $3.85 $3.85 N/A $4.55
10-15 miles $4.00 $4.40 $4.40 N/A $5.45
15-20 miles $4.50 $5.00 $5.25 N/A $5.70
20-25 miles $5.00 $5.40 $6.35 N/A $6.10
25-30 miles $5.50 $5.70 $7.15 N/A $8.15
30-35 miles $6.00 $6.20 $8.55 N/A $9.20
35-40 miles $7.00 $6.70 $9.65 N/A $10.05
40-45 miles $7.00 $7.20 $9.90 N/A $10.85
45-50 miles $7.50 $7.70 $11.00 N/A $11.95
over 50 miles $8.00 $8.20 N/A N/A CALL
ON SITE DELIVERY
0-5 miles $3.00 $3.45 N/A $4.55
5-10 miles $3.50 $3.85 N/A $4.55
10-15 miles $4.00 $4.40 N/A $5.45
15-20 miles $4.50 $5.00 N/A $5.70
20-25 miles $5.00 $5.40 N/A $6.10
25-30 miles $5.50 $5.70 N/A $8.15
30-35 miles $6.00 $6.20 N/A $9.20
35-40 miles $7.00 $6.70 N/A $10.05
40-45 miles $7.00 $7.20 N/A $10.85
45-50 miles $7.50 $7.70 N/A $11.95
over 50 miles $8.00 $8.20 N/A CALL
AFFIDAVIT COMPLETED YES YES YES YES YES
COPY OF INSURANCE
PROVIDED YES YES YES YES YES
TAX RECEIPTS OR
NOTARIZED LETTER STATING
NO REAL OR PERSONAL YES YES NO YES NO
PROPERTY OWNED IN
JEFFERSON COUNTY
COOPERATIVE BID FORM NO YES YES YES YES
(Y/N)
COOPERAT'\II\;EZCONTACT NO YES YES YES YES
COMPANY INFORMATION
AND SIGNATURE YES YES YES YES NO
BID DEPOSIT REQUIRED N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A




BID TABULATION - CRUSHED STONE AND GRAVEL 2015

CRUSHED STONE AND
GRAVEL 2015
BID OPENING

COMMENTS

H SAND AND
GRAVEL

HOUSE SPRINGS
QUARRY

KA PAZDERA
HAULING &
EXCAV INC

SIMPSON
MATERIALS CO
LLC

WINTER BROTHERS
MATERIAL COMPANY

*Note: There is a 15 ton
minimum freight charge on all
deliveries. Example: If 5 ton of
material is ordered for delivery
from 0-5 miles customer is
billed for 5 ton of material and
15 tons x $4.55 = $68.25 for
freight.




