PAPER SUPPLIES BID TABULATION

PAPER SUPPLIES SCHOOL NATIONAL [MINERAL AREA
BID OPENING SPECIALTY XPEDX ENVELOPE - OFFICE TRIPROLLC
11-20-07 LENEXA SUPPLY
_ 0 Q" ——
County ID #
$11.46 P/B 500
10300 NO BID NO BID $28.73 M NO BID CTN - 5000
$4.63 NO BID $57.24 M NO BID $8.09
10301 ' ' TABS OF 100
$11.78
10302 $5.35 NO BID $75.06 M NO BID TABS OF 100
$9.88
10303 $5.54 NO BID $73.98 M NO BID TABS OF 100
$17.14
10304 $7.79 NO BID $111.24 M NO BID TABS OF 100
$18.47
10305 $8.65 NO BID $117.72 M NO BID TABS OF 100
$22.61
NO BID NO BID $23.68 M NO BID BOX OF 500
10306 CTN - 1000
$34.54
NO BID NO BID $66.74 M NO BID BOX OF 500
10307 CTN -500
$61.00
NO BID NO BID $96.76 M NO BID BOX OF 500
10311 CTN -500
$8.43
NO BID NO BID $11.40 M NO BID BOX OF 500
10313 CTN - 5000
$11.71
NO BID NO BID $14.10 M NO BID BOX OF 500
10314 CTN - 2500
$9.67
NO BID NO BID $11.80 M NO BID BOX OF 500
10315 CTN - 2500
$9.67
NO BID NO BID $11.80 M NO BID BOX OF 500
10316 CTN - 2500
$13.47
NO BID NO BID $14.10 M NO BID BOX OF 500
10317 CTN - 2500
$11.71
NO BID NO BID $14.10 M NO BID BOX OF 500
10319 CTN - 2500
10700 NO BID NO BID NO BID $2.62 NO BID
10701 $3.75 $2.75 NO BID $3.71 NO BID
10702 $3.75 $4.20 NO BID $3.71 NO BID
10703 $3.75 $4.20 NO BID $3.71 NO BID
10704 $3.75 $4.20 NO BID $3.71 NO BID
10705 $3.75 $4.20 NO BID $3.71 NO BID
10706 $3.75 $4.20 NO BID $3.71 NO BID
10707 $4.35 $4.25 NO BID $3.99 NO BID
10710 $5.20 $5.50 NO BID NO BID NO BID
10711 $6.84 $3.70 NO BID $6.67 NO BID
10713 NO BID $9.20 NO BID NO BID NO BID
10714 NO BID $35.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
10800 NO BID $4.25 NO BID NO BID NO BID
10802 NO BID $5.90 NO BID NO BID NO BID
10803 NO BID $3.50 NO BID NO BID NO BID
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11-20-07 LENEXA SUPPLY
10804 NO BID $4.50 NO BID NO BID NO BID
10805 NO BID $5.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
10806 NO BID $4.90 NO BID NO BID NO BID
10807 NO BID $4.90 NO BID NO BID NO BID
10809 NO BID $5.50 NO BID NO BID NO BID
10811 $0.35 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
10812 $0.35 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
10814 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
10815 $0.54 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
10816 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
10817 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
10818 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
10819 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
10900 NO BID $6.20 NO BID NO BID NO BID
10901 NO BID $6.95 NO BID NO BID NO BID
10902 NO BID $7.40 NO BID NO BID NO BID
10903 NO BID $7.40 NO BID NO BID NO BID
10904 NO BID $7.60 NO BID NO BID NO BID
10905 NO BID $7.60 NO BID NO BID NO BID
10917 NO BID $33.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
10918 NO BID $7.90 NO BID NO BID NO BID
10919 NO BID $8.45 NO BID NO BID NO BID
10920 NO BID $9.40 NO BID NO BID NO BID
10923 NO BID $75.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
10950 NO BID $21.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
10951 NO BID $33.60 NO BID NO BID NO BID
10960 NO BID $19.20 NO BID NO BID NO BID
10970 NO BID $19.95 NO BID NO BID NO BID
10971 NO BID $19.95 NO BID NO BID NO BID
10972 NO BID $3.20 NO BID NO BID NO BID
w
PRICING IS FIRM FOR THE
PERIOD OF 1-1-08 THROUGH 3-31
08. ON APRIL 1, JULY 1, AND
OCTOBER 1, 2008 PRICING WILL ETETFECRHT;D
BE ADJUSTED UP OR DOWN TO
COMMENTS REFLECT CURRENT MARKET %';iEgRllzﬁg
CONDITIONS. DOCUMENTATION DETAILS
WILL BE PROOVIDED ON ANY
INCREASE OR DECREASE OF
PRICING




