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1 PROJECT/VENDOR LNGTH | $ TON/BASE total cost | LNGTH | TON/BITUM total cost | LNGTH [TON/WEDGE total cost DIST $HAUL | $BaseBIT & TOTAL
2 base 3" total tons base bitum 2" total tons bitum wedge 1" total tons wedge haul rate Wedge Haul cost
3 2347| base 1564 |bitum 1000|wedge Temporary Pavemnet Temporary
4 Gary 1.61 1.61 0.0 Striping Fabric Markers
5 [Jokerst (Pace) $ 54.00 3,778 | $ 204,019 $ 56.00 2,519 | $ 141,050 $ 56.50 - $ - 8.8 $ 375 % 23613 |$ 368,683 | $ 400.00 | $ 1901 % 225.00
6 |Jokerst (MAA) $ 48.10 3,778 | $ 181,728 $ 4855 2519 | $ 122,286 $ 48.95 - $ - 460 |$ 9.751 % 61,395 | $ 365,408
7 [Jokerst RAP (Pace) $ 48.10 3,778 | $ 181,728 $ 50.00 2,519 | $ 125,938 $ 50.30 - $ - 8.8 $ 3751 9% 23,613 | $ 331,279
8 [PACE $ 49.75 3,778 | $ 187,962 $ 54.85 2,519 | $ 138,154 $ 58.00 - $ - 8.8 $ 3.60 | $ 22,669 | $ 348,785 | $ 90.00 | $ 250 | $ 66.00
9 |Pace RAP $ 43.75 3,778 [ $ 165,293 $ 47.95 2519 [$ 120,774 $ 50.75 - $ - 8.8 $ 360 (% 31,439 [$ 365,504
10 [NB West $ 50.80 3,778 [ $ 191,929 $ 53.15 2519 |$ 133,872 $ 54.15 - $ - 139 |$ 5001 9% 31,484 |$ 357,285|% 2,000.00 | $ 10.00 | $ 400.00
11 [NB West RAP $ 44.25 3,778 [ $ 167,182 $ 46.10 2519 |$ 116,115 $ 50.00 - $ - 139 |$ 500 % 31,484 | $ 314,781
12 [Fred Weber South $ 47.80 3,778 | $ 180,595 $ 49.45 2,519 | $ 124,552 $ 49.45 - $ - 8.8 $ 340 [ $ 21,409 | $ 326,557 | $ 350.00 | $ 2501 % 350.00
13 [Fred Weber Festus $ 53.50 3,778 [ $ 202,130 $ 53.50 2,519 [$ 134,753 $ 53.50 - $ - $ - $ - $ 336,884
14 [Fred Weber South RAP $ 44.30 3,778 | $ 167,371 $ 45.95 2,519 [$ 115,737 $ 45.95 - $ - 8.8 $ 340 | % 21,409 | $ 304,518
15 [Fred Weber Festus RAP $ 49.50 3,778 | $ 187,018 $ 49.50 2,519 [$ 124,678 $ 49.50 - $ - $ - $ - $ 311,696
16 [Krupp FWS $ 53.08 3,778 | $ 200,543 $ 53.76 2,519 | $ 135,408 $ 55.75 - $ - 8.8 $ 586 [ $ 36,900 [$ 372,851 | $ 500.00 | $ 280 $ 315.00
17 |Krupp FWF no bid $ 200,543 $ 59.21 2,519 | $ 149,136 $ 61.20 - $ - $ - $ - $ 349,679
18 [Krupp FWS RAP $ 50.01 3,778 | $ 188,944 $ 50.68 2519 |$ 127,651 $ 52.67 - $ - 8.8 $ 5.86 [ $ 36,900 [ $ 353,495
19 [Krupp FWF RAP no bid $ 188,944 $ 56.48 2,519 | $ 142,259 $ 5847 - $ - $ - $ - $ 331,203
20 |Dura Seal $ 65.38 3,778 | $ 247,014 $ 66.38 2519 |$ 167,195 $ 66.88 - $ - $ - $ - $ 414209 | $ 600.00 | $ 200 | $ 300.00
21 |Dura Seal RAP $ 60.63 3,778 | $ 229,068 $ 60.88 2,519 | $ 153,342 $ 61.13 - $ - $ - $ - $ 382,410
22 |County Asphalt $ 52.92 3,778 | $ 199,939 $ 58.38 2,519 | $ 147,045 $ 62.38 - $ - $ - $ - $ 346,984 |$ 1872791 9% 2.68 | $ 605.75
23 |County Asphalt RAP $ 47.12 3,778 | $ 178,026 $ 51.82 2519 | $ 130,522 $ 5557 - $ - $ - $ - $ 308,548
24 |Gershenson $ 59.50 3,778 | $ 224,799 $ 60.40 2519 |$ 152,133 $ 85.80 - $ - $ - $ - $ 376932 % 1,260.00 $ 280 $ 358.00
25 |Gershenson RAP $ 53.50 3,778 | $ 202,130 $ 53.50 2,519 | $ 134,753 $ 78.70 - $ - $ - $ - $ 336,884
26 |Byrne & Jones $ 66.34 3,778 | $ 250,641 $ 67.14 2,519 | $ 169,109 $ 74.67 - $ - $ - $ - $ 419751 |$% 110571 ($ 484 | % 276.43
27 |Byrne & Jones RAP $ 62.45 3,778 | $ 235,944 $ 65.76 2519 | $ 165,633 $ 80.91 - $ - $ - $ - $ 401,578
28 |Lead Belt Materials $ 39.37 3,778 | $ 148,745 $ 39.91 2,519 | $ 100,524 $ 42.68 - $ - 466 |$ 885|9% 55,727 |$ 304,996 | $ 2,760.00 | $ 5.00 | $ 145.20
29 |Lead Belt Materials RAP no bid no bid no bid
30
31
32
33
34 Buck Creek 0.00 1.07 0.00
35 |Jokerst (Pace) $ 54.00 - $ - $ 56.00 1,674 | $ 93,742 $ 56.50 - $ - 235 [ $ 6.05]| % 10,127 | $ 103,869
36 |Jokerst (MAA) $ 48.10 - $ - $ 48.55 1674 |$ 81,271 $ 48.95 - $ - 246 |$ 6.05]| % 10,127 | $ 91,398
37 |Jokerst RAP (Pace) $ 48.10 - $ - $ 50.00 1,674 |$ 83,698 $ 50.30 - $ - 235 [ $ 6.05 (% 10,127 [ $ 93,825
38 |PACE $ 49.75 - $ - $ 54.85 1674 |$ 91,816 $ 58.00 - $ - 235 |$ 6.95| 9% 11,634 | $ 103,450
39 |Pace RAP $ 43.75 - $ - $ 47.95 1,674 |$ 80,266 $ 50.75 - $ - 235 |'$ 6.95| % 11,634 [ $ 91,900
40 INB West $ 50.80 - $ - $ 53.15 1674 |$ 88,971 $ 54.15 - $ - 278 |$ 765 (% 12,806 | $ 101,776
41 |NB West RAP $ 44.25 - $ - $ 46.10 1,674 |$ 77,169 $ 50.00 - $ - 278 | $ 765 (% 12,806 | $ 89,975
42 [Fred Weber South $ 47.80 - $ - $ 49.45 1674 | $ 82,777 $ 49.45 - $ - $ - $ - $ 82,777
43 |Fred Weber Festus $ 53.50 - $ - $ 53.50 1,674 |$ 89,557 $ 53.50 - $ - 3.2 $ 250 ( $ 4185 $ 93,742
44 |Fred Weber South RAP $ 44.30 - $ - $ 4595 1674 |$ 76,918 $ 45.95 - $ - $ - $ - $ 76,918
45 |Fred Weber Festus RAP $ 49.50 - $ - $ 49.50 1674 |$ 82,861 $ 49.50 - $ - 3.2 $ 250 | $ 4,185 | $ 87,046
46 |Krupp FWS $ 53.08 - $ - $ 53.76 1674 |$ 89,992 $ 55.75 - $ - $ - $ - $ 89,992
47 |Krupp FWF no bid $ 59.21 1674 |$ 99,115 $ 61.20 - $ - 3.2 $ 465 | % 7,784 | $ 106,899
48 |Krupp FWS RAP $ 50.01 - $ - $ 50.68 1674 |$ 84,836 $ 52.67 - $ - $ - $ - $ 84,836
49 |Krupp FWF RAP no bid $ 56.48 1,674 | $ 94,545 $ 5847 - $ - 3.2 $ 465 $ 7,784 |$ 102,329
50 |Dura Seal $ 65.38 - $ - $ 66.38 1674 |$ 111,117 $ 66.88 - $ - $ - $ - $ 111,117
51 |Dura Seal RAP $ 60.63 - $ - $ 60.88 1,674 |$ 101,910 $ 61.13 - $ - $ - $ - $ 101,910
52 |County Asphalt $ 52.92 - $ - $ 58.38 1,674 |$ 97,726 $ 62.38 - $ - $ - $ - $ 97,726
53 |County Asphalt RAP $ 47.12 - $ - $ 51.82 1674 [$ 86,744 $ 55.57 - $ - $ - $ - $ 86,744
54 |Gershenson $ 59.50 - $ - $ 60.40 1,674 |$ 101,107 $ 85.80 - $ - $ - $ - $ 101,107
55 |Gershenson RAP $ 53.50 - $ - $ 53.50 1,674 |$ 89,557 $ 78.70 - $ - $ - $ - $ 89,557
56 [Byrne & Jones $ 66.34 - $ - $ 67.14 1,674 |$ 112,389 $ 74.67 - $ - $ - $ - $ 112,389
57 |Byrne & Jones RAP $ 62.45 - $ - $ 65.76 1,674 1% 110,079 $ 80.91 - $ - $ - $ - $ 110,079
58 [Lead Belt Materials $ 39.37 - $ - $ 39.91 1674 [$ 66,808 $ 42.68 - $ - 252 |$ 594 % 0,943 | $ 76,751
59 |Lead Belt Materials RAP no bid no bid no bid
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2 base 3" total tons base bitum 2" total tons bitum wedge 1" total tons wedge haul rate Wedge Haul cost
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63
64 McNutt School 0.00 0.61 0.00
65 [Jokerst (Pace) $ 54.00 - $ - $ 56.00 954 | $ 53,441 $ 56.50 - $ - 212 | $ 6.05| $ 5774 | $ 59,215
66 [Jokerst (MAA) $ 48.10 - $ - $ 48.55 954 | $ 46,332 $ 48.95 - $ - 326 |[$ 735 | $ 7,014 | $ 53,346
67 [Jokerst RAP (Pace) $ 48.10 - $ - $ 50.00 954 | $ 47,716 $ 50.30 - $ - 212 | $ 6.05| $ 5774 | $ 53,489
68 [PACE $ 49.75 - $ - $ 54.85 954 | $ 52,344 $ 58.00 - $ - 212 | $ 6.95| % 6,632 | $ 58,976
69 [Pace RAP $ 43.75 - $ - $ 47.95 954 | $ 45,759 $ 50.75 - $ - 212 | $ 6.95| % 6,632 | $ 52,392
70 [NB West $ 50.80 - $ - $ 53.15 954 [$ 50,722 $ 54.15 - $ - 270 [$ 765 $ 7,300 | $ 58,022
71 [NB West RAP $ 44.25 - $ - $ 46.10 954 [$ 43,994 $ 50.00 - $ - 270 [$ 765 3$ 7,300 | $ 51,294
72 [Fred Weber South $ 47.80 - $ - $ 49.45 954 |$ 47,191 $ 49.45 - $ - $ - $ - $ 47,191
73 [Fred Weber Festus $ 53.50 - $ - $ 53.50 954 | $ 51,056 $ 53.50 - $ - 7.3 $ 340 | $ 3,245 | $ 54,300
74 [Fred Weber South RAP $ 44,30 - $ - $ 45.95 954 |$ 43,851 $ 45.95 - $ - $ - $ - $ 43,851
75 |Fred Weber Festus RAP $ 49.50 - $ - $ 49.50 954 | $ 47,238 $ 49.50 - $ - 7.3 $ 340 | $ 3,245 | $ 50,483
76 |Krupp FWS $ 53.08 - $ - $ 53.76 954 | $ 51,304 $ b55.75 - $ - $ - $ - $ 51,304
77 |Krupp FWF no bid $ 59.21 954 [$ 56,505 $ 61.20 - $ - 7.3 $ 5.86 | $ 5592 | $ 62,097
78 |Krupp FWS RAP $ 50.01 - $ - $ 50.68 954 | $ 48,364 $ 5267 - $ - $ - $ - $ 48,364
79 [Krupp FWF RAP no bid $ 56.48 954 [$ 53,899 $ 58.47 - $ - 7.3 $ 5.86 | $ 5592 | $ 59,492
80 [Dura Seal $ 65.38 - $ - $ 66.38 954 | $ 63,347 $ 66.88 - $ - $ - $ - $ 63,347
81 [Dura Seal RAP $ 60.63 - $ - $ 60.88 954 | $ 58,098 $ 61.13 - $ - $ - $ - $ 58,098
82 [County Asphalt $ 52.92 - $ - $ 58.38 954 [$ 55,713 $ 62.38 - $ - $ - $ - $ 55,713
83 [County Asphalt RAP $ 47.12 - $ - $ 51.82 954 | $ 49,452 $ 5557 - $ - $ - $ - $ 49,452
84 |Gershenson $ 59.50 - $ - $ 60.40 954 [$ 57,640 $ 85.80 - $ - $ - $ - $ 57,640
85 [Gershenson RAP $ 53.50 - $ - $ 53.50 954 [$ 51,056 $ 78.70 - $ - $ - $ - $ 51,056
86 [Byrne & Jones $ 66.34 - $ - $ 67.14 954 1 $ 64,072 $ 74.67 - $ - $ - $ - $ 64,072
87 [Byrne & Jones RAP $ 62.45 - $ - $ 65.76 954 | $ 62,755 $ 80.91 - $ - $ - $ - $ 62,755
88 [Lead Belt Materials $ 39.37 - $ - $ 39.91 954 | $ 38,087 $ 42.68 - $ - 33.3 | $ 7.07 | $ 6,747 | $ 44,834
89 |Lead Belt Materials RAP no bid no bid no bid
90
91
92 Lead Bellt Materials $ 121,584
93
94 Fred Weber South $ 304,518
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