BID TABULATION - SAFETY SUPPLIES 2014.xls

HENRY SCHEIN INC

JOHNSTON INDUSTRIAL

S TY SUPPLIES 2014 HENRY SCHEIN INC EVLR READY FIRST AID SUPPLY/SAFETY SUPPLY MTS SAFETY PRODUCTS QUILL CQRPORATIQN TAVA PRODUCTS LLC WISE EL SANTO CO
BID OPENING
RIT T
1-28-2014 135 DURYEA RD E270 | PO BOX 3227 IRMOSC |  101-01 FOSTER AVE 7;{32 CHE%FT;;FL;&S PO BOX 204 GOLDEN Lﬁé‘éﬁ;g&? ;9‘22 %iﬁiﬁf&sﬂ 0; 11000 LINPAGE PL ST.
MELVILLE NY 11747 29063 BROOKLYN NY 11238 MS 38827 : LOUIS MO 63132
MO 63005 60069 nC
HEARING PROTECTION
Max Lite Ear Plugs (uncorded) Model: LPF-1 (Box of 200) 338-4202 - (Box of 100) Radians FP30
$ $20.99 $18.07 $19.00 B15.35 bx (’:;;‘ purchase 4 £30.37 NB $15.50 15,74 box
Max Lite Ear Plugs (with cords) Model: LPF-3C (Box of 200) - - (Box cf 180) Radians FP31 (100 bx}
$ - $17.77 $19.00 815.35 b"é‘::; purchase $30.37 NE $15.55 $15.43 box
BANDED HEARING PROTECTION
E.AR. Caps per Box of 10 - NOBID Pyramex BP1000 321.210)
5 - - $51.00 bx (Bex of 40) NO RID NB $3.25 $34.89 box
E.AR. Replacement Pods per Box of 10 - NO BID Pyramesx RJ:‘;I) (Box of 12 3217103
$ - , $5.95 Box (munirmum NO BID NB $8.60 $9.53 box
purchase 10 bx)
EAR MUFFS
Ear Muffs (with NER 29) - NO BID
. ' Moldex M1Earmuffs (BIDx| Howard Light V3 Pyramex PM3010 {Nrr31)
Make/Model (10+ . .
(16+) Radians EL30 (512.65 EA)| Vibe-20775KE2 (825.81) | "y conpen tung 59) Viking($14.15) (57,901
Radians TRO16CS ($12.05| Smith & Wesson-Recoil . Radiansg EL30-bx
Mak 1 (10 - - NRR3
eModel (10) EA) 226 13KC2 (551.87) NB Radians NRR3O (81185) | vpRsg) (511591
Ear Mufls (with NRR24) - -
Make/Model - - Pyramex PM3010 (NRR27) | Radiens SLO130CS | Economuff 1061273MSA SM(;’E‘;‘;';EIIS;EW Howard Light QM2dplus | Rediens SL013005
(10+) - - $7.60 S.E0EA 514,98 $19.67 5530 $5.9
Radian DF03L0HC (NRR EXC&XLS Radians CP0100D NRR.
Make/Model - -
23) 10051226MSA, 26 Horeywell QM24
(104} - - 53.70 EA $35,25 NB $5.75 $5.37 ea
CAP MOUNTED MUFF
24 NRR. Moldex 6300M3
Make/Model - - Pyramex CM6010 Radians S02EAR Elvex/HM20 Cap Mound Earmuff (BID-| Howard Leight 101601 | Radians CMT26 (NRR26)
1544730RS)
(ac+) - . $9.50 $7.35 EA 15.38 ea 528.95 ea $6.62 $9,96 pr
Make/Mode! - - Pyramex CM6010 Radians 502 Radians 502 (NRR22)
(10-+) - - $5.05 EA NO BID NB 56.82 $7.47 pr
EYE PROTECTION
SAFETY GLASSES
Clear Lens (Must mect latest ANST and CSA Standards) - NO BID
] Pyramex SB6310SP (Sold
Gateway Scorpion (corded) 16GBS0 ($1-49) - - inmultcf 12 EA) ($2.32 } Sub Nemesis ($65.00 dz) NB 56.00 52.20ea
EA)
Gatewsy Scorpion (corded) 16GBS0 ($50+) - - $2.21 A $64,00 dz - $5.75 $2,08 ea
Uvere Ambient (medium) OTG 53160 (§1-49) . . $7.50 Sold in mult of L0 EA $85.36 per 10 . $5.65 $5.80ca
(86.65 EA)
Uvex Ambient (medium) OTG §3160 (§50+) - - $7.10 $6.43 EA $38.36 “ $5.60 $5.55 ea
Gray Lens (Must meet latest ANSY and CSA Standards)
Pyramex SB6320SP (Sold
Gatewsy Scorpion (corded) 16GB23 (8149} - - in mult of 12ZBA) (52,65 | Sub Nemesis (576.38dz) NB £7.70 $2.60ea

EA)
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HENRY SCHEIN INC HENRY SCHEIN INC EVER READY FIRST ATD MTS SAFETY PRODUCTS QUILL CORPORATION TAVA PRODUCTS LLC WISE EL SANTO CO
SAFETY SUPPLIES 2014 SUPPLY/SAFETY SUPPLY
RIM NDENTR
Gatevay Scorpion (corded) 1 5GB33 (530+) - - $2.60 EA $75.38 dz - $7.60 52.33ea
Uvex Ambient (medium) OTG 83162 (§1-49) . - $8.00 Sold in mult of 10 A $108.17 per 10 . $6.26 $6 382
($7.29 EA)
Uvex Ambient (medium) OTG S3162 (550+) - - 57.80 $7.12EA 5108.17 ; $6.00 56.12e
#5 Lens (Must meet latest ANSY and CSA Standards) - -
Uvex Ambient {medium) OTG 3165 - - $12.00 5""5‘(;’{‘;;‘(:?;; Oea $159.27 10 per NB $9.10 $9.00ca
GOGGLES
Uwex Stealth Goggle Uvex Stealth Goggle TUvex Stealth Goggle
Malke/Model - Uvex: Stealth Ith Gaggle 5396 "
e Goggia |Uvex Stealth Goggle 33960C| T 6604T2) {comes in cage of SO Uvex Stealth Goggle 539600
(10+) - 55,15 $10.25 $7.95EA £17.40 ez NB 57.99 $8.0908
Make/Model - NO BID Pyramex GGS04T Radians BG1-11 Pyremaz/G704T GHOT(::Z;;"“ Fog
(10+) - - $6.20 $2.55BA £4.61 ea - $1,69ea
vex Spoggle Fury Uvex Spoggle
Make/Model . B
ode NOEBDD TUvex Spoggle Uvex Spoggle S1890% Discontinued
10+) - . $11.00 NiA - $2.20 NiA
FACE SHIELDS AND HEAD GEAR
Ratchet Style Headgear (Make/Model) (10+) . NO BID RAD64051065 (£9.10) R“E‘s“s“j ;‘:’;‘m NO BID NB $5.00 Pyramex HGE ($4,29¢2)
Hard Hat Attachment Style Headgear (Make/Model} {10+ - N ! Radians FIG-410A4 (Sold ]
ty Igear (Make/Model} (10+) RADS4OS1067 (8290) | s osen) NO BID $3.25 Pyramex HELAN (52.79¢2)
Polycarbonate 040 Clear Shislds (50+) - y RADS4051710 ($3.99) R’d‘z‘;‘f ;’:;i;scr $4.75 . 151540 (52.0) MCR. 181540 ($1.85¢2)
Polycarboate 040 #5 Cutting Shields (10+) - - RAD64051722 (54.50) Raidans V40373 NOEBD - 101640 (51.80) Gateway 663 ($11,29)

($12.40EA)




EID TABULATION - SAFETY SUPPLIES 2014.xls

HENRY SCHEIN INC

JOHNSTON INDUSTRIAL

HENRY SCHEIN INC LVER READY FIRST AID MTS SAFETY PRODUCTS | QUILL CORPORATION TAVA PRODUCTS LLC WISE EL SANTO CO
SAFETY SUPFLIES 2014 SUPPLY/SAFETY SUPFLY
BID OB NNN G
LENS CLEANING STATION AND SUPPLIES
Make/Model: UVEX CLEAR LENS Cleaning Station:
(Includes 4 boxes of tissues {500ct}, a 16 oz
Bottle of Uvex cleaning solution, mirror,
screw mounts, and double sided ahesive foam for mounting,)
Above Make and Model (§1-9) NO BID $37.00 Uvex 8461 ($28.15en) No Bids NB $24,50 5461 (£26.92ea)
Above Mzke and Model {10-+H) NQ BID $36,00 Uvex 5461 ($27.45) No Bids - 525,89z
16 oz. CLEAR Refill Solution w/pump {10+) $3.87 $3.95 Uvex 8463 (53.27) No Bids - $3.00 3463 (52.80ea)
CLEAR Tissues (300 count) {1 0+) NQ BID $3.00 Thvex S462 ($2.65) No Bids - $2.50 S462 (§2,10ea)
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DI NPENTNA

EYE WASH STATION: (16 oz. Double Botrle Wall Station}
Make: Fisher Balco Fendall Packit Honeywell Packit Fendal Honeywell
Model: #15003035 612-0230 607-114 32000465000 24-102 eyesaline BID-§572590RS 32-0000-455-000 32-000465-5000
(81-9) $40.54 $29.78 $34.00 $15.83 EACH $34.38 $21.37 ea 528.98 $27.49¢ea

16 oz. Eye Wash Refills (for above station)
Make: Fendall (sold in rult of 12)
Model: #12003030 106-5963 32-000454-0000 32-0000-454-000 32-000454-0000
($20+) $7.71 £9.49 $6.72 $5.23 EACH $10.33 NB £6,00 $5.48ea

PERSONAL EYEWASH:
1 oz, Sterile Solution Eyewash (24 to a case) Pricc per case
" First Aid Only (mode]:
Make: #662-002 Medique 19828 Packit K;"gf;:’ case of BID-80298) Sold ! per 32.000451-0000
bx, 24 each=case
§50.64 for 24
(10+) $1.92 $33.61 §36.00 $237.75 Per Case $60.69 {12 10 box) £2,11/bx $46.00 $59.4%¢cs
lea=bx
RESPIRATORS
DUST/MIST RESPIRATORS
Make/Model: Moldex 2260 N95 Particulate Respirator 335-9968 #8210 - P:’I_l?ldf":;ig tf:jm
ticulate Respirats
Price per Box of 20 (10+) $29.44 NO BID $18.00 $17.10 BX 528,08 513.17/bx 51425 $13.75 box
Make/Model: Moldex 2200 N95 Particulate Respirator Tray Biolcgical . Gerson 1501 P 270';2::;1““”““ Cordova INX93 3M BID-3M8210 (20/b%) Cordova CDM2
Price per Box of 50 (10+) /A - $5.72 $4.10 BX {$11.81 per box of 20) NB 514,00 $2.94 box
HALF MASK FACEPIECE
Make (Survivair BLUE 1 TM Facepiece) - .
Maodel: (220010) - -
Color (Blue) - -
Size: Small (§1-9) - NO BID £31.00 $28.10EA No Bid NB $29.00 $24.75
Size; Small ($10+) - - $30.00 $2742 EA - NB $29.00 £24.20es
Size: Medium ($1-9) - - $31.00 $28.10EA - - 529,00 524.75
Size: Medium (§10+) - - $30.00 $27.42EA - . $29.00 524,20ea
Size: Large ($1-9) - - $31.00 $28.10EA - - $29.00 $24.75
Size: Large ($104) - - 530.00 $2742EA - - $25.00 £24.20
CARTRIDGES: (For Above Half Mask Facepiece)

Type: CRGANIC VAPOR - -
Make: Survivair B -
Model: #100100-Ng5 - - Survivair #100100 B100100
6 Cartridges per Box (Box of §) § - - $31.00 $27.95BX No Bid NB $226.00 $24.30box

FARTICULAR FILTERS: (For above Hall Mask Facepiece)
Type: CRGANIC VAPOQR (Cloth Pre-Filter) - -
Make: Survivair - -
Model; #1060-N95 - - #1060-10N95 1056010
24 Filters per Box (Per Box of 24) § - - 527,00 $24.90 BX No Bid NB $26.00 $22 20box

PREFILTER RETAINER (For Above Half Mask Facepiece)
$10+ - - §2,60 $2.42 (pack of 2) No Bid NB $3.50 14900975 (52.25ea)
HARD HATS: (MUST MEED LATEST ANSI STANDARDS)

WITHREGULAR SUSPENSION:

Make: - NO BID Pyramex ERB {US Made) North Safety Pyramex
Model: - - HP14010 Omega 2 HF14010
$10+ . - $3.65 EA‘p‘l‘"é")"“""' mAltofl 12133 dzcap syle NB $6.00 $1.87ea
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RN ADTNTNL
Make: - - PP Pyramex Radi
Madel; - - 280-EV5121 HP16010 GHP4
s10+ - - SLZOEA Dot | 59538.16) o srle - §5.450
WITH RATCHET SUSPENSION
Make: - - Pyramex ERB {1JS Made) North Safety Pyramex
Maodel: - - HP14110 Omega 2 A-79 HP14110
810+ - - s1.62 EAQ(I,"‘]‘;"N Ut | 141,00 dz cap style - $9.00 $49%e
Make: - - Radians Pyramex Radians
Model: - - GHR4 Model GEHR4
$10+ - - $6.45 EA (purchage mult $121.23 {16/box) - $6.10¢a
of 20)
HELMET LINERS:
Make: - - KCP N-Ferno Ergodyne Kimberly Clark
Model: - - 16762 Extreme Ser 12338 16762
$50+ - - §2.73 EA {purchase mult $6.95ea - $3.00 $2.89e
of 12)
Make: v - KCP Quiltted Kimberly Clark
Model; - - 14502 ‘Winter 14502
$50+ - . $2.50 EA {purchase mult $4.15 ea R $2.20ea
of 12)
EOOTS: (RUBBER, NEOPRENE, ETC.)
"17 OVER THE SHOE
Make: - - West Chester Cordova Bass Wilshire
Maodel: - - 8200 BYS17 ZKP4431 1640Y
Each § - - $17.30PR $25.77 $30.00 $15.98ea
Make; - - River City
Model: - - BYR.100
Each $ - - $36.52
5 BUCKLE OVER THE SHOE
{Make: - - West Chegter Cordova Servus Wilshire
Maodel: - - 8250 BB35B T-369 3014
Each § - - $21.73PR $37.60 NB $41.00 $22.9¢
Make: - -
Model: - -
Each $ - - -
SLIF ON STYLE WITH SAFETY TOE AND $TEEL SHANK
Make; - NQ BID West Chester Cordova Cordova Onguard
Model: - - §350 BST BST-8 86102
Each § - - 515,50 PR, $37.12 NB $32,00 $20.29
Make; - - River City
Madel: - - PRS120
Each $ - - $27.35 -
MISC. PROTECTIVE WEAR:
CHAIN SAW CHAPS:
Make: - - Forester Marmac Elvex
Model: - - Chap 4 Chain Breaker JE-9033 33"/TE-9036 36"
Each § - - N/A $49,95 NB $56.00 £38.50ea
Make: - - Forester Elvex
Model; - - Chap 7 JE-9039 39"
Each § - NQ RIDD N/A $55.62 NB 59,50
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RITY MDENTAIC

LEATHER ANTI VIBRATION GLOVES: (M-L-XL-2XL)
(Full-Finper With Wrist Wrap)
Make; Valeo - -
Model:v4 - - VI 4876 35-WS 435wy V435
Eachs - NO BID s28.10% RZ(P":;‘ purchase $38.10 NB $26,00 $21.50pr
LEATHER ANTI VIBRATION GLOVES: (M-L-XL-2XL)
{Half-Finger With No Wrist Strap)

Make: Valao - -
Model: V4 - u V14872 V440 Y440
Tach $ - NOBD $I0.00PR (’::)“ purchase § No Bid NB $15.00 $16,20pr

SWEAT BANDS:
Make: - General Scientific PP Logistics Cccunomix QecuNomix
Model: - 21867 396-505 12452eg SB 100 SBX100
Each § @ 100 - $277.00 (2.77 each) $40,00 per pack of 100ea $190.00 per 100 - $24.00 £21.95pk
Make: - - PIP Oceunomix Kimberly Clark
Model; n - 356-500 SB 16751
Each $ @ 100 - - $32,50 per pack of [00ea $34.60 per 100 - £32.48pk

WATER-JEL STYLE EURN SUPPLEES:
COMPLETE BURN KITS:
Make: - Waterjel Tech Waterjel Packit Ever ready ‘Waterjel/Packit Soft Pouch|
Model: . EBK2:3 ((T:::L]; e 3030 EBKI-6 3030
Each & - £90.05 §53.90 $30.10 Ne Bid NB $62.00 $29,95¢a
$109.50

%' X 6' BLANKET
Make; N/S Watergel 6x 5 - Waterjel ‘Water jel Everready Waterjel/Packit
Model: 326-8339 7260-04 - 9672-04 9672-1 9672-04 96721

$429.38 (sald 4/cs)
Each § (5122.35 Bach sold NO BID $189.00 $236,30 No Bid - $210.00 $248,00ea
in box of 4)
3 X 2' 6" DRESSING:
Make: Waterjel Tech Waterjel Water jel Ever ready Wateriel/Packit
Model: 3630-04 0206-60 3630-1 0206-60 3630-1
Each § $1.00 544,23 $2.72 $68.10 No Bid - $3.32 $66,30ea
18" X 3” DRESSING:

Make; Watergel Waterjel Tech ‘Waterjel Water jel Ever ready Waterjel/Packit
Model: 400-9893 0818-20 0818-20 0818-20 0818-01 0818-2¢ 08181
Each § $9.30 $8.17 39,72 $12,60 No Bid - 510,72 $13.40¢a

4" X 4" Dressing:
Make; Watergel Waterjel Tech Waterje! Water jel Ever ready ‘Waterjel/Packit
Model: 326-2802 0404.60 BS§2-24 040460 0404-01 0404-60 0404-01
Each § $3.17 32,30 5325 $4.30 Na Bid - £4.00 $4.66ea

BULK FIRST AID SUPPLIES

Band Aids- 1" x 3" Plastic Strips {100 per box) # HS 112-6138 0300001 (1-200) BID-4444 Band-Aid 1-200
520+ $0.89 50.72 $1.54 $2.43 54,98 $5.07/bx £1.75 2.65
Knuckle Bandages (100 per box) # Conco 210-3966 0300015 (1-900) 1-900
510+ 5547 $1.91 §3.85 §7.55 Si1.42 NE $4.50 Bx $7.45pk
Fingertip Bandages (100 per box) # Conco 104-3319 Q300017 1-910 1-990
510+ $4.54 $1.91 $3.50 36,79 $5.37 NB $4.00 Bx 56,22 box
Disposable Latex Gloves (Lazge) (100 per box) 1027763 HS 1200009 PP 32IL B3 17:2;:‘;’""’ Free GRDR
$10+ $6.02 $3.02 $6.15 84,99 $9.90 57.73/bx $7.00 Bx $4.47 box
Guaze Pads- 2'x2" (100 per box) # 100-4380 Sterile HS 0200001 3102 3102
$20+ 3260 $0.60 $2.25 £3.43 $9.13 NB 52.75 Bx $5.29 box
Roll Gauze- 2"x Syd (12 per package) # 104-2739 Sterile HS 0200066 (24 per package) 5-6600 5-6600 (24 per package)
20+ 3249 50,56 $1.10 56,25 $13.17 NB EL.35Pk $6.43ea
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MNIT DENEN
Alcahol Wipes (100 per bor) # 850-0236 DYN1104 12110 12110
KENDAL #5750 200/bx.
$20+ $1.47 5164 51,00 $1,89 $3.63 NB $1.25 Bx $1.98 per box
Antiseptic Wipes {100 per box)# 112-6735 HS DYN1303 12-180 (50 per box) 12-180
§20+ §1.50 $1.63 $1.75 5249 $6.71 NB $2.00 Bx §2.48 box
Medical Tape- 1/2" x 10 yd (24 per bon)# HS 101-3025 2600009 {2 per box) B-001 EID-101983BX 3M 8-050
$20+ §8.61 $7.58 $8.95 $0.75 $3.17 ea §7.73/bx $9.95 Bx $.89 roll
Aatiseptic Ointment~1/320z. Packets (144 per bax)# NB 1000078 12-744 sub entibiatic aintment, (.5gm) 12-744
10+ N/B $6.63 $10.25 513,685 532,87 NB $12.00 Bx $13.35 box
CORTAID Crea z ub 1 .
1.0% Hydrgoort[;;;h: ;fﬁtc:aéf:fm)# NB 1000052 18144 cmigmf_l Py gel N Bid
510+ N/B $7.73 $10.25 810.40 $24.90 NB 514,00 Bx -
TVY BLOCK (4 oz Bottlex/1 2 per case) # N/B (D‘sw“:;::‘;éc‘"““ 18-050 SUB-IVYX (12 per case) No Bid
$12+ NB $52.33 Case of 12 $36.00 2,65 per BT $99.29 NB $44.00 Cs -
VY SOOTHE (1 oz. tube) # N/B Tvarest 2oz Rhr relief 18-060 No Bid
512+ N/B $26.70 54,50 $2.15 No Bid NB $5.25Ea -
'TECHNU "QAK-N-IVY" Cleanser (12 oz Bottle) # N/B F(10079 FG10079
$10+ N/B NO BID §7.95 N/A $10.19 NB 58,95 Ea §7.29a
TECHNU "OAK-N-LVY" Cleanser (32 oz Bottle) # N/B FG10089 F{310089
510+ N/B NO BID 512.95 NA 516.73 NB $14.25 Ba $12.29 ea
Empty First Aid Boxes (Flastic) (APP 5" x 3-1/2" x 2) & N/B 209.000
§ Lots of {00 N/B 53429 $2,50 N/A No Bid NB $3.90 Ea $3.08ea
FALL PROTECTION
FULL BOD'Y HARNESSES; (With Black and Side D-Rings)
STRETCHARBLE STYLE:
Make: - - Miller Titan Honeywell Miller Miller Honeywall
Modei: - - TF4007/UAK BID-1980410RS P'950qe-T/ugn TF4007/UAK
$Each: - NO BID $72.49 No Bid 515195 ea $114.00 $63.59%ea
Same In Quantities Of 3: $70.70
Make; - -
Model: - -
$ in quantities of 3 - - No Bid NE $62.53ea
Make: - - 3M
Model: - - 1411
$Each: - - $79.27 No Bid NB
Same In Quantities OF 3: §76.47
Make: - -
|Model: - -
$ in quantities of 3 - - Ne Bid NB
NON-STRETCH STYLE
Make: - - IM Honeywell Miller Miller Capital Safety
Model: - - 10911 BID-1980260RS 650-uyk ABI7520
$Each: - - $39.39 Ne Bid 312%.11 ea $95.00 $41,50ea
Same In Quantities Of 3: $38.40
Make: - -
Model: - -
§ in quantities of 3 - - No Bid NB $40.502a
Make: - u
Model: - -
$Each; “ - No Bid NB
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Make;

Model:

$ in quantities of 3

No Bid

NB

LANYARDS (With 2 Locking Snap Hooks)

SHOCK ABSOREING STYLE

Make:

M

Miller

Miller

Capital Safety

Model:

208512

BID-7746710RS

216M-27/6FTGN

1341001

$Each;

$33.79

No Bid

$73.00

531.20ea

Same In Quantities Of 3:

$38.42

$52.01 ¢a

MMake:

Model:

§in quantities of 3

No Bid

§30.75ea

Make:

Model:

$Each;

No Bid

Same In Quantities O 3:

Make:

Model:

§ in quantities of 3

No Bid

"TIE-BACK" STYLE

Make:

3M

Miller

Capital Safety

Model:

3561

915B/6FTGN

1240200

$Each;

854,56

No Bid

$36.00

$41.50ea

Same In Quantities OF 3:

553.28

Make:

Model:

$ in quantities of 3

No Bid

$40.50ea

|Make:

Model;

$Each:

No Bid

NB

Saroe In Quantities OF 33

{Make:

[Model:

§$ in quantities of 3

Ne Bid

LOW VOLTAGE LINEMAN'S GLOVES

CLASS 00 INSULATED RUBBER. GLOVES

(Gloves must meet or exceed ASTM D120 and
IEC EN60903 standards)

(Gloves must be available in a range or sizes from 7-12
including half sizes;available in various colors and lengths
of 11* and 14"}

Make/Model: Salisbury EO011BLO

NO BID

$Each

N/A

No Bid

$60.00

B41.45

Make/Maodel: Salisbury EO014BLO

$Each

N/A

No Bid

$62.00

$42.50

|Make/Model:

$Each

N/A

NB

LEATHER PROTECTORS

(Leather Protectors must meet or exceed ASTM F696
| standards)

(Leather protectors must be made of genuine leather, and
mannfactured to insure proper fit over the Insulated
Rubber Gloves)

(Gloves must be availzble in a range of sizes from 7 -12,
including half sizes. and in lengths frem 10" - 14"

Make/Model: Salisbury ILPG Series

ILPGL0

$Each

N/A

No Bid

NB

§25.00

516,35

|Make/Model: Salisbury LPG Series

LPG10
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g TY SUPPLIES 2014 HENRY SCHEIN INC EENRY SCHEIN INC EVER READY FIRST AID | oo e rETY SUPPLY | MTS SAFETY PRODUCTS | QUILL CORPORATION | TAVA PRODUCTS LLC | WISE EL SANTO CO
BTN ABENTNG
$Each - - NIA No Bid NB $27.00 $39.50
Make/Model; - M
$Each - - N/A NB
GLOVE STORAGE BAG -
(Bags must contain two layered pockets in one bag to stere
both a pair of Insulated Rubber Gloves, and a pair of
Leather Protectors)
Make/Model: Salisbury GPB114 - -
$Each - - N/A No Bid NB $33.00 526,95
Make/Model: - -
$Each - - N/A No Bid NB
MISC. SUPPLIES
REFLECTIVE PAVEMENT MARKING TAPE (FOIL BACKED) Heavy Duty "Wet Type"
4in. 150 ft. White Pavement Marking Tape per roll (1-10) , NOBIDD NiA XB 585,30 Harrig Brand PT-3-4 white
{84645 roll}
4 in. x 150 ft. White Pavement Marking Tape per ro}l (10+) - - “ - $8530 54495 roll
. . Harris Brand PT-3-4
4 in, x 150 ft. Yellow Pavement Marking T: 2 (1-10; - . - -
ng Tape per roll (1-10) $83.30 Yellow ($46.43 roll}
4 in. x 150 ft. Yellow Pavement Marking Tape per roll (10+) - - - - $85.30 $44.95 roll
SATETY VESTS
DISPOSABLE ORANGE PLASTIC VEST
Make: 1-999 - R & B Fabricaticns Hygrage 2W Anchor 2w
Model: 1-999 - 002-OR. Fvl V30M 20010.CP 7518
$1-599 - $23.28 $5,90 /A $0.82 NEB $3.25 §0.5382
Make: 1000 -+ - -
Model: 1000 + - N
$1000+ - $23.28 $3.90 N/A, 50,78 - $3.22 $0.4%ea
$100.00 for free freight Na "‘i"i“l‘“’" d°"“;
MINIMUM DOLLAR AMOUNT OF ORDER, IF ANY $150.00 NONE $100.00 {under min order can be j Rotfor oo feight o
. . laced but freight will be - No Min. $250.00 but for free freight ocur
P added to invoice) minimum is $100.00 per
order
NUMBER CF DAYS BETWEEN ORDER AND 1-2 business days ARQ
2.5 3 14 2 . * ‘ i
DELIVERY ON SITE 710 day aro 5-14 stock items) 14 Bus{ness Days Varies
DATE YOUR BID PRICE EXPIRES - - - 12-31-2¢G14 - 1-31-2015 12-31-2014 12-31-14
AFFIDAVIT COMPLETED YES NO YES YES YES YES YES YES
COPY OF INSURANCE PROVIDED YES NO NO NO NO YES YES YES
HSSHENRY SCHEN Page 2 of 21 states: SEE ATTACHED SHEET
COMMENTS: NS=NON STOCK Insurance will be issued FOR ADDITIONAL
ALLOWED EXTRA TIME upon awarded PRICING




Invitation for Bid: SAFETY SUPPLIES 2014

BIDS SHALL BE ACCEPTED UNTIL: TUESDAY, JANUARY 28, 2014, AT 2:00 P.M. LOCAL TIME.

Specification
Contact:

Contract
Contact:

Mail (3) Three
Complete Copies
‘With Vendor And
Bid Information As
Shown In Sample:

Contract Term:

UPON APPROVAL OF THE
COUNTY COUNCIL AND
COUNTY EXECUTIVE

Vendor
Information:

Invitation For Bid and Bid Form

JEFFERSON COUNTY

DEPARTMENT OF ADMINISTRATIVE SERVICES
729 MAPLE ST /PO BOX 100

HILLSBORO MO 63050

WWW.JEFFCOMO.ORG

Date Issued:

JASON JONAS
Department of Public Works
636-797-5369

VICKIE PRATT
Department of Administrative Services
636-797-5382

SAMPLE ENVELOPE
VENDOR NAME
VENDOR ADDRESS
CONTACT NUMBER DEPARTMENT OF THE COUNTY CLERK
JEFFERSON COUNTY MISSOURI
729 MAPLE ST /POBOX 100

HILLSBORO MO 63050-0100

SEALED BID; (BID NAME)

The undersigned certifies that he/she has the authority to bind this company in an
agreement/contract to supply the comtmodity or service in accordance with all terms,
conditions, and pricing specified, This Bid, if accepted, will constitufc an Agreement and
Contract with Jefferson County, Missouri, upon approval of the County Council and County
Executive, Prices are firm during this agreement term, unless agreed upon in writing by the
County, The County has the option to renew this agreement at the same terms and conditions
as the original agreement for one additional one-year term with the written consent of the
successful Bidder, Price increases for renewals are not authorized unless approved in writing

by the County. .
Quin Corpmvadwn Doy, -
Company Name uthorized Agent{Brinf)
o0 Schelea Rd j—
Address " Signatu
Lineorund TC oo™ De Al pf SOES
City/State/Zip Code Title
FOO. Lo Y%A 2o-yAS 90N
Telephone # Date Tax ID#
o (B e aiin s CONA FOO AR, SO\ g
E-mail ” Fax #

Bidder's Initials: @
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Quill Bid Response Form

Quill Bid#: 14-8013
Customer Bid#: SAFETY SUPPLIES 2014

Organization Name: COUNTY OF JEFFERSON

Enterprise# : 10558820
Contact Name: Vickie Pratt
Contact Phone#: 6367975380

Bid Type: ltem

Bid Open Date: 1/28/2014

Bid Open Time: 2:00 PM

Item Expiration Date: 2/1/2015
Catalog Expiration Date:
Total Items: 11 (0 Won, 0 Lost )

Total: $ 1768.76 { 0.00 Won, 0.00 Lost)

. L . C

Line# ltem# Description ColoriMake |Qty|Price |UoM|UoM Conv Q?yse Ext Total|Note Page

1 8575620RS M1 PREMIUM EARMUFF 10| 2959 EA 1 295.90

PELTOR DLX PRSNL HEARNG

2 8574410RS PRTOTR 10| 1947 EA 1 194.70

3 1544730RS M3 CAP MOUNT EARMUFF 10| 2895 EA 1 289.50

2 8572590RS 16-OZ. EYE & SKIN FLUSHSTATN o] 21.37] EA 1 192.33

5 800298 EYEWASH, 1 10Z BOTTLE 10 211 BX 24 2110

6 38210 PARTICULATE RESPIRATOR N95 M 20 1347| BX | 20EA=1BX 8 263.40
JOHNSON

7 4444 1 FABRIC ADHESIVE BANDAGES 3 20 507 BX | 100EA=1BX | 12 101.40
JOHNSON

31765 LATEX PWDR FREE EXAM GLOVE, |ADENNA | 10 773 BX | 100EA=1BX | 10 77.30
8 [1980410Rs DURAFLEX STRETCH HARNESS 1| 151.95 EA 7 151.95
10 |7980260RS FULLBODY HARNESSUNIVERSAL | 129.11] EA 1 129.11
- GTUBLR WEB SHCK ABSREI ) '
11 7746710RS Nven - RBNG 1|  s207 EA 1 52.07

&u&b&d




