BID TABULATION-TRACTION SAND

TRACTION SAND
BID OPENING
10-1-14

BOBBY HOELSCHER
TRUCKING INC

BOBBY HOELSCHER
TRUCKING INC
(ALTERNATE BID)

IRON MOUNTAIN
TRAP ROCK

KA PAZDERA
HAULING LLC

24477 WINDY LANE
WARRENTON MO 63383

2477 WINDY LANE
WARRENTON MO 63383

2320 CREVE COEUR MILL
RD MARYLAND
HEIGHTS MO 63043

11866 STATE RD CC
FESTUS MO 63028

BASE BID- Traction Sand Material
Only. Does NOT Include Loading and
Hauling. County Will Load and Hall.

Price Per CU YD NO BID NO BID NO BID
Price Per TON NO BID NO BID NO BID
ALTERNATE 1- Traction Sand
Material Loaded on County Provided
Trucks. Does Not Include Hauling.
Price Per TON NO BID NO BID $6.00

[ AL TCRINVATLE Z- T Tacuorr sama
Material Loaded and Delivered to
County. Price Will be Unit Price Plus

Lin.d Dodn

Price Per TON

$7.00 (material is

$7.00 (material is ice
control man sand Iron

$6.00 (plus hauls)

ECOsand) Mountain Trap Rock)
HAUL RATE CHART-ADD ON
PRICE PER TON FOR DELIVERY
(Price Per TON)

Deliver to 5275 Hwy B, Hillsboro, MO $9.80 $10.60 $12.50 $11.75
Deliver to 2960 Li;gyle Road, Desoto, $11.90 $8.45 $11.25 $12.25
Deliver to 6460 State Hwy MM, House

Springs, MO $6.95 $13.10 $15.50 $11.75

Location of Stockpiled Material

Chara 3435 Labadie
Bottom Rd Labadie MO
63055 (material is
ecosand)

Iron Mountain Trap Rock
325 Hwy N Ironton MO
63650 (material is ice
control man sand)

325 Highway N
Ironton MO 63650

Bussen JB Quarry

PRICES WILL REMAIN IN EFFECT
UNTIL (DATE)

October 31, 2015

October 31, 2015

1 year from award date as
requested by Jefferson

County
NOTARIZED WORK AFFIDAVIT
COMPLETED YES YES YES YES
COPY OF INSURANCE PROVIDED | SHOULD BE ON FILE | SHOULD BE ON FILE YES YES
TAX RECEIPTS OR NOTARIZED
LETTER STATING NO REAL OR
PERSONAL PROPERTY OWNED IN YES YES YES NO
JEFFERSON COUNTY
COOPERATIVE BID FORM (Y/N) YES YES YES YES
COOPERATIVE CONTACT INFO: YES YES YES YES
COMPANY INFORMATION AND
SIGNATURE NO NO YES YES
BID DEPOSIT REQUIRED N/A N/A N/A N/A

COMMENTS:




