SAFETY SUPPLIES BID TABULATION

BOUND THE AMERICNAN
SAFETY SUPPLIES WISE EL TREE GOLDEN MTS EVER OLYMPIC SAFETY &
BID OPENING SANTO MEDICAL PACIFIC SAFETY READY HP GLOVE & MEMCO, | ABATEMEN NORTHERN
1-30-07 CO. LLC HCP PRODUCTS | FIRST AID | PRODUCTS SAFETY INC T ARAMSCO |SAFETY CO.
Ear Plugs -
Model LPF-1 Bx 200 $13.93 NO BID NO BID $26.50 $16.50 $15.31 $14.50 $14.60 $14.00 $18.29 NO BID
BANDED HEARING
PROTECTION
$269.92 CASE
OF 100 PR
QB3 Quite Band $26.59 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $28.71 $29.90 $31.40 $25.75 CASE NO BID
QB3 Replacment Cushions $13.45 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $6,936.00 $68.00 $13.65 $12.95 $263.92 NO BID
EAR Caps $30.50 NO BID NO BID $59.95 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $30.98 NO BID
EAR Replacement Pods $7.38 NO BID NO BID $24.95 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $9.00 NO BID
EAR MUFFS WITH NRR 29
VIKING V3
Bilsom Elvex F- Bacou Dalloz Viking #1010927 NS - 118 -
MAKE / MODEL 1010924 NO BID NO BID HB5000 NO BID Thunder T3 Radians Peltor HI0A | V3-1010927 (BILSOM) 20996
10+ $12.95 NO BID NO BID $22.00 NO BID $15.31 $10.50 $14.40 $12.58 $13.68 $10.25
Radians Leightning L3-| THUNDER T3
MAKE / MODEL TRO160CS NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID EL 29 Bilsom V3 1010924 (NNR30) NO BID
10+ $10.98 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $10.50 $13.66 $13.47 $14.93 NO BID
EAR MUFFS WITH NRR 24
HORNET
HEAD EAR
MUFF WITH
Liberty Ultra Viking COMFORT
MAKE / MODEL Bilsom QM24 NO BID NO BID Elvex F-HB25 NO BID Light NRR25 Silencer E.A.R. 4000 | V1-1010925 PAD, RED. NO BID
10+ $4.58 NO BID NO BID $8.50 NO BID $3.53 $5.10 $5.09 $5.27 $10.60 NO BID
Radians QM24 + THUNDER T-
MAKE / MODEL SLO130ID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID Radians Bilsom L1 |Howard Lwight| 1#1010928 NO BID
10+ $4.25 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $5.10 $6.15 $5.00 $6.31 NO BID
CAP MOUNTED MUFF
CLARITY
Radians CMT- Elvex F- MSA CIH-BILSOM
MAKE / MODEL 26 NO BID NO BID HM14823 NO BID 10061272 Radians Bilsom L1H | Thunder T1H #1011144 NO BID
10+ $9.70 NO BID NO BID $18.50 NO BID $18.08 $7.75 $6.15 $5.79 $6.06 NO BID
Radians
MAKE / MODEL 502-Earmuff NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID Cap Mount Bilsom T1H | Thunder T3H NO BID NO BID
10+ $7.60 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $7.75 $6.15 $14.05 NO BID NO BID
EYE PROTECTION - SAFETY
GLASSES
CLEAR LENS
UVEX Astrospec 3000 1-49 $3.88 NO BID NO BID $6.60 NO BID $4.36 NO BID $4.31 $3.85 $4.57 NO BID
UVEX Astrospec 3000 50+ $3.78 NO BID NO BID $6.40 NO BID NO BID NO BID $4.09 $3.77 $4.18 NO BID
UVEX Astro OTG 3001 1-49 $4.87 NO BID NO BID $8.70 NO BID NO BID NO BID $5.22 $4.81 $5.88 NO BID
UVEX Astro OTG 3001 50+ $4.73 NO BID NO BID $8.65 NO BID NO BID NO BID $5.10 $4.70 $5.37 NO BID
Clear Lens Astrospec 3000 50+ $1.21 NO BID NO BID $3.12 NO BID $1.46 NO BID $1.36 $1.25 $1.60 NO BID
Clear Lens Astro OTG 3001 50+ $2.21 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $2.40 $2.21 $2.85 NO BID
GREY LENS
UVEX Astrospec 3000 1-49 $4.38 NO BID NO BID $7.80 NO BID NO BID NO BID $4.70 $4.33 $5.13 NO BID
UVEX Astrospec 3000 50+ $4.23 NO BID NO BID $7.70 NO BID NO BID NO BID $4.59 $4.24 $4.69 NO BID
UVEX Astro OTG 3001 1-49 $5.33 NO BID NO BID $9.60 NO BID NO BID NO BID $5.74 $5.64 $6.27 NO BID
UVEX Astro OTG 3001 50+ $5.17 NO BID NO BID $9.50 NO BID NO BID NO BID $5.61 $5.52 $5.73 NO BID
Clear Lens Astrospec 3000 50+ $1.73 NO BID NO BID $4.10 NO BID NO BID NO BID $1.88 $1.73 $2.20 NO BID
Clear Lens Astro OTG 3001 20+ $2.68 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $2.92 $2.63 $3.49 NO BID
#5 Lens for Astro OTG 3001 10+ $5.19 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $5.64 $5.20 $6.17 NO BID
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GOGGLES
UVEX Stealth 10+ $6.87 NO BID NO BID $12.25 NO BID NO BID NO BID $7.47 $6.89 $7.60 NO BID
UVEX Spoggle 10+ $2.48 NO BID NO BID $13.15 NO BID NO BID NO BID $8.03 $2.98 $7.99 NO BID
FACE SHEILDS
Ratchet Style Headgear
MCR 103 Radians NORTH
MAKE / MODEL Headgear NO BID NO BID Crews D-103 NO BID Pyramex HGB HG-400 NO BID Pyramix H6B | #KHG4001 | NS 107-20124
10+ $4.40 NO BID NO BID $6.75 NO BID $3.55 $4.05 NO BID $3.85 $6.19 $4.74
Hard Hat Attachment Style
Headgear
Radians
MCR 102 Pyramex HG410A or Pyramix NORTH
MAKE / MODEL Bracket NO BID NO BID Crews D-102 NO BID HHAN 410B NO BID HHAA #CP5005 NO BID
10+ $4.58 NO BID NO BID $7.05 NO BID $2.55 $4.80 NO BID $3.95 $4.67 NO BID
Polycarbonate .40
Clear Shields 50+ $2.33 NO BID NO BID $3.00 NO BID $2.03 $1.65 NO BID $1.50 $2.61 $2.16
Polycarbonate .40
Cutting Shields 10+ $9.27 NO BID NO BID $2.60 NO BID $3.42 $12.40 NO BID $13.49 $3.43 NO BID
LENS CLEANING
1-9 $19.59 NO BID NO BID $15.75 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $23.00 $22.88 NO BID
10+ $19.25 NO BID NO BID $15.25 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $19.35 $22.88 NO BID
16 oz Clear Refill solution
with pump 10+ $2.48 NO BID NO BID $4.75 NO BID $2.70 NO BID NO BID $2.65 $3.04 NO BID
Clear Tissues 10+ $1.89 NO BID NO BID $3.60 NO BID $2.12 NO BID NO BID $1.98 $2.31 NO BID
EYE WASH STATION
Certified K250 Bradley D-B75 HL Bouton Bio Med Iso-Tone CERTIFIED
Make / Model 507 NO BID NO BID S19-902 HL Bouton 017 01018 Double NO BID 242016C North 127035 109-5416
1-9 $13.95 NO BID NO BID $33.95 $21.36 $12.95 $26.00 NO BID $16.36 $84.34 $14.55
16 oz Eye Wash Refill 20+ $3.93 NO BID NO BID $7.50 $5.40 $5.24 $15.00 NO BID $4.45 $63.65 NO BID
PERSONAL EYEWASH
1 oz Sterile Solution Eyewash
Price per case of 24 $37.10 NO BID NO BID NO BID $17.72 $1.37 $52.00 NO BID $1.76 $41.50 NO BID
RESPIRATORS
Moldex 2200 N95 Particulate Bidding Gerson
Respirartor N95
Price per box of 20 10+ $12.20 NO BID $7.92 $23.00 NO BID $13.65 $12.35 NO BID $8.45 $9.88 NO BID
Survivair - Aramsco
Maytex 3395- Moldex 2200 Nelson A24137 N95
Make / Model MCR RPDM1 NO BID N95 NO BID NO BID N/A N95 NO BID 14110094cc Respirator NO BID
Price per box of 50 10+ $3.15 NO BID N/A NO BID NO BID $8.92 NO BID NO BID $4.95 $142.33 NO BID
HALF MASK FACEPIECE
1-9 $17.75 NO BID NO BID $33.95 NO BID NO BID $18.85 NO BID $17.26 $18.00 NO BID
10+ $17.49 NO BID NO BID $33.50 NO BID NO BID $18.85 NO BID $16.89 $18.00 NO BID
CARTRIDGES - ORGANIC
VAPOR
Box of 6 $19.24 NO BID NO BID $37.00 NO BID $21.02 NO BID NO BID $19.00 $22.44 NO BID
PARTICULATE FILTERS
Box of 24 $18.10 NO BID NO BID $19.25 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $19.30 $30.12 NO BID
PREFILTER RETAINER
10+ $1.78 NO BID NO BID $3.10 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $9.53 $2.20 NO BID
HARD HATS

SUSPENSION




SAFETY SUPPLIES BID TABULATION

BOUND THE AMERICNAN
SAFETY SUPPLIES WISE EL TREE GOLDEN MTS EVER OLYMPIC SAFETY &
BID OPENING SANTO MEDICAL PACIFIC SAFETY READY HP GLOVE & MEMCO, | ABATEMEN NORTHERN
1-30-07 CO. LLC HCP PRODUCTS | FIRST AID | PRODUCTS SAFETY INC T ARAMSCO |SAFETY CO.
Pyramex Pyramex HP Radians Pyramex NS 115-23188
Make / Model HP14010 NO BID NO BID ERB E-E19762 NO BID 14010 Granite NO BID HP16010 North A59 WE
10+ $3.72 NO BID NO BID $6.12 NO BID $3.17 $3.35 NO BID $3.50 $2.90 $5.03
Radians Pyramex
Make / Model Aearo 45988 NO BID NO BID ERB E-E19132 NO BID NO BID Granite NO BID HP14010 North A79 NO BID
10+ $3.72 NO BID NO BID $7.15 NO BID NO BID $3.35 NO BID $3.25 $3.63 NO BID
SUSPENSION
Pyramex Pyramex Radians Pyramex NS 115-23189
Make / Model HP140110 NO BID NO BID ERB E-E19362 NO BID HP16110 Titanium NO BID HP16110 North A79R WE
10+ $4.77 NO BID NO BID $9.40 NO BID $4.46 $4.65 NO BID $4.75 $5.89 $7.97
Radians Pyramex
Make / Model Aearo 45993 NO BID NO BID ERB E-E19952 NO BID NO BID Titanium NO BID HP26110 MSA 475358 NO BID
10+ $5.89 NO BID NO BID $10.40 NO BID NO BID $4.65 NO BID $6.25 $8.11 NO BID
HELMET LINERS
Am Allsafe Occunomics E- Occunomix Loveline Pyramex
Make / Model 250 NO BID NO BID 930-16 NO BID Rq301 FL100 NO BID WL400 North WL3 | NS 115-23625
10+ $2.29 NO BID NO BID $3.45 NO BID $2.72 $1.85 NO BID $5.00 $1.86 $4.27
Am Allsafe Occunomix Pyramex
Make / Model 225 plus NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID BA618 NO BID WL201 North WL4 NO BID
10+ $1.95 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $4.15 NO BID $2.35 $2.85 NO BID
BOOTS
17" OVER THE SHOE
Seidman Assoc| Cordova C- Bata- Onguard NS 145-
Make / Model BSYE NO BID NO BID 69504 NO BID Liberty 1510 | Seidman 8680 | Servus B7914 86050 North B7914 218648
Price Each $12.96 NO BID NO BID $15,375.00 NO BID $10.57 $11.00 $13.85 $17.05 $12.19 $11.35
Bata-Onguard
Make / Model NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID Seidman 8680 | Servus A380 88050 NO BID NO BID
Price Each NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $11.00 $13.36 $17.26 NO BID NO BID
5 BUCKLE OVER THE SHOE
Johnson Cordova C- Bata-Onguard
Make / Model Wilshire B75 NO BID NO BID 04015 NO BID Liberty 1520 NO BID Servus A351 86065 North 31860 NO BID
Price Each $16.95 NO BID NO BID $20.75 NO BID $15.02 NO BID $19.47 $19.84 $37.56 NO BID
Make / Model MCR BBR110 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID Servus T369 NO BID NO BID NO BID
Price Each $16.95 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $25.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
SLIP ON STYLE WITH
SAFETY TOE ANS STEEL
SHANK
Bata-Onguard
Make / Model Norcress 73505 NO BID NO BID Boss C-06430 NO BID Liberty 1551 NO BID Servus 18821 86606 North 18801 NO BID
Price Each $17.70 NO BID NO BID $10.25 NO BID $8.31 NO BID $10.68 $16.50 $16.65 NO BID
OnGuard
Make / Model 86606 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID Liberty 1501 NO BID Servus 18801 NO BID NO BID NO BID
Price Each $10.70 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $12.66 NO BID $16.86 NO BID NO BID NO BID
CHAIN SAW CHAPS
Elvex Boss I-
Make / Model JE-9028 NO BID NO BID WOODYS1 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Price Each $55.50 NO BID NO BID $49.95 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Elvex
Make / Model JE-9033 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Price Each $55.50 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
ANTI VIBRATION GLOVES
Valeo Valeo V-14- Safety Today
Make / Model GAFW LH NO BID NO BID GLAS-LR NO BID VAGLAXL NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Price Each $14.00 NO BID NO BID $13.95 NO BID $8.18 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
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Valeo Valeo V-14- Occunomix
Make / Model GAFW RH NO BID NO BID GAFS-LR NO BID 427L NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Price Each $14.00 NO BID NO BID $18.25 NO BID $12.36 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
SWEAT BANDS
American
Allsafe Dry
Occunomix Culebra Occunimix Brow
Make / Model SBR100 NO BID NO BID E-24710 NO BID SBR100 NO BID NO BID 220093005335 | North SB470 NO BID
Price Each $19.00 NO BID NO BID $1.25 NO BID $24.19 NO BID NO BID $31.00 $10.49 NO BID
Am AllSafe Occunimix
Make / Model 22009 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 940B-24 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Price Each $25.95 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $1.32 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
WATER JEL STYLE BURN
SUPPLIES
COMPLETE BURN KITS
Certified K203 Burn Free H- Water Jel Hart Health Certified Water Gel
Make / Model 030 NO BID NO BID BF-EMRO01 EBK23 2933 K203030 Swift 20-1992 NO BID EBK-23 NO BID
Price Each $27.20 NO BID NO BID $34.50 $90.00 $63.22 $21.50 $39.94 NO BID $93.97 NO BID
Certified K203 Water Jel Certified Water Gel
Make / Model 026 NO BID NO BID NO BID EBK16 NO BID K203026 Swift 20-2020 NO BID EBK 1-6 NO BID
Price Each $42.50 NO BID NO BID NO BID $45.00 NO BID $37.75 $76.22 NO BID $48.21 NO BID
8 X 6 BLANKET
Certified Certified Water Jel  |Moore Medical Certified Water Jel Water Gel
Make / Model 505-205 NO BID NO BID 233-091 9672-04 41726 505205 209672 NO BID 9672-04 NO BID
Price Each $189.50 NO BID NO BID $168.00 $160.00 $112.16 $242.20 $211.83 NO BID $151.71 NO BID
3 X 2'6" DRESSING
Certified Certified Water Jel Water Gel
Make / Model 505-118 NO BID NO BID NO BID Burn Free 0206 NO BID 505118 203630P NO BID 3630-04 NO BID
Price Each $48.95 NO BID NO BID NO BID $1.89 NO BID $69.85 $50.40 NO BID $42.24 NO BID
18 X 8 DRESSING
Certified Swift H-20- Water Jel Certified Water Jel Water Gel
Make / Model 505-147 NO BID NO BID 1808 0818-20 NO BID 505147 201808 NO BID 0818-20 NO BID
Price Each $9.75 NO BID NO BID $13.75 $8.00 NO BID $13.05 $9.57 NO BID $8.16 NO BID
4 X 4 DRESSING
Certified Burn Free H- Burn Free |Moore Medical Cerified Burn Free Water Gel
Make / Model 505-204 NO BID NO BID BF-00404 0404 33843 505204 20BF0404 NO BID 40460 NO BID
Price Each $3.40 NO BID NO BID $4.30 $2.00 $2.76 $4.50 $2.92 NO BID $2.80 NO BID
BULK FIRST AID SUPPLIES
Band Aid s 1x3 20+ $2.39 NO BID NO BID $3.50 $1.25 $2.39 $2.70 $1.20 NO BID $3.79 $6.91
Knuckle Bandages 10+ $6.50 NO BID NO BID $8.50 $2.79 $4.93 $7.40 $3.13 NO BID $5.12 $10.72
Fingertip Bandages 10+ $6.50 NO BID NO BID $8.75 $3.29 $8.15 $7.40 $3.08 NO BID $6.15 $9.14
$3.86
Powdered latex
$4.21 Powder
Disposable Latex Gloves 10+ $3.45 NO BID Free $4.05 $3.49 $3.32 $3.50 $4.86 $4.95 $35.00 $5.22
Gauze Pads 20+ $5.40 NO BID $21.49 $6.25 $1.99 $1.72 $6.15 $2.04 NO BID $4.50 $7.78
Roll Gauze 20+ $0.78 NO BID NO BID $3.25 $0.99 $11.55 $9.40 $2.52 NO BID $4.20 NO BID
Alcohol Wipes 20+ $2.20 NO BID NO BID $2.25 $1.18 $1.11 $2.15 $1.38 NO BID $3.87 $3.11
Antiseptic Wipes 20+ $4.35 NO BID NO BID $3.75 $1.29 $2.24 $4.85 $1.36 NO BID $1.60 $2.63
Medical Tape 20+ $1.16 NO BID $83.00 $71.50 $4.29 $1.13 $28.45 $6.88 NO BID $1.43 NO BID
Antiseptic Cream 20+ $9.30 NO BID NO BID $13.75 $10.18 $8.18 $9.50 $9.47 NO BID $13.38 NO BID
Cortaid Cream 10+ $10.50 NO BID NO BID $24.95 $9.36 $7.98 $10.70 NO BID NO BID $12.60 NO BID
Sunscreen Towelettes 20+ $15.50 NO BID NO BID $185.00 $29.80 NO BID $26.50 NO BID NO BID $43.60 NO BID
Poison Ivy Towelettes 20+ $18.75 NO BID NO BID $10.95 $7.36 NO BID $20.25 NO BID NO BID $59.20 NO BID
Oak-N-Ivy Cleanser $3.42 per 4 0z
12 oz bottle 10+ $6.98 NO BID NO BID $9.45 $6.90 bottle $9.60 NO BID NO BID $2.46 NO BID
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Oak-N-Ivy Cleanser
32 oz bottle 10+ $11.95 NO BID NO BID $15.75 $11.59 NO BID $9.60 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Empty First Aid Boxes 100 $2.95 NO BID NO BID $3.00 $2.90 NO BID $2.90 $2.96 NO BID $589.00 NO BID
FALL PROTECTION
STRETCHABLE STYLE
Miller TF4007 Titan TF4009 Miller
Make / Model uak NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID UAK TF4007/U NS 166-22757
Price Each $46.50 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $51.60 $53.49 NO BID
Price per 3 $46.50 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $48.73 $53.49 $53.15
Miller TF4007 Titan TF4507
Make / Model uak NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID UAK NO BID NO BID
Price Each $46.50 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $56.75 NO BID NO BID
Price per 3 $46.50 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $53.60 NO BID NO BID
NON-STRETCHABLE STYLE
Miller T4000 French Creek Titan T4007 Miller
Make / Model uak NO BID NO BID 850AB NO BID NO BID NO BID Fall Tech 7013 UAK T4007/U NO BID
Price Each $34.95 NO BID NO BID $136.50 NO BID NO BID NO BID $39.90 $36.84 $38.19 NO BID
Price per 3 $34.95 NO BID NO BID $135.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID $37.80 $34.80 $38.19 NO BID
Miller T4000 Fall Tech Titan T4507
Make / Model uak NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 7017 B UAK NO BID NO BID
Price Each $34.95 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $43.75 $40.52 NO BID NO BID
Price per 3 $34.95 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $42.30 $38.26 NO BID NO BID
LANYARDS
SHOCK ABSORBING STYLE
French Creek French Creek Titan T6111 - Miller
Make / Model Miller T6111 NO BID NO BID 450AB NO BID 631 NO BID Fall Tech 7256 6FTAF 216WLS NS 166-22587
Price Each $32.55 NO BID NO BID $61.00 NO BID $28.57 NO BID $34.40 $30.63 $49.57 NO BID
Price per 3 $32.55 NO BID NO BID $60.00 NO BID N/A NO BID $33.30 $28.93 $49.57 $28.45
French Creek Titan T5111 -
Make / Model Miller T6111 NO BID NO BID 450A NO BID NO BID NO BID Fall Tech 7259 6FTAF NO BID NO BID
Price Each $32.55 NO BID NO BID $54.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID $31.70 $29.36 NO BID NO BID
Price per 3 $32.55 NO BID NO BID $53.50 NO BID NO BID NO BID $30.60 $27.73 NO BID NO BID
TIE-BACK STYLE
Miller French Creek Fall Tech |Titan T6111TB
Make / Model T6111TB NO BID NO BID 456AW NO BID NO BID NO BID 72562 - 6FTAF Miller 913B NO BID
Price Each $39.95 NO BID NO BID $87.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID $41.05 $38.01 $71.63 NO BID
Price per 3 $39.95 NO BID NO BID $86.25 NO BID NO BID NO BID $39.60 $35.90 $71.63 NO BID
Miller Fall Tech |Titan T6121TB
Make / Model T6111TB NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 7259D - 6FTAF NO BID NO BID
Price Each $39.95 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $38.10 $57.00 NO BID NO BID
Price per 3 $39.95 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $36.90 $53.83 NO BID NO BID
MISC. SUPPLIES
MEASURING WHEELS
Rolatape Bane Clene
Make / Model NO BID NO BID NO BID R-MM30 NO BID MM30 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Price Each NO BID NO BID NO BID $95.00 NO BID $121.51 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Price per 3 NO BID NO BID NO BID $94.00 NO BID N/A NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Rolatape
Make / Model NO BID NO BID NO BID R-MM30T NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Price Each NO BID NO BID NO BID $105.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Price per 3 NO BID NO BID NO BID $103.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

STORAGE CABINETS
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FLAMMABLE LIQUID
STORAGE CABINETS WITH
SELF CLOSING DOORS
Justrite
Make / Model Justrite 25450 NO BID NO BID K-400-25545 NO BID Justrite 25452 NO BID NO BID NO BID Eagle 4510 NO BID
$582.36 plus
45 Gal $610.00 NO BID NO BID $1,125.00 NO BID freight NO BID NO BID NO BID $685.00 NO BID
Justrite
Make / Model Justrite 25600 NO BID NO BID K-400-25602 NO BID Justrite 25602 NO BID NO BID NO BID Eagle 6010 NO BID
$645.30 plus
60 Gal $720.00 NO BID NO BID $1,315.00 NO BID freight NO BID NO BID NO BID $768.59 NO BID
PAINT AND INK STORAGE
CABINETS WITH SELF
CLOSING DOORS
Justrite
Make / Model Justrite 25400 NO BID NO BID K-400-25402 NO BID Justrite 25402 NO BID NO BID NO BID Eagle P1-3010 NO BID
$502.95 plus
45 Gal $569.00 NO BID NO BID $1,045.00 NO BID freight NO BID NO BID NO BID $621.34 NO BID
Make / Model Justrite 25491 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID Justrite 25493 NO BID NO BID NO BID Eagle P1-4510 NO BID
$743.53 plus
60 Gal $715.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID freight NO BID NO BID NO BID $753.68 NO BID
$0.00 but some
items have a
MINIMUM DOLLAR AMOUNT minimum
OF ORDER $100.00 NO BID NO BID $0.00 $100.00 $159.00 $100.00 $75.00 $0.00 quanity order N/A
NUMBER OF DAYS BETWEEN Instock
ORDER AND DELIVERY ON Depends on Z.AR.O. 7-10DAYS
SITE Up to 10 Days NO BID 4 item $14.00 7-10 Days 7-10 Days 7-10 Days B/O 5-7 14-30 Days ARO
All pricing
subject to
manufacturers
increases with
documentation.
Additional
freight may be
required for
PRICES GOOD THROUGH N/A NO BID N/A N/A N/A some itms. 1 Year 1 Year 12-31-07 Dec. 31, 07 N/A
Bid a Option 2
on Dual
Cartridge
Silicone Half
Mask, Organic
Vapor
Cartridge,
Copy of Ins. Filter and Filter
COMMENTS Included Retainer




