BID TABULATION - CRUSHED STONE 2016

CRUSHED STONE 2016
BID OPENING DATE
3-1-2016

WINTER
BROTHERS
MATERIAL
COMPANY

BUSSEN

QUARRIES-

TRAUTMAN
PLANT

HOUSE SPRING
QUARRY

BUSSEN
QUARRIES INC -
ANTIRE

DAN ALTHOFF
TRUCKING

FRED WEBER
INC

CENTRAL
STONE CO
HwWY M
ANTONIA
QUARRY

CENTRAL
STONE CO
MORSE MILL
QUARRY

SIMPSON
MATERIALS
LLC

H SAND AND
GRAVEL

13098 GRAVOIS
ROAD
ST LOUIS MO 63127

8799 TRAUTMAN
QUARRY ROAD
PEVELY MO 63070

5200 HILLSBORO -
HOUSE SPRINGS RD
HOUSE SPRINGS MQ

63051

6800 BUSSEN ROAD
EUREKA MO 63025

4600 WALDO IND
DR
HIGH.RIDGE MO
630149

2320 CREVE
COEUR MILL RD
MARYLAND
HEIGHTS MC 63043

1195 SMIZER
MILL RD
FENTON MO
63026

1195 SMIZER,
MILL RD
FENTON MQ
63026

1053
HEADQUARTERS
PARK DR
FENTON MO
63026

PO BOX 69
[MPERIAL MO
53052

In emergency, can we call you after regular
hours? (Y or N)

N

N

N

Y

Y

Y

Y

Y

Y

If yes, name party to call:

DAN ALTHOFF

RESOURCE
INTEGRATION
CENTER

JEFF PULLEN

JEFF PULLEN

SCOTT LACY

CHUCK
SMREKER

Telephone number:

314-578-5074

866-739-8853
ORDER
PLACEMENT:
STONE: FESTUS -
838 VFW DRIVE,
FESTUS MO
63025
SOUTH -
4200 NEW
BAUMGARNTER,
8T LOUIS MO
63129

314-435-4708

314-435-4708

314-660-1852

636-337-0025

Minimum Delivery Required {Y or N}

Y
DELIVERY IS
SUBJECT TO AN
18 TON
MINIMUM HAUL
CHARGE PER
LOAD

If yes, amount $

310600
DELIVERY IS
SUBJECT TO

WAITING TIME
AFTER 15
MINUTES ON
THE JOB AT
$60.00 PER HOUR

24 TON

24 TON

$20.00 FOB
NOTE: IF WE
DELIVER, MIN.
OF 20 TONS
REQUIRED

Additicnal Supplier Fees $

$1,500.00 PER
CCCURRENCE

NA

Comments

AFTER HOURS
OPENING
CHARGES

NA

If you cannot hold your price for one full
year, you will guarantee this price to
remain in effect until:
(Date Your Bid Prices Expire}

372017

1 YEAR

1 YEAR




BID TABULATION - CRUSHED STONE 2015

WINTER BUSSEN BUSSEN %_m%“mwww CENTRAL SIMPSON
EROTHERS QUARRIES- HOUSE SPRING Qu >E~,Em._z ¢ [DAN ALTHOFF | FRED WEBER oWy ?r STONE CO MATERIALS | SAND AND
MATERIAL TRAUTMAN QUARRY TRUCKING INC . MORSE MILL GRAVEL
CRUSHED STONE 2016 COMPANY PLANT ANTIRE ANTONIA | ™ o aRRY LLC
BID OPENING DATE QUARRY =
3-1-2016 5200 HILLSBCRQ - 4500 WALDQ IND 2320 CREVE 1195 SMIZER 1193 8MIZER | i
aooﬂmwwé_w mqm,wwﬂ&cmwuw% HOUSE SPRINGS RD | 6800 BUSSEN ROAD DR COEUR MILL RD MILL RD MILL RD __m.»%%wr__%cwmnWm __,H_mmmmmom_ o
ST LOUIS MO 63127 _.m<mr< MO 63070 | HOUSE SPRINGS MO| EUREKA MO 63025 | HIGK RIDGE MO MARYLAND FENTON MC FENTON MO PENTON MO 53057
e h 63051 63049 HEIGHTS MO 63043 63026 63026 " 53098 -
CLEAN STONE

Cost per Ton

174" - 510,30 - NC BID NO EID - - NA
3/8" $5.00 £10.00 $9.50 NC BID NOEID $9.235 58.70 $10.00
172" 58.60 $10.00 $11.50 NG BID NO EID - - $10.00
3/4" $8.80 $9.50 $9.50 NO BID $8.50 $8.50 - $8.00
I 58.80 $9.50 $9.50 NO BID $8.50 $8.50 $7.65 S8.00
1&1/4" - - $9.50 NQ BID NO BID - n NA
1&1/2" - $8.20 $8.20 NO BID 58.50 $7.40 - NA
1&3/4" - - - NOBID NC BID - - NA
2" $7.50 $8.20 $8.20 NOBID 57.95 $7.70 $7.15 NA
3" - - - NO BI> NO BID 58.05 - NA
4" §7.50 - - NO BID 87.93 - - NA
5" - - $8.20 NO BID NC BID - NA
6" - - $8.20 NO BID 58.00 $7.70 $8.35 NA
310" CLEAN
$11,00

$1.00

$1.00

$1.00

$5.60

. $1.00 NOBID SCREENINGS SCREEN 51.00 NA
3/8" 85.50 $5.00 $6.50 NOEBID NO BID - - $1.30
172" - $5.00 - NO BID NO BID - - NA
34" $5.30 $5.60 $5.60 NC BID $5.50 $5.00 - £4.75
" §5.30 $5.60 $5.60 NC BID $5.50 $3.00 §5.00 $4.75
1&1/4" - - . NC BID NO BID - . NA
1&1/2" - - - NO BID $5.50 $5.00 . NA
2" $5.30 $5.60 $5.60 NC BID $5.50 $5.00 §5.00 $5.50
28172 - . - NOBID NOBID - - NA
3" - - - NCBID NO BID $5.00 $5.00 NA
4 $5.30 - 3,60 (ANTIRE) NO BID $5.50 - - NA
1/2" - 4" Minus Backiill §5.30 - §5.60 (ANTIRE) NO BID NO BID - - NA
8" MINUS




BID TABULATION - CRUSHED STONE 2016

CRUSHED STONE 2016
BID OPENING DATE
3-1-2016

WINTER BUSSEN BUSSEN %Nw_“mﬂw CENTRAL SIMPSON
BROTHERS QUARRIES- HOUSE SPRING QUARRIES INC - DAN ALTHOFF| FRED WEBER HWY M STONE CO Ebh_,m_ﬂ_»rm H SAND AND
MATERIAL TRAUTMAN QUARRY ANTIRE TRUCKING INC ANTONIA MORSE MILL LLE GRAVEL
. ; v ;
COMPANY PLANT OUARRY QUARRY
1033
. 5200 HILLSBORO - 4600 WALDO IND [ 2320 CREVE 1195 SMIZER LI95 SMIZER || " .
_uoomwmwhw,\o_m moqmﬂ%ﬂn\_.ﬂwwﬂ HOUSE SPRINGS RD | 6300 BUSSEN RCAD DR COEUR MILL RD MILL RD MILL RD __n»,_w.pomc_w_uﬂnzm :&Wwﬂﬂﬂw_ o
STLOUIS MO 63127 | PEVELY Mo 63070 | FOUSE SPRINGS MO| EUREKA MO 63025 | HIGH RIDGE MO MARYLAND FENTON MO FENTON MO FENTON MO 63057
63051 63049 HEIGHTS MO 63043 63026 63026 53026 e

MODOT TYPE 1 OR 5 BASE $5.50 $6.00 $6.00 NO BID NO BID - BARNHART $13.00
ONLY
P-GRAVEL $9.70 - - - NOBID NO BID - $5.10 $8.50
SCREENED GRAVEL - - - NOEID NO BID - NA
B-GRAVEL $20.00 - - - NOEID NO BID - §15.73 $7.50
C-GRAVEL $10.63 - - - NOBID NO _w.HU - $15.10 $15.00
$9.00
CONCRETE ROCK B11.25 - 511.80 NO BID NO BID - BARNHART $15.00
GNLY
$10,00
FILTER SAND - - - NOBID NO BID - Q46 N/A
ASTM C33 E-11 N $14.95 n
SAND $10.70 $6.60 (IB) - $6.60 (JB) NOBID NO BID - MEDIUM $13.00
$1.40 $2.35 FILL DIRT $5.00 | $6.00/TOP SOIL
DIRT ) ) NO BID NOBD BURROW BURROW TOPSOIL $5.75 | $4.00/FILL DIRT

HAUL CHART MILEAGE

ADD ON PRICE PER TON FOR
STOCK PILE DELIVERY

0-3 miles
5-10 miles $4.55 33.60 $3.85 $4.00 $4.30 $4.60 $4.25 $4.50 NA £3.50
10-15 miles $5.45 54.10 $4.40 54.30 $4.95 $5.35 £4.90 $5.00 NA $4.00
15-20 miles $5.70 $4.80 $5.00 $5.00 $5.20 $6.10 QUOTE QUOTE NA 85,00
20-25 miles $6.10 $5.3¢ 55.40 83.50 $5.63 $6.85 QUOTE QUOTE NA £5.50
25-30 miles $8.15 $6.00 $3.70 56,00 56.25 57.60 QUOTE QUOTE NA $6.00
30-35 miles $9.20 $6.70 $6.20 $6.50 36.95 $8.35 QUOTE QUOTE NA $7.0¢
35-40 miles $10.05 $7.40 36.7¢ $7.00 37,63 59.35 QUOTE QUOTE NA, $7.50
40-45 miles $10.85 $8.00 $7.20 $8.00 §8.30 $10.35 QUOTE QUQTE NA $8.00
4350 miles $11.95 $8.70 $7.70 $9.00 $9.00 51133 QUOTE QUOTE NA $8.50
over 50 miles CALL FOR QUOTE - $8.2¢ - $9.50 $ H%w_mvm%m QUOTE QUOTE NA $9.00




BID TABULATICN - CRUSHED STONE 2016

ADD ON PRICE PER TON FOR O

SITE DELIYERY

WINTER BUSSEN BUSSEN MMMMMMW CENTRAL SIMPSON
BROTHERS QUARRIES- | HOUSE SPRING | o nprecto . | DAN ALTHOFF| FRED WEBER WY M STONECO | ol | HSAND AND
MATERIAL TRAUTMAN QUARRY . TRUCKING INC ; MORSE MILL GRAVEL
CRUSHED STONE 2016 COMPANY PLANT ANTIRE ANTONIA, QUARRY LLC
BID OPENING DATE QUARRY —
1= N 5200 HILLSBORD - 4600 WALDO IND | 2320 CREVE 1195 SMIZER. | 1195 SMIZER
3-1-2016 :%m_ﬂ wwﬂém Mc@.»._ﬁ.ﬁﬂ&cmw.w»% HOUSE SPRINGS RD | 6800 BUSSEN ROAD DR COEUR MILL RD MILL RD MILLRD mm%»o%MWMmQ HL”MmeWmm o
STLOUIS MO 63127 | PEVELY MO sabs0 | HOUSE SPRINGS MO| EUREKA MO 63025 | HIGH RIDGEMO |  MARYLAND FENTON MO FENTON MO SENTON 110 pvi
63051 03049 HEIGHTS MO 63043 63026 £3026 o
*DELIVERY [
SUBJIECT TO AN
18 TON
MINIMUM HAUL
CHARGE PER
* 20 TON LOAD
MINUMUM | * DELIVERY IS SEE ATTACHED
HAUL SUBJECT TO
WAITING TIME
AFTER 15
MINUTES ON
THE JOB AT

360 00 PER HOLIR

0-5 miles §4.55 $3.20 83.45 $3.60 3395 $3.85 8375 $4.00 NA $3.00
5-10 miles $4.55 $3.60 $3.85 34,00 34,30 $4.60 54,25 $4.50 NA 53,50
10-15 miles 3545 $4.10 $4.40 %4.50 3495 $5.35 54,90 $5.00 NA $4.00
15-20 miles $5.70 $4.,80 $5.00 F5.00 5520 $6.10 QUOTE QUOTE NA $5.00
20-25 miles $6.10 $5.30 $5,40 35.50 8565 56.85 QUOTE QUOTE NA 55,30
23-30 miles $8.15 $6.00 8570 56.00 56.25 $7.60 QUCTE QUOTE NA §$6.00
30-35 miles 920 56.70 $6.20 $6.50 3693 58,35 QUCTE QUOTE NA 37.00
35-40 miles $10.05 $7.40 56.70 §7.00 S7.65 59.33 QUOTE QUOTE NA $7.50
40-45 miles $10.85 $8.00 $7.20 $8.00 5830 $10.35 QUOTE QUOTE NA $8.00
45-50 miles $11.95 $8.70 87,70 $9.00 39.00 $11.33 QUCTE QUOTE NA $8.50

over 50 miles CALL FOR QUOTE - 58.20 - 59.50 w_%mmumm.uum QUOTE QUOTE NA $9.00
* DELIVERY [§
SUBJECT TO AN
18 TON
MINIMUM HAUL
CHARGE PER
* 20 TON LOAD
MINUMUM * DELIVERY IS SEE ATTACHED
HAUL SUBJECT TO
WAITING TIME
AFTER 15
MINUTES ON
THE JOB AT




BID TABULATION ~ CRUSHED STONE 2016

CRUSHED STONE 2016
BID OPENING DATE
3-1-2016

WINTER BUSSEN BUSSEN m%%u me CENTRAL SIMPSON
BROTHERS QUARRIES- HOUSE SPRING OH.>—ﬂ—.~.——mm INC - DAN ALTHOFF | FRED WERER WY M STONE CO MATERIALS H SAND AND
MATERIAL TRAUTMAN QUARRY ! ANTIRE TRUCKING INC ANTONIA MORSE MILL LLC GRAVEL
i/ s
COMPANY PLANT OUARRY QUARRY
< ey 3 1053
13098 GRAVOIS 8799 TRAUTMAN 5200 HILLSBOROQ - N 4600 WALDOQ IND 2320 CREVE 1185 SMIZER 1195 SMIZER HEADGUARTERS PO BOX 69
ROAD QUARRY ROAD HOUSE SPRINGS RD | 5800 BUSSEN ROAD DR COEUR MILL RD MILL RD MILL RD PARK DR IMPERIAL MO
ST LOUIS MO 63127 | PEVELY MO 83070 HOUSE SPRINGS MO | EUREKA MO 63025 | HIGH RIDGE MO MARYLAND FENTON MO FENTON MO FENTON MO 63052

63051

63049

HEIGHTS MO 63043

63026

63026

63026

AFFIDAVIT
COMPLETED

REQUIRED DOCUMENTS

Y
BUT NO SEAL

E-VERIFICATION DOCUMENTATION
(Y/NY:

Y

COPY OF INSURANCE PROVIDED

Y

TAX RECEIPTS OR NOTARIZED
LETTER STATING NO REAL OR
PERSONAL PROPERTY OWNED IN
JEFFERSON COUNTY

Y

COOQPERATIVE BID FORM (Y/N)

NOT
COMPLETED

COOPERATIVE CONTACT INFO:

COMPANY INFORMATION AND
SIGNATURE

D DE

COMMENTS:

"SAND IS
AVAILABLE AT
JEFFERSCN
BARRACKS
QUARRY FOR
$6,00/TON AND
RESOLD AT
TRAUTMAN
QUARRY FOR
39 00/TON

SEE ATTACHED
FOR HAUL
CHART
MILEAGE




JEFFERSON COUNTY
DEPARTMENT OF ADMINISTRATIVE SERVICES
729 MAPLE ST/ PO BOX 100

HILLSBORO MO 63050
WWW.JEFFCOMO.ORG

Invitation for Bid: CRUSHED STONE AND GRAVEL 2016

Date Issued: 1-29-2016

BIDS SHALL BE ACCEPTED UNTIL: TUESDAY, MARCH 1, 2016, AT 2:00 P.M, LOCAL TIME,

Specification
Contact:

Contract
Contact:

Mail (3) Three
Complete Copies
With Vendor And

Bid information As

Shown In Sample:

Contract Term:
UPON APPROVAL OF THE

COUNTY COUNCIL AND -

COUNTY EXECUTIVE

Vendor
Information:

Invitation for Bid and Bid Form

KURT WENGERT
Depariment of Public Works
636-797-5427
kwengert@jeffcomo.org

VICKIE PRATT
Depariment of Administrative Services
636-797-5380

SAMPLE ENVELOPE

VENDOR NAME
FENDOR ADDRESS

CONTACT NUMBER DEPARTMENT OF THE COUNTY CLERK

JEFFERSON COUNTY MISSOURI
T29 MAPLE ST/POBOX 100
HILLSBORO MO 63050-0100

SEALED BID: (BID NAME}

The undersigned certifies that be/she has the authority to bind this company in an
agreemcnt/contract to supply the comumedity or service in accordance with all terms,
conditions, and pricing specified. This Bid, if accepted, will constitute an Agrecment and
Contract with Jefferson County, Missouri, upen approval of the County Council and County
Executive. Prices are firm during this agreement term, unless agreed upon in writing by the
County. The County has the option to renew this agreement at the same terms and conditions
as the original agreement for one additional one-year term with the written consent of the
successiul Bidder. Price increases for renewals are not authorized unless approved in writing

St lacy

Authorized Agent (Pript)

by the County.

Simifson MATERIALS LLC

Company Name

1053 Haashvor Pous Tane 2.

Address
fentor, MO §3024

City/State/Zip Code

(3¢ - 243 YU/

Title

73516 43-17818Y3

Telephone # Date Tax ID #
«i/Qg;@Smwmr?mz‘énak. tory __636-343 - YY1
E-mail / Fax #

10f15 Bidders Inifials; 5,4



HAUL CHART

MILEAGE
ADD ON PRICE PER TON ADD ON PRICE PER TON
FOR STOCK PILE DELIVERY FOR ON SITE DELIVERY
0 - 5 miles $ A4 PERTON 5§ *#  PERTON
5 - 10 miles $ PER TON $_ 7~ PER TON
10-15 miles $ PER TON $ \ PER TON
15-20 miles  $ PER TON $ / PER TON
20 - 25 miles $ PER TON $ (\ PER TON
25 - 30 miles $ PER TON $ ) PER TON
30 - 35 miles $ PER TON $ ( PER TON
35 - 40 miles $ PER TON $ > PER TON
40 - 45 miles $ PER TON $ Q PER TON
45 - 50 miles $ PER TON $ /> PER TON
Over 50 miles  $ PER TON MILE $ PER TON MILE
Stocupite Bures 7o Yoko Locwrmoms ! Breartans Vhiley Foup
Des0TD YRl Y25 for B 570 Forl
WHsbors Yand A Y for 5. 00 Horo
House Sprmgs Yans 4 30000 4 3,554

L Brasec) o mmvm 2425 Jon lpack. - usins end dmp2s,

Invitation for Bid and Bid Form

13 0f 15

gL

Bidders Initials:



