BID TABULATION - HVAC UNIT DESIGN AND INSTALLATION 2016

SHEET METAL

AMERICAN
CONTRACTORS DEKA SERVICE
HVAC UNIT DESIGN AND NG MECHANICAL
INSTALLATION 2016 BID
OPENING DATE 5-17-16 1661 VETRANS DR 16 E 2ND ST 1802 LARKIN
DESOTO MO 63020 | EUREKA MO 63025 |  WILLIAMS RD
TOTAL COST ADMINISTRATION
MEETING ROOM $ SECTION 8.1: $26,308.00 $47,185.00 $29,488.00
PROPOSED MAKE: TRANE TRANE TRANE CO.
TZD150F4RN--D601
) THD150G4-RNA -12.5 TON
PROPOSED MODEL: THD150G4-RNA (125 TON) VOYAGER I
ROOFTOP UNIT
TOTAL COST OF
ADMINISTRATION EXCEPT $90,696.00 $99,349.00 $93,900.00
MEETING ROOM AND IT ROOM 8.2:
PROPOSED MAKE: TRANE TRANE TRANE CO.
SEHLF704-70 TON
PROPOSED MODEL: SEHLF704 SEHI}'ZS? (70 INTELLIPAK
ROOFTOP UNIT
TOTAL COST OF JAIL DORMITORY
POD 1 SECTION 8.3: $14,400.00 $12,330.00 $11,680.00
PROPOSED MAKE: TRANE TRANE TRANE CO.
YSCO092FARLA-
PROPOSED MODEL: YSCO092F4RLA YSCOD%ERLA' DOO1-7.5TON
ROOFTOP UNIT
TOTAL COST OF JAIL DORMITORY
POD 6 SECTION 8.3: $14,400.00 $12,330.00 $11,680.00
PROPOSED MAKE: TRANE TRANE TRANE CO.
YSCO092F4RLA-
PROPOSED MODEL: YSCO092F4RLA YSC(I);)CZ)ERLA' DOO1 7.5TON
ROOFTOP UNIT
TOTAL COST OF JAIL DORMITORY
POD 9 SECTION 8.3: $14,400.00 $12,330.00 $11,680.00
PROPOSED MAKE: TRANE TRANE TRANE CO.
YSCO092F4RLA-
PROPOSED MODEL: YSCO092F4RLA YSC(E?CZ)ERLA' DOO1-7.5TON

ROOFTOP




BID TABULATION - HVAC UNIT DESIGN AND INSTALLATION 2016

SHEET METAL

AMERICAN
CONTRACTORS DEKA SERVICE
HVAC UNIT DESIGN AND INC MECHANICAL
INSTALLATION 2016 BID
OPENING DATE 5-17-16 1661 VETRANS DR 16 E2ND ST 1802 LARKIN
DESOTO MO 63020 | EUREKA MO 63025 | WILLIAMS RD
TOTAL COST OF THE ANNEX
ADMINSTRATOR SECTION 8.4: $10,162.00 NO BID $14,400.00
PROPOSED MAKE: TRANE N/A TRANE CO.
YSC060G4RHA-
PROPOSED MODEL: YSCOBOE4RLA N/A DO010006-5 TON
ROOFTOP UNIT
440000 RTU
TOTAL COST OF ANNEX PARKS $2,373
SECTION 8.5 $12,920.00 NO BID DUCTWORK
' CHANGES TOTAL
{1A 77200
PROPOSED MAKE: TRANE N/A TRANE CO
YSC060G4RHA-
PROPOSED MODEL: YSCOBOE4RLA N/A D0010006 5 TON
ROOFTOP UNIT
TOTAL COST OF THE ANNEX
SOILID WASTE SECTION 8.6 $10,162.00 NO BID $14,400.00
PROPOSED MAKE: TRANE N/A TRANE CO.
YSC060G4RHA-
PROPOSED MODEL: YSCOBOE4RLA N/A D0010006 5 TON
ROOFTOP UNIT
TOTAL COST OF THE ANNEX
CONFERENCE/ TRAINING ROOM $12,273.00 NO BID $18,720.00
SECTION 8.7
PROPOSED MAKE: TRANE N/A TRANE CO.
YSC060G4RHA-
PROPOSED MODEL: YHCO60E4RLA N/A D0010006 - 5 TON

ROOFTOP UNIT
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COPY OF INSURANCE PROVIDED Y Y Y
TAX RECEIPTS OR NOTARIZED
LETTER STATING NO REAL OR v v v
PERSONAL PROPERTY OWNED IN
JEFFERSON COUNTY
COOPERATIVE BID FORM (Y/N) Y Y
COOPERATIVE CONTACT INFO: Y Y
COMPANY INFORMATION AND v v v
SIGNATURE
BID DEPOSIT REQUIRED N/A N/A N/A
SEE ATTACHED | _SEEATTACHED

COMMENTS:

FOR MORE PRICES

SHEET FOR MORE
PRICES




