
WELDING EQUIPMENT AND SUPPLIES BID TABULATION

WELDING EQUIPMENT AND 
SUPPLIES                      

BID OPENING                  
2-16-07 Apex Pinnacle Ozarc Gas Praxair

Welding Rods
E-7014 AWS

1/8" $117.07 $1.65 $1.560
 5/32" $117.37 $1.62 $1.540
3/16" $117.37 $1.60 $1.540

E-7018 AWS
1/8" $113.97 $1.62 $1.540

 5/32" $112.71 $1.59 $1.520
3/16" $112.71 $1.66 $1.600

E-8018 AWS
1/8" $126.00 $1.93 $1.810

 5/32" $125.67 $1.89 $1.800
3/16" $125.67 $1.97 $1.800

E-9018 AWS
1/8" $126.53 $2.78 $2.160

 5/32" $125.53 $2.71 $2.160
3/16" $125.53 $2.58 $2.160

E-8010 AWS 
1/8" $149.33 $2.10 $2.140

E-9010 AWS 
5/32" $162.67 NO BID NO BID
3/16" $162.67 NO BID NO BID

E-110-18 AWS
1/8" $127.87 $2.03 $2.010
5/32" $127.00 $1.80 $1.983

#35 HARD SURFACE 
5/32" $156.67 $10.06 $9.130
3/16" $156.67 $9.78 $9.200
1/4" $156.67 $10.39 $9.000

60 AP-6010                      
General Purpose Rods

1/8" $119.67 $1.67 $1.626
5/32" $118.40 $1.61 $1.600
3/16" $118.40 $1.59 $1.570

24-AWS 7024                    
High Speed Electrode

1/8" $126.64 $1.71 $1.590
5/32" $126.00 $1.67 $1.590
3/16" $126.00 $1.69 $1.610
1/4" $126.00 $1.69 $1.600

LH 3800-AWS E-7028
1/4" $153.68 NO BID NO BID

ENI-CI NICKEL STEEL          
ELECTRODE FOR              

CAST IRON

1/8"
$79.85 (NI55)        

$117.11 (NI99) $30.48 $1.466

5/32"
$79.67 (NI55)        

$118.75 (NI99) $30.34 $13.533



WELDING EQUIPMENT AND SUPPLIES BID TABULATION

WELDING EQUIPMENT AND 
SUPPLIES                      

BID OPENING                  
2-16-07 Apex Pinnacle Ozarc Gas Praxair

ACETYLENE
Demurrage Charge per bottle NQ $0.12 $3.600

75 cu.ft NQ $15.00 $11.620
125 cu.ft. NQ $20.80 $19.980
244 cu.ft. NQ $50.23 $47.780

OXYGEN
Demurrage charge per bottle NQ $0.12 $3.600

80 cu.ft NQ $5.00 $4.990
125 cu.ft. NQ $5.25 $5.220
251 cu.ft. NQ $5.90 $5.650

COMMENTS:

SOLD BY POUND. 
$20.00 DELIVERY 

CHARGE TO EACH 
LOCATION. NO 

HAZMAT CHARGE


