BID TABULATION - TRAP ROCK 2016

BID TABULATION TRON MOUNTAIN TRAP BOBBY HOELSCHER | TRAPROCKAND GRANITE [~ pore o o n T om0 CKING
P ROCK 2016 ROCK. TRUCKING, INC. QUARRIES LLC
TRA 2320 CREVE COEUR MILL RD 24477 WINDY LANE ONE RACEHORSE DR, 3224 N EWY 67 4600 WALDO IND, DRIVE
BID OPENING DATE: 1-12-16 MARYLAND HEIGHTS MO 63043 |  WARRENTON MO 63383 EAST 8T LOUIS IL 62205 FLORISSANT MO 63033 HIGH RIDGE MO 63049
$365.00
MINIMUM DELIVERY REQUIRED 18 TON MINIMUM DELIVERY NO 25 TON MINIMUM $416.70 {24 TONS) NO
HAUL CHARGE PER LOAD
GRADE Bl TRAP ROCK EID PRICE FER TON $10.50 (IMTR #41) ~ 58,10 $10.00 NiA
PLANT LOCATION 1325 HWY N IMTR, CENTRAL STONE 1952 COUNTY ROAD 3601 EWY DD IRON MOUNTAIN
: TRONTON MO 63650 BUTLER HILL & BEELMAN 96 IRONTON MO 63650 FARMINGTON MO 63640 TRAP ROCK
DELIVERY COST TO THE HOFFO,S:ZD LOCATIONS WILL BE AS STATED BELOW
DE SOTO BUILDING $9.70/PER TON $7.55/PER TON 7.55/ PER. TON - HAUL ONLY $7.35/PER TON $11.76/PER TON
HILLSBORO BUILDING $11.20/PER TON $9.25/PER TON 2.75/PER TON - HAUL ONLY $7.35/PER. TON $10.19/ PER TON
HOUSE SPRING BUILDING 12,70/PER TON $11.70/PER TON 51025/PER TON - HAUL ONLY $7.35/PER TON $13,34/ PER TON
ADD ON PRICE PER TON FOR STOCK PILE DELIVERY
DELILVERY SUBJECT TO A 18 WE WILL QUOTE
TON MINIMUM HAUL ADDITIONAL HAUL RATES | 20 TON ﬁﬂwﬁ%@ﬁ ON
CHARGE PER LOAD IF NEEDED ,
0-5 MILES $4.00 $3.20 $3.00 — $3.36
5-10 MILES $4.50 $3.70 $3.50 — $3.89
10-15 MILES $5.00 $4.20 $4.00 ~ $441
15-20 MILES $5.50 $4.70 $4.50 ~ $4.94
20-25 MILES $6.00 $5.20 $5.00 _ $5.46
25-30 MILES $6.50 55.70 $5.50 ~ $5.99
30-35 MILES $7.00 56.20 $6.20 ~ $6.51
35-40 MILES $7.50 $6.70 $6.90 ~ $7.04
4045 MILES $8.00 57.35 §7.35 — $7.56
45-50 MILES $8.50 $8.05 $8.15 - $8.09
50-55 MILES $5.00 $8.75 $8.75 ~ $8.61
55-60 MILES NO BID $9.50 §9.25 — 51128
60-65 MILES NO BID $10.20 $9.75 -~ §12.30
65-70 MILES NO BID $10.90 $10.25 ~ $13.33
70-75 MILES NO BID $11.65 $10,95 ~ $14.35
OVER 75 MILES NO BID - N/A ~
—
REQUIRED DOCUMENTS
NOTARIZED WORK AFFIDAVIT COMPLETED ¥ v ¥ Y ¥
E-VERIFICATION DOCUMENTATION (¥/N): ¥ v N v Y
COPY OF INSURANCE PROVIDED Y N Y Y Y
TAX RECEIPTS OR NOTARIZED LETTER
STATING NO REAL OR PERSONAL PROPERTY Y Y ¥ ¥ Y
OWNED IN JEFFERSON COUNTY
COOPERATIVE BID FORM (Y/N) e Y v Y Y
COOPERATIVE CONTACT INFO: ¥ Y ¥ Y ¥
COMPANY INFORMATION AND SIGNATURE Y Y N e Y
BID DEPOSIT REQUIRED A N/A N/A N/A NA
SEE ATTACHED,
COMMENTS: SEE ATTACHED NO BIDDERS INITIALS ON SEE ATTACHED SEE ATTACHED SEE ATTACHED
PAGES




JEFFERSON COUNTY

DEPARTMENT OF ADMINISTRATIVE SERVICES
729 MAPLE ST /PO BOX 100

HILLSBORO MO 63050

WWW.JEFFCOMO.ORG

Invitation for Bid: TRAP ROCK 2016

Date Issued: 12-11-15

BIDS SHALL BE ACCEPTED UNTIL: TUESDAY, JANUARY 12, 2016, AT 2:00 P.M. LOCAL TIME.
KURT WENGERT

Specification Department of Public Works

Contact: | 636-797-5427
kwengert@jeffcomo.org

Contract | VICKIE PRATT

Contact: | Department of Administrative Services
636-797-5380

SAMPLE ENVELOPE
Complete Copies | | "#VPOR APDRESS
With Vendor And || CONTACT NUMBER DEPARTMENT OF THE COUNTY CLERK,
Bid Information As JEFFERSON COUNTY MISSOURI
729 MAPLE ST/ PO BOX 100

Shown In Sample:
HILLSBORO MO 63050-0100

SEALED BID: (BID NAME)

. | The undersigned certifies that he/she has the authority to bind this company in an
Contract Term: agreement/contract to supply the commodity or service in accordance with all terms,
UPON APPROVAL OF THE | conditions, and pricing specified. This Bid, if accepted, will constitute an Agreement and
COUNTY COUNCIL AND | (000t with Jefferson County, Missouri, upon approval of the County Council and County
COUNTY EXECUTIVE Executive. Prices are firm during this agreement term, unless agreed upon in writing by the
County. The County has the option to renew this agreement at the same terms and conditions
as the original agreement for one additional one-year term with the written consent of the
Vendor | syccessful Bidder. Price increases for renewals are not authorized unless approved in writing

Information: | by the County.

Invitation for Bid and Bid Form

Iron Mountain Trap Rock Konn Wilson

2320 Creve Coeur Mill Rd /
Address Signature
_Maryland Heights, MO 63043 President- Business Development
City/State/Zip Code Title

314-473-3628 1-12-16 43-1127552
Telephone # Date TaxID #

slbartlett@fredweberinc.com

314-344-0970

E-mail

Page 1 of 14

Fax #

Bidders Initials:ﬁ



SPECIFICATIONS FOR TRAP ROCK

‘The material shall meet the requirements of Section 1003 "AGGREGATE FOR SEAL COATS" of the
October 2015 version of the Missouri Standard Specifications for Highway Construction unless otherwise

approved by the County Engincer.

The aggregate shall be 3/8-inch maximum size Trap Rock Chips (washed) and shall meet the following
gradation (subject to approval by the Engineer):

GRADE B1 TRAP ROCK SIEVE SIZE %PASSING (BY WEIGHT)
1/2” 100
3/8” 95-100
NO. 4 0-30
NO. 200 0-2

Testing reports shall be submitted by the selected vendor(s) to the County Engincer for approval prior to
delivery.

Bid Price shall be for County pickup at the plant location listed below. Delivery Cost to County building
locations will be an additional cost as listed. Please also provide a cost for various stockpile locations in the
County based on the distance from your plant location (if any, locations to be determined after award).
Stockpile delivery will receive five (5) working days’ notice to fill order. Delivery order will be a minimum of
2,000 tons. Deliveries will be accepted at the locations below between 7:00 AM and 2:00 PM, unless prior

arrangements have been made with the County.

Estimated order under this confract shall be a minimum of 5,000 tons and a maximum of 8,000 tons, subject to
project need and budgetary limitations. Aggregate will be used as cover rock for seal coat work. Stockpile for
seal coat will not begin until after April 1, 2016 and will be completed before June 1, 2016. All material
ordered under this contract may be ordered at stated price until April 1, 2017.

In emergency, can we call you after regular hours? YES X NO

If yes, name party to call: Resource Integration Center

Telephone number: 314-739-8855

Minimum Delivery Required (Circle One) @ No
If yes, amount $_ 365.00 ; 18 ton minimum delivery haul charge per load.

GRADE B1 TRAP ROCK BID PRICE $ $10.50 (IMTR #41) PER TON

PLANT LOCATION: _Iron Mountain Trap Rock- 1325 Hwy N, Ironton, MO 63650
Order Placement: Resource Integration Center 314-739-8855

DELIVERY COST TO THE FOLLOWING LOCATIONS WILL BE AS STATED BELOW

De Soto Building 2960 Lee Pyle Road, off U.S. Hwy. 67 $ 9.70 PER TON
Hillsboro Building 5275 State Highway B at Butcher Branch Road $ 11.20 PER TON
House Springs Building 6460 State Highway MM $ 12.70 PER TON

Page 11 of 14 Bidders Initials:_/ :

Invitation for Bid and Bid Form



HAUL CHART MILEAGE

ADD ON PRICE PER TON FOR STOCK PILE DELIVERY

- Delivery Subject to a 18 ton minimum haul charge per load.
0 - 5 miles $ 400 PER TON
5-10miles $_ 450  PERTON
10 -15miles $__5.00 PER TON
15-20miles $ 550 PER TON
20-25miles § 6.00 PER TON
25-30miles § 6.50 PER TON
30-35miles $_ 7.00 PER TON
35-40miles §_ 750 PERTON
40-45miles §  8.00 PER TON
45-50miles §__ 850  PERTON
50— 55miles §  9.00 PER TON

55—-60miles $§ NoBid PERTON
60—65miles $§ NoBid PERTON
65—70miles $_NoBid PER TON
70—-75miles $_NoBid PERTON

[nvitation for Bid and Bid Form

Over 75 miles

$ NoBid

Page 12 of 14

PER TON

Bidders Initials: _&‘)



JEFFERSON COUNTY
DEPARTMENT OF ADMINISTRATIVE SERVICES
729 MAPLE ST /PO BOX 100

HILLSBORO MO 63050
WWW JEFFCOMO.ORG
Invitation for Bid: TRAP ROCK 2016 Date Issued: 12-11-15

BIDS SHALL BE ACCEPTED UNTIL: TUESDAY, JANUARY 12, 2016, AT 2:00 P.M. LOCAL TIME.

Specification
Contact;:

Contract
Contact:

Mail (3) Three
Complete Copies
With Vendor And
Bid Information As
Shown In Sample:

Contract Term:

UPON APPROVAL OF THE
COUNTY COUNCIL AND
COUNTY EXECUTIVE

Vendor
Information:

KURT WENGERT
Department of Public Works
636-797-5427
kwengert@jeffcomo.org

VICKIE PRATT
Department of Administrative Services
636-797-5380

SAMPLE ENVELOPE
VENDOR NAME
VENDOR ADDRESS
CONTACT NUMBER DEPARTMENT OF THE COUNTY CLERK
JEFFERSON COUNTY MISSOUR!
729 MAPLE ST / PO BOX 100
HILLSBORO MO 63050-0100
SEALED BID: (BID NAME)

The undersigned certifies that he/she has the authority to bind this company in an
agreement/contract to supply the commodity or service in accordance with all terms,
conditions, and pricing specified. This Bid, if accepted, will constitute an Agreement and
Contract with Jefterson County, Missouri, upon approval of the County Councit and County
Executive. Prices are firm during this agreement term, unless agreed upon in writing by the
County. The County has the option to renew this agreement at the same terms and conditions
as the original agreement for one additional one-year term with the written consent of the
successful Bidder. Price increases for renewals are not authorized unless approved in writing
by the County.

BOBRY HOELSCHER TRUCKING, INC. BOMW Hhe,k \Nﬂ /
C

Company Natne Authf:zz ent (Print)
J;(ZLI’-)77 WWAA,LCMW [%MMH /Z/LL

Address 7 Slgﬂature

lfl)nwvn"\‘o n D !)335)3 ﬁ“?-‘-'lclﬂh‘l'

City/State/Zip Code Title
L3)-454-833Y [-b-lb__ Y3-/LiRkok

Telephone # Date Tax ID #

bhoelscher 20967 B Gmad scom. b3b-Hgl-84h

E-mail Fax #




SPECIFICATIONS FOR TRAP ROCK

The material shall meet the requirements of Section 1003 "AGGREGATE FOR SEAL COATS" of the
October 2015 version of the Missouri Standard Specifications for Highway Construction unless otherwise

approved by the County Engineer.

The aggregate shall be 3/8-inch maximum size Trap Rock Chips (washed) and shall meet the following
gradation (subject to approval by the Engineer):

GRADE Bl TRAPROCK SIEVE SIZE %PASSING (BY WEIGHT)
1/2” 100
3/8” 95-100
NO. 4 0-30
NO. 200 0-2

Testing reports shall be submitted by the selected vendor(s) to the County Engineer for approval prior to
delivery.

Bid Price shall be for County pickup at the plant location listed below. Delivery Cost to County building
locations will be an additional cost as listed. Please also provide a cost for various stockpile locations in the
County based on the distance from your plant lecation (if any, locations to be determined after award).
Stockpile delivery will receive five (5) working days’ notice to fill order. Delivery order will be a minimum of
2,000 tons. Deliveries will be accepted at the locations below between 7:00 AM and 2:00 PM, unless prior

arrangements have been made with the County.

Estimated order under this contract shall be a minimum of 5,000 tons and a maximum of 8,000 tons, subject to
project need and budgetary limitations. Aggregate will be used as cover rock for seal coat work. Stockpile for
seal coat will not begin until after April I, 2016 and will be completed before June 1, 2016. All material
ordered under this contract may be ordered at stated price until April 1, 2017.

In emergency, can we call you after regular hours? YES X NO
If yes, name party to call: BDL l? “ H‘D(i IS cLﬁ{
' f
Telephone number: é_? é, *-3 ?‘? -0597
Minimum Delivery Required (Circle One) Yes No’)

If yes, amount $

GRADE B1 TRAP ROCK BID PRICE 5 PER TON

~ PLANT LOCATION: FMTR .l(_’,e,n:{*rc»\ Stowne %w“‘r\e.f H:\\ ) Be,el wan

DELIVERY COST TO THE FOLLOWING LOCATIONS WILL BE AS STATED BELOW

De Soto Building 2960 Lee Pyle Road, off U.S. Hwy. 67 $ Zt 5 5 PER TON
Hillsboro Bulding 5275 State Highway B at Buicher Branch Road $ 9 . 2 1:5 PER TON
House Springs Building 6460 State Highway MM $ [ {[. 70D PERTON



HAUL CHART MILEAGE

0 - 5 miles

$ 3.4D

PER TON

5-10 miles $ 3.7’0 PER TON

10 -15 miles $ i,g U PERTON

15 - 20 miles

20 - 25 miles

25 - 30 miles

30 - 35 miles

35 - 40 miles

40 - 45 miles

45 - 50 miles

s H,70
5540
$35.70
sb:A0
s b 70
s /.35
5.8.05

PER TON

PER TON

PER TON

PER TON

PER TON

PER TON

PER TON

S0--55miles § 8, 7.5 PER TON
$ Z,EQ PER TON

55 — 60 miles

60 — 65 miles

65 — 70 miles

70 — 75 miles

Over 75 miles

$/0.20

PER TON

$ /10.90 pERTON

s //. b5 pErTON

$

PER TON

ADD ON PRICE PER TON FOR STOCK PILE DELIVERY

3422Y KOFI SOHER TRICKING ING.
28477 WINDWY LANE
WARRENION MO, 63383




JEFFERSON COUNTY

DEPARTMENT OF ADMINISTRATIVE SERVICES
729 MAPLE ST /PO BOX 100

HILLSBORO MO 63050

WWW.JEFFCOMO.ORG

Invitation for Bid: TRAP ROCK 2016 Date Issned: 12-11-15

BIDS SHALL BE ACCEPTED UNTIL: TUESDAY, JANUARY 12, 2016, AT 2:00 P.M. LOCAL TIME.

| KURT WENGERT
Specification | Department of Public Works

Contact: | 636-797-5427
kwengert@jeffcomo.org

Contract | VICKIE PRATT
Department of Administrative Services

Contact:
636-797-5380
SAMPLE ENVELOPE
Mail (3) Three VENDOR NAME
Complete Copies || "ENPORADDRESS
With Vendor And || COVHACTNUMBER DEPARTMENT OF THE COUNTY CLERK
Bid Information As JEFFERSON COUNTY MISSOURI

Shown In Sample: 729 MAPLE ST/ PO BOX 100
HILLSBORO MO 63030-0100

SEALED BID: (BID NAME)

. | The undersigned certifies that he/she has the authority to bind this company in an
Contract Term: agreement/contract to supply the commodity or service in accordance with all terms,
UPON APPROVAL OF THE | conditions, and pricing specified. This Bid, if accepted, will constitute an Agreement and
COUNTY COUNCIL AND | conpact with Jefferson County, Missouri, upon approval of the County Council and County
COUNTY EXECUTIVE Executive. Prices are firm during this agreement term, unless agreed upon in writing by the
County. The County has the option to renew this agreement at the same terms and conditions
as the original agreement for one additional one-year term with the wriiten consent of the
Vendor | successful Bidder. Price increases for renewals are not authorized unless approved in writing

Information: | by the County.
Trap Rock and Granite Quarries LLC Terry Bileddo

Company Name Authorized Agent (Prinf)
One Racehorse Dr. 4

Address " Signature
E. 8t. Louis, IL 62205 sales manager

City/State/Zip Code o "7 Title”
618-646-5306 1-11-16 45-3083209

Telephone # Date Tax ID #
terryb@beelman.com 618-646-5406

E-mail Fax #

Invitation for Bid and Bid Form Page 1 of 14 Bidders Enitialszﬁ



SPECIFICATIONS FOR TRAP ROCK

The material shall meet the requirements of Section 1003 "TAGGREGATE FOR SEAL COATS" of the
October 2015 version of the Missouri Standard Specifications for Highway Construction unless otherwise

approved by the County Engineer.

The aggregate shall be 3/8-inch maximum size Trap Rock Chips (washed) and shall meet the following
gradation (subject to approval by the Engineer):

GRADE B!l TRAP ROCK SIEVE SIZE %PASSING (BY WEIGHT)

1/2” 100
3/8” 95-100
NO. 4 0-30
NO. 200 0-2

Testing reports shall be submitted by the selected vendor(s) to the County Engineer for approval prior to
delivery.

Bid Price shall be for County pickup at the plant location listed below. Delivery Cost to County building
locations will be an additional cost as listed. Please also provide a cost for various stockpile Jocations in the
County based on the distance from your plant location (if any, locations to be determined after award).
Stockpile delivery will receive five (5) working days’ notice to fill order. Delivery order will be a minimum of
2,000 tons. Deliveries will be accepted at the locations below between 7:00 AM and 2:00 PM, unless prior

arrangements have been made with the County.

Estimated order under this contract shall be a minimum of 5,000 tons and a maximum of 8,000 tons, subject to
project need and budgetary limitations. Aggregate will be used as cover rock for seal coat work. Stockpile for
seal coat will not begin until after April 1, 2016 and will be completed before June 1, 2016. AJI material
ordered under this contract may be ordered at stated price until April 1,2017.

In emergency, can we call you after regular hours? YES X NO

If yes, name party to call: Alex Cortez
Telephone number; 618-443-8920

Minimum Delivery Required (Circle One) No
Hyes, amount$ 25 ton minimum

GRADE BI TRAP ROCK BmPRicE g 8-10 PER TON

PLANT LOCATION: TTrap Rock & Granite 1952 cCounty Rd 96 Ironton, MO 63650

DELIVERY COST TO THE FOLLOWING LOCATIONS WILL BE AS STATED BELOW
$ 755  prprTONny Daul only

SES_PERTON haul only
$1);ZLPERTON haul only

De Soto Building 2960 Lee Pyle Road, off U.S. Hwy. 67
Hillsboro Building 5275 State Highway B at Butcher Branch Road
House Springs Building 6460 State Highway MM

Invitation for Bid and Bid Farm Page 11 of 14 Bidders In]tialsﬁ



HAUL CHART MILEAGE

ADD ON PRICE PER TON FOR STOCK PILE DELIVERY

invitation for Bid and Bid Form

0 - 5 miles

5 - 10 miles

10 -15 miles

15 - 20 miles

20 - 25 miles

25 - 30 miles

30 - 35 miles

35 - 40 miles

40 - 45 miles

45 - 530 miles

50 — 55 miles

55— 60 miles

65— 70 miles

$ 3.00

$ 8.75

¢ 9.25

60—65miles § 27>

10.25
g .

T0—-75miles $ 10.95

Over 75 miles  § n/a

Page 12 of 14

PER TON

PER TON

PER TON

PER TON

PER TON

PER TON

PER TON

PER TON

PER TON

PER TON

PER TON

PER TON

PER TON

— PERTON

PER TON

PER TON

Bidders Initials: Z Z g



JEFFERSON COUNTY

DEPARTMENT OF ADMINISTRATIVE SERVICES
729 MAPLE ST /PO BOX 100

HILLSBORO MO 630350

WWW JEFFCOMO.ORG

Invitation for Bid: TRAP ROCK 2016

Date Issued: 12-11-15

BIDS SHALL BE ACCEPTED UNTIL: TUESDAY, JANUARY 12, 2016, AT 2:00 P.M. LOCAL TIME.

Specification
Contact:

Contract
Contact:

Mail (3) Three
Complete Copies
With Vendor And
Bid Information As
Shown In Sample:

Contract Term:
LPON APPROVAL OF THE
COUNTY COUNCIL AND
COUNTY EXECUTIVE

Vendor
Information:

invitation for Bid and Bid Form

KURT WENGERT
Department of Public Works
636-797-5427
kwengert@jeffcomo.org

VICKIE PRATT
Department of Administrative Services
636-797-5380

SAMPLE ENVELOPE

VENDOR NAME

VENDOR ADDRESS

DEPARTMENT OF THE COUNTY CLERK
JEFFERSON COUNTY MISSOURI

729 MAPLE ST /PO BOX 160

HIL.LSBORO MO 63050-0100

CONTACT NUMBER

SEALED BID: (BID NAAME}

The undersigned certifies that he/she has the authority to bind this company in an
agreement/contract o supply the commodity or service in accordance with all terms,
conditions, and pricing specified. This Bid, if accepted, will constitute an Agreement and
Confract with Jefferson County, Missouri, upon approval of the County Council and County
Executive, Prices are firm during this agreement term, unless agreed upon in writing by the
County. The County has the option to renew this agreement at the same terms and conditions
as the original agreement for one additional one-year term with the written consent of the
successful Bidder. Price increases for renewals are not authorized unless approved in writing

by the County.
Jeff Pullen

7

Central Stone Co

Company Name

3224 N Hwy 67

Address / ’ Signature
Florissant, MO 63033 Sales Representative
City/State/Zip Code - “Title -
314-830-5000 1/5/16 36-1489597
Date Tax ID #

Telephone #
314-830-9001
Fax #

Bldders rnitia%z

jpuilen@centralstone.com

E-mail

Page 1 of 14



SPECIFICATIONS FOR TRAP ROCK

The material shall meet the requirements of Section 1003 "AGGREGATE FOR SEAL COATS'" of the
October 2015 version of the Missouri Standard Specifications for Highway Construction unless otherwise

approved by the County Engineer.

The aggregate shall be 3/8-inch maximum size Trap Rock Chips (washed) and shall meet the following
gradation (subject to approval by the Engineer):

GRADE Bl TRAP ROCK SIEVE SIZE %PASSING (BY WEIGHT)
1/2” 100
3/8” 95-100
NO. 4 0-30
NO. 200 0-2

Testing reports shall be submitted by the selected vendor(s) to the County Engineer for approval prior to
delivery.

Bid Price shall be for County pickup at the plant location listed below. Delivery Cost to County building
locations will be an additional cost as listed. Please also provide a cost for various stockpile locations in the
County based on the distance from your plant location (if any, locations to be determined after award).
Stockpile delivery will receive five (5) working days® notice to fill order. Delivery order will be a minimum of
2,000 tons. Deliveries will be accepted at the locations below between 7:00 AM and 2:00 PM, unless prior

arrangements have been made with the County.

Estimated order under this contract shall be a minimum of 5,000 tons and a maximum of 8,000 tons, subject to
project need and budgetary limitations. Aggregate will be used as cover rock for seal coat work. Stockpile for
seal coat will not begin until after April 1, 2016 and will be completed before June 1, 2016. All material
ordered under this contract may be ordered at stated price until April 1, 2017.

In emergency, can we call you after regular hours? YES_ ¥ NO

If yes, name party to call: Jeff Pullen
314-435-4708

Telephone number:

Minimum Delivery Required (Circle One) @ No
I yes, amount §_& 1 M ° L Fon S}

GRADE B1 TRAP ROCK BID PRICE $ 10.00 PER TON

PLANT LOCATION: 5601 Hwy DD, Farmington, MO 63640

DELIVERY COST TO THE FOLLOWING LOCATIONS WILL BE AS STATED BELOW

De Soto Building 2960 Lee Pyle Road, off U.S. Hwy. 67 §_ 733 PER TON

Hillsboro Building 5275 State Highway B at Butcher Branch Road § 73> PER TON
. 7.35

House Springs Building 6460 State Highway MM S PER TON

Invitation for Bid and Bid Form Page 11 of 14 Bidders Initials: é 'tz .



HAUL CHART MILEAGE

ADD ON PRICE PER TON FOR STOCK PILE DELIVERY

Invitation for Bid and Bid Form

0 - 5 miles

5 - 10 miles

10 -15 miles

15 - 20 miles

20 - 25 miles

25 - 30 miles

30 - 35 miles

35 - 40 miles

40 - 45 miles

45 - 50 miles

50 — 55 miles

55 — 60 miles

60 — 65 miles

. 65~ 70 miles

70 — 75 miles

Over 73 miles

$ N\ PER TON
$ N PER TON

$ . PER TON

$ \ PER TON

$_ .. PERTON
$ ™~ PERTON

$ ~.___ PERTON
$ ™~ PER TON

$;k PER TON
$_L PER TON

PER TON

/

PER TON

PER TON

$ ™~ .. PERTON
$ ~ PER TON

$ ~ PER TON

2
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JEFFERSON COUNTY
%A DEPARTMENT OF ADMINISTRATIVE SERVICES
<1 729 MAPLE ST /PO BOX 100

HILLSBORO MO 63050
WWW.JEFFCOMO.ORG
Invitation for Bid: TRAP ROCK 2016 Date Issued: 12-11-15

BIDS SHALL BE ACCEPTED UNTIL: TUESDAY, JANUARY 12,2016, AT 2:00 P.M. LOCAL TIME.
, KURT WENGERT
Specification | Department of Public Works
Contact: | 636-797-5427
kwengert@jeffcomo.org

Contract | VICKIE PRATT
Contact: Department of Administrative Services
636-797-5380

SAMPLE ENVELOPE
Mail (3) Three || "ZVPORNAME
Complete Copies | | PFVPORADDRESS
With Vendor And || CONTACT NUMBER DEPARTMENT OF THE COUNTY CLERK
Bid Information As JEFFERSON COUNTY MISSOURI

Shown In Sample: 729 MAPLE ST/ PO BOX 100

HILLSBORO MO 63050-0100

SEALED BID: (BID NAME)

. | The undersigned certifies that he/she has the authority to bind this company in an
Contract Term: | agreement/contract to supply the commodity or service in accordance with all terms,
UPON APPROVAL OF THE | congitions, and pricing specified. This Bid, if accepted, will constitute an Agreement and
COUNTY COUNCIL AND | ¢oniract with Jefferson County, Missouri, upon approval of the County Council and County
COUNTY EXECUTIVE | gyeiiive. Prices are firm during this agreement term, unless agreed upon in writing by the
County. The County has the option to renew this agreement at the same terms and conditions
as the original agreement for one additional one-year term with the writien consent of the
Vendor | successful Bidder, Price increases for renewals are not authorized unless approved in writing

Information: | by the County.

e %“ac/me, e et T

Company Name %ﬂmrued Agent (Pr,
00 (Deldle Tan ., e, /}b&tﬁ;ﬁgg

Address SignatupéL/

Ahh /€9Q‘7t— Mo ¢ 349 0@»@&

T T T Ciyrstate/Zip Code 7 Title
A ¢77 777 /~/o7'D/é Y4./93 9987
Telephone ate Tax ID
Z)ﬂ’*/#fo F @,O&na/%)@’f’ £ wr, Cm_636£77 B7O
E-mail Fax #

Invitation for Bid and Bid Form Page 10f14 Bidders ,nma,;% -



SPECIFICATIONS FOR TRAP ROCK

The material shall meet the requirements of Section 1003 "AGGREGATE FOR SEAL COATS" of the
October 2015 version of the Missouri Standard Specifications for Highway Construction unless otherwise

approved by the County Engineer,

The aggregate shall be 3/8-inch maximum size Trap Rock Chips (washed) and shall meet the following
gradation (subject to approval by the Engineer):

GRADE B1 TRAP ROCK SIEVE SIZE %PASSING (BY WEIGHT)
1/2” 100
3/8” 95-100
NO. 4 0-30
NO. 200 0-2

Testing reports shall be submitted by the selected vendor(s) to the County Engineer for approval prior to
delivery.

Bid Price shall be for County pickup at the plant location listed below. Delivery Cost to County building
locations will be an additional cost as listed. Please also provide a cost for various stockpile locations in the
County based on the distance from your plant location (if any, locations to be determined after award).
Stockpile delivery will receive five (5) working days’ notice to fill order. Delivery order will be a minimum of
2,000 tons. Deliveries will be accepted at the locations below between 7:00 AM and 2:00 PM, unless prior

arrangements have been made with the County.

Estimated order under this contract shall be a minimum of 5,000 tons and a maximum of 8,000 tons, subject to
project need and budgetary limitations. Aggregate will be used as cover rock for seal coat work, Stockpile for
seal coat will not begin until after April 1, 2016 and will be completed before June 1, 2016. AJl material
ordered under this contract may be ordered at stated price until April 1, 2017.

In emergency, can we call you after regular hours? YES //NO
If yes, name party to call: ,O/?/O A’ Z ,
Telephone number: (3/ é/ ’ 6/ 78 6/ o 7"’7j
Minimum Delivery Required (Circle One) Ye@

If yes, amount §

GRADE B1 TRAP ROCK swerice s A /A‘ PER TON
PLANT LOCATION_Zron. ﬁ?mc/dr) 7;'7‘;; /é.J 4

DELIVERY COST TO THE FOLLOWING LOCATIONS WILL BE AS STATED BELOW
De Soto Building 2960 Lee Pyle Road, off U.S. Hwy. 67 5/ '[/ 2 PER TON
Hillsboro Building 5275 State Highway B at Buicher Branch Road $ /O PER TON
House Springs Building 6460 State Highway MM 3 3 %, PERTON
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HAUL CHART MILEAGE

ADD ON PRICE PER TON FOR STOCK PILE DELIVERY

¥ 20 7o
m}no_ﬂubl“—— W
on al/ ﬂﬂffésé

Invitation for Bid and Bid Form

0 - 5 miles

5 - 10 miles
10 -15 miles
15 - 20 miles
20 - 25 miles
25-30 rﬁiles
30 - 35 miles
35 - 40 miles
40 - 45 miles
45 - 50 miles
50 — 55 miles
35 — 60 miles
60 — 65 miles
65 — 70 miles
70 — 75 miles

Over 75 miles

$ 3.2 _PERTON
$ 3-89 PERTON
$ 4447 _PER TON
$ 474 PERTON
$ $.4% PERTON
$ $.99 pErRTON
$ £:5/ pErTON
$ML PER TON
$79¢ PER TON
$ ©.©7 PERTON

s § ¢/ PERTON

$ /28 PER TON

$ /& 30O PERTON

$ /3, 33--PER TON

$,.38 PER TON

$ PER TON
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