WORK UNIFORMS LEASE ~ PURCHASE BID TABULATION

WORK UNIFORMS
LEASE ~PURCHASE
BID OPENING
10-09-07
Rental of Work Uniforms with
Laundry Service

BATTALION
THREE INC.

ARAMARK
UNIFORM
SERVICES

INC

CINTAS
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MARKETING
PRODUCTS
GROUP

CLEAN THE
UNIFORM
COMPANY

UNIFIRST
CORP

Lease of Work Uniforms without

Laundry Service

Fabric Blend Shirt per week NO BID $0.182 $0.130 N/A $0.120 $0.200
Fabric Blend Pant per week NO BID $0.182 $0.210 N/A $0.170 $0.250
Fabric Blend Jacket per week NO BID $0.125 $0.380 N/A $0.360 $0.250
Cotton Fabric Shirt per week NO BID $0.230 $0.205 N/A $0.180 $0.230
Cotton Fabric Pant per week NO BID $0.230 $0.240 N/A $0.230 $30.000
Cotton Denim Jean per week NO BID $0.230 $0.250 N/A $0.210 $30.000

Cotton Jersey Tee Shirt per week NO BID $0.182 $0.130 N/A $0.130 N/A

PURCHASE

Spun Polyester Hi-Vis T-Shirt per week NO BID N/A ONLY N/A $0.310 N/A
Dress Spun Polyester Shirt per week NO BID $0.230 $0.220 N/A $0.250 $0.250
Dress Cotton Pant per week NO BID $0.230 $0.240 N/A $0.270 $0.400

BDU Blend Pant per week NO BID N/A $0.300 N/A $0.650 N/A

Buy out of Work Uniforms

Fabric Blend Shirt per week NO BID $0.200 $0.130 N/A $0.120 $0.150
Fabric Blend Pant per week NO BID $0.200 $0.210 N/A $0.170 $0.200
Fabric Blend Jacket per week NO BID $0.125 $0.380 N/A $0.360 $0.200
Cotton Fabric Shirt per week NO BID $0.238 $0.205 N/A $0.180 $0.200
Cotton Fabric Pant per week NO BID $0.238 $0.240 N/A $0.230 $0.250
Cotton Denim Jean per week NO BID $0.238 $0.250 N/A $0.210 $0.250

Cotton Jersey Tee Shirt per week NO BID $0.182 $0.130 N/A $0.140 N/A

PURCHASE

Spun Polyester Hi-Vis T-Shirt per week NO BID N/A ONLY N/A $0.310 N/A
Dress Spun Polyester Shirt per week NO BID $0.238 $0.220 N/A $0.290 $0.200
Dress Cotton Pant per week NO BID $0.238 $0.240 N/A $0.270 $0.350

BDU Blend Pant per week NO BID N/A $0.300 N/A $0.650 N/A

Fabric Blend Shirt

NO BID

$9.850

$14.000

N/A

$9.600

$12.000




WORK UNIFORMS LEASE ~ PURCHASE BID TABULATION

Estimated Yearly Costs Worksheet

WORK UNIFORMS ARAMARK
LEASE ~ PURCHASE UNIFORM MARKETING | CLEAN THE
BID OPENING BATTALION| SERVICES PRODUCTS UNIFORM UNIFIRST
10-09-07 THREE INC. INC CINTAS GROUP COMPANY CORP
Fabric Blend Pant NO BID $12.150 $16.000 N/A $12.170 $15.000
Fabric Blend Jacket NO BID - $19.850 $25.000 N/A $26.420 $30.000
Cotton Fabric Shirt $11.300 $14.000 N/A $12.000 Aﬂ $16.000
Cotton Fabric Pant NO BID $12.300 $20.000 N/A $17.770 $18.000
Cotton Denim Jean NO BID $16.000 $21.000 N/A $16.080 $18.000
Cotton Jersey Tee Shirt NO BID $9.620 $10.000 N/A $6.650 $16.000
Spun Polyester Hi-Vis T-Shirt NO BID $24.820 $14.990 N/A $23.610 $16.000
Dress Spun Polyester Shirt NO BID $9.620 $17.000 N/A $17.600 $16.000
Dress Cotton Pant NO BID $14.000 $20.000 N/A $19.600 $24.000
BDU Blend Pant NO BID $25.990 $25.000 N/A $31.950 N/A

Rental Fabric Blend type Work Uniforms

with Laundry Service NO BID $2,210.000 $2,340.000 N/A $2,033.200 $2.834.000
Lease Cotton Fabric Work Uniform
Shirts and Jean Work Pants without
Laundry Service NO BID $2,735.200 $3,156.400 N/A $2,776.800 $2,756.000
Rental Cotton Fabric Work Uniform
Shirts and Jean Work Pants with Laundry
Service NO BID $16,380.000 $17,986.800 N/A $15,631.200 | $19,749.600
Lease Spun Polyester Dress Shirt and
Cotton Twill Work Pants without
Laundry Service NO BID $4.102.800 $4.539.600 N/A $5,491.200 $4,914.000
Buy Hi-Visibility T-shirts
450 Shirts
X NO BID $24.820 $14.990 N/A $23.610 $16.000
= NO BID $11,169.000 $6,745.500 N/A $10,624.500 $7,200.000
Buy Spun Polyester Dress Uniform Polo
Shirts
150 Shirts Each
X NO BID $9.620 $17.000 N/A $17.600 $25.000
= NO BID $1,443.000 $2,550.000 N/A $2,640.000 $3,750.000




WORK UNIFORMS LEASE ~ PURCHASE BID TABULATION

WORK UNIFORMS ARAMARK
LEASE ~PURCHASE UNIFORM MARKETING | CLEAN THE
BID OPENING BATTALION| SERVICES PRODUCTS UNIFORM UNIFIRST
10-09-07 THREE INC. INC CINTAS GROUP COMPANY CORP
Buy BDU Blend Pants
50 Pants Each
X NO BID $25.990 $25.000 N/A $31.950 N/A
= NO BID $1,299.500 $1,250.000 N/A $1,597.500 N/A
Rental Cotton Fabric Tee Shirts with
Laundry Service NO BID $1,040.000 $743.600 N/A $743.600 N/A

Total estimated yearly cost

COMMENTS:

$40,379.500 $39,311.900

N/A

REFER TO
ATTACHED
SHEET

$41,538.000

$41,203.600




INVITATION FOR BID NOTICE ISSUED: 09-07-2007

COUNTY OF JEFFERSON, MISSOURI SPECIFICATION CONTACT
Office of Contracts, Grants, and Special Projects WILLIAM KOEHRER
729 Maple Street Director of Public Works

PO Box 100 636-797-5369

Hillsboro, MO 63050
636-797-5382
INVITATION FOR BID
WORK UNIFORMS (Lease/Purchase)

BIDS SHALL BE ACCEPTED UNTIL:

TUESDAY, OCTOBER 9, 2007, at 2:00 p.m. local time.

Thereafter, bids shall be opened in the County Commission Assembly Room.
THREE (3) COMPLETE COPIES OF SEALED BIDS MUST BE DELIVERED TO:

Office of the County Clerk
County of Jefferson, Missouri
729 Maple Street
PO Box 100
Hillsboro, MO 63050

The outside of the envelope must contain the vendor’s name, address and the following language:

SEALED BID FOR: WORK UNIFORMS (I.case/Purchase)

SUBMITTED BIDS ARE SUBJECT TO THE TERMS AND CONDITIONS OF THIS INVITATION
FOR BID AND SPECIFICATIONS.

The Agreement/Contract term is from:
11-01-2007 through 10-31-2009.

The undersigned certifies that he/she has the authority to bind this company in an agreement/contract to supply the commodity or
service in accordance with all terms, conditions, and pricing specified. Prices are firm during this agreement term, unless agreed upon
in writing by the County. The County has the option to renew this agreement at the same terms and conditions as the original
agreement for one additional two-year term with the written consent of the successful bidder. Price increases for renewals are not
authorized unless approved in \\rltnw;{ the County.
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BUY OUT OF WORK UNIFORMS

I.A.1 — Fabric Blend Shirt Men’s, SE14, Page 11

S-XL 2X-5X
$12.87 $15.14

I.A.1 — Fabric Blend Shirt Women’s, SE13, Page 11

S-XL 2X-3X
$13.02 $15.36

[.A.2 — Fabric Blend Pant Men’s, PT20, Page 29

28-44 44-52
$12.55 $15.45

[.A.2 — Fabric Blend Pant Women’s, PT21, Page 29
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I.A.3 — Fabric Blend Jacket Unisex, JT22, Page 41

S-XL 2X-5X & Longs
$22.87 $28.40

I.B.1 — Cotton Fabric Shirt Unisex, SC30, Page 13

S-XL 2X-5X
$16.32 $19.48

[.B.2 — Cotton Fabric Pant Men’s, PC10, Page 36

28-44 44-56
$15.25 $18.85

[.B.2 — Cotton Fabric Pant Women’s, PC45, Page 33

4-20 2-24
$17.90 520.84
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[.B.3 — Cotton Denim Jean Men’s, PD60, Page 38

28-44 44-54
$11.95 $14.73

[.B.3 — Cotton Denim Jean Women’s, PD61, Page 38

4-22
$14.43

I1.C.1 — Cotton Jersey Tee Shirt Unisex, Gildan 2300, No catalog page.

S-XL 2X 3X-5X
$4.45 $5.75 $5.85

1.C.2 — Spun Polyester Hi-Vis T-Shirt, SYK6HV, Page 120

S-XL 2X-4X
$20.85 $24.95

1.D.1 — Dress Spun Polyester Shirt Unisex, SK87, Page 24

S-XL 2X-4X
$17.10 $20.68

[.D.2 — Dress Cotton Pant Men’s, PC20, Page 36

28-44 44-50
$16.28 20.16

1.D.2 — Dress Cotton Pant Women'’s, PT59, Page 35

I.LE.1 — BDU Blend Pants Unisex, Propper F5201, No Catalog Page

XS-XL 2X 3X
$26.29 $27.96  $29.62



NOTE: All pricing includes patches, attaching patches, hemming, left chest embroidery,
left chest screening and freight. Shipping dates will be 3 to 4 weeks from receipt of
purchase order.



