
BID TABULATION - JANITORIAL SUPPLIES 2016

QUILL 

CORPORATION

HP PRODUCTS 

CORPORATION

ICS JAIL 

SUPPLIES, INC

INTERBORO 

PACKAGING 

CORP.

ALL-TYPE 

VACUUM

CENTRAL POLY-

BAG CORP.

CALICO 

INDUSTRIES, INC
DISPOSE N' SAVE

INDUSTRIAL 

SOAP COMPANY

PYRAMID 

SCHOOL 

PRODUCTS

CHEMCO 

INDUSTRIES

100 SCHELTER RD 

LINCOLNSHIRE IL 

60069

4220 SAGUARO 

TRAIL 

INDIANAPOLIS, IN 

46268

PO BOX 21056 

WACO TX 76702

114 BRACKEN RD. 

MONTGOMERY NY 

12459

10678 TRENTON 

AVE ST. LOUIS MO 

63132

2400 BEDLE PLACE 

LINDEN NJ 07036

9045 JUNCTION DR 

ANNAPOLIS 

JUNCTION                 

MD 20701

5 GRETZIL BERGER 

BLVD MONROE NY 

10950

722 S. 

VANDEVENTER 

AVE                               

ST LOUIS MO 63110

6510 NORTH 54TH 

STREET                      

TAMPA FL 33610-

1908

5731 MANCHESTER 

AVE                             

ST LOUIS MO 63110

JUMBO TOILET TISSUE (1)

MANUFACTURER: NO BID CASCADES NO BID NO BID NO BID
GEORGIA OR 

EQUIVALENT
NO BID NO BID

HOW PACKAGED: 12 RL/ CS 12 ROLLS/ CASE

ROLLS PER CASE: 12 12 12

SHEETS PER CASE: 2000 2000 2000

BID PRICE PER CASE: $21.82 $16.95 $19.99 

COMMENTS:
3.3' CORE/ 9' 

DIAMETER

TIDE LIQUID (2)

HOW PACKAGED: NO BID
6-50 OZ./ CS ($2.34 

GL/ CS)
NO BID 4-100 OZ NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

BID PRICE PER GALLON:
$60.84/ CS ($26.00/ 

GL)
$18.03 

COMMENTS:

ULTRA 

STRENGTH 2X 6/50 

OZ.

SMALL TOILET TISSUE (3)

MANUFACTURER: CASCADES NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

HOW PACKAGED: CASE CASE 96 PER CASE

ROLLS PER CASE: 96 96 96 96

SHEETS PER ROLL: 500 500 500 500

BID PRICE PER CASE: $32.69 $29.78 $25.89 $27.50 

COMMENTS:
BRIGHTON 

PROFESSIONAL

KITCHEN TOWELS (4)

MANUFACTURER: CASCADES ICS NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

HOW PACKAGED: CASE CASE CASE 30 PER CASE

ROLLS PER CASE: 30 30 12 30 30

SHEETS PER ROLL: 100 85 90 90

BID PRICE PER CASE: $28.42 $18.09 $4.43 $18.45 $17.50 

COMMENTS:
PREFERENCE 

GEORGIA PACIFIC
9"X11"

TRASH BAGS (LARGE) (5)

MANUFACTURER: NO BID PITT PLASTICS NO BID CENTRAL POLY CALICO NO BID NO BID

HOW PACKAGED: CASE 200/ CASE 25 RLS/ 5 RLS/ CS 200/ CS CASE 200/ CASE 250 BAGS

ROLLS PER CASE: 250 200 200 200/ FLAT PACK 200 10 RLS OF 25 BAGS

BAG SIZE: 40X46 (0.5 MIL) 40"X48" 40X46 40X46 40X48 40"X48" 40X46

BAG PRICE PER CASE: $19.05 $16.18 $11.10 $22.40 $16.48 $17.32 $16.60 

COMMENTS:
40-45 GAL/ MAX 

LOAD: 35 LBS.

STANDARD PACK: 

25O/ $20.225

ALT OPT: SAMPLE 

B $17.92/ CS

BID TABULATION 

JANITORIAL SUPPLIES 2016 

BID OPENING DATE                               

9-15-15
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QUILL 

CORPORATION

HP PRODUCTS 

CORPORATION

ICS JAIL 

SUPPLIES, INC

INTERBORO 

PACKAGING 

CORP.

ALL-TYPE 

VACUUM

CENTRAL POLY-

BAG CORP.

CALICO 

INDUSTRIES, INC
DISPOSE N' SAVE

INDUSTRIAL 

SOAP COMPANY

PYRAMID 

SCHOOL 

PRODUCTS

CHEMCO 

INDUSTRIES

100 SCHELTER RD 

LINCOLNSHIRE IL 

60069

4220 SAGUARO 

TRAIL 

INDIANAPOLIS, IN 

46268

PO BOX 21056 

WACO TX 76702

114 BRACKEN RD. 

MONTGOMERY NY 

12459

10678 TRENTON 

AVE ST. LOUIS MO 

63132

2400 BEDLE PLACE 

LINDEN NJ 07036

9045 JUNCTION DR 

ANNAPOLIS 

JUNCTION                 

MD 20701

5 GRETZIL BERGER 

BLVD MONROE NY 

10950

722 S. 

VANDEVENTER 

AVE                               

ST LOUIS MO 63110

6510 NORTH 54TH 

STREET                      

TAMPA FL 33610-

1908

5731 MANCHESTER 

AVE                             

ST LOUIS MO 63110

BID TABULATION 

JANITORIAL SUPPLIES 2016 

BID OPENING DATE                               

9-15-15

TRASH BAGS (SMALL) (6)

MANUFACTURER: NO BID PITT PLASTICS NO BID CENTRAL POLY CALICO NO BID NO BID

HOW PACKAGED: 1000/ CS (20/50) 1000/ CASE 50 RLS/20 RLS/ CS 1000/ CS 1000/ CASE 1000/ CASE 1000

ROLLS PER CASE: 1000 1000 1000 20 ROLLS/ 50 1000 1000

BAG SIZE: 23"X33" (0.4 MIL) 24"X33" 24X32 22X33 24X33 24"X33" 24X32

BAG PRICE PER CASE: $30.24 $18.82 $25.58 $13.50 $15.42 $14.34 $23.18 

COMMENTS:
ALT OPT: SAMPLE 

B $16.34/ CS

BAR HAND SOAP (7)

MANUFACTURER: NO BID DIAL NO BID NO BID DIAL NO BID

HOW PACKAGED: 1000/ CS CASE 1000 1000/ CASE

OZ. PER BAR: 3/4 OZ. 3/4 OZ 3/4 OZ 3/4 OZ 

BARS PER CASE: 1000 1000 1000 1000

BID PRICE: $63.72 $57.50 $49.99 $59.00 $95.95 

COMMENTS:

DIAL PURE & 

NATURAL 

COMPLEXION 

(BAR WRAP 3/4 

OZ.)

UNWRAPPED UNWRAPPED WRAPPED

SINGLE FOLD TOWELS (8)

MANUFACTURER: NO BID GEORGIA PACIFIC NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

SHEET SIZE: 9X10 9X10 9X10

HOW PACKAGED: 16 PACKS/ CS 12 / CS
4000 TOWELS PER 

CASE

SHEETS PER PACKAGE: 250 334 250

PACKAGE PER CASE: 16 12 16

BID PRICE: $15.98 $16.10 $14.20 

COMMENTS:
S-FOLD TOWEL/ 

NATURAL

ICE MELT (9)

MANUFACTURER: NO BID
KNOX FERTILIZER 

CO
NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

CHEMCO 

INDUSTRIES

HOW PACKAGED: BAG BAG/BOX BAG

LBS. PER BAG: 50 LBS 50 LBS 50 LBS 50 LBS

BID PRICE: $8.54 
$8.99/ $50.00 

DELIVERY
$8.34 $17.50 PER BAG

COMMENTS: 42 BAGS PER SKID

INDIVIDUALLY WRAPPED 

SANITARY NAPKINS (MAXI PADS) 

(10)

MANUFACTURER: RMC NATURELLE HOSPECO NO BID NO BID
HOSPECO 

(GARDS)
NO BID

HOW PACKAGED: CASE 250/ CASE 250 250/ CS

PADS PER BOX: 1 EACH 1 1 EACH 1 EACH 1 EACH
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QUILL 

CORPORATION

HP PRODUCTS 

CORPORATION

ICS JAIL 

SUPPLIES, INC

INTERBORO 

PACKAGING 

CORP.

ALL-TYPE 

VACUUM

CENTRAL POLY-

BAG CORP.

CALICO 

INDUSTRIES, INC
DISPOSE N' SAVE

INDUSTRIAL 

SOAP COMPANY

PYRAMID 

SCHOOL 

PRODUCTS

CHEMCO 

INDUSTRIES

100 SCHELTER RD 

LINCOLNSHIRE IL 

60069

4220 SAGUARO 

TRAIL 

INDIANAPOLIS, IN 

46268

PO BOX 21056 

WACO TX 76702

114 BRACKEN RD. 

MONTGOMERY NY 

12459

10678 TRENTON 

AVE ST. LOUIS MO 

63132

2400 BEDLE PLACE 

LINDEN NJ 07036

9045 JUNCTION DR 

ANNAPOLIS 

JUNCTION                 
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722 S. 

VANDEVENTER 

AVE                               

ST LOUIS MO 63110

6510 NORTH 54TH 

STREET                      

TAMPA FL 33610-

1908

5731 MANCHESTER 

AVE                             

ST LOUIS MO 63110

BID TABULATION 

JANITORIAL SUPPLIES 2016 

BID OPENING DATE                               

9-15-15

BOXES PER CASE: 250 250 250 250 250

BID PRICE: $46.43 $26.60 $30.14 $35.95 $23.95 $26.98 

COMMENTS:

MOP HEADS (11)

MANUFACTURER: NO BID

WILLEN/ 

CONTINENTAL 

COMMERCIAL 

PRODUCTS

NO BID NO BID NO BID ABCO NO BID

HOW PACKAGED: BULK BULK BULK 6 PER CASE

MOP HEADS PER CASE: 12 6 6 6

BID PRICE: $63.18 $6.50 EACH $15.23 $13.74 

COMMENTS:

BOLT ON CUT 

END COTTON 

PINNACLE 16 OZ 

LAY FLAT TYPE

BLEACH (12)

MANUFACTURER: JAMES AUSTIN CO NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

HOW PACKAGED: CASE CASE CASE CASE

GALLONS PER CASE: 3 6 GAL 4 4

BID PRICE: $10.48 $8.04 $11.15 $5.80 

COMMENTS: PURE BRIGHT A-1 ULTRA 6% 6 GAL PER CASE

BROOMS (13)

MANUFACTURER: NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID GREENWOOD NO BID

HOW PACKAGED: 6 PER BOX DOZEN

BID PRICE PER DOZEN: $61.44 $63.48 

COMMENTS:

SANITIZER CONCENTRATE FOR 

PIT TOWELS (PARKS) (14)

MANUFACTURER: NO BID SPARTAN NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
CHEMCO 

INDUSTRIES

HOW PACKAGED: 5 GAL/ PAIL 4-1 GAL 5 GAL BUCKETS

BID PRICE PER GALLON:

$11.23/ GAL OR 

$0.1718/ DILUTED 

GAL OR $56.16/ 5 

GAL PAIL

$4.75 $24.60 

COMMENTS:
DILUTION RATIO: 

1:64
GERMA KILL

DEODERIZER CONCENTRATE FOR 

PIT TOWELS (PARKS) (15)

MANUFACTURER: NO BID SPARTAN NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
CHEMCO 

INDUSTRIES

HOW PACKAGED: 5 GAL/ PAIL GAL CONTAINER 5 GAL BUCKETS

BID PRICE PER GALLON:

$11.23/ GAL OR 

$0.1718/ DILUTED 

GAL OR $56.16/ 5 

GAL PAIL

$3.85 $23.79 

COMMENTS:
DILUTION RATIO: 

1:64
ODOR SUPPRESS



BID TABULATION - JANITORIAL SUPPLIES 2016

QUILL 

CORPORATION

HP PRODUCTS 

CORPORATION

ICS JAIL 

SUPPLIES, INC

INTERBORO 

PACKAGING 

CORP.

ALL-TYPE 

VACUUM

CENTRAL POLY-

BAG CORP.

CALICO 

INDUSTRIES, INC
DISPOSE N' SAVE

INDUSTRIAL 

SOAP COMPANY

PYRAMID 

SCHOOL 

PRODUCTS

CHEMCO 

INDUSTRIES

100 SCHELTER RD 

LINCOLNSHIRE IL 

60069

4220 SAGUARO 

TRAIL 

INDIANAPOLIS, IN 

46268

PO BOX 21056 

WACO TX 76702

114 BRACKEN RD. 

MONTGOMERY NY 

12459

10678 TRENTON 

AVE ST. LOUIS MO 

63132

2400 BEDLE PLACE 

LINDEN NJ 07036

9045 JUNCTION DR 

ANNAPOLIS 

JUNCTION                 

MD 20701

5 GRETZIL BERGER 

BLVD MONROE NY 

10950

722 S. 

VANDEVENTER 

AVE                               

ST LOUIS MO 63110

6510 NORTH 54TH 

STREET                      

TAMPA FL 33610-

1908

5731 MANCHESTER 

AVE                             

ST LOUIS MO 63110

BID TABULATION 

JANITORIAL SUPPLIES 2016 

BID OPENING DATE                               

9-15-15

NON-ALCOHOL FOAMING HAND 

SANITIZER (16)

MANUFACTURER: NO BID RUBBERMAID NO BID DEB NO BID NO BID DEB NO BID NO BID

HOW PACKAGED: 1100/ML  4/CS 1 LITER BTLS 1 LITER BTLS

BID PRICE PER BOX:
$15.57/PER  

$62.26/CS
$39.10 

$35.97 OR $5.99/ 1 

LTR BTL

COMMENTS:
ONLY SOLD BY 

CASE

WHITE ROLL TOWELS (17)

MANUFACTURER: NO BID
KIMBERLY 

CLARK
NO BID

KIMBERLY 

CLARK
NO BID NO BID

KIMBERLY 

CLARK
NO BID NO BID

HOW PACKAGED: 12/ CS 6 PKS OF 1000 12 ROLLS

BID PRICE PER BOX: $66.69 $46.53 $67.92 

COMMENTS:

HIGH CAPACITY 

HARD ROLL 

TOWEL/ WHITE/ 

8X1000

ANTI-BACTERIAL HAND SOAP (18)

MANUFACTURER: NO BID NO BID NO BID DEB NO BID NO BID DEB NO BID NO BID

HOW PACKAGED: 1 LITER BTLS 1 LTR BTLS

BID PRICE PER BOX: $32.90 
$29.66/ CS OR $4.94 

EACH BTL

COMMENTS:

CHLOROX BLEACH (19)

MANUFACTURER: NO BID SPARTAN NO BID P&G NO BID NO BID NO BID CLOROX NO BID

HOW PACKAGED: 5 GAL PAIL 3-121 OZ. 3-1 GAL

BID PRICE PER GALLON: $32.13 $5.30 $8.99 

COMMENTS:

COLOR SAFE 

OXYGEN BLEACH 

7005 

DOWNY FABRIC SOFTNER (20)

MANUFACTURER: NO BID SPARTAN NO BID P&G NO BID NO BID NO BID P&G NO BID

HOW PACKAGED: 5 GAL PAIL 4 GAL 8-64 OZ/ CASE

BID PRICE PER GALLON: $62.75 $7.34 
$4.99 PER 64 OZ 

BOTTLE

COMMENTS:

LARGE AEROSOL DISINFECTANT 

CAN DEORDORIZER SPRAY (21)

MANUFACTURER: CLAIRE NO BID NO BID NO BID
CLEASE 

(SPRAYPACK)

CHEMCO 

INDUSTRIES

HOW PACKAGED: EACH (14 OZ.) 12/20 OZ./ CS 16.5 OZ 17 OZ
12-16.5 OZ CANS / 

CASE
15 OZ PER CAN

BID PRICE PER OZ.

$0.024 PER OZ./ 

$3.26 PER (1) 14 

OZ. CAN

$29.19 $0.117 OZ. $0.1089 OZ. $0.1414 OZ. $0.67 PER OZ



BID TABULATION - JANITORIAL SUPPLIES 2016

QUILL 

CORPORATION

HP PRODUCTS 

CORPORATION

ICS JAIL 

SUPPLIES, INC

INTERBORO 

PACKAGING 

CORP.

ALL-TYPE 

VACUUM

CENTRAL POLY-

BAG CORP.

CALICO 

INDUSTRIES, INC
DISPOSE N' SAVE

INDUSTRIAL 

SOAP COMPANY

PYRAMID 

SCHOOL 

PRODUCTS

CHEMCO 

INDUSTRIES

100 SCHELTER RD 

LINCOLNSHIRE IL 

60069

4220 SAGUARO 

TRAIL 

INDIANAPOLIS, IN 

46268

PO BOX 21056 

WACO TX 76702

114 BRACKEN RD. 

MONTGOMERY NY 

12459

10678 TRENTON 

AVE ST. LOUIS MO 

63132

2400 BEDLE PLACE 

LINDEN NJ 07036

9045 JUNCTION DR 

ANNAPOLIS 

JUNCTION                 

MD 20701

5 GRETZIL BERGER 

BLVD MONROE NY 

10950

722 S. 

VANDEVENTER 

AVE                               

ST LOUIS MO 63110

6510 NORTH 54TH 

STREET                      

TAMPA FL 33610-

1908

5731 MANCHESTER 

AVE                             

ST LOUIS MO 63110

BID TABULATION 

JANITORIAL SUPPLIES 2016 

BID OPENING DATE                               

9-15-15

COMMENTS:

CLOROX 4 IN 1 

DISINFECTANT & 

SANITIZER (12 

PER CASE)

12 CANS PER 

CASE

DIS-DEO 

PACKAGED IN 1 

OZ TO A CASE

SCREW ON MOP HANDLES (22)

MANUFACTURER: NO BID RUBBERMAID NO BID NO BID NO BID ABCO NO BID

HOW PACKAGED: UNITS OF 12 UNITS OF 12 UNITS OF 12 UNITS OF 12

BID PRICE PER BOX: $66.38 $49.44 $34.60 $35.52 

COMMENTS:
BOLT ON WET 

MOP HANDLE 60"

SPIC-N-SPAN 3-N-1 MULTISURFACE 

GLASS DISINFECTANT CLEANER 

(23)

MANUFACTURER: NO BID P&G NO BID P&G NO BID NO BID NO BID P&G SPIC-N-SPAN NO BID

HOW PACKAGED: 3 - 1 GAL/ CS 8-32 OZ/ CS 2-1 GAL/ CASE

BID PRICE PER BOX: $37.48 $42.05 $89.98 

COMMENTS: READY TO USE

COMMET CLEANER WITH 

BLEACH (24)

MANUFACTURER: NO BID P&G NO BID P&G NO BID NO BID NO BID P&G COMET NO BID

HOW PACKAGED: 3 GL/ CS 8-32 OZ/ CS
24-21 OZ CANS/ 

CASE

BID PRICE PER BOX: $48.31 $44.10 $39.98 

COMMENTS:

FEBREEZE ODOR ELIMINATOR (25)

MANUFACTURER: NO BID NO BID NO BID P&G NO BID NO BID NO BID FEBREEZE NO BID

HOW PACKAGED: 8-32 OZ/ CS
9-9.7 OZ CANS/ 

CASE

BID PRICE PER BOX: $45.70 $38.98 

COMMENTS:

MR. CLEAN FINISHED FLOOR 

CLEANER (26)

MANUFACTURER: NO BID P&G NO BID P&G NO BID NO BID NO BID P&G MR CLEAN NO BID

HOW PACKAGED: 3 GL/ CS 3 GAL/ CASE 3-1 GAL/ CASE

BID PRICE PER BOX: $44.65 $42.81 $54.98 

COMMENTS:

DISINFECTANT FLOOR CLEANER 

(27)

MANUFACTURER: MR. CLEAN SPARTAN NO BID P&G NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

HOW PACKAGED: 1 EA./ BX 5 GAL PAIL 4 GAL/ CASE

BID PRICE PER BOX: $15.46 EA

$36.14/ PAIL OR 

$0.1093/ DILUTED 

GAL

$34.60 



BID TABULATION - JANITORIAL SUPPLIES 2016

QUILL 

CORPORATION

HP PRODUCTS 

CORPORATION

ICS JAIL 

SUPPLIES, INC

INTERBORO 

PACKAGING 

CORP.

ALL-TYPE 

VACUUM

CENTRAL POLY-

BAG CORP.

CALICO 

INDUSTRIES, INC
DISPOSE N' SAVE

INDUSTRIAL 

SOAP COMPANY

PYRAMID 

SCHOOL 

PRODUCTS

CHEMCO 

INDUSTRIES

100 SCHELTER RD 

LINCOLNSHIRE IL 

60069

4220 SAGUARO 

TRAIL 

INDIANAPOLIS, IN 

46268

PO BOX 21056 

WACO TX 76702

114 BRACKEN RD. 

MONTGOMERY NY 

12459

10678 TRENTON 

AVE ST. LOUIS MO 

63132

2400 BEDLE PLACE 

LINDEN NJ 07036

9045 JUNCTION DR 

ANNAPOLIS 

JUNCTION                 

MD 20701

5 GRETZIL BERGER 

BLVD MONROE NY 

10950

722 S. 

VANDEVENTER 

AVE                               

ST LOUIS MO 63110

6510 NORTH 54TH 

STREET                      

TAMPA FL 33610-

1908

5731 MANCHESTER 

AVE                             

ST LOUIS MO 63110

BID TABULATION 

JANITORIAL SUPPLIES 2016 

BID OPENING DATE                               

9-15-15

COMMENTS:

WILL NOT 

ATTACK OR DULL 

HIGH GLOSS 

FLOOR FINISHES. 

DILUTION RATIO: 

1:64

NOTARIZED WORK AFFIDAVIT 

COMPLETED
Y Y Y Y Y Y Y Y Y Y Y

E-VERIFICATION DOCUMENTATION 

(Y/N):
Y Y N N Y Y N N Y N

COPY OF INSURANCE PROVIDED Y Y Y Y N N Y Y

INCLUDED BUT 

EXPIRED ON 

9/16/15

Y Y

TAX RECEIPTS OR NOTARIZED 

LETTER STATING NO REAL OR 

PERSONAL PROPERTY OWNED IN 

JEFFERSON COUNTY

Y Y N Y N N N Y Y Y Y

COOPERATIVE BID FORM (Y/N) Y Y Y Y Y Y Y Y Y Y Y

COOPERATIVE CONTACT INFO: Y Y Y Y Y Y Y Y Y Y Y

COMPANY INFORMATION AND 

SIGNATURE
Y Y Y Y Y Y N Y Y Y

COMPANY 

INFO.BUT 

UNSIGNED

BID DEPOSIT REQUIRED N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A

COMMENTS: SEE ATTACHED

SEE ATTACHED 

DELIVERY IN 3-7 

BUSINESS DAYS

SEE ATTACHED

BID MISSING 

PAGES12, & 15-22 

SEE ATTACHED 

DELIVERY IN 5-7 

BUSINESS DAYS

SEE ATTACHED SEE ATTACHED SEE ATTACHED

BID MISSING 

PAGES 12, 13, & 15-

22                                     

SEE ATTACHED 

DELIVERY IN 5-7 

DAYS ARO

SEE ATTACHED SEE ATTACHED SEE ATTACHED




























































































































































































































































































































































































































































