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13512 Copier Staples - Sharp AR-M237/AR-M277 Copier, 3/Box Sharp AR-SC1 BOX $20.18 $19.00 NO BID $20.00 $88.20 NO BID $32.30 $31.30 NO BID $38.00 $27.89

13514 Copier Staples - Sharp AR-M350 Copier AG559, 3/Box Sharp AR-SC1 BOX $20.18 $17.00 NO BID $20.00 NO BID NO BID $32.30 $31.30 NO BID $38.00 $27.89

13555
Copier Staples - Staple Cartridge for use in RICOH Aficio 

MP5002
Ricoh * MXSCX1 BOX $84.16 $49.00 NO BID $20.00 NO BID NO BID $54.92 $52.85 NO BID $65.00 $27.89

14204 Toner - Sharp AR270 NT1 also AR310NT Sharp * SHRAR310NT EACH $64.68 $78.00 $98.69 $70.00 $88.20 $66.10 $62.70 $61.65 NO BID $73.00 $81.45

14205 Toner - Sharp AR450U Sharp * SHRAR450NT EACH $60.48 $47.00 $55.59 $58.00 $61.95 $56.05 $50.21 $49.15 NO BID $59.00 $65.11

14206 Toner - Sharp ARM620U Sharp * SHRAR621NT1 EACH $101.02 $70.00 $74.59 $60.00 $86.10 $89.35 $80.90 $81.05 NO BID $91.00 $94.81

14207 Toner - Sharp ARM255N,355/455 Sharp * AR455NT1 EACH $81.65 $55.00 $56.39 $58.00 $61.95 $57.90 $52.55 $61.00 NO BID $65.00 $65.11

14208 Toner - RICOH Aficio MP 50022 Copier Ricoh * RIC 841346 EACH $43.41 $50.00 NO BID $40.00 $46.20 $47.50 $43.60 $65.15 NO BID $51.00 $55.72

14209 Toner - Sharp MX-M310 Copier Sharp * SHR MX-312NT EACH $78.89 $70.00 NO BID $69.00 $93.45 $97.40 $79.95 $77.00 NO BID $83.00 $102.48

14215 Toner - Sharp MX-M503N Copier, Black Sharp * SHR-MX500NT EACH $84.14 $70.00 $63.79 $71.00 $87.15 $91.25 $72.43 $69.75 NO BID $84.00 $96.64

14216 Drum - Sharp MX-M503N Copier Sharp * SHR-MX500NR EACH $61.12 $50.00 NO BID $20.00 NO BID NO BID $53.15 $51.20 NO BID $59.00 $49.22

14217 Developer - Sharp MX-M503N Copier Sharp * SHR-MX500NV EACH $52.36 $50.00 NO BID $22.00 NO BID NO BID $51.08 $48.60 NO BID $57.00 $62.97

14220 Toner - Sharp MX 3501N Color Copier, Black Sharp * MX45NTBA EACH $64.60 $55.00 $56.39 $60.00 $67.20 $61.25 $54.90 $63.55 NO BID $71.00 $73.98

14221 Toner - Sharp MX 3501N Color Copier, Cyan Sharp * MX27NTCA EACH $94.72 $80.00 $90.19 $80.00 $95.55 $98.65 $88.39 $88.00 NO BID $95.00 $108.14

14222 Toner - Sharp MX 3501N Color Copier, Magenta Sharp * MX27NTMA EACH $94.72 $80.00 $90.19 $88.00 $95.55 $98.65 $88.39 $88.00 NO BID $95.00 $108.14

14223 Toner - Sharp MX 3501N Color Copier, Yellow Sharp * MX27NTYA EACH $94.72 $80.00 $90.19 $90.00 $95.55 $98.65 $88.39 $88.00 NO BID $95.00 $108.14

14224 Waste Toner Cartridge - Sharp MX 3501N Color Copier Sharp * SHRMX270HB EACH $19.29 $21.00 NO BID $20.00 NO BID NO BID $19.76 $19.10 NO BID $24.50 $28.41

14230 Toner - Sharp MXM364N Copier, Black Sharp *
SHRARMX560N

T
EACH $74.71 $66.00 NO BID $20.00 NO BID NO BID $68.79 $66.20 NO BID $79.00 $84.86

14231 Waste Toner - Sharp MXM364N Copier Sharp *
SHRARMX560H

B
EACH $103.11 $22.00 NO BID $20.00 NO BID NO BID $25.51 $24.85 NO BID $33.00 $29.21

14303 Toner - XEROX MFP 8560 Color, Cyan, 3/Box XEROX * XER108R00723 BOX $123.23 $105.00 $118.89 $80.00 $123.90 $122.70 $95.04 $111.95 $100.00 $117.00 $110.16

14304 Toner - XEROX MFC 8560 Color, Magenta, 3/Box XEROX * XER108R00724 BOX $123.23 $105.00 $118.89 $86.00 $123.90 $122.70 $95.04 $111.95 $100.00 $117.00 $110.16

14305 Toner - XEROX MFC 8560 Color, Yellow, 3/Box XEROX * XER108R00725 BOX $123.23 $105.00 $118.89 $87.00 $123.90 $122.70 $95.04 $111.95 $100.00 $117.00 $110.16

14306 Toner - XEROX MFC 8560 Color, Black, 3/Box XEROX * XER108R00726 BOX $78.97 $60.00 $76.09 $50.00 $76.65 $78.65 $59.62 $71.75 $75.00 $66.42 $73.83

14307 Toner - XEROX MFC 8560 Color, Black, 6/Box XEROX * XER108R00727 BOX $120.31 $105.00 $115.89 $80.00 $122.85 $119.80 $92.80 $109.25 $100.00 $117.00 $107.80

14509
Toner - Toshiba T3500 Studio E35 and Studio E34, 4 

Cartidges/Box
Toshiba * TOST3500 BOX $72.63 $18.00 $75.09 $58.00 NO BID $58.50 $52.50 $15.00 NO BID $65.00 $35.03

14601 Toner - Toshiba E-studio 555/655 Toshiba * T8550 EACH $84.64 $65.00 NO BID $40.00 NO BID $80.30 $71.85 $74.80 NO BID $84.00 $94.31

14603 Toner - Toshiba E-studio 523/523T/603 Toshiba * T7200 EACH $81.18 $70.00 NO BID $60.00 NO BID NO BID $100.00 NO BID NO BID $82.00 $94.31

14702 Toner - Panasonic DP2000/2500 Panasonic * DQTU18B EACH $103.02 $80.00 NO BID $20.00 NO BID NO BID $98.55 NO BID NO BID $105.00 $120.53

14703 Toner - Panasonic DP18 WORKIO/DP1810P Panasonic * DQTU10C EACH $50.39 $30.00 $56.09 $20.00 NO BID NO BID $47.09 $57.50 NO BID $55.00 $75.94

14707 Toner - Panasonic DP2310/3030 Panasonic * DQTU15E EACH $44.17 $40.00 $62.29 $20.00 NO BID $45.80 $41.08 NO BID NO BID $51.00 $53.08

14800 Toner - Minolta Bizhub 222 Minolta * MLNTN211 EACH $45.19 $38.00 $43.99 $40.00 $49.35 $50.86 $36.59 $47.50 NO BID $43.00 $58.36

15104
Laser Toner - HP LaserJet, 1012, 1020, 1022, 3020, & 3030 

Series, Black
HP * HEWQ2612A EACH $60.34 $57.00 $67.59 $60.00 $58.92 $61.30 $54.17 $58.00 $65.00 $59.00 $76.29

15107 Laser Toner - HP LaserJet 4200 Series HP * HEWQ1338A EACH $145.68 $135.00 $163.29 $120.00 $142.26 $147.95 $130.79 $144.00 $129.00 $143.00 $170.02

15109 Laser Toner - Hewlett Packard 4000, 4000N, 4000SE HP * HEWC4127X EACH $148.75 $128.00 $155.79 $111.00 $144.90 $151.95 $141.31 $134.00 $95.00 $140.00 $162.76

15118 Drum - HP Color Laser Jet 4500 and 4550N Series HP * C4195A EACH $106.57 $60.00 $87.49 $70.00 NO BID NO BID $63.95 NO BID $60.00 $115.00 $81.48

15119 Laser Toner - HP 2100 Series, Black HP * HEWC4096A EACH $119.34 $90.00 $122.59 $106.00 $113.40 $119.50 $111.11 $105.00 $75.00 $110.00 $130.12

15120 Laser Toner - HP 4100 Series, Black HP * HEWC8061X EACH $139.06 $125.00 $155.89 $40.00 $135.80 $141.25 $129.98 $138.50 $90.00 $140.00 $162.76

15121 Laser Toner - HP Laserjet 1000 Series, Black HP * HEWC7115A EACH $66.51 $59.00 $74.59 $40.00 $64.96 $67.55 $57.42 $66.25 $52.00 $68.00 $83.06

15124 Laser Toner - HP Laserjet 5500 Color Printer, Black HP * HEWC9730A EACH $216.65 $205.00 $247.49 $233.00 $211.56 $220.05 $202.49 $233.00 $210.00 $215.00 $267.01

15125 Laser Toner - HP Laserjet 5500 Color Printer, Cyan HP * HEWC9731A EACH $358.11 $300.00 $367.89 $327.00 $340.20 $358.50 $294.58 $326.75 $275.00 $320.00 $370.42

15126 Laser Toner - HP Laserjet 5500 Color Printer, Yellow HP * HEWC9732A EACH $358.11 $300.00 $367.89 $322.00 $340.20 $358.50 $294.58 $326.75 $275.00 $320.00 $370.42

15127 Laser Toner - HP Laserjet 5500 Color Printer, Magenta HP * HEWC9733A EACH $358.11 $300.00 $367.89 $329.00 $340.20 $358.50 $294.58 $326.75 $275.00 $320.00 $370.42

15135 Laser Toner - HP Laserjet 4600 Color Printer, Black HP * HEWC9720A EACH $168.75 $155.00 $189.19 $120.00 $164.79 $171.40 $145.67 $168.05 $129.00 $168.00 $195.37

15136 Laser Toner - HP Laserjet 4600 Color Printer, Cyan HP * HEWC9721A EACH $211.71 $200.00 $256.29 $150.00 $206.74 $214.95 $197.88 $227.70 $160.00 $197.90 $261.16

15137 Laser Toner - HP Laserjet 4600 Color Printer, Yellow HP * HEWC9722A EACH $211.71 $200.00 $256.29 $160.00 $206.74 $214.95 $197.88 $227.70 $160.00 $197.90 $261.16

15138 Laser Toner - HP Laserjet 4600 Color Printer, Magenta HP * HEWC9723A EACH $211.71 $200.00 $256.29 $170.00 $206.74 $214.95 $197.88 $227.70 $160.00 $197.90 $261.16

15139 Laser Toner - HP Laserjet 2550N Color Printer, Black HP * HEWQ3960A EACH $85.61 $78.00 $87.69 $30.00 $81.90 $85.45 $79.48 $77.90 $50.00 $81.00 $95.92

15140 Laser Toner - HP Laserjet 2550N Color Printer, Cyan HP * HEWQ3961A EACH $109.43 $88.00 $105.79 $30.00 $103.95 $103.10 $95.88 $94.00 $55.00 $100.00 $113.65

15141 Laser Toner - HP Laserjet 2550N Color Printer, Yellow HP * HEWQ3962A EACH $109.43 $88.00 $105.79 $30.00 $103.95 $103.10 $95.88 $94.00 $55.00 $100.00 $113.65

15142 Laser Toner - HP Laserjet 2550N Color Printer, Magenta HP * HEWQ3963A EACH $109.43 $88.00 $105.79 $30.00 $103.95 $103.10 $95.88 $94.00 $55.00 $100.00 $113.65

15143 Drum Unit - HP Laserjet 2550N Color Printer HP * HEWQ3964A EACH $200.24 $180.00 $188.99 $60.00 $196.35 $207.15 $200.48 $197.00 $125.00 $195.00 $211.55

15144 Laser Toner - HP Laserjet 2300N Printer, Black HP * HEWQ2610A EACH $143.41 $125.00 $147.29 $120.00 $136.00 $143.55 $117.97 $130.85 $70.00 $142.00 $154.33

15145 Laser Toner - HP Laserjet 4300 Printer, Black HP * HEWQ1339A EACH $211.07 $175.00 $216.29 $170.00 $199.50 $210.75 $195.99 $192.10 $140.00 $210.00 $221.88

15147 Laser Toner - HP Laserjet 4350/4250 Printer, Black HP * HEWQ5942X EACH $213.77 $197.00 $239.69 $179.00 $208.75 $217.10 $173.47 $212.90 $180.00 $222.00 $244.82

15148 Laser Toner - HP Laserjet 2400 Series, Black HP * HEWQ6511X EACH $215.85 $180.00 $221.09 $186.00 $204.75 $215.50 $177.07 $196.40 $160.00 $204.00 $226.65

15149 Laser Toner - P3005 or M3035 Printer, Black HP * HEWQ7551A EACH $111.70 $105.00 $122.89 $40.00 $109.09 $113.45 $100.29 $111.25 $105.00 $118.00 $132.70

15157 Laser Toner - Lexmark E234N, Black Lexmark* LEX24015SA EACH $86.13 $68.00 $80.29 $78.00 $87.15 $86.20 $79.00 $86.30 $90.00 $76.00 $126.01

15158 Laser Toner - LEXMARK T650 Printer, Black Lexmark* LEXT650A11A EACH $146.08 $132.00 $140.79 $200.00 $149.42 $152.30 $137.49 $144.15 $135.00 $148.00 $275.53

15159 Laser Toner - Lexmark T520, T522 Printer, Black Lexmark * LEX12A6735 EACH $423.77 $360.00 $422.49 $400.00 $428.40 $423.90 $388.29 $397.85 $315.00 $375.00 $438.46

15161
Laser Toner - HP LaserJet P1606DN, HP LaserJet 1536DNF 

MFP, Black
HP * HEWCE278A EACH $60.73 $56.00 $65.49 $52.00 $58.74 $61.65 $52.43 $57.00 $60.48 $65.00 $76.71

15165 Laser Toner - HP Laserjet 90A, Black HP * HEWCE390A EACH $133.31 $123.00 $149.49 $126.00 $130.18 $135.40 $115.08 $132.80 $140.00 $145.00 $156.44

15166
Laser Toner - HP Color LaserJet CP4025, CP4525 Series 

Printer, Black
HP * HEWCE260A EACH $123.24 $115.00 $138.19 $120.00 $120.08 $125.15 $110.64 $122.75 $123.00 $125.00 $145.38

15167
Laser Toner - HP Color LaserJet CP4025, CP4525 Series 

Printer, Cyan
HP * HEWCE261A EACH $244.44 $230.00 $250.39 $234.00 $232.05 $244.05 $200.54 $222.45 $210.00 $240.00 $255.36

15168
Laser Toner - HP Color LaserJet CP4025, CP4525 Series 

Printer, Yellow
HP * HEWCE262A EACH $244.44 $230.00 $250.39 $230.00 $232.05 $244.05 $200.54 $222.45 $210.00 $240.00 $255.36

15169
Laser Toner - HP Color LaserJet CP4025, CP4525 Series 

Printer, Magenta
HP * HEWCE263A EACH $244.44 $230.00 $250.39 $210.00 $232.05 $244.05 $200.54 $222.45 $210.00 $240.00 $255.36

15171 Laser Toner - HP LaserJet 3600, Cyan HP * HEWQ2671A EACH $144.89 $105.00 $139.99 $90.00 $137.55 $136.50 $126.97 $124.45 $110.00 $135.00 $147.26

15172 Laser Toner - HP LaserJet 3600, Yellow HP * HEWQ2672A EACH $144.89 $105.00 $139.99 $90.00 $137.55 $136.50 $126.97 $124.45 $110.00 $135.00 $147.26

15179 Laser Toner - HP Laserjet 1160, 1320 Series, Black HP * HEWQ5949X EACH $155.77 $130.00 $159.99 $124.00 $148.05 $155.95 $145.02 $140.00 $100.00 $155.00 $166.78

15184 Laser Toner - HP Color Laserjet 3600 & 3800, Cyan HP * HEWQ6471A EACH $115.70 $115.00 $140.09 $115.00 $112.98 $117.50 $108.14 $124.45 $100.00 $125.00 $147.26

15185 Laser Toner - HP Color Laserjet 3600 & 3800, Yellow HP * HEWQ6472A EACH $115.70 $115.00 $140.09 $110.00 $112.98 $117.50 $108.14 $124.45 $100.00 $125.00 $147.26

15186 Laser Toner - HP Color Laserjet 3600 & 3800, Magenta HP * HEWQ6473A EACH $115.70 $115.00 $140.09 $112.00 $112.98 $117.50 $108.14 $124.45 $100.00 $125.00 $147.26

15187 Laser Toner - HP Color Laserjet P2015DN, Black HP * HEWQ7553A EACH $83.47 $68.00 $85.49 $76.00 $79.80 $83.30 $68.46 $75.95 $62.00 $84.00 $93.76

15188 Laser Toner - HP Laserjet P1505, Black HP * HEWCB436A EACH $60.34 $57.00 $67.59 $56.00 $58.92 $61.25 $54.17 $57.00 $60.09 $66.00 $76.29

15190 Laser Toner - HP Laserjet 4013 and 4014, Black HP * HEWCC364A EACH $133.37 $126.00 $149.49 $130.00 $130.23 $135.40 $115.22 $132.85 $143.00 $142.00 $156.49

15191
Laser Toner - HP Laserjet M1212 MFP, HP Laserjet Pro 

1102W, Black
HP * HEWCE285A EACH $53.03 $50.00 $57.19 $47.00 $51.79 $53.85 $49.57 $49.00 $52.81 $57.00 $68.25

15193 Laser Toner - HP Color Laserjet CP3520/CP3530, Black HP * HEWCE250A EACH $114.41 $108.00 $117.19 $106.00 $108.15 $114.20 $93.87 $104.15 $115.00 $115.00 $124.84

15194 Laser Toner - HP Color Laserjet CP3520/CP3530, Cyan HP * HEWCE251A EACH $209.08 $204.00 $230.09 $200.00 $204.16 $212.30 $184.30 $204.45 $195.00 $213.00 $235.48

15195 Laser Toner - HP Color Laserjet CP3520/CP3530, Magenta HP * HEWCE253A EACH $209.08 $204.00 $230.09 $204.00 $204.16 $212.30 $184.30 $204.45 $195.00 $213.00 $235.48

15196 Laser Toner - HP Color Laserjet CP3520/CP3530, Yellow HP * HEWCE252A EACH $209.08 $204.00 $230.09 $206.00 $204.16 $212.30 $184.30 $204.45 $195.00 $213.00 $235.48

15197 Laser Toner - HP Laserjet P3015, Black HP * HEWCE255A EACH $113.61 $114.00 $126.79 $111.00 $110.50 $114.90 $101.60 $112.70 $120.00 $118.00 $134.31

15210 Laser Toner - Ricoh Aficio SP C811DN Printer, Black Ricoh * RIC820000 EACH $58.37 $54.00 $52.99 $57.00 $59.85 $67.05 $62.13 $60.80 NO BID $71.00 $75.15

15211 Laser Toner - Ricoh Aficio SP C811DN Printer, Yellow Ricoh * RIC820008 EACH $183.33 $170.00 $156.49 $160.00 $180.60 $190.25 $170.09 $186.00 NO BID $192.00 $188.36

15212 Laser Toner - Ricoh Aficio SP C811DN Printer, Magenta Ricoh * RIC820016 EACH $183.33 $170.00 $156.49 $160.00 $180.60 $190.25 $170.09 $186.00 NO BID $191.00 $188.36

15213 Laser Toner - Ricoh Aficio SP C811DN Printer, Cyan Ricoh * RIC820024 EACH $183.33 $170.00 $156.49 $169.00 $180.60 $190.25 $170.09 $186.00 NO BID $194.00 $188.36

15214
Laser Drum Unit - Ricoh Aficio SP C811DN Printer, Black 

Drum Unit Photo Conductor
Ricoh * RIC402714 EACH $160.32 $144.00 $162.59 $160.00 $179.55 $182.95 $173.60 $170.80 NO BID $191.00 $192.04

15215
Laser Drum Unit - Ricoh Aficio SP C811DN Printer, Color 

Drum Unit Photo Conductor
Ricoh * RIC402715 EACH $460.23 $434.00 $487.69 $400.00 $494.55 $548.50 $520.51 $512.00 NO BID $535.00 $595.81

15216 Laser Transfer Unit - Ricoh Aficio SP C811DN Printer Ricoh * RIC402717 EACH $209.27 $434.00 $207.79 $190.00 NO BID $233.90 $221.79 $219.00 NO BID $220.00 $262.56

15217 Fuser Unit - Ricoh Aficio SP C811DN Printer Ricoh * RIC402718 EACH $324.77 $434.00 $307.39 $249.00 NO BID NO BID $305.27 NO BID NO BID $480.00 $359.99

15218 Waste Toner - Ricoh Aficio SP C811DN Ricoh * RIC402716 EACH $17.64 $434.00 $18.09 $17.00 $15.90 $20.05 $17.15 $19.00 NO BID $20.50 $24.99

15220 Laser Toner - HP LaserJet M175NW, Black HP * HEWCE310A EACH $43.87 $39.00 $44.49 $40.00 $42.50 $43.40 $40.34 $39.55 $75.00 $46.00 $53.60

15221 Laser Toner - HP LaserJet M175NW, Cyan HP * HEWCE311A EACH $48.93 $44.00 $49.49 $50.00 $46.20 $48.25 $44.86 $44.00 $75.00 $49.49 $58.49

15222 Laser Toner - HP LaserJet M175NW, Yellow HP * HEWCE312A EACH $48.93 $44.00 $49.49 $45.00 $46.20 $48.25 $44.86 $44.00 $75.00 $49.49 $58.49

15223 Laser Toner - HP LaserJet M175NW, Magenta HP * HEWCE313A EACH $48.93 $44.00 $49.49 $46.00 $46.20 $48.25 $44.86 $44.00 $75.00 $49.49 $58.49

BID TABULATION

PRINTER - COPIER - FAX SUPPLIES 2016

BID OPENING DATE

10-27-15

UNIT COST



BID TABULATION - PRINTER - COPIER - FAX SUPPLIES 2016

OFFICE 

ESSENTIALS OFFICE SOURCE
OFFICE DEPOT 

INC.

CVR COMPUTER 

SUPPLIES

RE BUSINESS 

SOLUTIONS

SUMNER GROUP 

INC. DBA 

DATAMAX

BEYOND 

TECHNOLOGY

THE TREE 

HOUSE
THE OFFICE PAL

ON TIME TONER 

& SUPPLIES

COAST TO 

COAST 

EQUIPMENT & 

SUPPLIES

1834 WALTON RD

ST LOUIS MO 63114

719 RUDDER RD

FENTON MO 63026

6600 NORTH 

MILITARY TRAIL

BOCA RATON FL 

33496

9 TANNER ST, 

STE 107

HADDONFIELD NJ 

08033

1980 OLD 

CUTHBERT RD

CHERRY HILL NJ 

08034

6717 WALDEMAR 

AVE

ST LOUIS MO 63139

14697 E EASTER 

AVE #G

CENTENNIAL CO 

80112

PO BOX 413

NORWOOD MA 

02062

PO BOX 2

LAKEWOOD NJ  

08701

10805 SUNSET 

OFFICE DR.  #300

ST LOUIS MO  63127

10964 LINN-VALLE 

DR

ST LOUIS MO 63123

BID TABULATION

PRINTER - COPIER - FAX SUPPLIES 2016

BID OPENING DATE

10-27-15

15230 Laser Toner - HP LaserJet M750N, Black HP * HEWCE270A EACH $208.32 $198.00 $213.89 $180.00 $197.40 $208.45 $193.86 $190.00 $190.00 $204.00 $219.57

15231 Laser Toner - HP LaserJet M750N, Cyan HP * HEWCE271A EACH $338.99 $352.00 $347.99 $300.00 $321.30 $339.20 $315.47 $309.20 $310.00 $329.00 $351.03

15232 Laser Toner - HP LaserJet M750N, Yellow HP * HEWCE272A EACH $338.99 $352.00 $347.99 $309.00 $321.30 $339.20 $315.47 $309.20 $310.00 $329.00 $351.03

15233 Laser Toner - HP LaserJet M750N, Magenta HP * HEWCE273A EACH $338.99 $352.00 $347.99 $316.00 $321.30 $339.20 $315.47 $309.20 $310.00 $329.00 $351.03

15305 Laser Toner - HP Color Laserjet CP1215/1515, Black HP * HEWCB540A EACH $66.79 $60.00 $68.39 $52.00 $63.00 $66.65 $61.99 $60.80 $75.00 $67.49 $77.01

15306 Laser Toner - HP Color Laserjet CP1215/1515, Cyan HP * HEWCB541A EACH $61.36 $58.00 $62.79 $53.00 $57.75 $61.25 $56.98 $55.90 $75.00 $64.00 $77.01

15307 Laser Toner - HP Color Laserjet CP1215/1515, Magenta HP * HEWCB543A EACH $61.36 $58.00 $62.79 $50.00 $57.75 $61.25 $56.98 $55.90 $75.00 $64.00 $77.01

15308 Laser Toner - HP Color Laserjet CP1215/1515, Yellow HP * HEWCB542A EACH $61.36 $58.00 $62.79 $56.00 $57.75 $61.25 $56.98 $55.90 $75.00 $64.00 $77.01

15309 Laser Toner - HP Laserjet P1005, HP35, black HP * HEWCB435A EACH $52.49 $53.00 $58.79 $47.00 $51.26 $53.30 $47.12 $51.00 $52.27 $58.00 $67.66

15311 Laser Toner - HP Laserjet P2035, Black HP * HEWCE505A EACH $68.60 $68.00 $76.89 $60.00 $66.99 $69.65 $59.21 $65.00 $74.00 $76.00 $85.35

15312
Laser Toner - HP Laserjet 5000 Series, Black  (for use in 

Canon FP400 printer)
HP * HEWC4129X EACH $194.62 $130.00 $199.89 $100.00 $184.80 $194.80 $181.18 $177.60 $60.00 $194.00 $205.87

15313 Laser Toner - HP Color LaserJet CM2320NF MFP, Black HP * HEWCC530A EACH $95.46 $96.00 $106.99 $68.00 $93.22 $96.95 $89.22 $89.00 $88.00 $103.00 $114.86

15314 Laser Toner - HP Color LaserJet CM2320NF MFP, Cyan HP * HEWCC531A EACH $95.84 $96.00 $105.49 $80.00 $93.59 $97.30 $89.58 $88.00 $92.00 $97.00 $113.36

15315 Laser Toner - HP Color LaserJet CM2320NF MFP, Magenta HP * HEWCC533A EACH $95.84 $96.00 $105.49 $86.00 $93.59 $97.30 $89.58 $88.00 $92.00 $97.00 $113.36

15316 Laser Toner - HP Color LaserJet CM2320NF MFP, Yellow HP * HEWCC532A EACH $95.84 $96.00 $105.49 $82.00 $93.59 $97.30 $89.58 $88.00 $92.00 $97.00 $113.36

15317 Laser Toner - HP Laserjet M4345, Black HP * HEWQ5945A EACH $211.07 $170.00 $216.29 $180.00 $199.50 $210.75 $166.51 $188.00 $140.00 $80.92 $221.88

15318 Laser Toner - Canon MF8380CDW, Black Canon *
CNMCRTDG118

BK
EACH $146.25 $109.00 $103.39 $101.00 $122.85 $120.98 $112.43 $111.85 $100.00 $114.97 $129.13

15319 Laser Toner - Canon MF8380CDW, Magenta Canon *
CNMCRTDG118

MA
EACH $130.07 $104.00 $99.39 $101.00 $121.80 $117.60 $108.12 $107.45 $102.00 $111.78 $124.56

15320 Laser Toner - Canon MF8380CDW, Yellow Canon *
CNMCRTDG118

YW
EACH $130.07 $104.00 $99.39 $96.00 $121.80 $117.60 $108.12 $107.45 $102.00 $111.78 $124.56

15321 Laser Toner - Canon MF8380CDW, Cyan Canon *
CNMCRTDG118

CY
EACH $130.07 $104.00 $99.39 $104.00 $121.80 $117.60 $108.12 $107.45 $102.00 $111.78 $124.56

15330 Laser Toner - HP Laserjet 2600N, Black HP * HEWQ6000A EACH $78.46 $65.00 $80.29 $60.00 $74.55 $78.30 $64.34 $71.40 $50.00 $79.00 $88.72

15331 Laser Toner - HP Laserjet 2600N, Cyan HP * HEWQ6001A EACH $85.63 $70.00 $87.69 $70.00 $80.85 $85.45 $70.22 $77.90 $60.00 $84.00 $85.92

15332 Laser Toner - HP Laserjet 2600N, Yellow HP * HEWQ6002A EACH $85.63 $70.00 $87.69 $71.00 $80.85 $85.45 $70.22 $77.90 $60.00 $84.00 $85.92

15333 Laser Toner - HP Laserjet 2600N, Magenta HP * HEWQ6003A EACH $85.63 $70.00 $87.69 $76.00 $80.85 $85.45 $70.22 $77.90 $60.00 $84.00 $85.92

15335 Laser Toner - C610 Series, Black Okidata * 44315304 EACH $82.57 $74.00 $79.59 $71.00 $79.80 $86.35 $79.58 $77.05 NO BID $86.00 $96.89

15336 Laser Toner - C610 Series, Cyan Okidata * 44315303 EACH $166.60 $156.00 $160.69 $160.00 $172.20 $172.40 $160.57 $154.95 NO BID $171.00 $193.02

15337 Laser Toner - C610 Series, Magenta Okidata * 44315302 EACH $166.60 $156.00 $160.69 $163.00 $172.20 $172.40 $160.57 $154.95 NO BID $171.00 $193.02

15338 Laser Toner - C610 Series, Yellow Okidata * 44315301 EACH $166.60 $156.00 $160.69 $164.00 $172.20 $172.40 $160.57 $154.95 NO BID $171.00 $193.02

15339 Laser Drum - C610 Series, Black Okidata * 44315104 EACH $63.19 $60.00 $60.89 $61.00 $65.10 $66.10 $60.91 $59.80 NO BID $69.00 $76.45

15340 Laser Drum - C610 Series, Cyan Okidata * 44315103 EACH $67.67 $60.00 $65.19 $67.00 $70.35 $71.55 $65.22 $63.90 NO BID $74.00 $81.00

15341 Laser Drum - C610 Series, Magenta Okidata * 44315102 EACH $67.67 $60.00 $65.19 $64.00 $70.35 $71.55 $65.22 $63.90 NO BID $74.00 $81.00

15342 Laser Drum - C610 Series, Yellow Okidata * 44315101 EACH $67.67 $60.00 $65.19 $66.00 $70.35 $71.55 $65.22 $63.90 NO BID $74.00 $81.00

15343 Laser Toner - Okidata MB280 Okidata * OKI-56123401 EACH $119.76 $94.00 $99.79 $60.00 $107.10 $111.30 $99.78 $97.40 NO BID $112.00 $114.62

15346 Laser Toner - HP Laserjet 3600/3800N Series Printer, Black HP * HEWQ6470A EACH $125.37 $115.00 $140.59 $120.00 $122.42 $127.30 $112.55 $124.85 $100.00 $130.00 $147.72

15347 Laser Toner - HP Laserjet 3600 Series Printer, Cyan HP * HEWQ7581A EACH $176.48 $150.00 $180.19 $120.00 $166.95 $176.15 $163.85 $160.60 $155.00 $167.00 $187.13

15348 Laser Toner - HP Laserjet 3600 Series Printer, Yellow HP * HEWQ7582A EACH $176.48 $150.00 $180.19 $130.00 $166.95 $176.15 $163.85 $160.60 $155.00 $167.00 $187.13

15349 Laser Toner - HP Laserjet 3600 Series Printer, Magenta HP * HEWQ7583A EACH $176.48 $150.00 $180.19 $140.00 $166.95 $176.15 $163.85 $160.60 $155.00 $167.00 $187.13

15350 Laser Toner - HP Laserjet 400Pro, Black HP * HEWCE410X EACH $79.70 $77.00 $89.29 $72.00 $76.47 $80.90 $74.49 $78.00 $73.00 $82.00 $97.54

15351 Laser Toner - HP Laserjet 400Pro, Cyan HP * HEWCE411A EACH $94.14 $87.00 $103.59 $80.00 $91.93 $95.60 $87.99 $91.00 $93.00 $96.00 $111.53

15352 Laser Toner - HP Laserjet 400Pro, Yellow HP * HEWCE412A EACH $94.14 $87.00 $103.59 $84.00 $91.93 $95.60 $87.99 $91.00 $93.00 $96.00 $111.53

15353 Laser Toner - HP Laserjet 400Pro, Magenta HP * HEWCE413A EACH $94.14 $87.00 $103.59 $87.00 $91.93 $95.60 $87.99 $91.00 $93.00 $96.00 $111.53

15354 Laser Toner - HP Laserjet Pro M201DW, Black HP * HEWCF283X EACH $71.91 $65.00 NO BID $70.00 $51.45 $67.30 $62.61 $61.40 $65.00 $67.00 $77.69

15355
Laser Toner - HP Laserjet Pro 400, Models 

M401dn/M401dw/M401n/M425dn, Black
HP * HEWCF280X EACH $136.72 $129.00 $153.29 $126.00 $133.51 $138.30 $118.02 $136.15 $135.00 $150.00 $97.24

15356
Laser Toner - HP Laserjet Pro 500 Color MFP, Model 

M570dn, Black
HP * HEWCE400X EACH $172.44 $157.00 $173.39 $120.00 $160.65 $168.95 $157.13 $154.00 $152.00 $166.00 $179.86

15357
Laser Toner - HP Laserjet Pro 500 Color MFP, Model 

M570dn, Cyan
HP * HEWCE401A EACH $185.03 $170.00 $191.99 $160.00 $177.45 $187.10 $173.99 $170.55 $172.00 $185.00 $198.08

15358
Laser Toner - HP Laserjet Pro 500 Color MFP, Model 

M570dn, Yellow
HP * HEWCE402A EACH $185.03 $170.00 $191.99 $170.00 $177.45 $187.10 $173.99 $170.55 $172.00 $185.00 $198.08

15359
Laser Toner - HP Laserjet Pro 500 Color MFP, Model 

M570dn, Magenta
HP * HEWCE403A EACH $185.03 $170.00 $191.99 $168.00 $177.45 $187.10 $173.99 $170.55 $172.00 $185.00 $198.08

15360 Laser Toner - HP Color LaserJet CP5225 Printer, Black HP * HEWCE740A EACH $130.01 $125.00 $130.79 $130.00 $120.75 $127.50 $118.60 $116.25 $190.00 $125.00 $138.21

15361 Laser Toner - HP Color LaserJet CP5225 Printer, Cyan HP * HEWCE741A EACH $223.14 $225.00 $229.59 $239.00 $213.15 $224.60 $208.91 $204.75 $195.00 $221.00 $235.83

15362 Laser Toner - HP Color LaserJet CP5225 Printer, Yellow HP * HEWCE742A EACH $223.14 $225.00 $229.59 $246.00 $213.15 $224.60 $208.91 $204.75 $195.00 $221.00 $235.83

15363 Laser Toner - HP Color LaserJet CP5225 Printer, Magenta HP * HEWCE743A EACH $223.14 $225.00 $229.59 $252.00 $213.15 $224.60 $208.91 $204.75 $220.00 $221.00 $235.83

15365 Laser Toner - HP LaserJet 6P Printer, Black HP* HEWC3903A EACH $100.84 $65.00 $103.59 $36.00 $95.55 $100.95 $93.89 $88.00 $70.00 $110.00 $111.50

15370
Laser Toner - HP Color LaserJet Pro MPF M476DN Printer, 

Black
HP * HEWCF380A EACH $84.68 $77.00 $79.29 $79.00 $73.50 $77.35 $71.95 $70.55 $70.51 $79.00 $87.88

15371
Laser Toner - HP Color LaserJet Pro MPF M476DN Printer, 

Cyan
HP * HEWCF381A EACH $113.32 $100.00 $106.19 $90.00 $98.70 $103.60 $96.33 $94.45 $94.40 $106.00 $114.13

15372
Laser Toner - HP Color LaserJet Pro MPF M476DN Printer, 

Yellow
HP * HEWCF382A EACH $113.32 $100.00 $106.19 $96.00 $98.70 $103.60 $96.33 $94.45 $94.40 $106.00 $114.13

15373
Laser Toner - HP Color LaserJet Pro MPF M476DN Printer, 

Magenta
HP * HEWCF383A EACH $113.32 $100.00 $106.19 $99.00 $98.70 $103.60 $96.33 $94.45 $94.40 $106.00 $114.13

15380 Maintenance Kit - HP LaserJet 4200 Series HP * HEWQ2429A EACH $242.13 $235.00 $254.19 $160.00 $258.30 $225.85 $209.79 $214.00 $300.00 $255.00 $254.97

15381 Maintenance Kit - HP LaserJet 4250 Series HP * HEWQ5421A EACH $241.13 $320.00 $293.29 $80.00 $311.85 $246.30 $228.77 $234.00 $180.00 $310.00 $295.02

15409 Inkjet Cartridge - HP, Black HP * HEW51645A EACH $38.26 $24.00 $33.99 $26.00 $36.75 $39.20 $30.72 $35.00 $40.00 $39.00 $39.63

15412
Inkjet Cartridge - HP-2000C OR 2500C and 2200/2250 

Printers, Black
HP * HEWC4844A EACH $33.91 $30.00 $35.59 $32.00 $33.13 $37.44 $32.16 $36.45 $33.54 $40.00 $41.21

15420
Inkjet Cartridge - HP Business Inkjet 2200/2250 & Design 

Jet 500/800, Cyan
HP * HEWC4836A EACH $40.14 $32.00 $35.59 $30.00 $36.80 $41.65 $37.19 $36.45 $33.54 $40.00 $41.21

15421
Inkjet Cartridge - HP Business Inkjet 2200/2250 & Design 

Jet 500/800, Magenta
HP * HEWC4837A EACH $33.91 $32.00 $35.59 $33.00 $33.13 $37.44 $34.46 $36.45 $33.54 $40.00 $41.21

15422
Inkjet Cartridge - HP Business Inkjet 2200/2250 & Design 

Jet 500/800, Yellow
HP * HEWC4838A EACH $33.91 $32.00 $35.59 $36.00 $33.13 $37.44 $34.46 $36.45 $33.54 $40.00 $41.21

15423
Printhead - HP Business Inkjet 2200/2250 & Design Jet 

500/800, Black
HP * HEWC4810A EACH $44.68 $29.00 $36.79 $40.00 $38.85 $42.73 $38.14 $37.40 $40.00 $41.00 $42.24

15424
Printhead - HP Business Inkjet 2200/2250 & Design Jet 

500/800, Cyan
HP * HEWC4811A EACH $44.68 $29.00 $36.49 $32.00 $38.85 $42.73 $38.14 $37.40 $40.00 $41.00 $42.24

15425
Printhead - HP Business Inkjet 2200/2250 & Design Jet 

500/800, Magenta
HP * HEWC4812A EACH $44.68 $29.00 $36.49 $29.00 $38.85 $42.73 $38.14 $37.40 $40.00 $41.00 $42.24

15426
Printhead - HP Business Inkjet 2200/2250 & Design Jet 

500/800, Yellow
HP * HEWC4813A EACH $44.68 $29.00 $36.49 $31.00 $38.85 $42.73 $38.14 $37.40 $40.00 $41.00 $42.24

15430
Inkjet Cartridge - HP Deskjet 610 & HP Fax 1120, 1120xi, 

Black
HP * HEWC6614D EACH $37.54 $29.00 $34.49 $26.00 $35.70 $38.95 $34.79 $34.10 $32.50 $38.00 $38.60

15432
Inkjet Cartridge - HP Officejet 6110, 6110xi, MFC PSC 1210, 

2110, 2210, Black
HP * HEWC6656AN EACH $21.83 $19.00 $23.49 $23.00 $21.35 $23.94 $21.27 $23.30 $20.07 $27.00 $27.13

15436 Ink Cartridge - HP Officejet 940XL, Option 140, Black HP * HEWC4906AN EACH $37.91 $28.00 $33.45 $30.00 $35.70 $37.08 $30.23 $33.15 $40.00 $37.00 $37.54

15437
Inkjet Cartridge - HP Officejet 8500, 940XL, Option 140, 

Cyan
HP * HEWC4907AN EACH $24.89 $18.00 $22.29 $20.00 $23.10 $24.35 $20.14 $21.75 $40.00 $25.00 $24.99

15438
Inkjet Cartridge - HP Officejet 8500, Model 940XL, Option 

140, Magenta
HP * HEWC4908AN EACH $24.89 $18.00 $22.29 $20.00 $23.10 $24.35 $20.14 $21.75 $21.00 $25.00 $24.99

15439
Inkjet Cartridge - HP Officejet 8500, Model 940XL, Option 

140, Yellow
HP * HEWC4909AN EACH $24.89 $18.00 $22.29 $21.00 $23.10 $24.35 $20.14 $21.75 $40.00 $25.00 $24.99

15440
Inkjet Cartridge - HP 8600 Office Jet Premium; 950XL, 

Black
HP * HEWCN045AN EACH $35.13 $30.00 $31.75 $20.00 $32.55 $34.35 $31.33 $30.70 $30.19 $34.99 $34.87

15441 Inkjet Cartridge - HP 8600 Office Jet Premium; 951XL, Cyan HP * HEWCN046AN EACH $27.45 $22.00 $23.79 $31.00 $26.25 $26.98 $24.48 $23.90 $22.62 $27.49 $27.46

15442
Inkjet Cartridge - HP 8600 Office Jet Premium; 951XL, 

Magenta
HP * HEWCN047AN EACH $27.45 $22.00 $23.79 $24.00 $26.25 $26.98 $24.48 $23.90 $22.62 $27.49 $27.46

15443
Inkjet Cartridge - HP 8600 Office Jet Premium, 951XL, 

Yellow
HP * HEWCN048AN EACH $27.45 $22.00 $23.79 $24.00 $26.25 $26.98 $24.48 $23.90 $22.62 $27.49 $27.46

15451 Inkjet Cartridge - HP DesignJet T2500 Plotter, Black HP * HEWC1Q12A EACH $140.54 $159.00 $41.69 $121.00 $126.00 $138.75 $123.86 $121.40 $121.38 $135.00 $143.89

15452 Inkjet Cartridge - HP DesignJet T2500 Plotter, Cyan HP * HEWB3P19A EACH $58.20 $60.00 $60.99 $50.00 $57.15 $62.55 $55.85 $54.75 $54.73 $63.00 $70.37

15453 Inkjet Cartridge - HP DesignJet T2500 Plotter, Magenta HP * HEWB3P20A EACH $58.20 $60.00 $60.99 $56.00 $57.75 $62.55 $55.85 $54.75 $54.73 $63.00 $70.37

15454 Inkjet Cartridge - HP DesignJet T2500 Plotter, Yellow HP * HEWB3P21A EACH $58.20 $60.00 $60.99 $50.00 $57.75 $62.55 $55.85 $54.75 $54.73 $63.00 $70.37

15455 Inkjet Cartridge - HP DesignJet T2500 Plotter, Photo Black HP * HEWB3P23A EACH $58.20 $60.00 $60.99 $58.00 $57.75 $62.55 $55.85 $54.75 $54.73 $63.00 $70.37

15456 Inkjet Cartridge - HP DesignJet T2500 Plotter, Grey HP * HEWB3P24A EACH $60.65 $60.00 $60.99 $58.00 $57.75 $62.55 $55.85 $54.75 $54.73 $63.00 $70.37

15457 Printhead - HP DesignJet T2500 Plotter HP * HEWB3P06A EACH $265.46 $260.00 $266.99 $55.00 $248.85 $278.30 $244.42 $239.60 $300.00 $265.00 $274.23

15464
Printhead - HP 1055 Plotter/Design Jet 1050C, & 1055CM 

Plotter, Black
HP * HEWC4820A EACH $157.36 $130.00 $160.89 $148.00 $152.25 $167.49 $149.49 $146.60 $168.00 $162.00 $171.60

15465
Printhead - HP 1055 Plotter/Design Jet 1050C, & 1055CM 

Plotter, Cyan
HP * HEWC4821A EACH $157.36 $130.00 $160.89 $147.00 $152.25 $167.49 $149.49 $146.60 $168.00 $162.00 $171.60

15466
Printhead - HP 1055 Plotter/Design Jet 1050C, & 1055CM 

Plotter, Magenta
HP * HEWC4822A EACH $157.36 $130.00 $160.89 $146.00 $152.25 $167.49 $149.49 $146.60 $168.00 $162.00 $171.60

15467
Printhead - HP 1055 Plotter/Design Jet 1050C, & 1055CM 

Plotter, Yellow
HP * HEWC4823A EACH $157.36 $130.00 $160.89 $147.00 $152.25 $167.99 $149.49 $146.60 $168.00 $162.00 $171.60

15468 Inkjet Cartridge - HP Design Jet 500 Plotter, Cyan HP * HEWC4911A EACH $38.84 $32.00 $37.59 $36.00 $36.80 $39.65 $35.98 $35.30 $7.00 $39.99 $48.91

15469 Inkjet Cartridge - HP Design Jet 500 Plotter, Magenta HP * HEWC4912A EACH $38.84 $32.00 $37.59 $34.00 $36.80 $39.65 $35.98 $35.30 $7.00 $39.99 $48.91

15470 Inkjet Cartridge - HP Design Jet 500 Plotter, Yellow HP * HEWC4913A EACH $38.84 $32.00 $37.59 $32.00 $36.80 $39.65 $35.98 $35.30 $7.00 $39.99 $48.91

15474 Inkjet Cartridge - HP Office Jet 7210, HP94 Black HP * HEWC8765WN EACH $25.95 $18.00 $23.49 $24.00 $25.20 $26.65 $20.92 $23.50 $25.00 $25.99 $27.13

15475 Inkjet Cartridge - HP Office Jet 7210, HP97 Tri-Color HP * HEWC9363WN EACH $35.27 $32.00 $36.99 $36.00 $34.44 $38.05 $32.89 $36.90 $24.00 $40.49 $41.87

15476 Inkjet Cartridge - HP Office Jet 7210, HP100 Photo Gray HP * HEWC9368AN EACH $22.26 $23.00 $22.99 $24.00 $21.74 NO BID NO BID NO BID $22.66 $23.99 $27.13

15477 Inkjet Cartridge - HP Office Jet 7210, HP96 Black HP * HEWC8767WN EACH $31.37 $27.40 $33.25 $30.00 $24.63 $33.75 $30.06 $32.25 $28.55 $36.49 $39.23
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15478 Inkjet Cartridge - HP Office Jet 7210, Photo Black HP * HEWC9369WN EACH $30.42 $28.00 $27.69 $26.00 $29.40 $31.60 $28.18 $27.65 $299.00 $30.39 $31.46

15479 Ink Jet - Hewlett Packard, for use in Deskjet 5940; black HP * HEWC9364WN EACH $25.95 $28.00 $23.55 $24.00 $25.20 $26.50 $21.27 $23.50 $30.00 $25.99 $27.13

15480
Inkjet Cartridge - HP Deskjet 3940/3920/1400/F4140, Tri-

Color
HP * HEWC9352AN EACH $21.27 $15.00 $18.99 $19.00 $21.00 $21.85 $17.19 $19.45 $20.00 $21.99 $22.42

15482 Inkjet Cartridge - HP Deskjet 4140, HP21 Black HP * HEWC9351AN EACH $15.45 $13.00 $14.15 $14.00 $14.70 $15.90 $12.79 $14.00 $13.20 $15.99 $16.57

15484 Inkjet Cartridge - HP Officejet, 88XL Black HP * HEWC9396AN EACH $49.02 $38.00 $42.39 $42.00 $46.20 $48.20 $38.30 $42.85 $60.00 $47.99 $48.26

15485 Inkjet Cartridge - HP Officejet, 88XL Cyan HP * HEWC9386AN EACH $16.83 $14.00 $15.39 $16.00 $16.80 $17.45 $24.61 $15.30 $22.00 $16.99 $17.85

15486 Inkjet Cartridge - HP Officejet, 88XL Magenta HP * HEWC9392AN EACH $27.60 $20.00 $23.99 $22.00 $26.25 $27.58 $24.61 $24.15 $22.00 $26.99 $27.61

15487 Inkjet Cartridge - HP Officejet, 88XL Yellow HP * HEWC9393AN EACH $27.60 $20.00 $23.99 $23.00 $26.25 $27.58 $24.61 $24.15 $22.00 $26.99 $27.61

15495 Printhead - HP Officejet Pro L7680, HP88 Black/Yellow HP * HEWC9381A EACH $78.23 $55.00 $66.59 $64.00 $68.25 $74.94 $66.89 $65.60 $90.00 $72.00 $74.31

15496 Printhead - HP Officejet Pro L7680, HP88 Magenta/Cyan HP * HEWC9382A EACH $78.23 $55.00 NO BID $66.00 $68.25 $74.94 $66.89 $65.60 $90.00 $72.00 $74.31

15497 Inkjet Cartridge - HP95 Tri-Color HP * HEWC8766WN EACH $30.24 $18.00 $26.99 $27.00 $29.40 $31.05 $24.37 $27.60 $30.00 $30.49 $32.43

15498
Printhead - HP Officejet Pro 8500 All-in-One , HP940 

Black/Yellow
HP * HEWC4900A EACH $53.46 $45.00 $50.79 $40.00 $51.45 $55.50 $49.55 $48.60 $70.00 $56.00 $54.56

15499
Printhead - HP Officejet Pro 8500 All-in-One , HP940 

Cyan/Magenta
HP * HEWC4901A EACH $61.85 $45.00 $50.79 $41.00 $51.45 $55.50 $49.55 $48.60 $70.00 $56.00 $54.56

15508
Inkjet Cartridge - Standard Print Cartridge, MB260, 280, 

290
Okidata * 56123401 EACH $119.76 $95.00 $99.79 $20.00 $107.10 $111.30 $99.78 $97.50 NO BID $112.00 $114.62

15515
Inkjet Cartridge - HP OfficeJet Pro X476DNMFP, HP970, 

Black
HP * HEWCN621AM EACH $67.52 $60.00 $61.55 $58.00 $60.90 $66.25 $59.13 $58.00 $58.54 $67.00 $66.92

15516
Inkjet Cartridge - HP OfficeJet Pro X476DNMFP, HP971, 

Cyan
HP * HEWCN622AM EACH $74.48 $61.00 $64.19 $61.00 $63.00 $69.05 $61.66 $60.45 $61.04 $67.00 $68.66

15517
Inkjet Cartridge - HP OfficeJet Pro X476DNMFP, HP971, 

Magenta
HP * HEWCN623AM EACH $74.48 $61.00 $64.19 $61.00 $63.00 $69.05 $61.66 $60.45 $61.04 $67.00 $68.66

15518
Inkjet Cartridge - HP OfficeJet Pro X476DNMFP, HP971, 

Yellow
HP * HEWCN624AM EACH $74.48 $61.00 $64.19 $60.00 $63.00 $69.05 $61.66 $60.45 $61.04 $67.00 $68.66

15540
Inkjet Cartridge - HP Officejet Pro 6230 Series, Black, HP 

934XL
HP * HEWC2P23AN EACH $29.58 $27.00 $25.75 $20.00 $30.45 $29.55 $24.73 $25.85 $24.24 $28.99 $31.41

15541
Inkjet Cartridge - HP Officejet Pro 6230 Series, Cyan, HP 

935XL
HP * HEWC2P24AN EACH $18.29 $16.90 $16.09 $15.00 $18.90 $18.25 $15.50 $15.80 $15.19 $18.99 $20.63

15542
Inkjet Cartridge - HP Officejet Pro 6230 Series, Magenta, HP 

935XL
HP * HEWC2P25AN EACH $18.29 $16.90 $16.09 $11.00 $18.90 $18.25 $15.50 $15.80 $15.19 $18.99 $20.63

15543
Inkjet Cartridge - HP Officejet Pro 6230 Series, Yellow, HP 

935XL
HP * HEWC2P26AN EACH $18.29 $16.90 $16.09 $16.00 $18.90 $18.25 $15.50 $15.80 $15.19 $18.99 $20.63

15545 Inkjet Cartridge - Epson Printer, Black Epson *
EPST711XXL12

0
EACH $49.83 $47.00 $50.99 $16.00 $50.40 $54.40 $49.94 $50.90 NO BID $53.49 $52.73

15546 Inkjet Cartridge - Epson Printer, Cyan Epson *
EPST711XXL22

0
EACH $55.11 $51.00 $56.69 $47.00 $55.65 $60.60 $55.58 $56.60 NO BID $59.99 $59.47

15547 Inkjet Cartridge - Epson Printer, Magenta Epson *
EPST711XXL32

0
EACH $55.11 $51.00 $56.69 $50.00 $55.65 $60.60 $55.58 $56.60 NO BID $59.99 $59.47

15548 Inkjet Cartridge - Epson Printer, Yellow Epson *
EPST711XXL42

0
EACH $55.11 $51.00 $56.69 $50.00 $55.65 $60.60 $55.58 $56.60 NO BID $59.99 $59.47

15550 Inkjet Cartridge - Epson Stylus Photo R2000 Printer, Black Epson * EPST159120 EACH $20.87 $19.00 $21.05 $20.00 $23.10 $21.85 $19.87 $20.60 NO BID $22.77 $23.06

15551 Inkjet Cartridge - Epson Stylus Photo R2000 Printer, Cyan Epson * EPST159220 EACH $20.87 $19.00 $21.05 $20.00 $23.10 $21.85 $19.87 $20.60 NO BID $22.77 $23.06

15552
Inkjet Cartridge - Epson Stylus Photo R2000 Printer, 

Magenta
Epson * EPST159320 EACH $20.87 $19.00 $21.05 $22.00 $23.10 $21.85 $19.87 $20.60 NO BID $22.77 $23.06

15553 Inkjet Cartridge - Epson Stylus Photo R2000 Printer, Yellow Epson * EPST159420 EACH $20.87 $19.00 $21.05 $22.00 $23.10 $21.85 $19.87 $20.60 NO BID $22.77 $23.06

15554 Inkjet Cartridge - Epson Stylus Photo R2000 Printer, Red Epson * EPST159720 EACH $20.87 $19.00 $21.05 $22.00 $23.10 $21.85 $19.87 $20.60 NO BID $22.77 $23.06

15555
Inkjet Cartridge - Epson Stylus Photo R2000 Printer, Matte 

Black
Epson * EPST159820 EACH $20.87 $19.00 $21.75 $22.00 $23.10 $21.85 $19.87 $20.60 NO BID $22.77 $23.06

15556 Inkjet Cartridge - Epson Stylus Photo R2000 Printer, Orange Epson * EPST159920 EACH $20.87 $19.00 $21.49 $22.00 $23.10 $21.85 $19.87 $20.60 NO BID $22.77 $23.06

15557
Inkjet Cartridge - Epson Stylus Photo R2000 Printer, Gloss 

Optimizer
Epson * EPST159020 EACH $20.87 $19.00 $17.29 $22.00 $23.10 $21.85 $19.87 $20.60 NO BID $22.77 $23.06

15590
Inkjet Cartridge - HP Officejet Pro 8600/8100 Series, Black, 

HP 950
HP * HEWCN049AN EACH $22.72 $19.90 $21.99 $20.00 $22.05 $23.65 $21.14 $20.75 $20.93 $23.99 $25.85

15591
Inkjet Cartridge - HP Officejet Pro 8600/8100 Series, Cyan, 

HP 951
HP * HEWCN050AN EACH $19.67 $14.90 $15.49 $16.00 $16.80 $17.50 $15.63 $15.35 $14.74 $17.29 $19.89

15592
Inkjet Cartridge - HP Officejet Pro 8600/8100 Series, 

Magenta, HP 951
HP * HEWCN051AN EACH $19.67 $14.90 $15.49 $16.00 $16.80 $17.50 $15.63 $15.35 $14.74 $17.29 $19.89

15593
Inkjet Cartridge - HP Officejet Pro 8600/8100 Series, Yellow, 

HP 951
HP * HEWCN052AN EACH $19.67 $14.90 $15.49 $16.00 $16.80 $17.50 $15.63 $15.35 $14.74 $17.29 $19.89

15595 Inkjet Cartridge - Fujitsu FI-614PR, Black HP * HEWC6602A EACH $13.23 $12.00 $13.09 $16.00 $13.15 $13.79 $15.63 $12.70 $12.44 $14.29 $16.60

15596 Inkjet Cartridge - Fujitsu FI-614PR, Blue HP * HEWC6602B EACH $13.57 $14.00 $13.29 $16.00 $13.15 $14.10 $13.73 $12.70 $22.00 $14.29 $16.60

15597 Inkjet Cartridge - Fujitsu FI-614PR, Green HP * HEWC6602G EACH $11.31 $14.00 NO BID $12.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $22.00 NO BID $16.60

15598 Inkjet Cartridge - Fujitsu FI-614PR, Red HP * HEWC6602R EACH $13.76 $14.00 $13.29 $12.00 $13.65 $13.79 $12.63 $12.70 $22.00 NO BID $16.60

15602 Ribbon - Printer, IBM Lexmark* LEX1040930 EACH $2.89 $9.00 $11.79 $13.00 NO BID $15.15 $3.24 NO BID $20.00 NO BID $17.21

15610 Ribbon - Epson Ribbon Cartridge for TM-U675 Printer ITKKOR500P EACH $6.95 $5.00 $6.49 $13.00 NO BID NO BID $1.75 NO BID NO BID NO BID $5.01

15612 Ribbon - Canon CP1200D Calculator Ribbon, 2-Color ITKKOR80CBR EACH $1.47 $0.75 $1.29 $12.00 NO BID NO BID $1.10 NO BID NO BID NO BID $16.34

16101 Fax Cartridge - Brother Intellifax 2840, High Yield Brother * BRTTN450 EACH $47.97 $46.90 $47.19 $46.00 $49.35 $51.10 $46.74 $46.05 $49.86 $53.99 $60.59

16102 Fax Drum Cartridge - Brother Intellifax 2840 Brother * BRTDR420 EACH $74.59 $72.00 $72.79 $60.00 $74.55 $51.10 $71.22 $70.90 $76.78 $84.49 $87.91

16103 Fax Cartridge - Brother PPF 4750, Black Brother * BRTTN460 EACH $69.91 $64.00 $69.09 $60.00 $81.40 $74.37 $67.77 $67.45 $73.05 $79.99 $84.12

16104
Fax Cartridge - Brother Thermal Ribbon Cartridge PFC1170, 

1270, 1570, 1770, 1870, 1970MC
Brother * BRTPC201 EACH $23.65 $19.90 $22.89 $20.00 $24.15 $25.66 $22.47 $22.40 $25.36 $27.99 $30.57

16105 Fax Cartridge - Brother 2800, Toner Cartridge Brother * BRTTN250 EACH $31.08 $20.00 $30.09 $19.00 $31.50 $34.30 $29.53 $29.40 $31.83 $35.99 $42.30

16107 Fax Drum Cartridge - Brother 4750 Brother * BRTDR400 EACH $138.29 $99.00 $132.59 $120.00 $136.50 $146.00 $130.01 $129.35 $140.15 $149.99 $152.19

16108 Fax Cartridge - Brother 775, Thermal Ribbon Cartridge Brother * BRTPC301 EACH $17.80 $12.00 $19.09 $18.00 $18.90 $19.60 $16.90 $16.85 $20.05 $22.49 $23.48

16109 Fax Drum Cartridge - Brother 2800 Brother * BRTDR250 EACH $173.63 $140.00 $172.99 $20.00 $178.50 $193.43 $166.53 $165.70 $179.52 $190.00 $192.13

16110 Fax Cartridge - Brother DCP 7020, MFC-7220 Brother * BRTTN350 EACH $52.20 $46.00 $51.59 $50.00 $53.55 $55.93 $50.61 $50.40 $54.56 $57.99 $65.36

16111 Fax Cartridge - Brother 950C Brother * BRTTN550 EACH $64.18 $54.00 $62.09 $60.00 $65.10 $69.60 $60.95 $60.70 $65.70 $71.99 $76.67

16115 Fax/Copier Cartridge -  Brother DCP-8020 Brother * BRTTN530 EACH $60.06 $42.00 $58.19 $56.00 $61.95 $66.25 $57.64 $56.80 $61.50 $68.99 $72.40

16116 Fax Cartridge - Brother TN540 Brother * BRTTN540 EACH $64.17 $56.00 $62.09 $60.00 $65.10 $69.60 $60.95 $60.70 $62.70 $72.99 $76.67

16117 Fax Drum Cartridge - Brother DR510 Brother * DR510 EACH $151.56 $120.00 $145.39 $60.00 $154.35 $162.70 $142.48 $141.80 $153.59 $159.99 $165.38

16118 Fax Drum Cartridge - Brother DR350 Brother * BRTDR350 EACH $98.14 $75.00 $94.09 $93.00 $96.60 $105.60 $92.27 $91.85 $99.46 $108.00 $110.92

16121 Fax Drum Cartridge - Brother MFC 8480DN Brother * BRTDR620 EACH $108.37 $90.00 $104.09 $100.00 $107.10 $114.45 $101.90 $101.40 $109.84 $119.00 $121.45

16123 Fax Toner Cartridge - Brother MFC 8480DN, 3,000 pages Brother * BRTTN620 EACH $53.63 $50.00 $51.99 $51.00 $53.55 $57.20 $50.94 $50.70 $54.91 $58.99 $65.71

16125
Fax Toner Cartridge - Brother 4100E/4750E/5750E, 3,000 

pages
Brother * BRTTN430 EACH $49.58 $47.00 $48.99 $40.00 $50.40 $54.90 $48.06 $47.90 $51.81 $56.99 $62.57

16135
Fax Cartridge - Sharp UX355L, Thermal Transfer Refill 

Ribbon, Black, 2/Box
Sharp * SHRUX3CR EACH $6.71 $10.00 $20.29 $12.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $15.49 $25.05

17000

Multi-Function Machine Toner - DCP-7030, DCP-7040, HL-

2140, HL-2170W, MFC-7340, MFC-7345N, MFC-7440N, 

MFC-7840W

Brother* BRTTN330 EACH $35.49 $32.00 $34.39 $30.00 $36.75 $38.50 $33.71 $33.60 $36.34 $40.49 $46.88

17005

Multi-Function Machine Toner - HL-

3040CN/3045CN/3070CW/3075CW, MFC-

9010CN/9120CN/ 9125CN/9320CW/9325CW, Black

Brother * BRTTN210BK EACH $52.83 $43.00 $51.99 $52.00 $53.55 $56.30 $50.96 $50.75 $54.93 $59.99 $65.74

17006

Multi-Function Machine Toner - HL-

3040CN/3045CN/3070CW/3075CW, MFC-

9010CN/9120CN/ 9125CN/9320CW/9325CW, Cyan

Brother * BRTTN210C EACH $49.31 $40.00 $48.49 $40.00 $50.40 $53.40 $47.56 $47.40 $51.27 $54.99 $62.02

17007

Multi-Function Machine Toner - HL-

3040CN/3045CN/3070CW/3075CW, MFC-

9010CN/9120CN/ 9125CN/9320CW/9325CW, Magenta

Brother * BRTTN210M EACH $49.31 $40.00 $48.49 $49.00 $50.40 $53.40 $47.56 $47.40 $51.27 $54.99 $62.02

17008

Multi-Function Machine Toner - HL-

3040CN/3045CN/3070CW/3075CW, MFC-

9010CN/9120CN/ 9125CN/9320CW/9325CW, Yellow

Brother * BRTTN210Y EACH $49.31 $40.00 $48.49 $51.00 $50.40 $53.40 $47.56 $47.40 $51.27 $54.99 $62.02
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